Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 9 October, 2018 4:55 PM

'ONG LI LI'

Shu Pei (LKKAuto); MT_Claim_SG

RE: Your Ref 17/18/18/VP05/020761; Our Vehicle: GBB657X Accident involving
GBB657X & SKT8264S On 17 July 2018

After Repair Photos.pdf; LKK Inspection Photos.pdf; LKK Reinspection Photos.pdf;
LKKAdjustmentl.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; LOD.pdf

Lonpac Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020761
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC18013153/Awb3

Hi Lili,

We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 23 July 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our

Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a chain collision involving 4 vehicles chain collision where OI was the last vehicle

In accordance to the MCF guideline, we have to settle 3" claim at 100%.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Ryder Auto Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)

$20,528.60 $9,800.00

2. Loss of USE ($ 180.00 x 11days) $ 1,980.00 $ 1,100.00(11days x $100.00)

3. LTA/GIA search fee

$31.00 $31.00

Total | $22,540.60 $10,931.00

*%11 days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 4:46 PM

To: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; Vivian Lau
(LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref 17/18/18/VP05/020761; Our Vehicle: GBB657X Accident involving GBB657X & SKT8264S On 17
July 2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Orson

To avoid any delay, please send your LOD directly to LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.
Dear Vivian/ShuPei

fya

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Ryder Auto workshop [mailto:ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 4:32 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Your Ref 17/18/18/VP05/020761; Our Vehicle: GBB657X Accident involving GBB657X & SKT8264S On 17
July 2018

Dear SIr/Mdm,

Kindly view the attached LOD, original will be mail to you for your prompt processing.
Thank You

Best regards

Orson

90908277

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-56, Autobay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Fax: 64815390

5 Tuas Ave 3 BS Logistics Hub Singapore 639405
Fax: 64815390




