Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 16 September 2019 5:53 PM
To: Pauline Ngu
Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Soon Tat Ng; Pegasus Engineering; xianchern.pegasusengrg;
lionelchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg; Admin A
Subject: RE: LOD - Third party claim - Our ref: SLQ8115T Your ref: SBC3377D on 20/06/2018
Attachments: AIG DV.pdf
Tracking: Recipient Delivery
Pauline Ngu
Shu Pei (LKKAuto) Delivered: 16/9/2019 5:53 PM
Soon Tat Ng

Pegasus Engineering
xianchern.pegasusengrg

lionelchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg

Admin A
Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 16/9/2019 5:53 PM
olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 16/9/2019 5:53 PM

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for the acceptance.
We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your necessary action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pauline Ngu <pauline.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2019 3:46 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>



Cec: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Soon Tat Ng <ngsoontat@vendaengrg.com.sg>; Pegasus
Engineering <ar claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg>; xianchern.pegasusengrg
<xianchern.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; lionelchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LOD - Third party claim - Our ref: SLQ8115T Your ref: SBC3377D on 20/06/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Khanchna,

We have persuade our client to accept the offer.

Kindly let us have your discharge voucher for completion.

Have a nice day!

Many thanks.

Best Regards,

Pauline

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road

Singapore 628800

Tel : 6513 7749

Fax : 6251 3161

On Thu, 5 Sep 2019 at 17:29, Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:

2




Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC6/AIG18013124/R1kb3
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows:

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,946.97
2. Loss of Rental/ Loss of Income (5 days | $ 550.00

x $110)

3.LTA Search Fee $7.49
Total $2,504.46

Please confirm acceptance.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement."

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pauline Ngu <pauline.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 5 September 2019 4:10 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cec: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Soon Tat Ng <ngsoontat@vendaengrg.com.sg>; Pegasus
Engineering <ar_claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg>; xianchern.pegasusengrg
<xianchern.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; lionelchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LOD - Third party claim - Our ref: SLQ8115T Your ref: SBC3377D on 20/06/2018




Without Prejudice

Dear Khanchna,

We refer to above mentioned claim.

We agree with the repair costs and LTA search fee. But we would like to counter propose for Loss of
rental and Loss of income as below:-

LOR @ 5 days x $66.95 = $334.75

LOE @ 5 days x $120.00 = $600.00

Kindly consider to revise your offer.

We look forward to hearing from you soon.

Have a nice day!

Many thanks.

Best Regards,

Pauline

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road

Singapore 628800

Tel 1 6513 7749



Fax : 6251 3161

On Mon, 26 Aug 2019 at 15:28, Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC6/AIG18013124/R1kb3
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows:

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,946.97
2. Loss of Rental/ Loss of Income (4 days | $ 400.00

x $100)

3.LTA Search Fee $7.49
Total $2,354.46

Please confirm acceptance.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement."

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



