Vie !LKKAutnz

From: Jenny Lim <jenny lim@laihuat.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 20 March, 2020 2:46 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: Third Party Claim (EQ) - Your Ref: SLB 82587 / Our Ref: SDX 6173X (Date of

Accident: 11.07.18) LKK REF CC4/EQI18013081/Khb3

Dear Sir

We refer o the above.

We have our client's consent to accept your offer as provided therein.
Please let us have the payment.

Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110
Fax: 64596267

From: Vic [LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, B November 2019 12:00 pm

To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Third Party Claim (EQ) - Your Ref: SLB B258T / Our Ref: 5DX 6173X (Date of Accident: 11.07.18) LKK REF
CC4/EQI18013081/Khb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Jenny,

We refer to the subject matter and we confirmed in receipt of the LOD.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, we propose a global sum of $870.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

For your acceptance please. Kindly note that no DV is reguired.

The above amount is to be made payable to LAl HUA KEE g
Thank you.
“Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and

should not be construed as on admission of Kability an our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present




marter Is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settiement arising from this offer
in any ather related matters.,

Settlement and payment are subject to production of eriginal documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge
Voucher (for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Caimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us
after we have made payment on the seitlement sum.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: viealpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Indostrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933)

F Lr- A
LKK = Save the Earth: Print only when nacessary

This e-mail cantain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient s prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe thal you received this e-mail in efmor, please do nol
read (his e-mall or any altached llems. Please delets the e-mall and all attachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the
sendar thal you have delated the e-mail. &l attachmaents and any copies thareol. Thank you

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 1 August, 2018 1:18 PM

To: lenny Lim

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Third Party Claim (EQ) - Your Ref: SLB 82587 / Our Ref; SDX 6173X |Date of Accident: 11.07.18) LKK REF
CCa/EQI18013081/hb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Jenny,
Received with thanks.

We will get back to you for an update in due course.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkknuto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408633)

¥ e
IKK = Save the Earth Print only when necessory'

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribullon by an
unintanded recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belleve that you received this e-mail in ermor, please do nol
read Ihis e-mall or any attachad items, Please delale the e-mall and all attachmenis, Including any copies thersol, and inform the
sender that you have deisted the e-mail, all altachmenis and any copies thereofl. Thank you.




From: Jenny Lim [mailto:jenny im@laihuat.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 1 August, 2018 11:48 AM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Third Party Claim (EQ) - Your Ref: SLB 8258T / Our Ref: SDX 6173X (Date of Accident: 11.07.18]

Dear Sir
We refer lo the above malier.

Please find below the link for the video footage:
hitps://www dropbox. com/s/ri0xB94nvatBid/FNKPB117 MP47di=0

Flease can you confirm whether liability is in our client's favour?

Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTELTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267




K (32 ) Z % A k2 3]
LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

Sin Ming Autocity
160 Sin Ming Drive #04-01/#04-02/#07-03 Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110 Fax: 64596267
UEN: 188407582C

Your Ref: SLB 8258T 29 April 2019
Our Ref: SDX B173X - 2018/JL

EQ Insurance Company Lid WITHOUT PREJUDICE
5 Maxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block

MND Complex

Singapore 069110

Attention: Mator Claim

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SDX 173X AND SLB 8258T ON 11/07/2018 AT WOODLANDS
CHECKPOINT TOWARDS SINGAPORE

We refer 1o the above malter wherein your insured's vehicle no. SLB B258T was involved in an accident with
our client's vehicle no, SDX 6173X

As the accident was caused by your insured's negligence, our client is now claiming for the following losses:
« Repair cost % B690.35 (include GST)
« Rental cost: § B600.00 (4 days x $150 per day)
e« GlAsearchfee: § 200
Total: 1,292.35
Relevant documents in support of our client's claim are enclosed for your reference

Please do not hesitale to contact Jenny Lim at telephone 64533757 or email jenny im@iahust com sg
should you need any additional information,

Meanwhile, we look forward Lo receiving your affirmative response soon enough.
Thank you.
Yours faithfully
W
-
LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTELTD

ancs

WL




Vie !LKI(ﬁutnl

From: Vic (LEKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 31 August, 2018 3:12 PM
To: keng.wong@hotmail co.uk
Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Your Ref: SLB B258T_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB B258T AND SDX 61737 ON
11/07/2018
| Pl Vs

- EE N Consulfariy
Sda ma = Pre Lict

S1UHEAVE 1, #00-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (DB3) 42564115

Our Ref: CC4/EQI18013081/Khb3

31 AUGUST 2018

KENG WONG By Email Only
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 8258T AND SDX 6173T ON 11/07/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them,

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given
us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Hest Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408943)

yERS SO ..

SLERER SN Suve the Earth Print only when necassary

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the =ole use of the intended recipieni. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplant is prohibited, and may be a vialation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail In error, please do nol




read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, Including any copies thereaf, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any copies thereof Thank you.



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To:  Lal Huat (Meng Kee) Motor Fie Lid
160 Sin Ming Drive
704-01, #04-02 & #07-03
Sin Ming Autocity
Singapora 575722

Dear Sirs

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS: SDX B173X & _SLB 82587 ON _11/07/2018
AT WOODLANDS CHECKPOINT TOWARDES SINGAPORE

This is o confirm thal on _11/072018 . | / We gave you instiuctions (o repall my / our vehicle no.
SDX 6173X which was damaged in the above acciden!

In consideration of your agreement 1o repair my vehicle no.  SDX6173X | pay for my other
expenses and to defer demanding lor paymient of the costs of repair which was damaged as a result of
ihe above accident, | /| We hereby authorise you andlor your solicilars as my / our 1epresentative (o
wille, negotiate and sellle the accident claim on my /| our behall against any pant involved In the
abovementioned accident.

| 1 We hereby undenake 1o co-aperate with you and render you all the assistance (Including having my
{ our vehide re-inspacted and being & witness &t (risl) thal may be necessany (or you 1o recover the
cost of repaits and 1he loss of use 1o my / our vehicle. |/ We further undenake 10 keep you Informed &l
all times of any communication received from any party involved in the asbovementioned acciden.

| 1 We hereby confirm thal by signing this Letter of Aulthority, | / We are not entiiled in law 1o receive
any payment, If a cheque is sent to me. | / We shall retum the samea 1o the sender as | am precluded
in faw from accepting any payment,

In the eveni of my / our claim againsl any parly involvad in the abovementionad accident being
unsuccassiul for any reason whatsoever. | / We shall bear the repair / excess cost payable o Lai Huai
{Meng Kee) Mator Pie Lid sither by cash / cheque or claim against my / ow insurance policy,

| { We hereby aulhorise the payment of my / our claim (including any or all medical related invoices /
receipls) to be made direclly o my / our represenialive, Lal Hual (Meng Kes) Motor Ple Lid
accordingly.

In relation 1o the personal and vehicle information collected or otherwise provided during the course of
the claim process (including by way of recordings), | agree and consent that Lal Huat (Meng Kee)
Motor Pte Lid may use, disclose and process my personal data for the purpose of responding and
administering all activilies related to my insurance claim.

Yaurs failhfily
Signalure: _?_/’{;f
Name: Zurami Bin Ali

NRIC No: S7338670E




2% (M ) RE5A R 23
LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

164 Sin Ming Drive #0400, #0402 & #07-03 Singapore 575722 Tel: 6453 8110 Fax: 6459 6267
GST Noc M2-0128609.3
LTEMN; 10T S0

TAX INVOICE
EST No. .. EST0019812 GSTRegNo .......... .. M2-0128608-3
Zuraimi Bin Ali e s A | of 1
Number = ..~ INVD020789
Yourrel .. .......... . TP-SLB 8258T EQ
Ourref .. ... ... ... ... .. 180717
Attn ... ... Date ...................... 201272018
Vehicle No .. : SDX 6173X
Vehicle Model - Hyundai Elantra
Accident on .. 11/7/2018
‘Quantity Unit Description Unit price Disc. pot Amount
Supply of Parts:
1.00 Pc Front bumper 195.00 165.00
Total amount of parts supplied - S$195.00
1.00 15% of parts supplied: 20.25 29.25
Labour & Misc:
1.00 To remove and renew above parts 200.00 200.00
1.00 To spray paint 220.00 220.00
Sub-Total 644 25
GST 7.00% 4510
Total 5% 68935

sonmiRrias CAROLINERMARKIV M, TRHUBENRAN TS SRE FTRENRANNR I SNAGRSA .,
fit ¥, i W % &M SAICO Deluxe W i ot &

"Our services include the latest and reliable CAROLINER MARK IV repair bench, draw-aligner and the support
dolly system to provide accurate re-alignment and speedy repairs. We also provide the new and advanced SAICO
Deluxe oven heater for re-spraying all motor vehicles."



m Car Rental Pte Ltd

37A Bartley Road Singapore 539777

HIRING AGREEMENT CUM TAX INVOICE NUMBER:

UEN: 200102894H

(Please quote this number in all payments and correspondence)

Vehicle number : SKT 6291B
Make & model : Toyota Altis 1.6A

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

Hirer ¢ ZURAIMI BIN ALI

Contact Number Off :

Nationality : SINGAPOREAN
Date Of Birth : 31.10.1973

Address : BLK 4668 SEMBAWANG DRIVE #07-323, SINGAPORE 752466

Hip: 96659569

NRIC No: S7338670E

Res:

Licence Number: AS NRIC NO
Licence Expiry : NEW PHOTO LIC.

EXCESS js 555,000.00

Driver : AS ABOVE NRIC No: AS ABOVE
Address : AS ABOVE
Contact Numbaer Off : Res:

H/p:
Nationality : SINGAPOREAN Licence Number: AS NRIC NO
Date Of Birth H Licence Expiry : NEW PHOTO LIC.
RENTAL PRICING
Daily Rental Rate + 5% 150.00 Date Out : 28.08.2018
Days On Rental : OY /pay Time Out  : 09:50
Sub-Total :S¢  boOO-0O Date Return: 01.09.201§
G.S.T.@7.0% 1 5% - Time Return: 3.30pmM
Total :5% Goo.00

"®YRENTER' S Liability for Vehicle Damage EXCESS |s 551,500.00 ON ALL CLAIMS.
***Applicable to driver below 23YRS old and above 70YRS old OR with less than 2YRS driving experienca

Job no: 69652

REMARK - Vehicle no: SDX 6173X

HIRER DECLARATION

| agree to the terms and conditions above and s sl out
ovarleal. I opt 1o pay by crediticharge chard, my signature
here is deemed o have besn made on the application credit

card charge siip, -
3;/:;67'

Autheorised Signatory and Company Stamp

Date:

r’”“l(;\p:.:

APEX Car Rental Pie Ltd
Date:




Timzoie Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
GENM & Raflles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

I“SURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSODCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 3am to Spm
GST Registration No. M400017738

SECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Raf No: GR-1B-105719

Dale of Request: 1100712018 Your Ref Na: Online Purchass
Lai Huat (Meng Ke=) Molor Pie Lid
160 Sin Ming Drive #04-01
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 11/07/2018

Enguiry By Jenny Lim Lal Foong

TP Vehicle Na. SLBB258T

Accident Date 1072018

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Pariod of Insurance Insurer Tel No.
SLBB258T EQ Insurance Company Lid 23/082017-241M10/2018 6223 8433
Thank Yaou.

The images provided (o you are takan from the original reports lorwarded (o the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association ol
Singapore and we take no responsibliity for their accuracy or contems and shall be under no Kability whatsosvar for any loss or damage srising out af
o in connaction with the repons or their images.

This ts a computer generated document and requires no signature,

hitps-'mingapore. marimen comiclaimafindex.cimussbox=MTReas&lussaclion=dsp_peninviphrafid=18562734CF|D=37130803ACFTOKEN=d4a,., 1/2




O My LUy #o-uu, o5 oy
lHSURANCE Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: €224 D030
ASSDCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am 1o Spm

SECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Raef No: GR-18-105718
Date of Request: 110772018 Your Ref Na; Online Purchase
Lai Huat (Mang Kee) Motor Ple Lid
180 Sin Ming Drive #04-01
Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722
Dear SiriMadam,
Enquiry Date 11/07/2018
Enquiry By Jenny Lim Lai Foong
TP Vehicle No, SLBB258T
Accident Date 11072018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank Yo,

This Is a computer generated document and requiires no signalire.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ | Cash [ ] Chequa

hitps_singapore meriman.comiclaimalindex. cfm Husebax=MTRsasAfuseacllon=dsp_genimip&relid=185627T38CFI0=371308938CFTOKEN=dd4a .. 22




