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g il Consuwlfanis
a_dm A XN Pia Lid Company Registration No. 199G0T196R

51 UBAVE 1, #0225 PAYA URLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: ES559/SL/pl Date: 25 July 2018

Our Ref: CS/EGI18013078/Gsd3

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHB 8573E .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on __24/07/2018  at the premises of M/s ___Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd and
have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 188 4.799.20
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 1,634.40
“Check” Items Amount : 5%
Market Value : 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value : 88
Nett Value . 8%

Description of Damage:

nearsice

The vehicle sustained damages e . .

at the n/s portion. |I|I:r :' ] | ot
affside

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 4 Days

Yours faithfully,
Xing Guo Qiang
Automotive Assessor



: Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premiertaxi.com>
Sent: Monday, 27 August 2018 11:21 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); guoqgiang@Ikkauto.com
Cc: 'SUR'; Gary Shi

Subject: RE: SHBB573E- FINALIZE

Ok confirmed at 51,634 .40 4days.

Regards

Goh Wee Dek
Assistant Claims Manager
Premier Automotive Services Pte Lid

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 068 | DID: 6544 6682 | Fax: 6214 1511

Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.Sg

Confidentiality Motice | This ¢-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information, Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are nat the intended recipient, immediately contact
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

g4 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION
wh

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew @Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 27 August, 2018 10:37 AM

To: Goh Wee Dek; guogiang@lkkauto.com

Cc: 'SUR'; Gary Shi

Subject: RE: SHBE573E- FINALIZE

Dear Wee Dek/Gary,

Please re-confirmed P/P $ 1,634.40 @ 4 repair days.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Goh Wee Dek [mailto:weedek.goh@premiertaxi.com]

Sent: Thursday, 2 August 2018 2:20 PM

To: guogiang@lkkauto.com

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Gary Shi <gary.shi@premiertaxi.com>
Subject: SHBB573E- FINALIZE

Dear Quo Qiang

Please confirm PxP $1,734 40 4days.



Regards

Goh Wee Dek

Assistant Claims Manager
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 5214 B850 Ext 068 | DID: 6544 6682 | Fax: 6214 1511

Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.Sg

Confidentiality Motice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s] and may contain confidential or
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution 13 prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

g4 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION

o



Shirle! Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 July 2018 5:41 PM

To: '‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)'

Cc "SUR"; "Mivitha (LKK Auto)’; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Subject: RE: ES59D / TP : SHBBST73E/LKK / DOA : 17/07/2018
Attachments: SHB B573E - Preli Advise. pdf

Dear Pei Li,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SHB 8573E,

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 July 2018 1:56 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: "SUR" <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ES59D / TP : SHB8573E/LKK / DOA : 17/07/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 18 July 2018 11:.08 AM

To: "admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com=

Cc: "ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM' <ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM>

Subject: O1: E559D / TP : SHBB573E/LKK / DOA : 17/07/2018

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD.
1




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

B e T s s e e S T ———

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 18 July 2018 11:08 AM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com'

Ce: ‘ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM®

Subject: Ol ; E559D / TP : SHBBST3E/LKK / DOA 1 17/07/2018

Attachments: SHBEST3E - PRS NOTICE n SAS.pdf; SHBB5ST73E - PRS FORM.pdf

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,

both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”,

Please conduct this survey request from PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD.

ADDRESS : 23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2

#01-02

SINGAPORE 486443
PERSON TO CONTACT »  GOH WEE DEK @ 6544 6682 / 6214 8880 EXT 68
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : SITI

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please note that our insured/insured driver has yet to e-file their SAS

for this accident. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle. Obtain estimate from warkshop
and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to
claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey

status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.
Attached is TP's 5AS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Thank vou

Yee Pei Li

Claims Assistant (Motor)
EF nsu & Pte Lig

5 Temasek Boulevard
M-01 Suntec Tower Five

singapore (38985

Z 55 B

MNebsite: wawaw.arqo. com, s

I '.:.L_-J;:_. 5 one IZ: the miajor insurance groups in -L:-'-rl'r..'-:".-.-' =Talsl _ rope. Worldwide ERGO is I":'T-T%#-"IEE"J in more than T-J countries
and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO s part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers



Date:
Dur Referance:

Your Referanca:

To:

18.07.2018

E 559D/5A/pl

SHB 8573E

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

Pre-Repair Survey (PRS) Acknowledgement

ERGO

Sent via Fax

or

Emall

weedek goh@preminctaxicom
gary.shi@premlertaxilcom |
vincent.chua@premiertaxi.com

ehicle For inspection; SHB B573E
Insured's Vahicle: E 559D
Date Of Accident: 17.07.2018 Lo N
i | = '}
We acknowledge receipt of your request far PRS an: 18.07.2018 % ofy A
et Lo ace o LT
i
In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessorfrom .
the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *. ¥ 1 kle
AIS Automaobile Inspection Services Ple Lid LBS L.B.S Aulo Consultants Pte Ltd
FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pre Ltd LEK LEK Auta Consultants Ple Lid
145 Infinitl Appraisal Service Ps Priority Services
1PK IP Knights Pte Ltd VAL Wicom Ltd

v Our Insured's driver has not reported the accident to us todate,

Your request for inspection does not have your client's GIA report, kindly forward a copy.

Your request for inspection does not have your client's cost of repair estimata, kindy forward a copy,

We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert snan upon receipt of estimate.

V. |others:  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - SITI
Prepared by: QL Qf__\ e Pei Li GRS 9184 claim Ergo.com.s
Signature: FAX : 68299247
fasessor attended workshop on:
Assignment Date: Date:
Assignment Time: Time
Inspector:

Remarks;

D Vehicle not available at the appainted date and time,

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Warkshop Acknowledgemant & Stamp,

Note: Our inspection i an o witheut edmission to lability basis,
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Enquire Transaction History
Transaction History Details

Log Date/Time:
Aszzet Type:
Assget ID:

Transaction Type:

Business Transaction
Referance No.:

Wehicle Mo,

Vehicle Type:

Vehicle Attachment 1:
Vehicle Attachment 2:
Vehicle Altachment 3:
Vehicle Scheme:

First Registration Date;

OCriginal Registration
Date;

Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Chassis No.;

Engine No.:

Metar Mo

Trailer Chassis No.:
Propellant;
Passenger Capacity:
Engine Capacity:
Power Rating:

Unladen Weight

Maximum Laden
Weight:
Primary Color;

Secondary Color:
Manufacturing Year:

Open Market Value:

Minimum PARF
Benefit:

PARF Eligibility:

Wa. of Transfer:

Effectiva Ownearship
DateTime:

COE Mo.:
COE Expiry Date;
COE Bid Category:

Actual QP/POP Paid
Amaunt

Lifespan Expiry Date:
Crvner 1D Type:

2B Oct 2013/ 09,25:35 Receaipt No.:
Venhicle
SHBASTIE Channel:
01.02 Register New Vehicle (A4)

20131028032535813411

SHBA5T3E
H10 - Public Transport Taxi (Motor Car)
Air-Con (Taxi)

Taxi (Company)

28 Oct 2013

28 Oct 2013

Kia

OPTIMA 1.7(A) DIESEL
KNAGM414MES447775
DAFDDH30B0ET

Digsel

1685

1584
2050

Silver

2013

$19,836,00

§7.401.00

¥

4]

28 Oct 2013 09:25:35
2013102801001085W
27 Oct 2021

$61.324 00

27 Qct 2021

Company

https://vrlIta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/hubAssetOwnerTrnLogDetail ?FUNCTION 1D=F...

Transaction Amaunt:

Cage 1 vl 4

AACCKDDT-AX2359-131028-000034

£73,800.00

AA Counterless - CYCLE &
CARRIAGE KI& FTE LTD

31/0ct/2013



17-Jul-18
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PREMIER AUTOMOTIYE SERVICES PTE LT
3 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2401 Dz

Sl [JAPURI“ 486443

TEL: 65446676 / 65446689 FAX: 6214151
CO. REG:200707743D qSI REG zm?ﬂmm

1

ESTIMATE REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA REGN N?: s_ﬁa'_fgs?':r; E

1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc

SINETT

1 set
1pc
1 set

| Dae .
[
Wheel cover < u

Rear bumper

Front n/s door % a MW‘L’* ;

Rear n/s door X

Rear n/s fender sticker =
n's door sticker =
Rear bumper clips X AN

Sundry new
To check wheel alignment - Rear

To dismantle / refit the inner garnishes, inner linings, inner
trims, cushion seat, carpet, etc to facilitate repairs.

To dismantte and refit the front n/s door inner component
into new shell door

To dismantle and refit the Rear n/s door inner companent
into new shell door

To labour charge for dismantle and renew the accident
damaged parts. Including knock-out, straighten, repair,
reshape and adjust of the rear n/s fender etc

To putty and spray painting on Rear bumper, rear n/s fender,

rear n/s door, front n/s door

To apply rustproofing on the repaired and replaced panels.

{ ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST )

THE ABOVE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR DO NOT INCLUDE

ANY UNFORESEEN DAMAGES.

Less 10%

5 116.00
g £96.00
5 791.00
3 765.00
$  2,368.00
S 236.80
$  2,131.20
$ 60.00
5 100.00
S 4800
$ 50.00 (2
$ 8000 G
$ 180.00 X
n
8 150.00 X &
$ 150.00 X
s 85000 Cfeo
(oo
3 e oo
s 20000 X MW
§ 479920

qoag W18 S

gt Pt

Alder vegrv Mﬂﬁ-
Eas @xﬂﬂﬁ - ?’)&3&’}-3"}

N _ :<
(T



' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

H; :,.. - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Libi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
- TEL. 6256 3561 FAX 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GS5T Reg. Mo. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURAMNCE PTELTD Ref : CS/EGI18013078/Gsd3n2
VAV
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date : 29-08-2018
SINGAPCRE 038985
Code . EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. E 558D Veh. Inspected SHB 8573E
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. E5590/SA/p Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 1B/07/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model KIA OPTIMA c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. KNAGM414MES447775 Colour SILVER
Odometer 487974 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification NIL
General GOOoD
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/65 R16 ACHILLES & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/65 R16 ACHILLES & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/65R16 ACHILLES B mm
L/H Rear Tyre 205/65 R16 ACHILLES & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE WVEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY, )
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  17/07/2018 Inspection Date 24/07/2018
Survey held at PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02 SINGAPORE 486443
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"VTHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b, Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR. 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 15-8607188-R Page Mo.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHB 8573E
Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition Estimate By
Qty i | Workshop ($)) (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|WHEEL COVER cuT 116.00 116.00
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE G96.00 .
LABOUR
1|FRONT N/S DOOR TO REPAIR SEE 791.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR N/S DOOR TO REPAIR SEE TES.00 -
LABOUR
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -236.80 -11.60
2131.20 104.40
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR N/S FENDER STICKER (SM) MECESSARY &0.00 &0.00
1|N/S DOOR STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 48.00 -
1|SUNDRY (SN} NECESSARY 50.00 10.00
258.00 170.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT-REAR. 80.00 60.00
TO DISMANTLE/REFIT THE INNER GARMNISHES, INNER WOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
LININGS, INNER TRIMS, CUSHION SEAT CARPET,ETC TO
FACILITATE REPAIRS,
TO DISMANTLE AND REFIT THE FRONT N/S DOOR NOT NECESSARY 150.00 =
INNER COMPONENT INTO NEW SHELL DOOR
TO DISMANTLE AND REFIT THE REAR N/S DOOR INNER |NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
COMPONENT INTO NEW SHELL DOOR.
TO LABOUR CHARGE FOR DISMANTLE AND RENEW THE B50.00 400.00
ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS.INCLUDING KNOCK-
OUT STRAIGHTEM REPAIR, RESHAPE AND ADJUST OF
THE REAR N/S FENDER ETC.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR
OF REAR BUMPER, FRONT N/S DOOR AND REAR N/S
DOOR
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING ON REAR 1,000.00 500.00
BUMPER REAR WN/S FENDER REAR N/S DOOR FRONT
N/S DOOR.

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18013078/Gsd3n2




' 74 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

:-'____l_!_l
TEL. 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page No.:2 of 2

Qty Description of Parts Condition ngl Our ‘g{"‘t‘d
TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING ON THE REPAIRED AND NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
REPLACED PAMELS.

2.610.00 1,360.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,999.20 1.634.40

RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I

[ | 1,634.40|

XING GUD QIANG
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18013078/Gsd3n2

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng . AMSOE AMIRTE, AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named cn the front page of this Report.




