T UBEAVE L #0225 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J0893% TEL : (065 62563361 FAX

Immediate Advice

To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 08.08.2018

Survey Details:

Date of loss 27-Jun-18
Date of appointment 18-Jul-18
Date of survey 18-Jul-18
Location of survey LEONG S5ENG MOTOR PTE LTD

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Third party
Vehicle number FBG 1827P
Make and Model YAMAHA FZ 16
Date of registration 26/4/2012
Excess NIL
Market Value 57,000
Parf Rebate 5724
Mett Loss $6,276
Repair details:
Initial Estimate | s 8,127.90 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts S 4,488 40
Check items (estimate) 5 2,110.50
Labour 5 580.00
Total ] 7,178.90
Lump Sum(if applicable)
|[Number of days for repair | 7




ompany Registration N WGOT 18R

I Al (1] 2 *A HIISNIBESTHILA, PAHE, SI&SG: SR E dikuil BB o aibs) i 25hlsn]l FAX

Remarks:

Mandate:
Liability(TP) 100%

Without Check Items|With Check Items

Proposed repair cost S 5,068.40 | § 7,178.90
Loss of use 5 27000 | S 270.00
Loss of rental MIL NIL
Loss of income MIL MNIL
LTA search fees ] 7.49 | 8 7.49
Others MNIL MIL
Proposed Total 5 5,345.89 | § 7,456.39




BI30/2018 Claim Portal
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Hsiao Tuns (LKKAuto) —

From: leongseng <leongsen@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 23 August 2018 3:29 PM

To: Taufikh [LKKAuto)

5 ] Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref. FBG 1827P *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18013059,T1 pb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLE 450R(AXA) & FBG 1827P ON 27/06/2018]

Attachments: IMG_20180823_0004.pdf

Dear Sir

Pls find enclosed marked estimate for FBG1827,
Kindly check and advice us on your recommended COR.

Pls find below are our working on COR

parts $5541.00
less 10% (5554.10)
54986.90
net items & labour $2215.00
sub total 57201.90
less 20% (51440.38)
total $5761.52

Based on our above working, we will like to request for Lump Sum repair of $5750.00.
Kindly consider and get back to us on your recommended COR.

Thanks

Csteo

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, August 8, 2018 11:42 AM

To: leongseng

Subject: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Qur Ref: CC4/ASM1B013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R{AXA) & FBG
1827P ON 27/06/2018)

Your Ref: FBG 1827P Without Prejudice
Cur Ref: CC4/ASMI1801305%/T1 pb3

Cear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R(AXA) & FBG 1827P ON 27/06/2018

We refer to the above matter.

Plegse be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear
and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.



Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of
repair o your client's vehicle,

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident,

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our survevor.
Please note that all finalisation subject insurer's approval,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement,”

Best Rerards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-3108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)



Hsiao Tuns (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAute)

Sent: Friday, 14 September 2018 9:46 AM

Tao: ‘lecngseng’

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18073059,/T1pba [ACCIDENT

INVOLWVING SLE 450R(AXA) & FBG 1827P ON 27/06/2018]

without Prejudice

Hi Mr Teao,

We refer to your below email.

For COR, recommended amount at L/sum $5,500.00 with 7 repair days.

# Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents|ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental
receipt) to us (LEK) for our necessary action.

Flease note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Plione: 742-93197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{g08a033)

From: leongseng <leongsen@singnet.com.sg=
Sent: Thursday, 23 August 2018 3:29 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R(AXA) & FBG
1827P ON 27/06/2018]

Dear Sir
Pls find enclosed marked estimate for FBG1827,

Kindly check and advice us on your recommended COR.

Pls find below are our working on COR



Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

From: leongseng <leongsen@singnet.comsg>

Sent: Friday, 14 September 2018 10:44 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Qur Ref: CC4/A5M18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLE 450R(AXA) 8 FBG 1827P ON 27/06/2018]

Attachments: IMG_20180914_0002. pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong

Thanks for your update,

Pls find enclosed our Final repair bill and LTA ins search receipt,
Kindly help to follow up accordingly.

Thanks

csteo

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, September 14, 2018 9:46 AM

To: leongseng

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Our Ref; CC4/ASM 18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R{AXA) &
FBG 1827P ON 27/06/2018]

Without Prejudice

Hi Mr Teo,

We refer to your below email,

For COR, recommended amount af L/sum $5,500.00 with 7 repair days.

" Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevani documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental
receipt) to us (LKK) tor our necessary action.

Flease note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 11:58 AM

To: 'leangseng’

Subject: RE: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Qur Ref: CC4/A5M18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SLE 450R({AXA) & FBG 1827P ON 27/06/2018]

Without Prejudice

Hi Mr Teo,

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $5,480.00(all-in),
Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s] in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-9197 | email: chewht@lkkapto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(g08913)

From: leongseng <leongsen@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 14 September 2018 10:44 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18013059/T1phb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R{AXA) & FBG
1827P ON 27/06/2018)]

Dear Hsiao Tong
Thanks for your update,
Pls find enclosed our Final repair bill and LTA ins search receipt.

Kindly help to follow up accordingly.

Thanks

csteo

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, September 14, 2018 9:46 AM

To: leongseng

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R(AXA) &
FEG 1827P ON 27/06/2018]

1



Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: leongseng <leongsen@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 October 2078 6:15 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Our Ref: CC4/A5M18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLE 450R(AXA) & FBG 1827P ON 27/06/2018]

Attachments: IMG_20181019_0006.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong

Pls find enclosed signed DV, LOD and authorised letter, we will mail original copies to your office shortly.
Pls help to follow up and arrange for payment.

Thanks

csteo

From: Hsiao Tong {LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, October 3, 2018 12:29 PM

To: leongseng

Subject: RE: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R{AXA) &
FBG 1827P ON 27/06/2018]

Without Prejudice
Hi Mr Teo,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with the following document to us(LKK) for
our necessary action: -

« Authorisation to Act signed by your client, ABDUL RAUF BIN YA'AKOP

Thank you.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080933)



From: leongseng <leongsen@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 12:35 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R(AXA) & FBG
1827P ON 27/06/2018]

Dear Hsiao Tong

Pls refer to your offer today,

Pls be informed that we are agreeable to your offer of 55680.
Kindly help to follow up accordingly.
Thanks

Cs5teo

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, October 2, 2018 11:57 AM
To: leongseng

Subject: RE: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R(AXA) &
FBG 1827P ON 27/06/2018]

Without Prejudice

Hi Mr Teo,

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $5,680.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

“please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice

engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter{s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4068933)

From: leongseng <leongsen@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 14 September 2018 10:44 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com:>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R(AXA) & FBG
1827P ON 27/06/2018]

Dear Hsiao Tong



Thanks for your update,

Pls find enclosed our Final repair bill and LTA ins search receipt.

Kindly help to follow up accordingly.
Thanks

csteo

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, September 14, 2018 9:46 AM

To: leongseng

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R(AXA) &
FBG 1827P ON 27/06/2018]

Without Prejudice

Hi Mr Teo,

We refer to your below emuail,

For COR, recommended amount at L/sum $5.500.00 with 7 repair days.

** Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documenits(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental
receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Flease note that dll the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties an this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
fram this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408937)

From: leongseng <leongsen@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 23 August 2018 3:29 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R{AXA) & FBG
1827P ON 27/06/2018)



Dear Sir
Pls find enclosed marked estimate for FBG1827,
Kindly check and advice us on your recommended COR.

Pls find below are our working on COR

parts $5541.00
less 10% (5554.10)
$4986.90
net items & labour $2215.00
sub total $7201.90
less 20% (51440.38 )
total $5761.52

Based on our above working, we will like to request for Lump Sum repair of $5750.00.
Kindly consider and get back to us on your recommended COR.

Thanks

csteo

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, August 8, 2018 11:42 AM

To: leongseng

Subject: Your Ref: FBG 1827P *Qur Ref: CC4/ASM18013059/T1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R[AXA) & FBG
1827P ON 27/06/2018]

Your Ref: FBG 1827P Without Prejudice
Qur Ref: CC4/ASM18013059/T1 pbd

Cear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 450R(AXA) & FBG 1827FP ON 27/06/2018
We refer to the above matter,

Flease be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parfies, the liability is clear
and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of
repair ta your client's vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident,

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Please note that all finalisation subject insurer's approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement,



In the event of new evidence being discovered or su bsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not boun d, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlament.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email; chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)

|‘u'ehicla No: SLE 450R (Insd veh) Maodal:
FBG 1827P (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |27/06/2018

YAMAHA FZ 18

Global Sum Settlement i ; | [X] Yes | [ 1 No

Repair Estimate L 8,127.90

Final Repair Cost 5 5,500.00

Loss of Use % 175.00 7 days at $25.00 per day
Rental (if any) . days

LTA / GIA Search Fee 5 7.45

Others: [ $|

Final Settlement Sum (GLOBAL SUM) - $ 5,680.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [ X] NO (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GlA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

B} For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability; (%) Assessed Liability (*:___ (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nof apply.

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No  BOLA Scenario No:

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) ]LEGNG SENG MOTOR PTE LTD |-. $|

5,680.0

NUR SHAQHLAH BTE ABDOL

WAHAB 06/11/2018

Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.

(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report! Bill (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

P P 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607196R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CC4/ASM18013058/T1pb3s2

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01
AXATOWERSINGAPORE 0658811

ATTN: KIAN CHUAN

Date: 05-11-2018

TR

Code: ASM

1

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SLE 450R Veh. Inspected FBG 1827F
Policy No. GA113445N1 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SEMOOMJ7 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KIAN CHUAN Assign Date 18/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model YAMAHAFZ 16 c.c 153
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2012
Chassis No. ME121C072C2030025 Colour BLACK
Odometer Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [110/70R17 METZELER 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre |140/70R17 METZELER 2 mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT AND REAR PORTION, O/S AND NS BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  27/06/2018 Inspection Date 18/07/2018
Survey held at LEONG SENG MOTOR PTE LTD
BLK 1008, BUKIT MERAH LANE 2
#01-08
ALEXANDRA VILLAGE
SINGAPORE 159762.
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 7 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AJE BA B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
g TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 109607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page No:1of3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. FBG 182TP
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =St np?g” {‘;il
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|HANDLE BAR (CONSISTENT) BENT 150.00 150.00
1|HANDLE GRIP (CONSISTENT) TORN 25.00 25.00
1|MIRROR (CONSISTENT) cuT 50.00 50.00
1|CLUTCH LEVER (CONSISTENT) cuTt 4500 45 00
1|AIR GUL (CONSISTENT) BROKEN 65.00 65.00
1|AIR COVER (R) (CONSISTENT) cuT 87.00 87.00
1|FUEL TANK SIDE COVER (COMNSISTENT) cuT 180.00 180.00
1|FUEL TANK CENTRE COVER (CONSISTENT) cuTt 160.00 160.00
1|SIDE COVER (L) (CONSISTENT) cut 185.00 185.00
1|FRONT FORK ASSY (CONSISTENT) BENT 860.00 BE0.00
1|FORK UNDER BRACKET (CONSISTENT) BENT 285.00 285.00
1|FRONT WHEEL RIM (CONSISTENT) BENT 380.00 380.00
1|FRONT WHEEL AXLE (CONSISTENT) BENT 95.00 95.00
1|GEAR PEDAL (CONSISTENT) BENT 78.00 78.00
1|FRONT FOOT REST (L) (CONSISTENT) cuT 50.00 80.00
1|CLUTCH COVER (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 220.00 220,00
1|OIL FILTER COVER & O RING (CONSISTENT) BROKEN 68.00 68.00
3|0IL FILTER COVER SCREW (CONSISTENT) BENT 15.00 15.00
1|OIL FILTER (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 15.00 15.00
1|ENGINE OIL (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 25.00 25.00
1|BRAKE PEDAL (CONSISTENT) BENT 98.00 a8.00
1|REAR BRAKE TIE ROD (CONSISTENT) BENT 64,00 64.00
1|FRONT FOOT REST (R) (CONSISTENT) cut 50.00 50.00
1|FRONT FOOT PROTECTOR (R) (COMSISTENT) MOT NECESSARY 75.00 -
1|MAIN STAND (CONSISTENT) BENT 120.00 120.00
1|REAR SWING ARM (CONSISTENT) BENT 320.00 320.00
1|SWING ARM BRUSH (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 75.00 T5.00
1|REAR SHOCK ABSORBER (CONSISTENT) BENT 380.00 380.00
1|REAR FOOT REST (R) (CONSISTENT) CUT 45.00 4500
2|TAIL COVER (CONSISTENT) cuT 370.00 370.00
1|TAIL CENTER COVER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 68.00 68.00

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18013059/T1pb3s2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

L ;" ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No; 199607198R GST Req. No. 18-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 3
Qty Description of Parts Condition vf::m:;?:n Our ﬁ:{“"‘d
2|TAIL BAR {CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 150.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR SIGNAL LAMP (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 45.00 =
1|REAR FENDER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 168.00 168.00
1|REAR MUDGUARD (CONSISTENT) cuT 155.00 155.00
1|REAR WHEEL RIM (CONSISTENT) BENT 450.00 300.00
2|REAR WHEEL BEARING (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1{REAR WHEEL AXLE (CONSISTENT) BENT 95.00 9500
1|REAR SPROCKET & CHAIN (CONSISTENT) BENT 70.00 70.00
1|REAR SPROCKET HUB (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 105.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -599.10 -546.60
5,391.90 4,919,40
NETTITEMS
1|ERP 1U (N) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 156.00 4
11U BRACKET (N) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 25.00 -
1|TOP COWLING (N) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 235.00 235.00
1|FRONT NO PLATE (N) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 15.00 15.00
1|FRONT WHEEL SLIDER LH (N) (CONSISTENT) MISSING 130.00 130.00
1|GEAR PEDAL RUBBER COVER (N} (CONSISTENT) cuT 15.00 15.00
1|CENTER COVER (N) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 120.00 120.00
1|RACING EXHAUST - FULL SYSTEM (N) (CONSISTENT)  |BENT 985.00 985.00
1|REAR NO PLATE (N) (CONSISTENT) BENT 20.00 20.00
1|0IL PRESSURE RELEASE VAVLE (N) (CONSISTENT) BENT 65.00 65.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -158.50
1,766.00 1,426.50
LABOUR
REPAIR MAIN FRAME. 450.00 300.00
TOWING - 2 WAY. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 .
LABOUR INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF TAIL BAR. 400.00 250.00
970.00 550.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,127.90 §,895.90

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18013059/T1pb3s2
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5,500.00

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref Mo, CC4/ASM18013059/T1pb3s2

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN

M.MATAI,L AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor

Automotive Assessor
DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the frent page of this Report.
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