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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 August, 2018 5:31 PM

To: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC/AR)

Cc: SUR; CS A Team; Admin A; Koo Yew Chung (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/AR & SC) 

(YewChung@smrt.com.sg); AutoSvs-ARC (Bus)

Subject: RE: Finalisation -  SMB49X (BUS/06/18/1023) - AIG

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 
Dear Catherine, 

 

We refer to the email below. 

 

Our surveyor have finalise COR at L/S $ $2,850/- @ 2 days. 

 

Please note that: 

• This e-mail is on ‘without prejudice’ basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your 

client’s vehicle. 

• The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the 

accident. 

• The days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor. 

• All finalisation is subject to our Principal insurer’s approval. 

 

 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 

Best Regards, 

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 26 July 2018 7:59 AM 

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC/AR) 

<catherineleesc@smrt.com.sg> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Koo Yew Chung 

(Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/AR & SC) (YewChung@smrt.com.sg) <YewChung@smrt.com.sg>; AutoSvs-ARC (Bus) <AutoSvs-

ARCBus@smrt.com.sg> 

Subject: FW: Finalisation - SMB49X (BUS/06/18/1023) - AIG 

 

Dear Thin Thin, 

 

CC3/AIG18013035/T1ub3 
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Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC/AR) <catherineleesc@smrt.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 25 July 2018 6:17 PM 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Koo Yew Chung (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/AR & SC) <YewChung@smrt.com.sg>; AutoSvs-ARC (Bus) <AutoSvs-

ARCBus@smrt.com.sg> 

Subject: Finalisation - SMB49X (BUS/06/18/1023) - AIG 

 

Hi Taufikh, 

 

Attached herewith our copy and your marked copy of the bus repair estimate for the case.  

Our finalised amount is $2,850/- @ 2 working days under lump sum repair. 

 

Please confirm the COR by return email ASAP. 

 

Thank you 

 

 
Best Regards 
Catherine Lee 
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
(Accident Repair Centre) 
DID: 6866 2669  Fax: 6368 5592 
catherineleesc@smrt.com.sg 

 
 


