Vic (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Ce:
Subject:

Attachments:

Dear Vic

e ————————— e ——

Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>
Wednesday, 9 October, 2019 2:24 PM

Vic (LKKAuUto)
Admin A

RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLZ2410H (REMINDER) LKK REF

CC4/AIG18013014/T1ha3

RENTAL INVOICE pdf; TAX INVOICE pdf; TP Insurer Enquiry pdf

Please refer to the LOD as attached.

Blease note we are claiming as below:-

COR 51227.54

TP Search Fee  52.00
LOR Se42.00
Total $1871.54

Thanks & Regards

Asthgj Tan
e HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
.f"'- 25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
‘;' - T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699

Follow us (@ huahong.com.sg

 fllin GG

From: Vic [LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 August 2019 9:13 AM
To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic [LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLZ2410H (REMINDER) LKK REF CC4/AIG18013014/T1ha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Ashley,

Kindly forward to us the LOD once available for our further action

Thank you



Auto
! !:{!‘{ Consuitonts
B dn BA B Ple lia

S1UBEAVE 1 #0025 PAY A U INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL © (0651 62563361 FAX : (065 67414108

Our Rel: CCYAIGIS013014/Tal

24" July 2018

HENG CHENG MENG
Block 285 Joo Chiat Place,
#03-01,

Singapore 427966,

Atth: Mr Heng Wee Siang
Dear Sir'Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP 3416A AND SLZ 2410H ALONG
SOUTH BUONA VISTA ON 13.07.2018

We refer 1o the above accident where we are acting for A1G Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid to
resolve the claim against you and/or vour authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken
up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish 1o further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement.
please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if vour
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Y ours faithfully,

Poh Kin, Chong
Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkin@|kkauto.com

c.C. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
fMotor Clatms Dept)



RELEASE VOUCHER

(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l. HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED (the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/l have

reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid LKK

AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
$$1.227.54 (Repair Cost), S$813.60 1 Loss of Rental/tise), §82.00 (Dishursement), for vehicle no.

SLZ 2410H that wis damaged pursuant (o the accident which occurred on L 3/07/2018 (date) along

SOUTH BOUNA VISTA ROAD tlocation) involving vehicle no/s SKP 3416A  This is pursuant 1o
the inspection conducted on 2Z707/2018 idute) w “the workshop™

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner HUA HONG PTE LTD (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no, SLZ 2410H make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have
full authonity to settle the matter on hiwher behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein

the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third panty claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining 1o costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SLZ
2410H (vehicle no.) as a result of the accordent

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this setilement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis

This agreemem s subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive junisdiction over any dispute arising oul of the same.

Dated this [T (day)of __ii0  (month) 2020 (year)
'aLLa \.'}t‘ e
Signed by appointed surveyor
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Y HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
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JTAX INVOICE

08 October 2019 WO201807-0001
HHTPCLAIMS 18-72

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

78 SHENTON WAY, #07-16

AIG BUILDING

SINGAPORE 079120

Aftn Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ2410H & SKP3416A ON 13/07/2018 ALONG BUONA VISTA RD AT
ABOUT 0100 HOURS

Insured : HUA HONG PTE LTD
Vehicle Registration No : SLZ2410H
Viehicle Make - TOYOTA
Vehicle Model : C-HR HYBRID 1.88 CVT
Vehicle Chassis No. : ZYX102114282
Policy No. : 508727220901
Date of Accident : 130712018 Type of Claim: Third Party
SN Quantity Description Unit Price 83 Amount S§
1 15 Rear Bumper Clip $ 300 § 4500
2 1  Rear Bumper Lower Gamish 5 472 40
3 1 Rear Reinforcemant $ 318.90
S 836 30
Less 25% § _(20007)
82723

To dismantie & change rear bumper, rear reinforcement, knocking & pull straight s 250.00
rear panel and all area affected by accident.

To perform wire checking $ 20.00
To spray rear bumper, rear reinforcement and rear panel 3 250.00
5 114723

™OSTS 8031
Total § 122754

(i
Authorised by Claims Dept

Co Reg. Mo 70090000 |  hughongoomag | GS! Reg No 200P00308M
Pape 1 of 1



HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

250 Sungel Kodul Stest 1 Sngopone 729332
Tet (65] 6441 7688 Fom: (45) 646) PEFF  Emol infolihuahong.comasg

@

TJAX INVOICE
31 July 2018 HH18-SLWE858J
Edmund Choo Kok Leong
Blk 709 Jurong West Street 71
#11-32
Singapore 6840709
Vehicle Registration No - SLwesse)
Vehicle Make : Toyota
Vehicla Modal z C-HR Hybrid
Rental Charges from 27/07/2018 to 31/07/2018 $§ 600.00
($150 per day x 4 days) 7% GST § 42.00

Total $ 642.00

This is a computer generated document and no signature is requirad.

Co. Reg No.200900309% | huchongcomsg | GATReg, Mo. 200900309M



HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
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VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT
oete: 2 111 iz'ﬁ\f VRANo.:  LZ2kip

Vehicle Rentsl Agreement made between ADrive Leasing Private Limited [MANAGING AGENT) and The Hirer and/or The Driver,
under the terms and conditions as set forth.

s P }_ Wy 3P ”-ﬁ' 1&g=" HIRER'S e et A 3 AR e ek i A
.l-”"'-l;';‘-g __“'- IH"-. PR e = .f-.n s ol g n.:iil?- 'L"E - g Tame £ '...L.',." -|-_-'-' .
[s 1 s . A L I | Fpay 4 E LR e
g mﬂ‘m'"u EDMUND CHOO KOK LEONG NRIC Mo, S7BI2695F | Gender MALE
BLOCK 709 JURONG WEST STREET 71 #11-32 5640709
(AS STATED IN NRIC)

CONTALT

DATE OUT ﬂ“i“‘f TIME QUT [0y HRS BLT“ 4. \

. NUMBER OF
MVALouRE | 8 |5T - (¥lbe 50 w| 661) oavisy/weekis) | H o dmfs
GRANDTOTAL | 5§ ﬁu,\.

REMARKIS)

PLEASE MAKE PAYMENT TO OUR DRS BANK LTD CURRENT ACCOUNT @ DO3-SAGa563

r—~ '
MMH HIRER'S m{i‘lm

=2, Fog ko, J00WOCR0T Feanoag sy | =17 Bmg wo. 20ROV -



Invoice Page |1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
m RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
lm 6 Raffles Quay #18-00,. Singapore 048580
ASSOCLATION

Phone: +85 8224 D010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Bam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Cur Raf No: GR-18-108472
Date of Request: 18/07/2018 Your Rel No: Onling Purchase
Hua Hong Pie Lid

250 Sungei Kadul Strest 1
Singapora T28332

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 16M07/2018

Enquiry By Yvonne Toh Yi Zhuang

TP Vahicle Na. SKP3418A

Accident Date 13072018

Enquiry Result

TP Vahicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tal. No.
SKP3416A AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid. 01/08/2017-31/082018 85-6418-3000
Thank You.

The images provided to you are lakan from the original reparts farwarded to thie centra by the mambars of the Ganeral Insurpnce
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no llablilty whatsoewver for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports of their images

This is a computer ganerated document and requires no signatune.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp... 16 Jul 2018



Invoice

Page 20f 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
8 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +85 8224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday 1o Friday 8am to Spm

GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-108472
Date of Request: 16/07/2018 Your Ref No: Cnline Purchase
Hus Hong Pta Lid
25D Sungei Kadul Street 1
Singapore 728332
Dear SiriMadam,
Enquiry Date 18/07/2018
Enguiry By Yvonne Toh Yi Zhuang
TP Vehicle No. SKP3418A
Accident Date 13/07/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%5)
TP Insurer Engquiry 187
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer genarated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official usa:
Data:
[%] GIRO [ | Cash [ ] Chegue

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp... 16 Jul 2018



