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/' HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
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Estimats Repair List

23 July 2018 HHTPClaims18-72

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Ltd
?BMWq
#08-18 AIG Bullding

Singapore 079120

Alin: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 2410 H & SKP 3416 A ON 13/07/2018 ALONG BUONA VISTA
RD AT ABOUT 0100 HOURS

Ineured ! HUA HONG PTE. LTD.
Vehicle Registration Mo ! SLZ2410H
Vehicla Make ! TOYOTA
Vehigle Model :  C-HR HYBRID 1.88 CVT
Vehicle Chassis No : ZYX102114262
Palicy No : S08TZTZR08-01
Date of Accident 1 13077018 of Clalm: Third Pa
SN  Quantlty Description Unit Price 5§ Amount 83
1 1 Rear Bumper $ 850.00 A
2 2 H&H‘BUmpirR&tﬂim{LHFRH] s 6500 $ 130.00 ¥~
3 15 Rear Bumper Clip s 300 $ 45.00 "4
4 1 Rear Bumper Lower Gamish $  8s0.00al~ 4724
5 1 Rear Reinforcamant < 520,00 ¢ bt 314
6 1 Rear Bumper Tow Cover $ 48.00 vn
$ 234300 | ®7%L-32°
Less 20% 468.60)257- )3 13,
$ 1.874.40
Tumm&mnmw.mmmmmam $ 800.00 25+
straight rear panel and all area affected by accident
To perform wire checking. $ 20,00 «—
P flemr bie b 25V
Tasmymm“.mmmﬂumwmrpﬂuh $ 600.00

$ 300440 %lf‘l_-',f-l"}'
TRGST § 21861 E
LI Auto Congyitants hence Tnul S  3311.01
: . “m“_. ] i | qliﬁ;ll,lf
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23 July 2018

25D Sungel

Estimate Repair List

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way
#08-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Altn: Motor Claims Department
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 2410 H & SKP 3416 A ON 13/07/2018 ALONG BUONA VISTA

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

Rodut Street | Singapore 729332
Tat (45) 4481 7488 Faxc [45) 4441 74FF Emall Infolihuahaong.com s

HHTPClaims18-72

RD AT ABOUT 0100 HOU
Insured :  HUA HONG PTE. LTD.
Vehicle Registration No SLZ 2410 H
Vehicle Make :  TOYOTA
Vehicle Model C-HR HYBRID 1,88 CVT
Vehicle Chassis No I X102114262
Policy No 5087272208-01
Date of Accident . 1300772018 Type of Claim: Third Party
S8/N Quantity Description Unit Price S§ Amount 5§
1 1 Rear Bumper $ £50.00 A%
2 2 Rear Bumper Retainer (LH/RH) 5 6500 $ 130.00 ™
3 15  Rear Bumper Clip $ 300 § 4500 "4
4 1 Rear Bumper Lower Gamish $ 650.00 af~
5 Rear Reinforcement $ 520.00 7
6 1 Rear Bumper Tow Cover $ 48.00 «
$ 2,343.00
Lless20%  § (468.60)
$ 1,874.40
To dismantle & change rear bumper, rear reinforcement, knocking & pull $ 600.00 25~
straight rear panel and all area affected by accident.
To perform wire checking. $ 20.00 —
(T o
To spray rear bumper, rear reintn:nimunt and rear paner flobe $ 600.00 <
$ 3,094.40
\w 7%GST § 216.61

Authorised by Claims Dep
Mrs Tan @ 9639 9195
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"Poh Kin (LKKAuto) .

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 23 July 2018 5:33 PM

To: Yvonne Toh'

Cc Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; assignments; 'jerleen@huahong.com.sg’

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE
SKP3416A AND SLZ 2410 H ON 13/07/2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG18013014/fa3

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC4/AIG18013014/fa3

Your Ref: SLZ 2410H

Dear Yvonne,

We refer to above matter,

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /
under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above
mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair
to your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.
And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor,

In the meantime, Kindly arrange for TP survey ASAP.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred fram this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Pah Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Hundler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Fhone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fox: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033]
T 7d 7

RSRER ST Sove the Eorth Print only when necessary:

1



«Pro repalr inspection requeat - SLIZ410M VE SHPIA18A (Of) DOA 13072018
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If youl have any SusrssToncETs, SeEss Wl s know

Tranie and regarnds,

Aanbiwemmreed Raur | Radwer |

A

Laprems Cipeng hai =sde i

&0 Tama Opwmiaorm | ALG Graren Servicmi

From: Yvonne Toh [mailtorponne@hushong, com.sg)

Sent: Tusscay, July 17, J018 5:12 PM

Ton Mithoosingh, Aashwesrjestiaur

Cex Tam, Lily (AEG)) Fang, Andy-5Y; dair, Baljt: Chin, Lee-Ying: Al Kastim, Mor Marisss; Mo [shab, Mond Trvar; Lim, Sheng Yang: Supremaniam, Darshens: Chan, Yoke Shi;
Aglan, Smmirdna; “Javesn Tang'

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING DUR IMSURED VEHICLE SORI4L6L AND SL2 2410 H O8N 13072018

‘W choose LEK Ayt Conpulam

Kindly advive an liabikty bafore furvey

Thank rou

Bagwi
Yvoreg T
Claime Dwparimem

&
Fram: Mithoosingh, Lavhwesnwetisur Chaibweenmatiaar Mithoosingh fay com»

Senv Tumsday, 17 buby 2018 &:20 PN

T clwirm @i hong com sy

€z Tam, Ly (RG] <idy Tanfag coms; Fong. Andy-57 “Rndy-5Y Fong@aig coms; Kar, Raljit <Raljit Kawreig coms] Chin, Lee-Ying <Les-Ying Chin@talg. com>; Abu Kantim, Noor
Martess eNoOIMariess AuKssn @ aig.coms Md lhok, Mohd imran <imren ishak @aig coms, Lim, Sheng Yang <bherg¥ang Lin@aiy coms, Sagramansm, Dershens

<Dasshene Suprarmaniam g coms; Chan, Yole Sh <yckashi chan@eg coms; Azlan, Syarawding <Syatairdine Agan ey, com>
Sabject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION « ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKP31 54 AND 5L22410W ON 10/07/2018

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
50 RUNGE] £ADUT STREET L WNGAPCRE 778307

T, GSd1 0GRS | F. 6681 3639 | huahong com g
EmeE N

Sithou Premcags

Your Refersnce SLEMI0H

Ot Reference J25601 2RRRSGO03
D Sip Vadaen

We sy 1o your Notice of Accident of even date.

We miend io conduch o prectegmir surery of the dostege b your clies)'s vour cusiome s ehicle jrntly with ymr cliss'your moeor waotkshop W propose o use e of the motor
wsirveyens ramed in i aached bt o conduct the jent pre- e sarvey as 8 singls join e

Name of Sarvevor tn-p.ng Name

Ken Wong AIT Asia Poeific Imurance Pre L1
Kumas Uthava Al Asin Pecific Insumnce Pte Ltd
Fong Soon Yee AlG Asia Pasific Insumnce Pie Lid
Lawrenee Mg Chin Kes Priority Services
JeiTrey Ong Lenj Kim Prionty Services
Timmmy Lee Priarity Services
EC Loal Autorobile Inspection Services Ple Lud
Fang Kioh Keen (Frankie) Formueam Adpustets Pie Lid
Mg You Han Formesm Adieser Pie Lid
Saon HanXin [Gary | Formigam Adjusiers Pre Lid

[ Thow Ba Xiong Formicam Adjustiers Pre |td
Chus Soo Teek (Benjamin) | Formicam Adjusaers Pre Lid
Kaluin Ang LKE Aums Consultants Pre Lid
King Cuo Qg LKK Autn Consuliants Pie Lid




Murcus Chisa LEK Auis Consultants Pe Lid
Muhasmad Taulfikh LEE Auto Consutants Pte Lid
Adnan Ling LEK Auio Consulisnis Pio Lid
ahamed Rasul LEK Alte Consubiants Pie Lid
Kenneth Kang LEK Aute Consuhiants Pie Lid

Pless lat ud know within twa [1) workmy days wheiber you agres 10 the appesnomest of sny of these molol ssrveyors we & siegle jomt expert, You may welect one or mote of
ithe listed momer surveyors. We will bear the oo of the pre-repair servey eamiml oot by the single ot expent

Thanes ana regaats,

Banbraweti et Bt i |

Wi

Espwwns Ciawrsd didociine ()

&5 Carme Qpsrsione | &G Snerea Sarvoes
IMPORTART NOTICE:

Tha information in this email [and ary ettachmenta] is confidentisl. I you ere not te intended recipient, you muit not use or diasernats the informetion. if you hees receied
s ermall in eetor, please immediately mtify me by "Reply” csmmand snd permanently delete the priginal and sny copied or prinfouty thereal Uthough this smell and any
sttachments are belewed 12 be fren of any viru or other defect that might affect any computer system into whach i i received snd opened, it is the resaonsibiiity of the recigien
1o mraure that it i varis free and no resconaibllity B sooepted by American international Groop, inc or it wheidisnes or effilistes sither pintly or severally, for any le o demage
arigng in @y way from its aee.,
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Mernmen e-Claims

Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Faitlgne

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Cuse MNatified Eat Submitted Ad] Assigred Ady Bpt Ad) Submitted s Austh'msd Status
o | 14201 2018 el $$1,147.22 | 551,147.22 Syritieny fr Saver
S hey et Ady e | tan satmates | | view Aot | tancel Case |

Main Heferance Claim Details
CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]
Insured: HENG CHENG MENG, 1D 5133607%]
Main y
Claimant: HUA HONG PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: Z00900309M
vehice Reg . 13072018 01:00 - ;59
sty SLZ2410H Date of Loss: |13 yonthe and 17 Days From LTA feg Date (Man Yr}]
Claim Type: | TP J 32560128885G uml ““""h"':‘“": ® | 2100384109 (Comprehensive)
Vahicie Reg Policy No
e SKPI416A : SD67TI3I09-01
{lnsusred): (Clalmant):
Excess:
Repairer: Hua Hong Pte Lid (Sungel Kadut) 250 Sungel Kodut Street 1, 729332 Sungel Kadut - Tel: 6760 8815 ( 6760 0539
Handling ALG Asls Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express] - Tel; 65-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Chan, Kian-Meng]
Insurer: Klanmeng Chanl Saig.com
Claimant's "
N s NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel!
Adjusier: LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6256-3561  [Mandied by MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID] .. [Final Rpt due
) 26/07/2018]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All |  Compese Case Mail |
There sre na makl for this case.
ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View Al | Sesrch Tasks | Creste tew Task | _tComolete |
Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Mo rasults.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 10/2/2020



Menimen e-Claims

unludbuun'-ul_l Llpk—:fﬂlﬂll Cnmnuﬂnl.ltbrl I.rphlclmj upm#ml

Claim Documents

*SLZI410H (32560128885G)
[SKP3416A]
TP
HUA HONG PTE LTD
Jul 13 2018 1:00AM
[HENG CHENG MENG]
Hua Hong Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

Letters/ Correspondences 1 per page «|| B
No | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ) [ Thumbrall[print
1 {Draft) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown Edn
Assassment Reports sperpege (<1 ©
tie | Finalized Cn AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) Thumbnall | Print
1 |38/07/18 09:34 wmm Clnimuni: HENG CHENG MM @ | oaa vt
Phatos/Images | vl
No | Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
T |37/06/1910:07 | Odometer Reading @ | wurs | A
2 |17/08/19 10:07 Ganeral View @ | woaws |
1 |17/06/19 10:07 | Genersl View @ | leeds | A
4 |17/06/19 10:07 | Chassis Mumber @ | edrs | A
5 |17/06/19 10:07 | Genersl View B | wedies |
& |17/06/19 10:07 General View 0| cades | B
7 [17/06/19 1007 | Genersl View 0| weirc | B
|8 [17/06/1910.07 | Genersl View 0| osrwc | A
& [17/06/1910:07 | Genaral View i Load G | BA
10 [17/06/19 10:07 | Genersl View O cors | B
11 |17/06/18 10:07 | General View 0| weaws | F
12 |17/06/19 10:07 Ganaral View ﬁ Load G | I
13 [17/06/19 10:07 | General View O | waaws | A
18 |17/06/19 10:07 Ganaral View 0| wedrs | A
15 | 17/06/19 10:07 General View @ | Loea s E;'
16 |17/06/19 10107 | Genersl View 0| wars | A
17 |17/06/19 10:07 Ganeral View i Load G | B4
18 |17/06/19 10:07 | General View 0| esrws | &
19 |17/06/19 10:07 | Ganeral View 0| cedes | A
20 |17/06/19 10:07 | General View @ | eaws | B
21 |17/06/1910:07 | Genersl View O | weaiwc | A
22 [17/06/19 10:07 | General View i Load 1rG | B
23 |17/06/1910:07 | Relnspection Phots @O v | A
24 |17/06/19 10:07 | Reinspection Photo 0| cadrc |
25 |17/06/19 10:07 Reinspection Photo 0| s | A
26 |17/06/19 10:07 Reinspection Photo 0| e | A
27 |17/06/19 10:07 Relnspection Photo 0| adiv: | A
28 |17/06/19 10:07 Relnspection Photo 0 | Loedies | B |
5 |17/06/19 10:07 Reinspection Photo @ | adws | M |
Documentation 1 per I“'I*_E A
o |Relabel/Reorder | LMK Auto Consultsnts Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
1 [17/07/18 20:01 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO AIG DD 17.07.2018 @ | icecror
2 |17/07718 20:01 EMAIL FROM AIG DD 17.07.2018 0 | oo roF
3 |irorns 20 HOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP + TP GIA REPORT a Load TIF
& |2307/18 17:52 LETTER TO O1 Load BOF
s |10/08/18 00:45 TP ESTIMATE - MARKED ) | Load PoF |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_... 10/2/2020



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Letters / Correspondences 1 per page E [l
Mo | Finalieng Dn | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thusmbnall | Print
& |10/02/2008.57 | WORKSHOP INVOICE - @) | toad FOF

i 16/02720 0B:57 Releass Voucher g Load PDF

a 10/0%/20 0B:57 RENTAL RECEIPT Load POF

- ] 10/0I0 D857 GIA SEARCH Load PDF

10 |10/02/20 08:57 LoD Load POF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | save | pro |

There are no document checklists configured.

Our Checkilst Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: [] Handling Insurer
fotr Remarks arw prvete uniems you show @ o siher partes
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR

Page 1 of |

TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
I\fthlch No: SKP3416A (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA C-HR HYBRID 1.8
SLZ2410H (TP veh) IS CVT (A)

| Date of Accident: | 13/07/2018

Global Sum Settiement [ - | [ ] Yes | [X] No

Repair Estimate - 3,311.01

Final Repair Cost 5 122754

Loss of Use - days at 50.00 per day

Rental (if any) - 51380 days

LTA / GIA Search Fee 8 2.00

Others: - 0.00

5

Final Settiement Sum 5 1.743.74

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

S\ )

BOLA Liability:

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenaric No:

Assessed Liability (*):
* Assessed Liability fo be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

(%)

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1} |Hua Hong Ple Lid - 1.743.14
2) : §
3) ' 8
10 Feb
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2020
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;

Medical Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_d...
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coregne 1ssso71sem)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3581 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG1B013014/T1HA3Q2

Date: 10/02/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. Policy No. 2100384109
Claimant i
Vehicle No : SLZ2410H Insured Vehicle No : SKP3418A
Date of Loss 13072018 Nature of Claim: P Claim No: 3256801288850
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLZ2410H
Make & Model, TOYOTA C-HR HYBRID, 1.8 5§ CVT (A) Engine No: 2ZRB4118B38
Reg Date: 26/04/2018 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: Z¥YX102114262
Colour: Silver Odometer: 20452 km
Engine Capacity 1797 cc
Market Valua/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (5%} Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steerning (Serviceable). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable); Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accidenl Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/60 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215/60 R17
Front Left Side: Bridgestone B mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone & mm
Front Right Side Bridgestone & mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone & mm
The sbove valuea reprasen! the remaing Hyre (Feacs depih
'COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %)
Parts 1.874.40 62722 1,247.18 56 54
Miscellaneous ltams 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,220.00 520.00 TO0ODO 5738
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S8) 3,094 .40 1,147.22 194718 6293
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 21661 B0.31 136.30 6292
Nett Amount (S$) 3311.01 1,227.53 208348 6293
+ Car Rental (4.0 x $§120,00/day + 7.00% GST) (55) 513.60
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 200
Nett Liability (55) 1,743.13
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 171072018
Date Inspected; 27072018 Inspectad AL Hua Hong Pte Lid (Sungel Kadut)
250 Sungel Kadut Street 1
Singapore 720332
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager; VIC ALPEH
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NOTE: Thia report represents our findings af the time and pisce of inapection siated harein. Such inspachion has been camed out fo the best of our
inowledge and ability but any oty KabiiTy under sy offer circumstances (s horaby arprassry axcluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Repair 850.00 FL =FL
2 2 *REAR BUMPER RETAINER (LH/RH) Mot Necessary 130.00FL *FL
3 15 *REAR BUMPER CLIP Necessary 45.00FL *4500FL
4 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH Cut B50.00FL  "472.40FL
5 1 *REAR REINFORCEMENT Bent 520.00FL *31B8.S0FL
[ 1 *REAR BUMPER TOW COVER Not Necessary 48.00FL *.FL
Fe=Franchise part. L=ListitemDisc.
Sub Total (S8) 2,343.00 836.30
- List ltem Discount on L lems 20.00/25.00% (S$) 468.60 208.08
Total Parts (S§) 1,874.40 627.22
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous items selectad,
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO DISMANTLE & CHARGE REAR BUMPER ,REAR Mew B800.00 250.00
REINFORCEMENT ,KNOCKING & PULL STRAIGHT REAR
PANEL AND ALL AREA AFFECTED BY ACCIDENT
2 TO PERFORM WIRE CHECKING New 20,00 20.00
3 TO SPRAY REAR BUMPER,REAR REINFORCEMENT AND MNew 800.00 250.00
REAR PANEL
Gross Labour Cost (55) 1.220.00 520.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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