Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Maonday, 24 December 2018 11:49 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Catherine Thia; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG 5102X (Ol
SNM18D03500C02/2) and SJZ 3192D (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI1B013003/Afa3) on
15/07/2018

Categories: clear

LKK REF - CC6/CTI118013003/Afa3
CTI REF — SNM18D03500C02/2 (GBGS5102X)

Dear Poh Kin

We refer to your email of 18 December 2018 pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $5,600.00.

We await your payment advice to enable Catherine to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 63896183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

alfred.toh .cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVFRSARY
In Singapore since 1938

Disclaimer ;

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte, Ltd Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If vou are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediarely.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 18, 2018 11:46 AM
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
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Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 18 December 2018 11:46 AM

To: ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’

Cc: ‘catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com’; ‘alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com’; Admin A

Subject: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG 5102X (Ol : CTI -
SNM1B8D03500C02) and 5JZ 3192D (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18013003/4Afa3) on
15/07/2018

Attachments: LKK ADJUSTMENT PHOTO.pdf; LKK INSPECTIOM REPORT.pdf: LKK RESURVEY

PHOTO.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LOD_ SJZ 3192D.pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18013003/Afa3
Your Ref:  SNMI18D03500C02

Dear Sir/madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING NOS. GBG 5102X (OI) AND SJZ 3192D (TP) ALONG
SLIP ROAD OF LOYANG AVENUE TOWARDS TPE ON 15/07/2018

We refer to the above matter.
Liability: Insured Driver collided into the rear of third party vehicle. Liability is down against our insured.

We did clarify with Insured(Mr Azali/PIC) the nature of the accident and They agree to settle and aware that
NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "Ho Beng Trading" at § 5,600.00(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair 512,245.42 5 5,000.00
2. Loss of Rental S 780.00(5130.00 x 6 days) S 600.00 (5100.00 x 6 days)
Total | 513,025.42 $ 5,600.00

**6 days recommendation for repair

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.



HO BENG TRADING

Block 3020A UIB ROAD 1

#01-323
Cur Ref : 54231920 Singapore 408714
TellFax: (65) 69664526
Your Ref . GBG5102X MR E92AETI2Es

Date 01* OCT 2018
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTELTD

J Anson Road #16-00
Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Dear Sirs,

RE : Accident Involving SJZ3192D & GBG5102X On 15.07.2018 Along Slip Rd Loyang Ave
Twds TPE ( PIE ) At About 14:00Hrs.

We are instructed by GIFT DESIGNERS GROUP ASIA to claim damages and losses against you
in connection with the above-captioned road traffic accident which our client's vehicle SJZ3192D
was damaged by vehicle GBG5102X driven by your insured at the material time,

We are instructed that the said accident was caused by your insured's negligent driving and/or
management of the vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle was damaged and our
client has been put to loss and expense, particulars of which are as tollows -

1) Repair Costs $ 5000.00
2) Luss of iental 6 Days $ 780.00
$ 5780.00

A copy each of the following supporting documents is enclosed -
1) Accident report of our client

2) Final repair bill

We would be grateful if you could let us have you reply soon .

Yours faithfully,

HO BENG TRAWW




ALk
L £4 CQ-T
Ml BA B Pte Lid

2] UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FANX : (163167414108

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18013003/Afa3

31% July 2018

AZ EXPRESS

Block 101 A Punggol Field,
#04-492,

Singapore 821101,

Attn: Mr Azali
Dear Sir'Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 5102X AND SJZ 3192D
ALONG SLIP ROAD OF LOYANG AVENUE TOWARDS TPE ON 15.07.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if vou have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Poh Kin, Chong

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkin@!lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
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HO BEMG TRADING
Ok 00133
Ubi A

Simgapse o JART
Blear =i, _ _ o
¢ S T e -
Accideut oo _ !:\S} ]M _1 III f' \. " k’( {fi} l/”l . N
Evoly iz Yehicie Nos ‘:"t“: __‘ “1 2 D _&“‘ {:; Jﬁ JX .
Al Eﬁ:‘_-:? "r:_\‘_ L ‘7 "’1 jh !"*"Jfll' x '_'II.F/I{": II"' f/f g /J

S
I /We il resistered owner idriver of vehicle registration no:
have tivolved (0 the above accident,

1MW bereby authorize Mys HO BENG TRADING  to commence repairs of the said vehicle
Forthie k.

¥

3z 32D

?}

e eree o assign the woole proceeds of my/our comprehensive/third parey claim o you and our
soliciloes to act on my/our behalf in respect of the above
mitter s if apoliceble my/our solicitors shall accept this as my/our irevocable authority to pay
e anoure as decmed compensated direet to vou after deduction of their costs on a Solicitor and
clizar basis

L o alutals 1o co-operate fully with you and our solicitors to ensurz that claim is successful.

Lo s authorize you to sign all discharge vouchers/indemnity forms and all necessary papers in
relatrin with the above claim in my/our absence.

Your boond co-Coerstion in this matter will be much appreciated,
Thank o,
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MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER
Policy Mo § DMCVSN175T7131704 Claim No : SNMIBDO3ISOOCOZSZ
Claimant : GIFT DESIGNERS GROUP ASTA
Amount i 855, 600,00

DOLLARS FIVE THOUSAND SIA HUNDRED GNLY

I/We agree to sccept the above mentioned amount to be paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries [/ damages

sustained by me/us threugh an acecident involving

Claimant Vehigle No. @ SJE 31920

Insured Vehicle No. £ EBGE 5102%
Date of Loss = 15/07/52018
Flace of Rccident + LOYANG AVENUE

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHIRA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.. I/fWe agree absolutely to
digrharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PIE. LTD. and/or

Insured MName : AZ EXPRESS
Driver Name » MOHAMRD ABDUL BAWNI BIN ABDUL AZIZ

from all clalms, ‘present or future In respecti of 211 loss,
sustained by me/us arising out of the sald acocldent.

injury or damage

I acknowledge that this payment iz made without sdmission of liability on the

part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (3INGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1) General Damages 53 -
(2] Cost of Repair/Excess 85 5,000.00
(3) Loss of Use/Restal/Eoerding 2 &00.00
(4) 'GIA/Police Reports/
Investigation Results/Search Fees 8% =
(5) Medical Reports/Experizes S5 -
(6] Survey Fees/F,T. Fees 55 -
(7) Cost including Disbursement 55 =
POWBT o o owy s oo e o 2 n S S wE 4k Gr o 5,600.00
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Claimant Name : "}“‘" L‘-"l,t' [I{hft-'« '&‘5\ ‘L\'E\' f‘; w NRIC No
=

Eignature : | Date
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HO BENG TRADING

Block 30204 Ul Howd 1 8 01-33 Singapore 408714
Tel : { 65) 69664520 HI: 92712214 Fax: (65) 690664510

Email :chris_ghanbebei hotmail, com

INVOICE

GIFT DESIGNERS GROUP ASIA Cate: 01" October 18
Bik J020A #01-33

Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408714

Accident date:15" JULY 2018
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SJZ3182D VOLKSWAGEN POLD 1.4

mcrrpﬁan: AMOUNT |

ump Sum repair cost as recommandod by $5.000.00
KK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor © Mr Adrian Ling

Towl] _ $5.000.00 |

S/DLRS: FOUR THOUSAND ONLY
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Pk sy A KENT-A-CAR PTE LTD
B Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #06-04 Bukit Singapore 415875  VHA No: 2624

Tel: 6315 8479 H/P: 9833 0807 Invoice No : [ (1 PL 1IN D 14.5 .
A8 VEHICLE RENTAL AGHEEHENT Hirer's Vehicle No :
3 PARTICULARS . .
Hasin1/CYIVCELYN CASSANGRY cllend, ook FpAPMCeNo: i 44577 ol 5
criNNo: S (1113618 : Bl ok £ ME:
& : /
miﬂul; “':: : I;'ﬂ Y 7oA PAYOH T 7_FRIGS € i yrhip yt
.if Al 51 0082/ Out : Date r6/7/i% Time: | 34 .
feme & Addrees of Employer: . HIRE / PERIOD EXPIRY Time:
Gcmpmbn: ) EIP' NDN-WAI'I.I'EFI HGESH 2oal [/
Singapore Driving Licence No: iy 2307 Ll CHARGES r.
Issue Date: : ___ Date of Birth: “'fl."'}:-  Daily 6 es [30 perday #76—0 = '
WO el s WP i toe Woeily s per week
ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULARS  Monthly as per month
Name: (asin1/C)_ Hours a@s per hour
NRIC/FINNo: ~ =
Address (Res): Extension @s

D - DENTS

INDICATE:

A - ACCIDENTS 8§ - SCRATCHES




