Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 November 2019 5:24 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLV2174K TP-CHINA TAIPING (DOA-14/07/2018) Finalised on a Without

Prejudice basis

Without Prejudice,
Dear Rasul,

We confirm COR @ L/S S$1,150.00 and 02 repair days.

Best Regards,

Vivian Tan

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Office: 65137748

Fax: 62513161

On Wed, 27 Nov 2019 at 10:51, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Vivian,

The reverse sensor not faulty. So the finalise amount is $ 1150 / 2 days lump sum

Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
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From: Vivian Tan [mailto:vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 25 November, 2019 2:31 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLV2174K TP-CHINA TAIPING (DOA-14/07/2018) Finalised on a Without Prejudice basis

Hi Rasul,

We don't have before paint photo, kindly finalised at Lump sum basis.

Best Regards,

Vivian Tan

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Office: 65137748

Fax: 62513161

On Mon, 18 Nov 2019 at 18:21, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Vivian

Kindly forward the resurvey before paint photos




Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-431
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From: Pegasus Engineering [mailto:ar claims@pegasusengrg.com.sq]

Sent: Saturday, 16 November, 2019 10:12 AM

To: SUR

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto); Belinda Sim; josephyeh@vendaengrg.com.sg; Lionel Chua
<lionelchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg>; Lawrence Sim; Seng Kee Wong

Subject: Re: SLV2174K TP-CHINA TAIPING (DOA-14/07/2018) Finalised on a Without Prejudice basis

Dear all

Thus far, we have vet to hear from you regarding our finalising for the vehicle SI.V2174K TO-China Taiping (DOA-
14/07/2018).

Kindly update us on the above matter.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Office: 65137748

Fax: 62513161



On Tue, Dec 4, 2018 at 11:38 AM Pegasus Engineering <ar claims@pegasusengrg.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Rasul,

Please find the calculation for your confirmation.

i’art by Part repair $1,672.00 and 3 days repair.

The attached copies of the documents for your attention.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Vivian Tan

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

74 Kian Teck Road S628800

Office: 65137748

Fax: 62513161



