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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAUtO)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 July 2018 2:08 PM

To: Yap Chee Ling; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); Janice Lee (LKKAuto); Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: GBB6778R | MT/1003228 (DOA: 15/07/2018) - MV Requisition

Dear Chee Ling,

The market value of GBB 6778R is $3K-$4K (Estimated) as at July 2018

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Yap Chee Ling [mailto:Cheeling.Yap@income.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 17 July 2018 11:57 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>; Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <JaniceLee @lkkauto.com>; Denise
Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: GBB6778R | MT/1003228 (DOA: 15/07/2018) - MV Requisition

Importance: High

Hi LKK,
Please provide the MV,

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No. GBB&E77ER

Vehicle to be Exported No
Intended De-registration Date 17 Jul 2018
Vehicle Make FIAT

Vehicle Model DOBLO 1.3NMITD
Primary Colour Blue
mManufacturing Year 2009

Engine No. 199A20003251536
Chassis No. ZFA22300005698143
Maximum Power Qutput -

Open Market Value $19,525.00
Original Registration Date 01 Oct 2009
First Registration Date 01 Oct 2009
Transfer Count 1

Actual ARF Paid $977.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date -

PARF Rebate Amount 50.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date 30 Sep 2019



COE Category C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years) 10

QP Paid $17,501.00

COE Rebate Amount $2,104.00

Total Rebate Amount $2,104.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Jul 2018

Thank you.

Yap Chee Ling (Ms)
Claims Executive
Maotor Insurance
T+65 6430 7893

WwWw. income.com.sg

(7 'Income
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Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s)
named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies
of it. Thank you,



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Yap Chee Ling <Cheeling.Yap@income.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 July 2018 11:57 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); Janice Lee (LKKAuto); Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Veron Chen
(LKKAuto)

Subject: GBB6778R | MT/1003228 (DOA: 15/07/2018) - MV Requisition

Importance: High

Hi LKK,

Please provide the MV.

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No. GBB&77ER
Wehicle to be Exported No
mintended De-registration Date 17 Jul 2018
Jehicle Make FIAT
Vehicle Model DOBLO 1.3MITD
Primary Colour Bilue
Manufacturing Year 2009
Engine No. 199A20003251536
Chassis No. ZFA22300005698143
Maximum Power Output -
Open Market Value $19,525.00
Original Registration Date 01 Oct 2005
First Registration Date 01 Oct 2009
Transfer Count 1
Actual ARF Paid $977.00
intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date -
PARF Rebate Amount $0.00
s Intended COE Rebate Details
<OE Expiry Date 30 5ep 2019
COE Category C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years) 10
QP Paid $17,501.00
COE Rebate Amount 52,104.00
Total Rebate Amount $2,104.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Jul 2018

Thank you. i
ST L

Yap Chee Ling (Ms])
Claims Executive
Motor Insurance
T+65 6430 7893
WWW.INCOME.COM.SE
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Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s)
named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies
of it. Thank you.
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2 Fiat Dobio )
Price Depreciation Eng Cap MEleage Vieh Type
Search Salection Fiat Dobls 2011 Ay Ay Avallwbbe
Fiat Doble Cargo Maxi 1.6M £11,800 57,300 fyr 12-Jul-2011 1558 ec 107,419 km am Awailable
Fuel Type: [esal
Caraful Owner, Well-Malntalned Accident Free On Time Servicng/Maintenance By Authonzed Warkshoo Mileage Shown Is As OF 26 Jua 2018 ST
Prsbeet: 16-7uk-2018 g5t 1011 Fiak Dobla, Fak Dably, Pk, Debio, s Fli
Fiat Doblo 1.3JTD 520,800 57,400 fyr 09-May-2011 1,248 ¢c Wan Available
Fuel Type: Digsal
Excellent Conditian, Low Mizage, Spacious And Comfy, Smocth Multi-jet Dresel, Well Maintzined, Mo Repair Needed, View To Balieve, Prica ——l
Negatiable, [n-House Lean Available, Call For Viewing, | FRET WG
AZWIN Bus Pre Lid
Posted Jul-2008  Tagd: 2011 Fi L, Fiat Doblo, Aar, Debk, Used Hat
Fiat Doblo Cargo Maxi 1.6M 521 800 7670 fiyr 20-May-2011 1,598 cc - Wan Available
Fuel Typa: Diesal
Aafiable Paned Van With New Paint Work, Call For Viewing, High Loan Available! —
QK2 Pte Lo
Posted: 04 3ul-2016 Tags; 11 Fat Dabla, Fiast Dobio; Fst, Doble, Usad Fal
Fiat Doblo 1.3)JTD $23 B0 £7,430 fyr 28-Sep-2011 1,246 cc van Available

Fuel Type: Dissel
Regular Service Dane By Preveous Owiner With Secord Proven, Van [n Tip Top Condition. You Can Just Take and Go Without Worry. Mo Repair

Meeded, Call Mow For View To Believe!
ABWIN Bus Pte Lio

Postist: Gr-hik-2018  Tags: 2011 Fiet Dobl, Faf Dablo, Fist, Doblo, Usad Fial
ar Buying Car Selling Car Dwnarshiy
3B
Aftermasket On The Move Lifesty ¥
Fiat Doblo Cargo Maxi 1,64 527,800 58,680 fyr 9-Sep-2011 1,558 cc 56 km an Available
Fuel Type: Diesed

Cheapest In Market! 1 Careful Owner, Seldom Driven, Low Mileage Regularly Sandcing At Agent, Price Negatiable, Pleass Call To Arrange A Test Drive,
56xm Mileage Only!

Mat Link Partners Pre Ltd
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Auto
Consultants

Pte Lid Company Regisiration No. 188607 196R

&1 URIAVE 1, #01/02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: (065) 6256 3561 FAX: (065) 6256 4315

Your Ref C MTAOO3Z2R
Qur Ref : CV/INC18012088/Bvs2 Date: 18" July 2018

NTUC Income Insurance Co-Operative Ltd
73 Bras Basah Road
#05-01 NTUC Trade Union House

Singapore 189556
Attn: Yap Chee Ling
Dear Sir/Madam,

RE: Vehicle No. GBB 6778R (Make : FIAT DOBLO 1.3MJTD Year of Registration: 2009)
Accident Date: 15/07/2018

We refer to your enguiry on 17/07/2018

Please be informed of the following:

Market Value (Est): S353.000/= to S$4.000/=
(as at July 2018)

Enclosed please find our invoice for your necessary action.

Yours faithfully,
Ll |-

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the
tront page of this Report. No liability or responsibility whatsoever, in contract or tort, is accepted to any third party who may rely an
the Report wholly or in part, Any third party acting or relying on this Report, in whole or in part, does so al his or her own risk.




