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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave { #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408533

Reg

TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
No 199607198R GST Reg Mo 18-9607198-R

Affillated to Federation |

nternationate Des Exparts En Automahile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Raf CC4/ASM1B012861/ub3
A oorarzon I
Code ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh,  SKG 5212E Veh. Inspected sGQ2111C
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 1710772018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
Genaral
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  14/07/2018 Iln:pw:tinn Date
Survey held at AUTO WHEELS MOTORWORKS PTELTD
NO 1 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT
#02-40 WCEGA PLAZA
SINGAPORE 858064
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




AUTO WHEELS

MOTORWORKS PTE LTD
WOEGA pLada NO | BLWT BATOR CAESCENT
o040 SINGAFORE 658064
ATTN: AXA INSURANCE DATE: 16/7/2018
VEHICLE NO: $GQ2111C
MODEL: LANCER
YEAR: 2008 - 2022
ACCIDENT DATE: 14/7/2018
TYPE OF CLAIM: TP CLAIM
ESTIMATION CLAIM ADVISOR:  LOUIS ONG (91928963)
EMAIL: loubsongautowheels@yahoo.com
DESCRIPTION arr LIST PRICE
PARTS
REAR BUMPER 1 $ 130k
REAR BUMPER CLIPS 10 5 30.00 a8
REAR BUMPER RETAINER | 2 5 94,80 LU- w7, K4 vp
LH TAILLAMP 1 $ 564.20 <ol
LH REAR FENDER 1 RESTORE  7y|y/
TOTAL: § 1,408.30
DISCOUNT 10%: $ 140.83
s 1,267.47
S/NET PRICE
REVERSE SENSOR 1 5 25000 X oy
2 250.00
- e
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AUTO WHEELS

MOTORWORKS PTE LTD

WCEGA PLAZA NO 1 BURIT BATOX CRESCENT

2040 SINGARORE £58064
LABOUR PRICE

LABOUR FOR FACILITATE REPAIR - REAR $ 80000 Lo=
TO RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS - REAR BUMPER 5 30000 Lae
TO RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS - LH REAR FENDER B 30000 Zow
RUST PROOFING s 80.00 2o 2c
SUNDARIES INA 5 5000 20
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR TRIM FOR FACILITATE REPAIR 5 250.00 A
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REVERSE SENSOR s 100.00 3o
TO CHECK AND RECONNECT ALL NECESSARY WIRING 5 50.00 30
TOTAL: § 1,930.00
TOTAL: § 3,447.47
7%RGST: § 241.32
s 3,688.79
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TR018 Claim Portal

LEE AUTO CONSLUITANTS FTELTD (TP = Menu

< Service Request Details

Claim
SBMO0CL

Reterence
None #*

Loss Date 13 (J‘{'li}‘% L 30
July 14, 2018 '
wn Y

Request Cate
July 17, 2018

Due Dati
July 24, 2018

Vendor Mame
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

Type af Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perform service

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
5GQ2111C

Make
TPVD MITSUBISHI

hitps-i/vp.smariclaims axa com sg/claim-portalhtmlfindex-vendor-service-requests himid/sarviceraquests/?serviceRequestNumber=57858



71712018 Claim Portal

) Mode
LANCER

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

LIM YONG KUEI

52A LORONG AH SO0, 534171, Singapore
96707435

tongkuei@hitmail.com

Claim Handler

LOH Cynthia
6568804843
cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

viessages Invaices History Documents Assessment Metrics Motes

ntips:/ivp.smanciaims.axa.com.sglclaim-portalhtmifindex-vendor-service-roquests himlifsarvice-requests/?sarvice RequestNumber=57458



Vic (LKKAuto)

e e

From: Louis Ong <louisongautowheels@yahoo.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 November, 2018 8:56 AM

To: Vie (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: Re: Finalize for vehicle SCQ2111C lumpsum $1,600 with 3 repair days LKK REF
CC4/ASM18012961/T1hb3

Attachments: DV1.PDF

Hi Vic,

Thanks.

The above attachment is the DV.
Thanks

Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD
Louis Ong
91028963

On Monday, 26 November 2018 08:49:30 AM +08, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpesh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Louls,

The owner will sign the DV but payment will be forwarded by AXA to the workshop.

Thank you,

Rest Repards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Lid

PMhone: 6841-2096 | email; vicalpeh@lkkuyts com | fnx: 67414108



filk 31, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, ¥02-25 | S{408933)

YT e

=57 Suve the Earth, Print only when necessary.

¥

This &-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient Is prohibited, and may be a violation of law If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mall and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any copies thereof Thank you.

From: Louis Ong [mailto:louisongautowheels@yahoo.com]
Sent: Saturday, 24 November, 2018 1:59 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: Re: Finalize for vehicle SCQ2111C lumpsum $1,600 with 3 repair days LKK REF
CC4/ASM1B012961/T1hb3

Hi Vie,

The DV do not indicate our company name. Wil the cheque pay to the owner?

Flease advise?

Thanks

Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD
Louis Ong
91928963

On Fri, 23 Nov 2018 al 15:40, Louis Ong

<louisongautowheels@yahoo.com> wrote:

Hi,

\We agreed the amount

Thanks



Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD
Louis Ong

81928963

On Frnday, 23 November 2018 03:36:20 PM +08. Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Louis,

We refer further to the below email.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our
Insured's part, we have our principal’'s mandate and we propose below amount to setlle your client's claim:

Cost of Repair (w/gst) § L712.00

Loss ol Use ($60 x 3 days) 5 180.00

GlA Search Fee - — 1]
TOTAL S 189945

It agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV and forward a copy to us for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to AUTO WHEELS MOTORWORKS PTE LTD.

Thank you



"Plaase note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice
basis. and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms
of sieh settlement should also not be disclosed in any other ralated matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made
in respect of this present matter is made solely o resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made fo this offer or
any settlement arising from this offer in any ather refated matters.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultanis Pte Lid

Pl 6841-2006 | emall: viealpehiaikbkauto com | fox: 674 1-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F RIS e
Teesme s mem o Save the Earth. Print only when necessiry.

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged malerial, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
urintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copias thereof. Thank you.

From: Louis Ong [mailto:louisongautowheels@yahoo.com

Sent: Thursday, 25 October, 2018 8:31 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Ce: SUR: Denise Tay (LKKAuto), Taufikh (LKKAuto), CS A Team

Subject: Re: Finalize for vehicle SCQ2111C lumpsum $1,600 with 3 repair days

Hi Thin thing,

The above attachment is our LOD, Tax invoice, LTA Seacrh fee and LOA.

Breakdown
| Cost of Repair ($1,600 + 7% GST) 55 1,712.00
2, Loss of Use ($100 x 3 COR days) 58 300,00
< 8 Third Party Insurer Enquiry Fee (§7.00 + 7% G5T) S$ 7.45



Toil 55 201945

Flease chack and revern.

Thanks

#Aulo Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD

Louis Ong

81828563

On Wednesday, 24 October 2018, 9:18:15 AM GMT+8, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@llkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE'

SAVE ASTO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

VWe refer to the email below

Our surveyar have finalise COR at § 1,600.00 - 3 days

Please note that:

= All finalisation is subject to our Principal insurer's approval.

+ This e-mail is on ‘without prejudice’ basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client's vehicle.

« The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident.

» The days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our
surveyor,



“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be
construed as an admission of liability on our part andior that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms
of aur without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor
should it be binding in any other related claims,”

Hesl Regards.

Thin Thin Hiaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd
Phone: B841-2360 | emall thinthin@|lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

filk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4088323

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 9:13 AM

To: Louis Ong <louisongautowheels@vyahoo com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkauto com>: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto com>
Ce: SUR <sur@ikkauto com>

Subject: RE: Finalize for vehicle SCQ2111C lumpsum $1,600 with 3 repair days

Dear Louls,

Thank you for your email

Dear Thin Thin/Taufikh,

CCA/ASM18012961/Tub3

Hest Regards,



[lenise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phote: 6258-3561 | email: denisatay@kkauto.com | fax: B2568-4315

dlk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408833)

From: Louis Ong <louisongautowheels@yahoo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 8:23 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Cec: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Finalize for vehicle SCQ2111C lumpsum $1.600 with 3 repair days

Hi Taufikh,

Can help to close,

Mo Supplementary.

Thanks

Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD

Louis Ong

41928963

Hi Taufikh,



'-:‘.an help to finalize this vehicle SCQ2111C lumpsum $1,600 with 3 repair days.
No Supplementary.

Thanks

Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD

Louis Ong

51928963
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AUTO WHEELS

MOTORWORKS PTE LTD

25" OCTOBER 2018

AXA INSURANCE

Subject: Accident between 5602111C and SKG5212E(TP) on 14/7/2018 Along Woodlands

Ave 2

We refer to the above case.
We are instructed by our client to file claim for the damages against your insured,

Our client has suffered loss and damage as a result of your Insured's negligence in the
driving of vehicle No. 56Q2111C

We quantify our client’s claim as follows:

1. Cost of Repair (51,600 + 7% GST) 5% 1,712.00

2. Lossof Use (5100 x 3 COR days) 5% 300.00

3. Third Party Insurer Enquiry Fee 55 7.45
($7.00 + 7% GST)

Total L33 2,019.45

We hereby append the following relevant documents for your perusal:

I Repair Bill Tax Invoice
il Third Party Insurer Enquiry Tax Invoice

Please let us know within the next 7 days from the receipt of this letter, whether you are
prepared to accept all the above amount

Best regards,

Louis Ong

Motor Claims Officer

Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD

Tel 19192 8963

Email : louisongautowheels@yahoo.com



Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

e ———————————————————————— e ——

From: Thin Thin [LEKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 6:29 PM
To: ‘vongkuei@hotmail.com’
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 5212E AND SGQ 2111C ALONG WOODLANDS AVE 2 ON
14/07/2018
! .I{ !‘.,.' .Atgfuunﬂnr:
ddn BA B P Uit

SN AVE L #0025 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAIMORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX : (065) 61564315
18 AUGUST 2018

LIM YONG KUEI (LIN YINGGUI)
Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18012961/ub3
YOUR REF : SKG 5212E

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKG 5212E AND SGQ 2111C ALONG WOODLANDS AVE 2 ON 14/07/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s AUTO WHEELS MOTORWORKS PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner
of SGQ 2111C against your motor insurance policy.

Hasing on the circumstances of the accident reported by both parties, we are of the opinion that we cannot be
absolved from liability.

Flease be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your
policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded
under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party
claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 07 days from the date
of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to us and acknowledged by us.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
thinthin@|Ikkauto.com within 07 days from the date of this letter_if not provided at our reporting centre. The

list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)



« If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep
us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Th'!rd
Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AXA’s prior
knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2360 or emall us at
thinthin@lkkauto.com

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.
Yours sincerely

THIN THIN HLAING

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
DID: 6841 2360

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: thinthin@lkkauto com

Ce AXA Insurance Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



AUTO WHEELS

MOTORWORKS PTE LTD

NO. 1 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT #02-40 WCEGA PLAZA SINGAPORE 658064
LETTER OF AUTHORITY

iwe., IMRAN BIN MOHAMED .owner of _SCG2111C (vehicie no)

hereby authorize AUTO WHEELS MOTORWORKS PTE LTD to act on my/our behalf with

respect to my/our claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use for my vehicle no.
SCG2111C that was damage pursuant to the accident which occurred

involving with the vehicle no. __ SKG5212E

I/We further authorize AUTO WHEELS MOTORWORKS PTE LTD to have full discretion to
Setile my/our above mentioned claim in a8 manner that they deem fit and to sign any discharge
voucher or receive any payment on my/our behalf further to the settlement of my/our claim with
payment cheque/s being made in favour of AUTO WHEELS MOTORWORKS PTE LTD.

IWe further acknowledge that any settlement that AUTO WHEELS MOTORWORKS PTE LTD
may reach on my/our behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis

insofar as the driver / owner / insurers of all vehicle/s is concerned.

- I = r
Date: v 2
Name: Tmgdyy v mepAmE
Company stamp / NRIC No: 3 755412

¢ S

Signature of claimant: e




M redefining / insurance

CLAIM REF : SEMO00OL
INSURED : LIM YONG KUEI (LIN YINGGUI)

DISCHARGE

we/l, wm NRIC Ham hereby agree to accept the sum of dollars ONE

oS D : . (551.899.45) paid to
us.l'me bv AKA IH!I.IRAHEE FTE LTD as *FuJI and ﬁnai settlernent of all claims of whatever kind
Including damages for personal injuries and damages to property that we/l may have against the
sald AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured or the driver of motor vehicle no. SKG 5212E as a
result of an accident along WOODLANDS AVENUE 2 on 14/07/2018 of which we/l were/was the
driver/ owner/ hirer/ passenger/rider/pillion/ insurer af motor vehicle no. 64 2111C,

‘We/l hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claimis) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. 5KG 5212E in connection directly or
indirectly with the sald accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/| hereby declare that we/) are/am the person(s) entitled to recsive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect of this settlement.

It Is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsoever
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SKG 5212E.

™ (\

Dated this day of 2018
4

Claimant’s Signature Far
NRIC no./ Company Stamp S 15Uy ¢
Occupation/ Business
Address . BUe 11y guiat 0ATE BT A § gizbo slfranz)
Telephone No. . KlLoei7il
Witness's Name : Louis @ '&j

Witness's Signature

=y
Witness's NRIC No. $31328 3582

ALY Insurance Fie Lid (Company Reg. Mo 199903512M)
8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Towsr, Sigapore 068811

Customer Cantre #8101

Tak +65 6880 4885 Fax: +£5 6338 . * The contenis . nus document apply to vahicie
el +65 Fax: +£5 2522 WeDBITE: www BXA.COM.8 dsmagee ~aly All personal injuries and damages

ar |5|n; inerafrom are excluded from the ambil
shcation of this document.”




AUTO WHEELS MOTORWORKS PTE LTD
No 1 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT

#O2-40 WCEGA PLAZA
SINGAFORE 658064
Irvolce Date Tel & Fax; 65795 4101
TAX INVOICE 25 Oct 2018
Imvolce Number
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD INV-034106
Referance
MITSUBISHI LANCER - 5GQ
2111 ¢
UEN [ GST Reg. No.
201226886H
Description Quantity Unit Price Tax Amount 5GD
LUMPSUM REPAIR FORSGO 2111 C 1.00 1,600.00 i 1,600.00
Subtotal 1,600.00
TOTAL SALES GAT ™% 112.00
TOTAL 56D 1,712.00

Due Date: 25 Oct 2018
Received In Good Order & Conditian
Goods 5old Are Not Refundable/Return

** Any defects or unsatisfied conditions after servicing are to be Informed within THREE (3] DAYS fram DATE OF INVOICE.

** Services rendered will be taken as accepted if no feedback Is recelved within THREE (3) DAYS from DATE OF INVOICE.

** Interest rate of 5% per month, calculated on a dally basis, Is levied on payment for OVERDUE AMOUNT(s)/ACCOUNT(s) owing to Auto
Wheels MotorWorks Pte Ltd after SEVEN (7) DAYS from DATE OF INVOICE.

** Chegue should be crossed and maks payable to "AUTO WHEELS MOTORWORKS PTE LTD"




and Trae \l-.-.--R‘,_._-} i

Land Transport Autharity

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0008529-2

Receipt No.  ITNET-00000-180716-001988
Pravious Recaipl No.

S/N Item Description/
::lh'lln’rnmmﬁnn Reference
Result of Insurance Enguiry - SKG5212E
As at 14 Jul 2018/20:00:00
Insurance Co: AXA INSURANCE FTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SKG5212E
Enquiry Fee
20180716171551238354

Prnt Date/Time
Receipt DateMime

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Sub-Total
Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable
Paid By
oooooooooxB429
Total
Cash Change
Tendered Amount
Excass Refuncable Amount

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are

Before Amount
GST (S$) (s%)
7.00 048
T.00 049
7.00 D48
Credit Card: Visa
MasterCard

16 Jul 2018/ 1T:16:42
16 Jul 2018 / 17:16:30

745

T48
T.AQ
0.04
745

745
745
0.00
745
0.00

good and promptly settled by the payment service

provider | financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT EREAKDOWN)
[Unhlch No: PHG 521ZE {(Insd veh)| Model: ITSUBISHI LANCER 1.8
[sGQ 2111C (TP veh)

| Date of Accident: [14/07/2018

Global Sum Settlement I | [ 1 Yes [X] No

Repair Estimate - 3,688.79

Final Repair Cost s 1,712.00

Loss of Use i 180.00 3days at $60.00 per day
Rental [if any) 5 0.00 days

LTA / GIA Search Fes 5 7.45

Others |: $| u.uu]

Final Settlement Sum - 1 1,859 .45

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [X ] NO (Kindly indicate
Delow)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop; Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable Y :
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: OLA Applicable: Yes/ No  BOLA Scenario No

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (7). %)
* Assessad Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply,

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) JUTO WHEELS MOTORWORKS PTE LTD % < 1,8984
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 131272018
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
(Final Repalir Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Repaort! Bill (if any)



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4215
Reg MNo: 188607T188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

Affilinted to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Ref CC4/ASM180128681/T1hb3g2
AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 068811 pale TR12208 H ‘l“‘”'”"ll“ll
ATTN.CYNTHIA LOH Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh,  SKG 5212E Veh. Inspected SGQ 2111C
Policy No. VA1/GA179040 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SBMODOJ Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 17/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI LANCER 16M c.c 1584
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2007
Chassis No. JMYSNCS3ATUDO5015 Colour BLACK
Odometer 176038 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General clalaln]
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[205/50 R16 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Front Tyre [205/50 R16 GOODYEAR B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/50 R16 GOODYEAR 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre  [205/50 R16 GOODYEAR 8 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  14/07/2018 Inspection Date 26/07/2018
Survey held at AUTO WHEELS MOTORWORKS PTE LTD
NO 1 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT
#02-40 WCEGA PLAZA
SINGAPORE 858064
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
31 Ubi Ave 1 201-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6258 1561 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg MNo: 190607198R GST Aeg. No. 19-9807188-R Page No.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGQ 2111C
Qty o G rte Condition | o o | (5
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 719.30 719,30
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
Z2|REAR BUMPER RETAINER (COMSISTENT) NIS NECESSARY / 94 80 47.40
Qs NOT
NECESSARY
1|LH TAILLAMP (CONSISTENT) cuT 584.20 564 20
1|LH REAR FENDER (CONSISTENT) (NPA) NOT NECESSARY
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -140.83 -136.09
1,267 47 1.224 81
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSOR(SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT MECESSARY 250.00 -
1|SUNDARIES (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 50.00 20,00
300.00 20.00
LABOUR
LABOUR FOR FACILITATE REPAIR -REAR, 800.00 300.00
TO RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS-REAR BUMPER. 300.00 200.00
TO RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS-LH REAR FENDER. 300.00 200,00
RUST PROOFING. 80.00 20,00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR TRIM FOR FACILITATE NOT NECESSARY 250.00
REPAIR
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REVERSE SENSOR . 100.00 30.00
TO CHECK AND RECONNECT ALL NECESSARY WIRING. 50.00 30.00
1,880.00 TBO.00
GRAND TOTAL - 344747 2,024.81
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMF SUM REPAIRS 1,600.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report RefNo. CC4/ASM18012961/T1hb3qg2
i 8
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor

Automotive Assessor

MECLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report s made saisty for (he wse and beretil of the Cliant nemed on (5 front pege of this Repor.
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