Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Louis Ong <louisongautowheels@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, 25 October, 2018 8:31 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAuto); CS A Team

Subject: Re: Finalize for vehicle SCQ2111C lumpsum $1,600 with 3 repair days
Attachments: LOA.pdf; LOD.pdf; LTA Search.pdf; TAX INVOICE.PDF

Hi Thin thing,

The above attachment is our LOD, Tax invoice, LTA Seacrh fee and LOA.

Breakdown:
1. Cost of Repair (51,600 + 7% GST) SS 1,712.00
2. Loss of Use ($100 x 3 COR days) SS 300.00
3. Third Party Insurer Enquiry Fee ($7.00 + 7% GST) SS 7.45
Total ) 2,019.45

Please check and revert.
Thanks
Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD

Louis Ong
91928963

On Wednesday, 24 October 2018, 9:18:15 AM GMT+8, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin @lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the email below.

Our surveyor have finalise COR at $ 1,600.00 - 3 days.



Please note that:

e All finalisation is subject to our Principal insurer’s approval.

e  This e-mail is on ‘without prejudice’ basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your client’s
vehicle.

e The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.

e  The days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 9:13 AM

To: Louis Ong <louisongautowheels @yahoo.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin @lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalize for vehicle SCQ2111C lumpsum $1,600 with 3 repair days

Dear Louis,

Thank you for your email.

Dear Thin Thin/Taufikh,

CC4/ASM18012961/T1ub3




Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay @lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Louis Ong <louisongautowheels @yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 8:23 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh @lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Finalize for vehicle SCQ2111C lumpsum $1,600 with 3 repair days

Hi Taufikh,

Can help to close.

No Supplementary.

Thanks

Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD

Louis Ong

91928963



On Friday, 21 September 2018, 7:57:48 PM GMT+8, Louis Ong <louisongautowheels @yahoo.com> wrote:

Hi Taufikh,

Can help to finalize this vehicle SCQ2111C lumpsum $1,600 with 3 repair days.

No Supplementary.

Thanks

Auto Wheels Motorworks PTE LTD

Louis Ong

91928963



