Asher S"E (LKKAuto)

From: Joyce Foo <joyce foo@gbe.com>

Sent: Friday, 15 February 2019 2:46 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuUto)

Subject: FW!: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: TP f OUR CLIENT SLHS5358B DOA: 10/07/2018 POLICY
NO. D17MTPV01016659 YOUR INSURED SJX8053A

Attachments: TP LOD.pdf; Wark Chart.pdf; LKK Resurvey Photo.pdf; LKK Survey Photo.pdf; LKK

Adjustment.pdf; LKK Inspection.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Your ref : VC011733
Our ref : CC6/QBE18014618/Keb3q2

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.

Please proceed to settle as advised.

Thanks & Best Regards

Joyce Foo
Senior Assistant - Claims
QBE Asia Pacific — Singapore

(QBE Insurance iSingapore) Pte Ltd
Phaone: +65 6477 1184

Email: jovce foo@gbe.com

Visit us on the web at www gbe com sg

Wecreate insurance solntions for

_ -ﬁlshi_eéﬂns&f" | '
.- Construction

From: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 14 February 2019 3:30 PM

To: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@qbe.com=

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: TP / OUR CLIENT SLH53588 DOA: 10/07/2018 POLICY NO. D17MTPV01016659 YOUR
INSURED SIXB053A

Your ref: VC011733



Our ref : CC6/QBE18014618/Keb3q2

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter,

The said chain collision invalved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the last vehicle.

In accordance to the MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle’s claim at 100%.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY" at 530,841.60 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

1, Cost of Repairs

2. Loss of Rental (39days x $130)

3. LTA Search Fee
4. Towing Fee

5. Medical Fee
Total

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

MARKET VALUE : 565,000
LTA REBATE : 536,330
NETT VALUE : 528,670

For your approval please.

Thank You.

Best Regards

Asher Sng | Cose Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 4841-4051 | email;

hersng @ikk

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

$62,676.71
S 5,070.00
$ 2.00
5 55.00
$  48.60
$67,852.31

m | fax: 4741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

$ 26,536.00
S 4,200.00 (35days x 5120)
S 2.00
$  55.00
S 4860
$ 30,841.60



From: Joyce Foo <joyce.fooc@gbe.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November, 2018 8:54 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg

Subject: RE: TP / OUR CLIENT SLH5358B DOA: 10/07/2018 POLICY NO. D17MTPV01016659 YOUR INSURED SIX8053A

Our Ref, VC011649
Hi Vivian
We refer to the above.

We have received the documents from Ah Lim Motor. Please conclude and let us have your full report soon.

Thanks & Best Regards

Joyce Foo
Senior Assistant - Claims
QBE Asia Pacific = Singapore

QBE Insurance (Singapora) Pte Ltd
Phone +65 6477 1184
Email joyce foof@gbe com

Visit us on the web at www ghe com sg

T

Wecreate insurancesolutionsfor

Y Engitieering & T
- Construction

From: Vivian Lau (LEKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 10:09 AM

To: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@qgbe.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP / OUR CLIENT SLH5358B DOA: 10/07/2018 POLICY NO. D17MTPV01016659 YOUR INSURED S5JX8053A

Dear Joyce
We refer to the email below.,

Please be informed that our surveyor pending finalise with TP repairer.



Thank vou

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Joyce Foo [mailto:joyce.foo@gbe.com]

Sent: Thursday, 11 October, 2018 10:05 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP / OUR CLIENT SLH5358B DOA: 10/07/2018 POLICY NO. D17MTPV01016659 YOUR INSURED SIX8053A

Our Ref. VC011649

Hi

We refer to the above.

Please advise status of the claim and let us have your report soon.

Thank You & Best Regards

Joyce Foo
Senior Assistant - Claims
QBE Asia Pacific = Singapore

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pie Ltd
Phone: +65 6477 1184

Email: joyce fooi@gbe. com

Visit us on the web at www gbe com.sg

.- Construction

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 19 July, 2018 11:16 AM




To: loyce Foo <jovee foo@gbe.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com®; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

» <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP / OUR CLIENT SLH5358B DOA: 10/07/2018 POLICY NO. D17MTPV01016659 YOUR INSURED SIX8053A

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

QBE ref: VC011649
LKK REF: CC4/QBE18012958 /Kwa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SLH 5358B
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
» TP estimated cost of repair
* Preliminary advice
* Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email; MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5{408933)

————— Original Message-----

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 16 July, 2018 2:41 PM

To: 'Joyce Foo' <joyce.foo@gbe.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP / OUR CLIENT SLH5358B DOA: 10/07/2018 POLICY NO. D17MTPV01016659 YOUR INSURED SJX8053A

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | 5(408933)



* From: Joyce Foo [mailto:joyce.foo@qgbe.com]

Sent: Monday, 16 July 2018 2:06 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: TP / OUR CLIENT SLH53588 DOA: 10/07/2018 POLICY NO. D17MTPV01016659 YOUR INSURED SIXB0O53A
QOur Ref. VC011649

Hi

Please assist to arrange for TP survey - Direct settlement.

Thank You & Best Regards

Joyce Foo
Senior Assistant - Claims
QBE Asia Pacific — Singapore

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
Phone: +65 6477 1184

Email: joyce.foo@gbe.com

Visit us on the web at www.qbe.com.sg

---=-0riginal Messageg-----

From: zila [mailto:zila@ahlimmotor.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 16 July, 2018 9:16 AM

To: Syaheeda Nacah Binte Mohamed Othman <syaheeda.othman@gbe.com>

Subject: TP / OUR CLIENT SLH5358B DOA: 10/07/2018 POLICY NO. D17MTPV01016659 YOUR INSURED SJX8053A

Hi Claims Dept,

Kindly arrange for survey.
Note: Vehicle is in @ ALM AMK Autopoint workshop.

Pls advise on liability & OIC as we have video footage.

Thanks.

Best Regards, Zila Ah Lim Motor Tel: 64831244 Fax: 64836170

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is



unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephane. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG.
https://www.avg.com

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are
not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this
email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us
by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.



AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

Mo, 10 Ang Me Kie Ind, Park 2A #01-09 AMK Avtopoint Singapore 368047
TEL: 6483 1244 ( 4 lines ) FAX; 6483 6170 Email: ahlimme@isingnel com.sg
GET:M-000%63%-E RCE NO:064703008

OurRef:  MC0913266

Your Ref : SJXB0O53A

Date : 12/11/2018

QBE INSURANCE (INTERNATIONAL) LTD
1 RAFFLES QUAY

#29-10 SOUTH TOWER

SINGAPORE 048583

Dear SirfMadam,

Request for Direct Settlement for Accident involving our client’s vehicle SLH5358B and your
Insured SJX8053A ON 10/07/2018 07:40 ALONG ALONG Y10 CHU KANG ROAD

We refer to the above matter.

Please assess through your Insured's (SJX8053A) report and our Client (SLH5358B) - LOY LE HUI
(LIU LEHUI)'s report as attached and advise whether there are possibilities of direct settlement.

Please find attached the following :

1)  Final Bill

2)  GIA Motor Accident Report form

3}  Certificate of Insurance, IC and Driving Licence
4) LTA Search

The above vehicle was surveyed by KENNETH from LKK as appointed by QBE con 18/07/2018.
We would quantify our claim as below:-

Cost of Repair : $26,536.00
Rental 1 $5,070.00 ( 39Day X $130) Surveyor recommend 28 days. Add 5 Sundays, 1 Public

Holiday and 5 days prior to survey. Car was towed in on 10/07 and cannot be driven anymore. We
request for survey on 16/07 but survey only on 18/07

Medical Fee : 348.60
Tow Fee : $55.00
LTA Search :$2.00

ST oETorEmEmm——

Total : $31,711.60

Kindly acknowledge and revert on the possibility of direct settlement within 14 days.

Thank You,

Yours faithfully,




B g o T LI

SULELAVE 180125 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62363501 FAN 1 (065) 2564313

Our Ref: CC4/QBE18012958/Kwal
11 September 2018

Lim Khiang Joo
93 ¥Yishun Ave |
#09-20

Singapore 789136

Dear Sir/Madam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJX 8053A / SLH 53588/ OTHERS ON 10/J07/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pre
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred. we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement. please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter,

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) will be with held for
the time being. Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal A1G
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte [.td.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yorrs faithfully,

Vivian Lau

Case Handler

DID: 6341 8625

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: Vivianlau(@lkkauto.com

c.c.  QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



Authorisation to Act

1 \-_ﬂ\\' e "M:. (theﬂﬁrdparty
claimant ) of __ QI Y3C, Feavale Lk #0233 3 JA33Y
( address ), owner of _((HE2X®® ( Vehicle no ) hereby
authorise Ah Lim Motor Company ( the workshop ) to act for me in
respect to my claim for repair costs and / or rental and /oriloss of use
"( Claim ) for my vehicle No. &3¢S that was damaged.pursuant to
the accident which occurred on !ﬁlﬁ}lmi ( ddte ) along
Nw dw ¥y Raag ( location )
R N " Q432X -
involving vehicle Nos Dk TeS2A «  S¥F “(the Accident)

[ further authorise the workshop to settle the above mentioned claim in a
manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorised to
receive the payment further to settlement of my claim with payment
cheque/s made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my
behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis
insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle is concerned.

Dated this ldh day of _ Jul | ( month ) 20 lE ( year)

b

Signed bﬁ hird party claimant
Owner Veh No: S 535%(

Personal data Frotection Act 2012

I/ We acknowledge -and consent to Ah Lim Motor Company collecting , using and
disclosing and for processing my/owr personal data to Third Party service providers

and/or Insurance company my / our personal data for the purpose of processing the
claim and related ipsurance / claim matters. st

A

Owner Sig!%ture



DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Without Prejudice
Save As to Costs

Your Reference ; MC0913266
Qur Reference ; VCO011649

'We, LOY LE HUI (LIU LEHUI) do hereby acknowledge the sum of Singapare Dollars:
THIRTY THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED FORTY ONE AND CENTS SIXTY ONLY
(5$30.841.60) being full discharge and satisfaction of all claims against QBE Insurance
(Singapore) Ple Lid and their Insured, 'LIM KHIANG JOO', over damage to my/our
vehicle SLH 5358B from an accident involving SJX 8053A at/along Y10 CHU KANG
ROAD, which occurred on 10 JULY 2018 at about 07:40hours.

Further, l'we hereby acknowledge and accept that the above said sum paid to me is
‘strictly on a without admission of liability basis’ and |/we hereby discharge and release

the said QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd and their Insured ‘LIM KHIANG JOO',
from all claims, demands or action of damages as a result of the said accident.

Also, l/'we hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnified the said QBE Insurance

{Singapore) Pte Ltd against all and any claims whatsoever made or to be made by any
person or persons on myfour behalf in respect of the said accident.

Dated this (day) J:s of (month) ["\ﬂ [C‘ (year) 2019

Sigrfature W'rtnam-ﬁnayfe
Yol (2 Y
Claimant's Name Witness's Mame
SN MY
FIN/NRIC No. FIN/NRIC No.
Ferale Link AH LI MOTOR COMPANY
W3ge, Hernva fn Lo 10 Ang Mo Ko Industrisl Park 24 :
13 AMK Autopoint Singapors 50204
*'ﬁ\‘),- 133 == a,«qsu-Sﬁ [al 483 1244 Fax A4A3 6170

Address Address

Please return to:

General Claims Depariment

QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
1 Raffles Quay

#29-10 South Tower

Singapore 048583

(By Fax: 6534 5356)

Company stamp il applicable



AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

Mo, 10 Ang Mao Kio Ind, Park 2A #01-00 AMK Autopoint Singapore 568047
TEL: 6483 1244 { 4 lines ) FAX: 6483 6170° Email: ahlimme@eingnel. com.sg
GSTM%-0009639-E RCB NO:064 103008

M/S: LOY LE HUI (LIU LEHUI) Final No: AL0929218
BLK 430C FERNVALE LINK Claim No: MC0913266
#17-233 Date: 12 Nov 2018
SINGAPORE 793430 Policy No: D1TMTPVO1016659
Veh Reg No: SLHS53588
ATTN; Make/Model: TOYOTA ESTIMA 2.44A

Your Ref No: SLH3358B
Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date:  10/07/2018

Tax Invoice-Final Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SLH5358B

P | PAGE:]

Description | Quantity | List Price = Amount
55 S5

As agreed to proceed repair at Lump Sum Repair 5§ 24,800.00

Less Excess 5% 0.00

Amount Before GST S§ 24,800.00

Add GST @ 7% 1,736.00

Total Amount payable 5§ 26,536.00

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR TWENTY SIX THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED THIRTY SI1X ONLY
The above vehicle was surveyed by KENNETH KONG -LKK on 18/07/2018

For AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

COMPANY

THinHi tndustrial Park 24
"-i ik Ty A ” A i pﬂﬁ"ﬂﬁﬂﬁm‘r
Tok G453 1244 Fme 283 8170

E.&0.E



Ace Auto

18, Ubi Road 4 #02-05 Ubi Car Mall
Singapore 408616 Regno: 53029719A

To: Ah Lim Motor Company Invoice No: A4138
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 24
#01-09 AMK Autopoint Date 18/08/2018

Singapore 568047

'Vehicle No : SJP1420L

Make / Model : Toyota Estima

Rentto: Loy Le Hui - SLH5358B

Account : Ah Lim Motor Company

Rental Ref : 4138

No. of days Rate Total
Duration : From: 10/07/2018 18.00pm 39 $ 130.00 | $ 5,070.00
To :18/08/2018 17.45pm
Grand Total $ 5,070.00

BoE AW

HEREE t..@::-r NabErathhEhREEREREE

Sfor Ace Auto



ACE Auto

18 Ubl Road 4, #02-07 Singapore 408516
Tel:B483 6143 Fax: 6483 6170
Regisiration No, 53020718 A

&

fx?ers 537; /0o sof
/S0 3,

No: 4138

RENTAL AGREEMENT / INVOICE

Fiors Name 5 = Doto of Birth T Fasspart7 e o, Nationafly
oy Ve W X
Addrass ? Qecupation Driving Licence No Date of Licence Oblained
K300 - Frrawd Lk X
- 5 : Fostal Code | Contmc! No kiobia Phone No. Own Vehicle No.
B\123) < 175530 SLi] $3588
Driver Nama \ : ) Diate of Birth Fasspon / Nric No. Naticnality J—
T- fxp-7-Up
Ardress Cceupstion Oriving Licance No Date of Licence Oblained
Posial Codg Coniact NG Mobifa Fhene No,
X 79907
£ : [ ~ i i
CHECK OUT Mf"[# i~ I‘mg-aufm RS V7 I B R Ta
Dafe Tirne Miloage L ":- A i
CHECK IN ( j kMg e m 34 *
1? ?1 I ? ‘5 QSPM Ir}-h Lk{l% Fay lor every quarier tank petroi if Lhe pelol s
lesa than the check oul amounL.
-~
VEHICLENO. S—777 (4o L MODEL (/o sfn_. /9 47
IMPORTANT NOTES:- UNIT RATE ($) TOTAL {5)
= This vehicle is resiricied fo SINGAPORE use onty, RATE PER DAY @
* BEWARNED : Hirer | Driver shall be fully respansible for all consequences including
::Lh?::m?;:mw and all costs incurred 1o & by the owner o any invald RATE PER WEEK @
Fy
+ Mo refend will be given for vahicle that rell.%m: early, < RATE PER MONTH @
* The hirer ghall be liable to pay the first [oe O far damage lo vehlale
plus loss of earmings while damaged vehicle is under repalr. GRAND TOTAL
=
+ Third Party Liability Is 310 any aceident, DEPOSIT
= Hirer shall Il fine i
T Dy SN0N en R oo mmnone, euned g the perod 8t | usimnicion VS
* Exlansion:- One dey's advence notice |s required olherwise Mo extension will be ]
erasiery TOTAL PAYABLE AMOUNT
* Wehicle should be relurned af the same time as collsctlon excepl en Salurday where
nedurn fima is befora 10am,
= Vehicle returned after office hour will be charged 1o the next warking day,
« Heurly exlansion:- Raler 1o prevafing ralos. DEPOSIT REFUNDABLE 5%
+ Fleege chack waler & engine ol dally as preventlive malntenance.
A7 1430 | | CHANGED DVER FROM VEH. DATE .
) i A P A <% S Y
B qlﬁf' I;Lk_ o ‘f))}- : 4 LA
. i T (12 5e - AT AV gﬁ,r}“
P i~ Lo N | I — { ¥e A %Iﬁ lll\. -
e T IR L1 e — | S T |
gl x a2 = o L s = 4 = ll”"‘ i 3,5
{i.,.__r____- :‘-"-,_.-3, . o A L J“t{Ir [ -—-._::Ir—'—r-h v ¥ 11;__ "-.IJ* H
e ST e e N et e S 1 | - |, =
—_— e TN e =y WY f\ﬁ"!‘ —— 1 R Pt T 1
= —= M £ - e e he = 3 dl]
T "}‘f::r“--'f:ﬂ" J RS i i O ={
y e = e I S
Reta = L s

We heve read and agree to the ferms and canditions of the renfel agreement above end as sel overaal
LW declare that sif information gheen on thik form ie irve and accurate,

| 74

i
Hirer's Signature i

Driver Signature

Whll'ﬂvw Fink « Account

Blue - Fifg



Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF
SINGAPORE

GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
INSURANCE 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

ASSOCIATION Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE - ot Ragistration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Cur Ref No: GR-18-105729
Date of Request:  11/07/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Ah Lim Motor Company

10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24
#01-08 AME Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 11/07/2018
Enquiry By Kee Mui Hong
TP Vehicle No.  SJX8053A
Accident Date 10/07/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. MNo.
SJXBOS3A QEE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid 14/072017-13/07/2018  |62246633
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reperis forwarded to the cenire by the members of the
General Insurance Assoclation of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall

be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their
images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fus... 11-Jul-18



Invoice Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF
SINGAPORE

GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
INSURANCE 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

ASSOCIATION Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Qur Ref Nao: GR-18-1057289
Date of Request: 11/07/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Ah Lim Motor Company

10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24,
#01-09 AMK Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Cear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 11/07/2018
Enquiry By Kee Mui Hong
TP Vehicle No.  SJXB053A
Accident Date 10/07/2018

CESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1,87

GST Ameunt 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[%] GIRO[] Cash[] Cheque

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fus... 11-Jul-18
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L

./'k:.';_
33 Sengkang West Ave #B1-18 The Seletar Mall Singapore 797653 % :

@ ProHealth Medical Group @Fernvale Pte Ltd Pt
*

Tel : 6886 4780 Fax ; 6886 4768
GST Reg. No, 2009223000

RCB No. 2008223000

TAX INVOICE
LOY LE HUI Invoice No : FVI289474
Nric: SB4044178 .  -Date: 10/07/2018
Attended By: DR CHOI SAI WA Al

items = b Amount
COMSULTATION ($28) + SURCHARGES (WHEN APLLICABLE) 1 con $28.00
ADJUSTMENT ' iy -50.08
MYONAL 50MG (EPERISONE HCL) S0 tabs $6.50
SODEN 275MG (NAPROXEN-275) 20 tabs $6.00
DIMENHYDRINATE 50MG 10 tabs $3.00
Paid By : $48.60 Cash Sub Total : $45.42
| *IJNEALTH MEDICAL GROUY GST Amount : s318
@FERNVALE PTE 1L.TD Grand Total : §48.60

77 Sengieyly West Avenue Amount paid : $48.60

#8116 Seletar Mall Amaount oulstanding : $0.00

‘Sim re 7O7E53
“.1 mpAfs ATAN Fav: RARA ATRP

ProHealth Medical Group @Fernvale Pte Ltd




R IE (M 1) 36 B ARTS
TEO KIAN HOCK (CHEE CHEN) TOWING SERVICES

Mailing Address: 40 Cactus Road, Singapore 808587

Tel: 6858 4067 Fax: 6854 0407 MM

+- 9 . B AR 3 24 HOURS SERVICE

, 413736/00L
CASH SALE / WORK ORDER ~ No, 0980
‘____—-—"H.'..’l

Date: \U\tﬂf\m \3
Messrs iﬁf\’\ \’\'N\ K\Pm

‘I-"ahln:l& Mo QL B3R MudEH No: .58\ P

me "?LEJ C,_E\,-r\ leona RS, Tn ﬁi\-b\ S ‘:‘w\mﬂh}
%M (8/E) /
Time (day/night):

3 &
Others:

CASH $: E\r::[ CHEQUE:

e+ A W & % A %
Authorised by: i ! Received by:

B ALANKezZ e, £AFPPHTETRALGE, —Ehrz a1,

NOTE: Vehicle s towed at owner's risk. The Company accepts no responsibifity for damages or ofher dnmnamu.rw your
vehicle whilst belng towed,




