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TrRE2018 PARFICOE Rebate Enguiry
. » Back to OneMotaring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

- Vehicle Owner Particulars
Crwner I Type- Comgpay
Owrier 1D 1B13C
Vehicle Details
WVehiche Na: 5iH4518L
\ahichs to he Exportes: Mo
Intended De-reglstration Date 25 Julzo18
Viehaclhe Make: HOMDA
Vihichs Modsl STREAM 18X A
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing ear: 2008
Enging ho - RIBAITT&TES
Chastin Mo RMN&1069355
Mazisrom Powsr Output: 10306V {138 bhal
Cpen Market Value $17.147.00
Original Registration Date 07 Aug 2008
Firnt Regiitratson Date OF Aug 2008
Tranafer Count: 1
Actual ARF Pakd. 1714700
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibillty Expiry Date D Aug 2018
PARF Rebate Amount. $8,572.00
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Dte: 08 Aug 2018
COE Category B - Car [1803cc & abow)
CIOE Period| Yeary): 10
b i $12.889.00
COE Rebate Ameunt: $4100
Tatal Rebate Amount 3861400

The information contained herein b correct a3 at 25 Jul 2018
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WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32.
SINGAPORE 575644
TEL: 6456 3830 » FAX: 6458 0128 » EMAIL: weileamatorwarksfigmall com
Business Regn No: 260438/00J

12,July 2018

India Intl Ins PL
64 Cecil Street #04-05/406-02
OB Building 5049711

Attn: Motor claim dept-3™ party claim
Claiming against your insured vehicle No: SHC3965K

Accident involving vehicle No; 5/H4518L/SHC3965K
DOA: 10/07/2018 AT RWS casino B1 Drop-off point

Dear officer incharge
Estimate cost of repair for vehicle no: SJH4518L

To repair/reshape Left portion-2 doors,2 fender ,side mirror $ 35000 Fesr
To spray paint 5 1,200.00 F‘,'r
o7 Asthars § 1,550.00

Foter,

LEK Ajlo Congiiltants hanes notiy

the Repairer of (he lallowing

* To resuirrmy beiomyafe 1078y fsirnding

* To dlspisy damaged pamy) CUHING IS Lirey
-Fﬁmnmmmﬁmm

* Third party survey i o i “Without Proyudicn” bomay
* Mo legal modifeatens) & s

lm mm
imhhmfmcrwf

Acancwiedond ty Bacsen
Sgratum:
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From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto]

Sent: Tuesday, 7 August 2018 10:.04 AM

To: ‘karen Seah'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJH 4518L AND SHC 3965K ON 10/07/2018
WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
{subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client's vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyar.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement.

Thank You.

Bast Regorols

Asher Sng | Cose Rondler

LEK Auto Consullants Ple Lid

phone. 58416051 | email: pshenng@ikkovio.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Poyo Ukl indushial Park, Ubl Avenue |, #02-25 | %(408%33)
From: Motor Claim - Ill [mailto:motorclaim @iii.com.sg]

Sent: Maonday, 16 July 2018 11:42 AM
To: karen Seah <weileemotorworks@gmail.com>; 'sur@Ikkauto.com' <sur@Ikkauto.com>;: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

<admin-d@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Manivel Priyadarshini <manivel @iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Fwd:

Dear Sir / Mdm.

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SJH4518L and let us have your report urgently
This claim will be handled by M= Priya.

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen



Thank You.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Mator Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

&4 Cecil Street | #05 108 Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: karen Seah [mailto:weileemotorworks@gmail.com]
Sent: 16 July, 2018 10:23 AM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Fwd:

Accident involving vehicle No: STH45181L/SHC3965K
Hi.

please arranhe arrange LKK Auto Consultants to survey the vehicle .
Thank you.

On Mon. Jul 16, 2018 at 8:47 AM. Motor Claim - [l <motorclaimi@iii.com.sg> wrote;

Dear Sir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email.

We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

* LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* \icom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list,

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee
Motor Claims Dept.



" India International Insurance Pte Ltd

. B4 Cacil Street | #05 108 Bullding | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: karen Seah [mailto:weileemotorworks@gmail.com]
Sent: 13 July, 2018 5:21 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motarclaim@iil.com.sg>
Subject: Fwd:

Your insured vehicle No: SHC3965K
Accident involving vehicle no: SIH435181/SHC3965K

DOA:10/07/2018 AT RWS casino B1 drop-off-point

Dear officer incharge
I refer 10 the above,attached with the accident report n video recording of the accident.
Please arrange to survey the vehicle.

Thank you.

Best Regards.

Karen Seah

Wei Lee Motor Works

Block 9 Sin Ming Industrial Estate



' #01-32 Singapore 575644

Tel: 6456 9830

Fax: 6458 0128

Company registrution: 269436/001

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data. sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the
General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or
dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If
you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is Intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information,

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it inmediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
Intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification,

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Best Regards,

Karen Seah

Wei Lee Motor Works

Block 9 Sin Ming Industrial Estate

#(01-32 Singapore 575644

Tel: 6456 9830

Fax: 6458 0128

Company registration: 269436/00)

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the
General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or
dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If
you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

4



" DISCLAIMER:
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.
If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
vou by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination
of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.
Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission
or any modification.
Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.
Registration No. 198703752-K

. AVI.'L This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antlvirus software.
. WWW.AVE.C



Report Remarks Entry

Report Remarks Entry - CCHOTHSOT0004/K 1 ph3

Page | of |

Remarks
|
Remarks
|
A
IRemarks 1 B o } a a ] l.;.ln
' 11/872018
[]|SHC 7003K | SJQ 2383H LSP |4:54 15
PM
11/82014
[]1[EST - $2481 58 — SUR AWK — WKSP ;COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD rLSP ;.:'34-2!} |
1142018
| |:] iFlNALISED P/F $980 4B / 2 DAYS AWK [541 32 |
FM
ar Hsiao Tong/Shu Pel We refer to your email of 11 June 2018. Regrel to advise that 12/6/2018
["] |insured has not and/or has yet to file accident report till date. Please assist to follow up on  |LSP [2:50:55
e matier. Best Regards Alfred Toh |PM
2662018
[C1INO Ol GIA._SENT LETTER TO OI***FILE PASS TO ACC LSP |9.0102
M |
26/6:2018
[:] |FILE PASS TO CHT LSF 1801 06
AM
372018
[ |Rec'd TP LOD CHT |120202 | |
| P |
aiTr2018
[T]|090718 Email to CT1. Request for Ol GIA (IF ANY) lcHT ﬁj‘un
| [ lor772018
| [C]|Rec'd 01 GIA ICHT |10:02:35
AN
| 117772018
Ij 110718 0ID collided onto TP from behind |ICHT 33027
iPM
|
1172048
| | Clhoo% BOAL 27 |cHT 33032
. IPM
127772018
[C]|120718 SENT LETTER TO OI [CHT [7-48.36
LA
http://init.com.sg/VIEWS/entry/ReportRemarksEntry aspx ?nid=277929 7/8/2018



Report Remarks Entry

Report Remarks Entry - CCHOTHROT0469/K 1 pb3
Remarks

Page 1 of |

Remurks
Add
" |Remarks 1 - -
[][SHD 71434 ; SKW 4578Y
[ver2018
[]|EST  § — SUR AWK — WKSP -COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD |LsP |12:38:00
M
11/872018 |
[1|FINALISED P/P $1116.18/ 2 DAYS AWK |5.41.02
FM
| 2082018
| [J|FILE PASS TO CHT ILSP [11:44:22
AN
| 3/7/2018
[]|Recd TP LOD CHT [12:02 44
|P‘M ‘
http://init.com.sg/VIEWS/entry/ReportRemarksEntry.aspx ?nid=277793 7/8/2018



Claim Audit

= AUDIT TRAIL
! WAl T
| H7MI20U8 oy veh Model Changed (202368] HONDA STREAM 1.6 X (A),
No: SIH4518L Acct Date: 2018/07/10. Claim Type: TF. Insurer: India Internation
3 17 Jul 2018 Cim Created :ﬁlmurunc: Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer: NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Lid (HQ)
11:47 Workshop: Wei Lee Motor Works (HQ)
3 ::i"?l, 018 gy co Assigned LKK Auta Consuftants Pre Lid (HQ):
17 Jul 2018 Next Rpt:-Final Rpt.Due Date:2018/07/26
4 4447 Adj Next Rpt Changed ext Bpt=Fira J !
s 110879 agj mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Ad) decides.
6 11087 Label Added (30651): Vehicte Not In,(30653): Direct Settiement.
7 :I‘:": 2018 Adj Adjuster Assigned  [None| -> MARCUS CHUA
X ipvry 2008 a4y Mandate Request  CurfReq:0.00/P00S  LIABILITY: 100% REMARK: 8:26 OID OPEN DOOR AND HIT TP
20 Jul 2018 . . "
- Ad] Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rot.Due Date: 2018/07/2
10 19102038 ag) Mandate Set Approved:0.00.
11150 " Label Removed (30651):vehicle Not In.
12 233008 agj adjuster Assigned  MARCUS CHUA -> KENNETH KONG
21 Aug 2018
PR -l Adj Rpt Initiated
1 1253 cim ou Modified Insured Name: -> =.
15 122377 cim ou Modified Claimant's Name: -> -, Claimaint's ID: > -,
16 14237 7' cim ou Moditiea 1F) Reg. Date: -> 2008/08/07,
21 Aug 2018
17 5 Cim Details Notified
Curfieq:1127.45:PODS: LIABILITY: 100% QUANTUM: (3) furz:riﬁén:;ncnuég Lou s
30 Aug 2018 $320,00 (4days x $80) + (c) LTA : $7.45 Total: a+bsc = $1,127,
'8 16:00 Adj Mandate Request " pp i 17990 PLEASE REVERT WITH YOUR APPROVAL / MANDATE / INSTRUCTIO
NS, IF ANY.
Date From 4|75 »| pateTo 4 77 »  Audit Type None v |
ACTIVITY —
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History
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Print Received Message

This mall is associated with :

*SJH4516L (MCT18070290)
[SHC3965K]
TP

KH LEASING PTE. LTD.
Juil 10 2018 5:00PM
H
Wai Les Molor Works

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (Ill_SG), sent on 30/08/2018 17:23 PM.
To LKK_HO
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5§1127.45) - SJH451BL - Clalm Handler: Priya

Approved:1127.45.
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WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK 8 SIN MING INDUSTHIAL ESTATE #01-32.
SINGAPORE 575644

TEL: 6456 9830 » FAX: 6458 0128 » EMAIL: weileemotorworkstigmall.com
Business Ragn No: 26043800,

15,Jul 2018

India Intl Ins PL

Attn: Motor claim dept-3" party claim
Claiming against your insured vehicle no: SHC3965K
Accident involving vehicle no:5JH4518L/SHC3965K
ON 10/07/2018 AT RWS casino B1 drop off point

Dear officer incharge
We are the workshop for the owner of vehicle no: SIH4518L

Regarding the claim for the case abave, this is a liability clear case considering that your client’s
vehicle collided Into the left portion of our cllent's vehicle.

The ¢claim for vehicle No: SIH4518L as follow:-

Cost of repair to SIH4518L S 800.00 finalised with your surveyor
Loss of use $ 320.00 580x04d
LTA search fee 5 7.45

S 1,127.45

Enclosed with all the necessary document for your reference.

Kindly let us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you.




i AUTHORISATION TO ACT

kH I{Q{{f;; nﬁ IL]L-Q L'r—d . |Vthe third pamy ciaimant ) ot
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T e Woi Lat wiohor” »Aer‘%

r,ETtLLlE_’c_ Tvehicle no. b herehv autherize
zluim for repaar :ns's sndigr rental anc/nr 1055 &

the vworkshop™) 1o a0t for e with respec! 10 l' -
use ("clalm™) for my vehicle no ) {'EI thet uﬂrnnﬁ'&h pursuan: 1o the aeticén:

4 rdate) o RWS Casine de’LP C’ﬁe Fﬂ“T flocation)
3‘?6‘5&_ng {“the accident™}

8

which cetwred {ﬂ -

invelving vehicle nals.

.

I Eavl 1 3
dAgsm Ot

| further suthorize the warkshop (o senle my sbeve mzhtioned claim 'n 2 manner [Rul gy aes
and the werkshop it Hirther suthorized te receive payment further to setdemeni of my =igim wiif

pevment cheguels being made 40 favouwr of the werkdhop.

| further acknowiedsge thar any semlement the workshop may reac. ' my Dehail is un & without

prejucice and without sdurission of liability Dasis insofar as the criverrownerinsurers 3f the th

vzhiglers 15 concamad.

_ L
Dazed thus tE’ _[dn;:]or'(‘il_.,mnn!hj Zﬂ@i}rzul

Sign “the third poarty eltimam” oot Sigmed by "the wurkshep”

{with chﬂp 7 upplicable) ; *  (with chop)
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

DISCHARGE VOUCHER
lil-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: MCT18070204
Claimant Ref SJH 25180

W,  WEILEE MOTOR WORKS ("tha warkahon”) heretty confirm that well have reached Bn agreameni
with Ihe appointed Surveyar of India Intemanonal Inscrance Ple Lid LEK AUTD COMSULTANTE PTE LTD {name
of Surveyor) with respeci o ihe amount claimed for 55 Bo0.00 (repair coat), 5% 32000 (loss of
Linere— 5% T 45 ismarch fee), vehicle no SuH 4510l thal was damaged pursuant 1o the accident which occurmed
on__ 10072018 (dais) at FWVS CASIND B DROP-OFF POSNT {locanon] involving vetscle no. SHC 3eesk (insured
wvehicle), This i pursuant lo the mspechion conducted on __ 24072018 (date} 8l "the workshop”

Wil confirn Ihat we/l arefam aulhorzed by the owner KH LEASING PTE. LTD. {"the third party
claimant®] of velucle no. SJH 4518, 10 make the claim as set oul inthe above pamagraph and we!l have lull authonty (o sstile
ihe matter on hisher behall in & manner that we/l deam fit We/l enclose hemin the letter of aulhority given by “fhe thim
party clalmant"

Weil turther confirm that weil will indemniy India Intermatibnal Insurance Pto Lid for all damages, loss andior expense (hat
fhey will of have already incurmed in the avent that The third pary claimant™ afler the above said agreemen| lodges a
m'mmqlhlmmrmmmlwm-mudpqmlnghmllnirmmwwrmmmm
of use pursuani lo the damage to _2uH45te,  (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident

Weﬂmfl'mihlltr-lqmmmrmﬂIMwhhlullmdﬁnﬂuﬂhmuntdﬂlthﬂnﬂ'ﬁheﬂlhﬂmrw
pursuant fo Ine accidant and thal further this satismean s reached on a withoul prejudics and without sdmission of lability
basis

This agresment is subject ta the appiication of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jursdichon over any
dispute arising out of the same

Wellaulnorize you to pay the total amount ol 5§ _1,127.45 to WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

Isdivim I mdan b el Daasiiibase o) Ly

U
Dated mu:_[ _ day of Mﬂ R zul' -
GLAIMANT: WITNESS:
Signatise Signatire KSC

" Sigred by appainted Surveyar
Name Wi ber wigher WerES Narme LKK AUTD CONSULTANTS PTELTD.
NRIC: 2 QAN (ou) NRIC: toseoTieem
Address Q)\"I; - l. X f—f}'_?.ti > Address: £1 UBI AVE 1. PAYA UB| INDUSTRIAL PARK
BN ;‘«\MC\ e iq-‘lﬁ Lhl £02-24 SINGAPORE 408813

Mallonmilty: Nationality: -

Decupalion Cooupation;




& # A 9
WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32,
SINGAPORE 575844,
TEL: B456 98730 « FAX: B45B 0128
Businssa FAegn No: ZE8438/00J
India Intl Ins PL INVOICE NO:12583
64 Cecil Strest #04-05/8#06-02 DATE:15,Jul 2018
10B Building S 049711

PARTICULARS AMOUNT (S%)

Accident involving vehicle no: SJH4518L/SHC3965K

Cost of repair for vehicle no: SJH4518L 800.00
Lump sum repaired as recommended by your appointed 800.00
surveyor. =EEoEET

Payments to be made by crossed chegque In favour of WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS



Keceipl Fage | ot |

> Back to OneMaotoring

8

Land Transport Autharity
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore STSTON
GST Registration No. - M4-0008529-2
Primt Date/Time ; 13 Jul 2018 / 16:55:00
Receipl Data/Time © 13 Jul 2018 / 18.55.00
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. - [TMET-00000-180713-001881
Previous Recept No
SIN Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S§) (S8) (S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SHC3865K
As at 10 Jul 2018/17:35:00

Insurance Co: INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD

1 Insurance Enguiry - SHCISA5K
Enguiry Fes 700 043 T49
2018071318501 1485233

Sub-Total T.00 048 T 48
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.48 748
Rounding Difference 004
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By

20180713185027930 :’m“ﬁa DebR 7.48
Total T.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 745
Excess Refuncadie Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
pravider [ financial Institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee
may apply.

hitps://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/completePayment?FUNCTION _ID=F1301001TT 7/13/72018



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlement

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING B o |
Cose | Natified Eat Submimted Ad) Asmigned jl._l::] Rpe | Ad) Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
N T 16 ul 2018 Fe—— e Pending for Survey ‘
o heg | S Ad) k| gt Esmatns | | view rpe | l:mlth

Haln Claim Detalls

'CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]
nsured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. feg. Mo 19930382 1R

| Main

Claimant: KH LEASING PTE. LTD., Co. Reg. No.: 20018118130

Wehicle Reg . |10/07/2018 17:00 - :59
Iwo.: 'SIHaS18L |Date oFLOSS | (119 Months and 3 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)] |

Claim Type: | TP / MCT18070290 FoCYICOVE | coMD015

hote No.:
Vehicie Rag,
Mo SHCIPGE5K
(Insured):

Policy No. |
(Dlabrrsant )
Excess!

Repairer: | Wel Lee Motor Works (HQ) BLOCK 3 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32, 575644 Sin Ming - Tel:
Handiing |

15100101189

Insurer: ;m International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 .. [Handled by Priya]

Clinanty | NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd [HQ) - Tel:

Insurer:
Adjuster. | LKX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62563561 . (Handled by KENMETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 26/07/2018]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED N

« 111_5G (30/08/2015): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$11327.45) - SJHA518L - Claim Handler: Priya
« III_5G[20/07/2018): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5%0.00) - SJH4518L - Claim Handler: Priya

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS - Wiew All | Search Tasks | Coeate New Task | Complets |‘

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On  Dona?
Mo results

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 14/9/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SIH45186L (MCT18070290)
[SHC3965K]
™

KH LEASING PTE. LTD.
Jul 10 2018 5:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Wel Les Motor Works

Page 1 of 2

Upload Bocurments. |  Upksad #totos | Compose New Letter | View [Visw o Browser | o]
| Photos/Images [3oeroage  [v] A |
No |Relabel/Resrder |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail Print|
1 |30/0B/16 16:10 | Genersl View D | wawe | A
2 30/08/18 16:10 | General View 0  weawe | 4
1 30/08/18 16:10 | General View 0O | waws | A
4 |30/08/18 16:10 | Ganeral View 0 tcoaws | A
S | 30/08/18 16:10 General View o 0 tocsdwc | A
6 30/08/18 16:10 | General View 0O | wsdws | B
7 [30/08/18 16:10 | Genaral View o O waws | M
B |30/DB/18 16:10 | General View D | tradies | B4
9 |30/08/18 16:10 | General View © | adirc | B4
10 30/08/1616:10 | General View O | aews | &
41 |30/08/18 16:10 | Chassis Mumber 0 | waws | A
E:z_?:wnam 1510 | General View 0| oadwc | A
i;ur_?:n_mm: 1610 | Odemeter Reading Q| cors | &2
14 |30/08/18 16:11 Reinspection Photo | ecars A
15 30/08/1816:11 | Reinspection Photo © | s |
16 |30/08/18 16:11 l:tn-g-nn-rhnu_ . D | wadws | A
17 |30/08/18 16:11 | Reinspection Photo B ® | waws | & |
18 |30/08/18 16:11 | Reinspection Photo i_ Loed PG | B |
Documentation - — [1oerpooe V]| &
Ho |Relabel/Asorder | LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
1 |17/07/18 11:48 | TP GIA REPORT % | LosdPOF |
2 [17/07/1811:48 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO 111 DD 16.07.2018 Load POF
3 26/07/1B 10:16 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load FOF |
4 (20/08/1B 15:45 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
5 (210818 15:45 | LTA SEARCH o o s Load POF
6 14/09/18 10:56 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
7 14/0%/18 10:56 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER B Load PDF
|8 [14/09/18 10:56  |LOD g Load FOF
[Ne [Finalised On Indis International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) _ Thumbnall| Print|
1 [18/07/18 08:40 Singapare Accldent Statemant ) | Load POF

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

Meset | Save | prine |

There are no document checkiists configured. -

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 14/9/2018



Menmen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Our Checklist Remarks - LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks Tor L] Handling Insurer
Moim: Ewrarks s prosis uniess you shows it o oiher perbes

https://singapore.merimen,.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 14/9/2018



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregne 1sesor1ser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/II1B012817/KEA3Q2
Date: 14/08/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. India International Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: MCOMDO15
ﬁ::"_’"'“‘ Vehicle o\ a518. Insured Vehicle No :  SHC3965K
Date of Loss: 10/072018 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT18070280
DESCRIFTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SJH4518L
Make & Model: HONDA STREAM, 1.8 X [A) Engine No: R1BA1TTETE4
Reg. Dale 07/08/2008 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No: RNE1069355
Colour Meatallic Silver Odomeler: 129931 km
Engine Capacity: 1799 cc
Market Valua/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S3%) Market Value/New Car Price
NDITION OF T THE TIM F RVEY
General Condilion: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabla): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-acciden! Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/m85 R16 Rear Tyre Size 205/65 R16
Front Left Side Michelin & mm Rear Lefl Side: Michelin 2 mm
Front Right Side Michelin 6 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 2 mm
The above vaives represent the remaining lyre ireads dopih
COST OF CLAIMS E—— Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,550.00 1,000.00 £50.00 3548
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 1,550.00 1,000.00 550.00 35.48
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 800.00
Nett Amount (5§) 1.550.00 800.00 750.00 48.39
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x S$80.00/day) (S5) 320.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S$) 7.45
Nett Liability (5§) 1,127.45
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 16/072018
Date Inspecied: 24/07/2018 Inspecied Al Wei Lee Malor Works (HQ)
BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL
ESTATE #01-32
Singapore 575644
Estimated Period of Repair 4.0 days
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/9/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE: This report represents cur findings af fie fime and place of inspection sinted herem. Such mspechon hes been camed oof io the best of our
khowiedge and abiity but any other lability under any ather circumstances 5 horaby arpressly sxciuded

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/9/2018



Adjuster Repont Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 21 Aug 2018B)

Parts: Mi-MPV HONDA STREAM 1.8 X (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SJH4518L)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they comain the print code [above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Furlfhar l_n'l'u: emsivalues nol in reference catalogue are prefixed with an aslerisk *.

Recommended Parts

Thaere are no new parts selected.
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/9/2018



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous tems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab. Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items

1 TO REPAIR /RESHAPE LEFT PORTION -2 DOOR ,2 New 350.00 300.00

FENDER ,SIDE MIRROR

2  TO SPRAY PAINT New 1,200.00 700.00

Gross Labour Cost {5§) 1.550.00 1,000.00

Repon was unsubmitted during this print-out. ]

< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/9/2018



