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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 16 July 2018 8:34 AM

To: '‘Ong Chin Kiat'; SUR

Subject: RE: Market Value for FBF7828C - Date of Loss: 10.07.2018
Dear Chin Kiat,

The market value of FBF 7828C is $3.5K-4.5K (Estimated) as at July 2018

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Ong Chin Kiat [mailto:chinkiat_ong@sg.msig-asia.com]

Sent: Friday, 13 July 2018 11:23 AM

To: M| <mi@aispl.com.sg>; Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>;
glen_enterprise@yahoo.com

Subject: Market Value for FBF7828C - Date of Loss: 10.07.2018

Hi all,
Can assist to check market value for FBF7828C?
Date of loss: 10.07.2018.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ong Chin Kiat
Senior Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | chinkiat ong@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

2016 Inturer Claims Team of the Year

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | Tel +65 6220

9644 | Fax +65 62256371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg

Amember of @UAYHNME INSURANCLE GROUP



7/13/2018

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 13 Jul 2018

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

OK

oow: (16

Foreign Identification Number

(Mga)
7326T

FBF7828C
No

13Jul 2018
YAMAHA
T135

Black

2011
5YP303419
5YP303419
$1,726.00
28 Nov 2011
28 Nov 2011
1

$259.00

No

$0.00

27 Nov 2021
D - Motorcycle
10

$1,889.00
$637.00
$637.00
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