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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9807198-R Page No..50of5

: Estimate By Our
Description of Parts Condition Worl;shop Adjusted ($)
g = (8)

TO STRAIGHTEN, REPAIR, REALIGN ON REAR 1,500.00 800.00
AFFECTED AREA AND REPLACE DAMAGED
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRT BUMPER
REINFORCEMENT, RR FLOOR PANEL COMPARTMENT,
FRT FENDER R/, FRT CHASSIS MEMBER RIL, RR
FENDER R/L .RR FLOOR PANEL AND RR CHASSIS
MEMBER RIL.
TO SPRAY PAINTING, BLENDING ON REAR AFFECTED 1,500.00 1,100.00
AND ADJACENT AREA.
TO SPRAY ANTI-RUST COATING ON NEW AND 150.00 120.00
AFFECTED PANELS.

7,630.00 4,200.00
GRAND TOTAL 69,066.81 49,005.35
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 39,200.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No CSYSMOT7024471/Urd3e2-1 ) 42 267 ¢
MARKET VALUE: $129,000.00(EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $100,990.00=NETT VALUE: 528.0r10.00
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CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABRLITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This R Is mads

for the yse and benef of the Cliant named on the front this R:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No..5 of 5

Estimate By Our
Description of Parts Condition Wor:csshop Adjusted ($)
)

TO STRAIGHTEN, REPAIR, REALIGN ON REAR 1,500.00 800.00
AFFECTED AREA AND REPLACE DAMAGED
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRT BUMPER
REINFORCEMENT, RR FLOOR PANEL COMPARTMENT,
FRT FENDER R/, FRT CHASSIS MEMBER RIL, RR
FENDER R/L,RR FLOOR PANEL AND RR CHASSIS
MEMBER RIL.
TO SPRAY PAINTING, BLENDING ON REAR AFFECTED 1,500.00 1,100.00
AND ADJACENT AREA.
TO SPRAY ANTI-RUST COATING ON NEW AND 150.00 120.00
AFFECTED PANELS.

7,630.00 4,200.00
GRAND TOTAL 69,066.81 49,005.35
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 39,200.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS3/SMO17024471/Urd3e2-1
MARKET VALUE: $129,000.00(EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $100,990.00=NETT VALUE: $28,010.00
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CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Is made solely for the uss and banefit of the Cllent namad on the front page of this Report.




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, September 15, 2018 9:53 AM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: PAPER RE-INSPECTION OF SLV57D; OUR REF: CMTD1704672; YOUR REF:
CS3/SM0O17024471/Ud3e2

Attachments: 0028_001.pdf

Importance: High

Dear Janice

The report of SLV57D stated nett value is 28,010/-
Please advise whether it is economical to repair SLV57D.
Thank you.

Best Regards
Agnes Chan

Claims Divison
D: 6329 5327| T: 6461 6555| F: 6221 3147

&= . Innovation for Wellbein
O SOMPO o A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

ownload on the

& App Store

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential and/or
legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. If you are
not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated
in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is
permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) [mailto:JaniceLee @lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 17 August, 2018 1:06 PM
To: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>



Dear Agnes,

Based on the nett value, the vehicle is uneconomical to repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes [mailto:agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Saturday, September 15, 2018 9:53 AM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <JaniceLee@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PAPER RE-INSPECTION OF SLV57D; OUR REF: CMTD1704672; YOUR REF: CS3/SM017024471/Ud3e2
Importance: High

Dear Janice

The report of SLV57D stated nett value is 28,010/-
Please advise whether it is economical to repair SLV57D.
Thank you.

Best Regards
Agnes Chan

Claims Divison
D: 6329 5327| T: 6461 6555| F: 6221 3147

. Innovation for Wellbeing A C fT
@ SOMPO entury of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sqg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

nosd On the

& App Stor

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential and/or
legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. If you are
not the intended recipient, please delete this message.



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, September 19, 2018 9:56 AM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: PAPER RE-INSPECTION OF SLV57D; OUR REF: CMTD1704672; YOUR REF:
CS3/SM0O17024471/Ud3e2

Importance: High

Dear Janice

The report did not stated that the vehicle is uneconomical to repair.
Any amendment of the report?
Thank you.

Best Regards
Agnes Chan

Claims Divison
D: 6329 5327| T: 6461 6555| F: 6221 3147

Innovation for Wellbeing A C f T
e

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

&  Download on the

@& App Store

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential and/or
legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. If you are
not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated
in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is
permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Folicy.

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) [mailto:JaniceLee @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 19 September, 2018 9:29 AM

To: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PAPER RE-INSPECTION OF SLV57D; OUR REF: CMTD1704672; YOUR REF: CS3/SM017024471/Ud3e2

1
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl B B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 5
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLV 57D
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | > Chop (g” ($])
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BOOT EMBLEM A8L NECESSARY 83.60 83.60
1|BONNET BUCKLED 5,878.40 5,814.00
1|BONNET TOP SEAL TORN 145.20 145.20
1|BONNET BOTTOM SEAL TORN 50.60 50.60
1|BONNET INSULATOR NOT NECESSARY 277.20 -
2|BONNET HINGE R/L @%237.60 NOT NECESSARY 475.20 -
2|BONNET HINGE ABSORBER R/L @$103.40 NOT NECESSARY 206.80 -
1|BONNET LOCK HOOK TWISTED 202.40 202.40
1|BONNET TOP LOCK STRIKER TWISTED 136.40 136.40
2|BONNET BOTTOM LOCK ASSY R/L @$105.60 BENT 211.20 211.20
2|BONNET BOTTOM LOCK BRACKET R/L @$136.40 BENT 272.80 272.80
1|BONNET LOCK CABLE ASSY TORN 66.00 66.00
2|HEADLAMP R/L @%$3546.40 CRACKED 7,092.80 7,018.00
1|FRT GRILLE ASSY BROKEN 1,661.00 1,661.00
1|FRT GRILLE EMBLEM CRACKED 107.80 107.80
1|FRT GRILLE EMBLEM BRACKET CRACKED 83.60 83.60
1|FRT BUMPER DENTED 2,932.60 2,932.60
2|FRT BUMPER WASHER NOZZLE R/L @%231.00 0/S CRACKED 462.00 231.00
2|FRT BUMPER WASHER NOZ. COVER R/L @%$112.20 O/S TORN 224 .40 112.20
2|FRT BUMPER PARK SENSOR @$217.80 SHORTED 435.60 43560
2|FRT BUMPER SIDE GRILLE R/L @$369.60 0/S CRACKED 739.20 369.60
1|FRT BUMPER ABSORBER TORN 110.00 110.00
1|FRT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT TO REPAIR SEE 957.00 -
LABOUR
2|FRT BUMPER BRACKET R/L @%44.00 BENT 88.00 88.00
2|FRT BUMPER SIDE GUIDE R/L @$50.60 CRACKED 101.20 101.20
1|FRT SUPPORT TOP COVER CRACKED 110.00 110.00
1|FRT SUPPORT PANEL ASSY DENTED / 981.20 981.20
CRACKED
2|FRT SUPPORT TOP SIDE MEMBER R/L @%$171.60 BENT 343.20 343.20
1|INTERCOOLER CAN'T SEE 1,010.00 -
DAMAGE

Report Ref No. CS3/SMO17024471/Urd3e2-1
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl mE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 5
Qty Description of Parts Condition ﬁ:fk':;;?g” Our A(:])ustad
1|RADIATOR ASSY BENT / PUNCTURE 1,206.00 1,206.00
1|RADIATOR SUPPORT AIR DUCT BROKEN 48.40 48.40
2|RADIATOR DEFLECTOR (AIR GUIDE) R/L @$61.60 DEFORMED 123.20 123.20
1|RADIATOR FAN COWLING NOT CHANGED 536.80 -
1|RADIATOR FAN ASSY NOT CHANGED 2,632.00 -
1|A/C CONDENSER FAN ASSY NOT CHANGED 2,632.00 -
1]A/C CONDENSER BENT / PUNCTURE 867.00 867.00
1]A/C DISCHARGE PIPE NOT NECESSARY 365.20 -
1|A/C SUCTION PIPE NOT CHANGED 499.40 -
1|A/C LIQUID PIPE BENT 132.00 132.00
1|A/C AMBIENT SENSOR BROKEN 165.00 165.00
2|HORN R/L @$254.00 CAN'T SEE 508.00 .
DAMAGE
1|P/STEERING COOLING PIPE BENT 869.00 869.00
1]AIR CLEANER ASSY BROKEN 655.60 655.60
1|BOOT LID BUCKLED 4,070.00 4,070.00
1|BOOT EMBLEM LOGO NECESSARY 107.80 107.80
1|BOOT EMBLEM 3.0 NECESSARY 83.60 83.60
1|BOOT EMBLEM QUATTRO NECESSARY 83.60 83.60
2|BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP R/L @%$1270.60 BROKEN 2,541.20 2,541.20
2|BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP SIDE COVER R/L @%52.80 CRACKED 105.60 105.60
1|BOOT REVERSE CAMERA NO PHOTO SHOW 1,183.60 -
DAMAGE
1|BOOT NO. PLATE GARNISH (W/LAMP) CRACKED 364.00 364.00
1|BOOT INNER TRIM TORN 796.00 796.00
1|BOOT LOCK ASSY BENT 121.00 121.00
1|BOOT LOCK STRIKER BENT 11.00 11.00
1|BOOT LOCK MOTOR ASSY DAMAGED 1,496.00 1,496.00
2|BOOT HINGE R/L @%$337.00 BENT 674.00 674.00
1|BOOT WEATHERSTRIP TORN 356.40 356.40
2|TAILLAMP R/L @$1353.00 BROKEN 2,706.00 2,678.00
2|TAILLAMP SIDE COVER R/L @%26.40 cuT 52.80 52.80
1|RR BUMPER TOP DENTED 3,245.00 3,211.00

Report Ref No. CS3/SMO17024471/Urd3e2-1
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:3 of 5
Qty Description of Parts Condition WE::IRE::);?Sy)) Our A(gj)usted
1|RR BUMPER BOTTOM NO PHOTO SHOW 594.00 -
DAMAGE
1|RR BUMPER CHROME MOULDING BENT 792.00 792.00
2|RR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR @$215.60 SHORTED 431.20 431.20
2|RR BUMPER SIDE GUIDE @$28.60 NECESSARY 57.20 57.20
1|RR BUMPER CENTER GUIDE CRACKED 55.00 55.00
1|RR BUMPER CENTER BRACKET BROKEN 61.60 61.60
1|RR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 1,328.80 1,315.00
1| TAILLAMP PANEL R/L DENTED 132.00 132.00
2|RR FENDER INNER TRIM R/L @%$1160.00 SERVICEABLE 2,320.00 -
1|RR END PANEL OUTER BADLY DENTED 497.20 497.20
1|RR END PANEL FILLER PLATE BADLY DENTED 451.00 451.00
1|RR END PANEL INNER BADLY DENTED 239.80 239.80
1|RR END PANEL GARNISH CRACKED 435.60 435.60
1|RR FLOOR PANEL COMPARTMENT TO REPAIR SEE 906.40 -
LABOUR
1|RR FLOOR TRIM SERVICEABLE 576.40 -
1|RR FLOOR COMPARTMENT COVER NOT CHANGED 899.00 -
1|FRT FENDER R/L (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
1|FRT CHASSIS MEMBER R/L (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - E
LABOUR
1|RR FENDER R/L (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
1|RR FLOOR PANEL (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - =
LABOUR
1|RR CHASSIS MEMBER R/L (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -3,222.99 -2,347 .65
61,236.81 44 605.35
1A 1T
1|SET FRT NO. PLATE (W/BRACKET) (SN) BROKEN 50.00 50.00
1|BOT RADIATOR COOLANT (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1[SET RR NO. PLATE (W/BRACKET) (SN) CRACKED 50.00 50.00

Report Ref No. CS3/SM017024471/Urd3e2-1
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Page No.:4 of 5

Qty

Description of Parts

Condition

Estimate By
Workshop ($))

Our Adjusted
($)

—_

RR END PANEL SEALANT (SN)

LABOUR

TO INSPECTICN, DIAGNOSE, RESET AND PERFORM
CODING PROGRAMMING ON :-

18.1)PARKING SENSOR CONTROL SYSTEM.
18.2)BOOT LOCK CONTROL SYSTEM.
18.3)COMFORT ACCESS SYSTEM.
18.4)STABILISATION CONTROL SYSTEM.
18.5)HILL HOLD ASSIST CONTROL SYSTEM.
18.6)ENGINE START-STOP CONTROL SYSTEM.
18.7)PARKING BRAKE CONTROL SYSTEM.
18.8)TYRE PRESSURE CONTROL SYSTEM.
18.9)AIR SUSPENSION CONTROL SYSTEM.

TOWING.

TO CHECK FRONT ELECTRICAL SYSTEM, REPAIR WIRE
HARNESS AND CALIBRATE / FOCUS HEADLAMP.

TO REMOVE, REPLACE AND REINSTALL INTERCOOLER
ASSY & PIPINGS. (INCLUDE PRESSURE TEST AIR
INTAKE SYSTEM)

TO REMOVE, REPLACE AND REINSTALL A/C
CONDENSER & A/C PIPINGS. (INCLUDE VACUUM &
RECHARGE A/C GAS) }

TO REMOVE, REPLACE AND REINSTALL RADIATOR &
COOLING SYSTEM. (INCLUDE PRESSURE TEST
COOLING SYSTEM) }

TO REMOVE, REPLACE AND / OR TRANSFER FRONT
PARKING SENSORS TO NEW BUMPER.

TO STRAIGHTEN, REPAIR, REALIGN ON FRONT
AFFECTED AREA AND REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS.

TO SPRAY PAINTING, BLENDING ON FRONT AFFECTED
AND ADJACENT AREA.

TO CONDUCT CHASSIS ALIGNMENTS (FRT/RR)

TO CHECK REAR ELECTRICAL WIRING SYSTEM AND
REPAIR WIRE HARNESS.

TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL REAR INTERIOR TRIMS,
GARNISHES, SEATS, ETC. FOR NECESSARY REPAIRS.

TO TRANSFER BOOT COMPONENT PARTS TO NEW
BOOT.

TO REMOVE, REPLACE AND / OR TRANSFER REAR

REVERSE SENSORS TO NEW BUMPER.

NECESSARY

NOT NECESSARY

NOT NECESSARY

Report Ref No. CS3/SM0O17024471/Urd3e2-1

40.00

40.00

200.00

200.00

600.00

100.00
80.00

100.00

120.00

100.00

60.00
1,200.00
1,200.00

350.00
80.00

180.00
150.00

60.00

300.00

80.00
30.00

100.00

40.00

700.00

700.00

30.00

80.00

80.00

40.00
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:5 of 5
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition
Y B Workshop ()| ()
TO STRAIGHTEN, REPAIR AND REALIGN REAR EXHAUST |[NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
MUFFLER.
TO STRAIGHTEN, REPAIR, REALIGN ON REAR 1,500.00 800.00
AFFECTED AREA AND REPLACE DAMAGED
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRT BUMPER
REINFORCEMENT, RR FLOOR PANEL COMPARTMENT,
FRT FENDER R/L, FRT CHASSIS MEMBER R/L, RR
FENDER R/L,RR FLOOR PANEL AND RR CHASSIS
MEMBER RI/L.
TO SPRAY PAINTING, BLENDING ON REAR AFFECTED 1,500.00 1,100.00
AND ADJACENT AREA.
TO SPRAY ANTI-RUST COATING ON NEW AND 150.00 120.00
AFFECTED PANELS.
7,630.00 4,200.00

GRAND TOTAL 69,066.81 49,005.35
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 39,200.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS3/SM0O17024471/Urd3e2-1
MARKET VALUE: $129,000.00(EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $100,990.00=NETT VALUE: $28,010.00

IT APPEARED THAT THE COST OF REPAIR OF $39,200.00 IS BEYOND ECONOMICAL, THROUGH IT WAS REPAIRED
TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION.

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




