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!‘ 'J}’ r/ Auto

- . Consultants
A BE & Pie Lid Company Registration No. 193607 138R

31 UKL AVE 1, #0225 FAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408931 TEL : (063 6563501 FANX @ (0631 62504315

Your ref: D18005313MFSH
Our ref: CS/FCI18012696/Uvd3 DATE: 12/11/2018
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

M/s: MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirMadam
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.S]JF 34490

We thank for your instruction on 12/7/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

vehicle on 5/10/2018  at the premises of M/s RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
and have the following Lo report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 55$25,976.80

Revised Estimate Amount : 8%6,500.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” Items Amount ok

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 8%

Nett Value 55

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
front portion. The chassis frame

affected due to collision.

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Ms @ FirstCapital

B Ratfles Quay 421-00 Singapore D4B5B0
Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fax (63)6Lce 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Cofeg bo 1950000050 GST Reg. he M2 0016764

Clsims & Motor Linderwriting Dept: 35 Robinsan Road #1E-0L City House Singapare DEEATT

Tek (551 6507 3848 Fax: (BS)E507 3845
winw mefirsteapltal.com.Sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.
Survey Type
Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

10-07-2018 COur Ref No.
02-07-2018 Claim Type.
SHE440G Third Party Vehicle.

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #02-24 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
CASS CHUA

62866080/ 0 Fax No.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

MA, Fax No.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D18005313MFSH

Third Party

SJF3443U

62867060

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

RICO 80 AUTO Attention
SERVICES PTELTD ’
MA TP Solicitor Fax No.

MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

MA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

A Memner af NSLURANCE




7272018 Claim Warkflow System
Job Sheet (/ClaimWS/Surveyor/JobSheet/242221) .f‘m; PRI Documents g | Close
PRI Header Details
Claimant
Claim No D18005313MFSH Policy No D-18088936MFSH S.No & 1 & RICO 60 /
MName
s Ei_‘ifﬂ AUTO SERVICES f"”‘*i"' 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #02-24 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
S { Cumai T &“E::!::ﬂt Mobile: 0 , Phone: 62866060 , Fax: 62867060
' E . IMS@R ,COM
CHUA) Details mailld: CLAIMS@RICOG0,CO
Our LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS Instructions WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Surveyor PTE LTD To Surveyor
Insured COMFORT Insured ¥
TRANSPORTATION PTE 2 SHE6440G Vehicle SIF3449U
Name Vehicle No
LTD No
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 10-07-2018 06:39:36 PM Appointed 12-07-2018 02:17:29 PM Accept 12-07-2018 0
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
Surveyor |_ Surveyor :E:::: ... S
Inspection | s Report Date 12-07-2018 Raport | Choose File
Date *: Hatl P2
Vehicle Particulars
ll Make Please Select Make v Model Please Select Model ¥ | Year Select Year v
Chasis No | Engine No [ Mileage
Cubic
| Co
lor i Capacity I
Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Multiple Documents
File Name Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks

hitps /ificlaims.com:9001/ClaimWS/Surveyor/Delails/242221 172



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUtO)

Sent: mMonday, 12 Mavember 2018 11:16 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Cc: ‘M.Ph‘r’CHLJA@MSFI.RSTCP-.PWAL.CDM.SG': SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005313MFSH/1, SJF 3443U
Attachments: SJF 3449U PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJF 3449U
Date of survey: 5/10/2018
Number of days : 9 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 October 2018 2:22 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=
Ce: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005313MFSH/1, SIF 3445U

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJF 3449U on 5/10/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 July 2018 2:27 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@ msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignmentsi@lkkauto.com>
Cc: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005313MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

. Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6255-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408033)

Erom: Claim Workflow System {rnailto:cwsmomrcIa‘|ms@msfirsttanital.mm.ﬁgl

Sent: Thursday, 12 July 2018 2:18 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LEKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMCITDRCLP-.IMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.CDM.SG; T'-."1A"l"CHUA@MSHHSTCANT&L.CDM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005313MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards.

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

i AVG This eflaﬁ has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
. www . avg.com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Weron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 October 2018 2:22 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Ce: Mh‘:’CHUA@MSFLRSTCJ&PITAL.CGM.SE; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005313MFSH/1, SIF 34490
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJF 3449U on 5/10/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 12 July 2018 2:27 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005313MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be infarmed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Elk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408023)

From: Claim Waorkflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@ msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 12 July 2018 2:18 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005313MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
~ Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AUCI. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
5 WWW.AVE.Com



10/5/2018 Used Honda Jazz Car for Sale in Singapore, - sgCarMart
sGCARMART.COM

MNew Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Article

s CONNECTING CAR BUYERS & SELLERS.

. We’'ll handle your loans, insurance & other paperwork for FREE. X0
honda jazz | | Price Range Y | | Depreciation ¥ | >10year(: ¥ | Vehicle Type T
Home » Used Cars » Direct Owners » Honda Jazz 1.34 (COE tll 06/2023)
Fesguroes Honda Jazz 1.3A (COE till 06/2023)
Car Buying VErvi Financial Accessories Similar Research Photos Map
Car Selling Add o Shortlist Add to Compare Add a Mote Report Error More Actions

Car Ownership

Price %30,888
Car Aftermarket

Depreciation  $6,530 /yr [ 7]
On The Move Reg Date 13-Jun-2008

{4yrs Bmths 7days COE left)

Lifestyle

Manufactured 2008 0

Car Tyres Mileage -

Transmission Auto

Engine Cap 1,339.cc
Road Tax $590 fyr (7]
Power 60.0 KW (B0 bhp)

View specs of the Honda Jazz (2002-2006)

Curb Weight 1,040 kg (7]
Features Powerful And Fuel Efficient 1.44 [-D5I SOHC Enaine,

CVT Auto Transmission, Dual SRS Airbags, ABS,

Knockdown Rear Seats,
Accessories Leather Seats, Factory Fitted Audio System, Retractable

Side Mirrors With Indicators, Solar Film, Sports Rims
With Michelin Tyres.

Description Lady Owner. Clean, And Meat Interior, Very Well-
Maintain, Supreme Conditlon, Servicing Just Done, No Contact Perso
Repairs Needed, Viewing Strictly By Appointment Only.
Contact No.
COE $19,107 (7]
Enquiry
oMV $14,433 (7]
USEFUL FOR
ARF $14,433 (7]
» Indemnity
Dereg Value $17,913 as of today (changs) e
» Receipt
Mo, of Owners 2 ﬂ' = MO1

hitps:ifwww.sgcarmart, com/used_carsfinfo,php?ID=732037&0L=1000 13



sGCARMART.COM i
New Cars Sell My Car Diractory Praducts Insurance Articles Forum Resources
Free Car Valuation

Unsure of how much your car is worth?
Let us tell you how much is the value - no charges & no obligations!

Jorea Price Range T | | Deprecation ¥ | | 2004 T Wehide Type r K
Rezources Honda Fit 1.3A G (Mew 5-yr COE)
Car Buying Financial Accessories Similar Research Phatos Map " PREMILM A0 ]
Car Selling

Car Ownership

Price 218,800
Car Aftermarket
Depreciation %5980 yr [ 7]
On The Mave Reg Date 30-May-2008
[Syrs COE laft}
o Lifestyle .
Manufactured 2008 7]
Mileage 105,000 km {104k 'y
Commercial Yehicle g
!f"\ - Transmission At
-
SERVICE T8 DESERVE,
BENSTY PEOPLE TOU TRBST Engine Cap 1,339 cc
oty Road Tax $590 fyr [ 7]
Power 73,0 %W (97 bhp)
MORE THAN 1,000 FLEET UNIT
sy, Wemichy, Merrhity & Yearly Fioet Swaciasls View specs of the
Curb Weight 1,010 kg [ 7]
Features Work Lata? Call Lis Far & After Work Hour

Appointment. We Will Ba Glad To Serve. Mo
Otsigations, Mechanical Or STA Tnspection Weloomed,

Cheapost!
ACCEsSOres Fully Origmal, Mo Mocsficabons, Doubia Din Maver
Sports Rims, Leather Seats, Roverss Sansors, Solaf
Film
Description 1 Chamesr, Wery Well Kept, With New Tyres, Stock
R E E Conditicn. Comes Wsh & Months Warranty By Our In
= Hiouse Workshop, Eree [stand Wide Tawing In Event Of
{U - 5333] Emergency. We Provide Loans, Trade In, Insurance
And Scrap Services With Flaxibility, Kindly Call Lis Now Company Victory Cars Trading Pte Ltd
1 FASTGro™ Hair Far Mare Irdormation, STAATCOM/Own \Workshop Pre . ' pric et
Care Produd Sei Purchase Evaluation Wekomed! o 78 vol 37
+
1 FASTGro™ o o Address 5 Uit Road 1 #04-24
Treatmen! oMY $12,663 7]
ARF §12.341 [ 7] Location
No. of Owners | 7] Office Mo 63854916
Type of Veh 1 Ack Contact Person{s] Mr Lim Gr470299
Mr Les BREESHTY
Category Mr Tan 0995505
Availability Available
Useful Services
) Afraid af lamons? Request to have
m this car evaluated professionally
abd al t
I,
Find out the markes value for your car
r Get a free Car Valuation
,.l-'k
Transfer Fes 525 2
Down Paymant 58.940 |

- -

1st Instalment



sGLC ARMART.COM

Mew Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Farum Resources
. I
.
- I
Hinia Price Range L Deprecianon ¥ 2008 v vahicke Type * W

REsOurces Honda Fit 1.3A L (New 5-yr COE)

Car Buying Financial Accessories Similar Research Phatos Map
Car Salling

Car Ownership

Price 43,800

Car Aftermarket

Depreciation 48,764 iy [ 7]
On The Mave Reg Date 28-May-2008

syrs COE left
- Lifastyle
Manufactured o] ﬂ
Mileage

Car Tyres

(R : 1 Transmission Alta
e ; -
Engine Cap 1,333 cc

Road Tax $590 /1 [ 7]

Power T30 kW (97 Bhp)

Curb Weight 1,030 kg [7]

VTEL Engine, 5 Soead CWT Auta

Features L. Fu
Transmit al Frant SRS Alrbags, AR5, EPS

Immaobicer, Knockdown Raar Seals, 585 Airbags.

AcoEssories Spoets Rims, Leather Seats, Autso Player, Reverse
¥ Company Mandai Maotor Trading
Sensors, Alarm Systeam :
Dascription Maw 5 Years OOE. Good Condition, Fuel Eficient And L] |28
Refiabile, Well Maintained, Loan Ay Trade 1 -
Address 31 =

Welcome, Price Negotiable, Call Or Vist Our Showroom

For Viewing Now!

COE Location

aMy 217 141 Office No 67775535

§12.1 Mr Tee 00058312
18GB & HUGE ARF 512141 Contact Person(s) M |

o000

Mr En 962 75545
IPHOME No. of Owners Ms L Jin 97548003

DISCOUNTS.

Only

Javid S3BE07L
Type of Veh { Dawid 60705

Category

X
Bimith Availability Available

Useful Services

Afraad of ler

srﬁ this car ¢

A AR R

* Reguest to have

ted professanally

Find aut the market vahue for your Car.

r Get a free Car Vahation
.-v"'h
]

Transfer Fee 475 7]
Down Payment 513,140 o
1st Instalment S60 [ 7]

7]

Total Upfront Payment $13,772

Items for Honda Fit
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFICNF Rahata Fnomine

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner D Type:

Owner 1D:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Business
7055)

SJF3449U

No

05 Oct 2018
HONDA
FIT1.3GA
Blue

2008
L13A4076303
GE61067401
73.0kW (97 bhp)
$11,467.00
27 May 2008
27 May 2008
3

$11,467.00

Forfeited

$0.00

26 May 2023

A - Car (1600cc & below)
5

$19,096.00

$17,720.00

$17,720.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must
be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if

applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 05 Oct 2018

https:iivrl.ta.gov.sg/talvilactionienguireRebateByPublicBetoreDareginput ?FUNCTION_ID=FO304009TT 112



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owener 1D
Wehicle Details

WViehicle No.

Vehicle ta be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year
Engine Mo

Chassis Mo

m aximum Power Outpuc:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

- Acta) ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category.

COE Period(Years):

PP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount.

Total Rebate Amount:

Message

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannat be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registersd upon COE expiry or when the

vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan {if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained hereinis correct as at 06 Jul 2018

OK

Business
7055)

SJE3449U

Yes

06 Jul 2018
HOMDA
FITL3IGA
Blue

2008
L13A40746303
GE&1067401
73.0kW (97 bhp)
31146700
27 May 2008
27 May 2008
3

1144700

Forfeited

0,00

26 May 2023

A - Car (1600cc & below)

5

$19.096.00
518.664.00
$18,664.00

h'\-{'.:a'l_..' i



Rico 60 Auto Services Pre Lid . Blk 8, Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 L #02-24 ¥
Premier o kaki Bukit Singapore 415875 , Email; claimsia ricoddl, com .
Tel: 6286 6060 . FAX: 6286 T6l A7 YA el
VECHICLE NUM: SIF 3440 U L
MAKE & MODEL: HONDA FI1 i
MILEAGE: e s D=
I'YRE:
CHASSIS MLM: GED o
DRSCRIFTION -FARTS P e
'Front bonnet S U £ S43.80
Front bonnet hinge L+R s | 5 8100
'Front bonet lock | s 109.50
'Front bonnet rubber L+R | 5 47.20 ,
'Front bonnet air duct rubber $ 75.00 >
'Front bonnet stand s 48.20
Front bumper | | S 623.00 |
‘Front bumper towing cap o s 34,00 -
‘Front bumper grille . 5 129.60 | 21
Front bumper reinforcement E" 272.10
Front bumper retainer L+R . 5 6. 00
'Front bumper bracket L+R ) | 5 76.00 -
‘Front grille L | s 177.00 I. }
Front grille logo 1 | 5 56.00 4
'Front fender L+R Ty Z B » e FYr |'s 962.80
Front fender cowling L+R :J, .y s 186.40
Headlamp L+R ._ A 4o K 1.424.00
‘Horn ) el 1 . 5 66.70
Aircon condensor A A ; s 822.50
|Aircon condensor liquid pipe 5 112.940
'Aircon condensor discharge pipe 5 216.90 ()
'Aircon condensor suction pipe 5 200,70 (X
'Aircon condensor electric fan cowling assy . g S08.50
'Radiator L, S 1.382.60
'Radiator electric fan cowling assy . 5 S82.70 |y
'Radiator spare tank . 5 65.60
'Radiator top hose | b 37.00
'Radiator bottom hose E 28.00 )
'Radiator top bracket L+R " ['s 41.00
Radiator themostat housing b 85.20
‘washer tank 4 s 78.40 |
‘washer tank neck . b 28.00
Alternator - 5 T52.80
'ABS actuator [ S 2.886.20 )
Air cleaner box . 5 284.50 | Vv
Intake manifold s 79230 )
'Bat‘tery cover . 5 36.20
‘Battery bracket | s 25.00 '
Battery tray . b 27.00 1

'Eng'me mounting RH 5 268.40 !



Engine muunting_bradﬂnt'R_H B i ol 4 5 11380 {'1\/
. Engine mounting LH - B - A1 it 5 234.30__;41
Engine mounting bracket LH A1 5 162.40 /
Engine mounting rear a a1 8 187.90
Engine mounting bracket rear A S 12670
Engine mounting front d 1 5 176.80
'Engi_ne mounting bracket front / ’1- | 5_ j|E_4F /(
" Front support p;mI B - é’ ,L,{{ ,/ [ | 5 7 79.00 f""
Front wheel housing LH - B % al S 84720 p 2
_mehaséi's_memﬁﬂr_l._.lilfﬁi}l_ - . B __ - o A | | b 2.680.00 )é
Front chassis extension LH+RH B - - - /I__ | |5 1.680.00 ﬂ“}/
Front windscreen moulding { {0 AM | S_ 180.00 o/
T . - Yoo
= - SUBTOTAL | S 2150850
= - LESS 20% s 430070
I - o o  PARISTOTAL S 17.206.80 |
SPECIAL NETT Qry| PRICE |
'FRONT NUMBER PLATE L0 | S suﬂfhﬁ
| FR{J\IBI.“mIIP\ - A s 10000 SO
[RADIATOR COOLANT - o A s 15000 3o
" FRONT BONNET ISMLATOR CL IPS I a1 s 10000 L
_ FRONT FENDER COWL INGCLIPS ) 78R 10000 1)
B o - - SPECIAL NETT TOTAL | | § 53000
TG S LABOUR QTY| PRICE |
TO RNR ACCIDENT DAMAGE PARTS,CUT/WELD KNOCK&REALIGN s 240000 /Jo0
TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA s 2amm g,
1O RUST PROOF ACCIDENT A¥ FECTED AREA B S 16000/
TO RNR FRONT WINDSCREEN N4 s 200. 00 X
| TO RNRENGINE ASSY TO ASSIST WORKLOAD Sas 60000 )
E— 1 L
TO RNR UPHOSTERY,GARNISH AND ATTACHMENT PARTS aa s 40000
" TO CHECK CHASSIS ALIGNMENT o AN s 40000
| TO RNR EXHAUST SYSTEM AND ATTACHMENT PARTS L aAs 20000 )(
'TO RNR UNDERCARRAIGE SYSTEM s 80000
'TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT N : S as 0w X
7O RNR A/C CONDENSOR ASSY AND REFILL GAS s IiﬂHl /90
TO CHECK WIRING LAYOUT AND HEADLAMP FOCUS 8 80.00 2 5
7O RNRTYRE AND WHEEL BALANCING anls 10000 X
10 DO DIAGNOSIS AND RESET . REPROGRAM OR CODING FAULT CODE. Csaa 20000 Y
7O RNR RADIATOR ASSY AND HOSES TO ASSIST WORK LOAD S 15000 ¥
T _'IF_HF Bnce ne lify " B
W R il R LABOUR TOTAL S 8.240.00
| G 5 aring ESUVeY GRAND TOTAL COST

Frnation

§  254976.80

Jithoul Prejudica” besis
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 4068933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCHMB012696/Uvd3n2
ssromeonro oo e[|
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHE440G Veh. Inspected SJF 34490
Policy No. D-1B088936MFSH Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18005313MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MAY CHUA Assign Date 12/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAFIT (A) c.C 1338
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. GEG1067401 Colour BLUE
Odometer r Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/50 R16 HANKOOK & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/50 R16 HANKOOK & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/50 R16 ACHILLES & rmm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/50 R1& ACHILLES 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.THE CHASSIS FRAME AFFECTED DUE
TO COLLISION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date _02/07/2018 [Inspection Date 05110/2018
Survey held at RICO 80 AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
B KAK] BUKIT AVENUE 4
#02-24 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875
Sa. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 9 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Libi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 31661 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607 198R GST Reg, No. 19-26507198-R Page Mo.:1 of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJF 3449U
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =8 mmp?;n ﬁf;‘
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|FRONT BOMNNET BUCKLED 543 80 543 80
2IFRONT BOMNET HINGE L+R BENT 82.00 82.00
1|FRONT BOMNET LOCK TWISTED 109.50 109.50
Z|FRONT BOMNET RUBBER L+R NECESSARY 47 20 47.20
1|FRONT BONNET AIR DUCT RUBBER NOT NECESSARY 75.00
1|FRONT BONNET STAND MNOT NECESSARY 48.20
1|FRONT BUMPER DISTORTED 62300 543 20
1|FRONT BUMPER TOWING CAP TORN 3400 3400
1|FRONT BUMPER GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 129.60 -
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DISTORTED 27210 27210
2|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER L+R BENT 64.00 G400
2| FRONT BUMPER BRACKET L+R MO SUCH PARTS T6.00 -
1|FRONT GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 177.00
1|FRONT GRILLE LOGO WOT NECESSARY 56.00 -
2|FRONT FENDER L+R N/S BUCKLED / O/S 852 .80 481 40

TO REPAIR SEE

LABOUR
2|FRONT FENDER COWLING L+R DEFORMED [ TORN 186.40 186.40
Z|HEADLAMP L+R MN/S BROKEN / OS5 1,424 00 1,424.00

CRACKED
1|HORMN NOT MECESSARY 66.70 -
1|AIRCON CONDENSOR BENT / TWISTED 82280 822 B0
1|AIRCON CONDENSOR LIQUID PIPE MOT NECESSARY 112,80 -
1|AIRCON CONDENSOR DISCHARGE FIPE MOT NECESSARY 216,90
1{AIRCON CONDENSOR SUCTION PIPE NOT NECESSARY 200.70 -
1laIRCON CONDENSOR ELECTRIC FAN COWLING ASSY NOT MECESSARY R9E.50 -
1|RADIATOR BENT /! CRACKED 1,382 60 1,382 .60
1|RADIATOR ELECTRIC FAN COWLING ASSY MOT MECESSARY 58270
1|RADIATOR SPARE TANK NOT NECESSARY 65.60 -
1{RADIATOR TOP HOSE TWISTED 3r.00 37.00
1|RADIATOR BOTTOM HOSE MOT NECESSARY 28.00 -
2|RADIATOR TOP BRACKET L+R TWISTED 41.00 41.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18012696/Uvd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
54 Lbi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GS5T Reg. No 19-9607198-R

Page Na_:2 of 3

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | cStiace Y gjj
S [RADIATOR THEMOSTAT HOUSING NOT NECESSARY 85.20 :
1| WASHER TANK NOT NECESSARY 78.40 :
1|WASHER TANK NECK NOT NECESSARY 28.00 d
1|ALTERNATOR NOT NECESSARY TE2 .80 -
11ABS ACTUATOR MOT NECESSARY 2,888 20 -
1]AIR CLEANER BOX MNOT NECESSARY 284 50 -
1|INTAKE MANIFOLD NOT NECESSARY 762,30 J
1|BATTERY COVER MNOT MECESSARY 36.20 -
1|BATTERY BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 25.00 :
1|BATTERY TRAY NOT NECESSARY 27.00

1|ENGINE MOUNTING RH NOT NECESSARY 266.40 -
1| ENGINE MOUNTING BRACKET RH NOT NECESSARY 113.80 =
1ENGINE MOUNTING LH HWOT NECESSARY 23430 -
1|ENGINE MOUNTING BRACKET LH NOT NECESSARY 162 .40 -
1|ENGINE MOUNTING REAR NOT NECESSARY 187.90 -
1|ENGINE MOUNTING BRACKET REAR NOT HNECESSARY 126.70 =
1| ENGINE MOUNTING FRONT NOT NECESSARY 176.80 ;
1|ENGINE MOUNTING BRACKET FRONT MOT NECESSARY 110.40 -
1| FRONT SUPPORT PANEL BENT / TWISTED 679.00 §79.00
1|FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LH TO REFAIR SEE 847 20 -

LABOUR
2lFRONT CHASSIS MEMBER LH+RH TO REPAIR SEE 2 6B0.00 -

LABOUR
2| FRONT CHASSIS EXTENSION LH+RH TO REPAIR SEE 1,680.00 "

LABOUR
1IFRONT WINDSCREEN MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -4.301.70 -1,350.00
17.206.80 5,400 00

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE [SN) BROKEN 80,00 40.00
1|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SMN) WECESSARY 100.00 a0.00
1|RADIATOR COOLANT (SN) NECESSARY 150.00 30.00
1|FRONT BONNET INSULATOR CLIPS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 100.00 .

Report Ref No. CSIFCI18012696/Uvd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 315681 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9807193-R Page Mo, 3 of 3
1 Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Gty e Workshop (§))| ___ (8)
1|FRONT FENDER COWLING CLIPS (SN) MECESSARY 100.00 50.00
530.00 150.00
LABOUR
TO BENR ACCIDENT DAMAGE PARTS,CUT/WELD, KNOCK 2,400.00 1,200.00
& REALIGN INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF O/S FRONT
FENDER.FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LH FRONT CHASSIS
MEMBER LH+RH AND FRONT CHASSIS EXTENSION
LH+RH
TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA 2,200.00 1,200.00
TO RUST PROOF ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA. 160.00 100.00
T RNR FRONT WINDSCREEN NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
TO ENR ENGINE ASSY TO ASSIST WORK LOAD NOT NECESSARY 600.00 -
TO BNR UPHOSTERY GARNISH AND ATTACHMENT WOT NECESSARY 400.00 -
PARTS
TO CHECK CHASSIS ALIGNMENT. NOT NECESSARY 400.00 =
TO RNR EXHAUST SYSTEM AND ATTACHMENT PARTS.  |NOT NECESSARY 200.00 =
TO RNR UNDERCARRIAGE SYSTEM NOT NECESSARY BOO.0O %
TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT NOT NECESSARY 200.00
TO RNR A/C CONDENSOR ASSY AND REFILL GAS 150.00 100.00
TO CHECK WIRING LAYOUT AND HEADLAMP FOCUS. 80.00 30.00
TO RNR TYRE AND WHEEL BALANCING, MOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
TO DO DIAGNOSIS AND RESET REPROGRAM OR NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
CODING FAULT CODE
TO RNR RADIATOR ASSY AND HOSES TO ASSIST WORK |NOT WECESSARY 150.00 =
LOAD.
g,240.00 263000
GRAND TOTAL 25,976.80 8,180.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 6,500.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

MARKET VALUE: $27,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $18,664,00=NETT VALUE: $8,336.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI1801 2696/Uvd3n2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DMSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report ia made sobely

fiur tha wee and Banefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report

Ieo Babiliny WWWM&WMWW
Report, in whals g in part. does 80 al his or her own risk,




