Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email; chewht@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 1 August 2018 3:12 PM

To: 'kalidass@khimseah.com' <kalidass@khimseah.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 2281Y AND GBF 847T ALONG/AT PUNGGOL WEST FLYOVER ENTRANCE TO TPE
ON 09/07/2018
Importance: High

01 Aug 2018

Khim Seah Enterprise Pte Lid

ATTN: The Ma ent

Dear Sir/ Mdm

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18012692/Upb3
YOUR REF : PO902358 (PA 2281Y)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 2281Y AND GBF 847T ALONG/AT PUNGGOL WEST FLYOVER ENTRANCE TO TPE ON
0%9/07/2018

We refer to the above subject matter, We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by
your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Lid to deal with the third party claim against your policy.



We have received a claim from LIU'S BROTHER AUTO ENGINEERING WORKSHOP acting on behalf of the
owner of GBF 847T against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that lickility is not in our favour,
We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable setflement with the Third Party,

Flease be informed that your No Claim Discount [NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against
your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take
conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us
within 10 days from the date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to us and acknowledged
by s,

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
chewht@lkkauto,.com within 10 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting centre. The
list below is not all inclusive and further document rmay be required:

. Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
. Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

. Authorisation Letter/ Employment Letter of your driver from you company

. Coloured photographs of accident scene [if any)

. Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

. Video footage of accident (if any)

. Statement and/er police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

. If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to

keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liabkility with any of the Third
Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settliement without AXA's prior
knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.



In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the
final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification. please do not hesitate to contact us at 6742 3197 or email us at

chewht@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@]kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080373)
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KHIM SEAH ENTERPRISE PTE LTD hirSHFE

T4 m

Date :03"™ December 2018

Ta whom it may concern,

Re: Mr. CHIA WONG FAH,

This letter is written to confirm that Mr. CHIA WONG FAH (NRIC: 52162494RB) has been
authorized by Khim Seah Enterprise Pte Ltd to drive vehicle PA2281Y to perform work duties
with a valid driving license.

Should you have any questions, please contact the undersigned.

Yours faithfully,

Liu Miaodi
HR Manager
Khim Seah Enterprise Pte Ltd

71 Woodlands Industrial Park E9 #06-08 Wave9 Singapore 757048 Tel: 6758 2468, 6758 1828 Fax: 6758 1384
Email: office@khimseah.com, sales@khimseah.com Business Registration No: 200206061K



JT209 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD(TP) = Menu

&« RE:IA?

Type
@ Question

Message
Hi KC, we have uploaded a copy of LO LOA in SC. Kindly advise if we may proceed DS, Thank you. Hsiao

Tong - 17 March 2019

httpsz.n"-rp.smartcdalms.axa,mm.agfcIairn-pur!all'htrnIﬁndax-vandnrvser-.rimraquesls_hlml#fsawrc&requestsfulemssagex?sewlgaﬂequesmumbe.., 17



Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 18 March 2019 7:42 PM
To: Hsiac Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: New message for service request 56863, vehicle number GBF847T
TYPE SENT RO SUBKECT BODY
[7] 1B/3/19 1:.37 PM CHAM Kian Cnusn Re-RE: 1A PLS PROCEED DS COR @ L
a 17/3/19 10:41 AM LKK AUTO RE: 147 Hi KC. we have unloseso s -

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lt

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 18 March 2019 2:09 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: New message for service request 56863, vehicle number GBF847T

G_Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg [mailto:kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 18 March 2019 1:38 PM

To: admin-d@Ikkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 56863, vehicle number GBF847T

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number SSMOONZW.

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided forin a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

1



This email has been checked for viruses by AVG.
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6/12/2018

«

hilps:ivp.smartclaims.axa.com.sglclaim-portal'him Hmdex—vendnr-sawica—raquesis.h!ml#rsanrit:u-reque5Is.l".riew—massaga#?sewiceRequeslNumhemEE. .-

Claim Portal

LEK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP} - Ment

<TP - Mandate |A> - SSMOON ACCIDE T INVOLVING
PA 2281Y(0I)&GBF 847T(TP) ON 09/07/2018]

Type
@ Question

MESSQEE
Liability: 100%. Insured driver rear-ended third party. Inform Ol about third party claim. Agreed to settle at best

and aware NCD issue. We seek your mandate at $8,442.45(all-in). TP-Mandate |A had been uploaded in
Smartclaims. Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. Hsiao Tong - 12 June 2019

1M
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Company Registration Mo 199607 198R

S URIANVE 1, #02-25 PAY A LRI INIM STHIAL PAKK, SINGAPOKRE 38933 TEL ; (6% 82583561 FAX ¢ e B Y
Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 12/06/2019

Survey Details:
Date of loss 09.07.2018
Date of appointment 11.07.2018
Date of survey 11.07.2018
Location of survey LIU'S BROTHER AUTO ENGINEERING WORKSHOP

Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: Third party
Vehicle number GBFB4TT
Fiat Doblo Cargo Maxi
dM

Make and Model (1598cc)
Date of registration 20.06.2016
Excess
Market Value/ Book Value 5 60,000.00 |{est)
Parf/COE Rebate 8 32,136.00 |{est)
Nett Value/ ERV S 27,864.00 |(est)

Repair details:
Initial Estimate | 5 17,134.00

Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts S 8,863.19
Check items (estimate) MIL
Labour 5 1,800.00
Supplementary MIL
Total 5 10,663.19
Lump Sum(if applicable) $ 8,500.00

|[Number of days for repair I

£




'r l‘"l‘ A

i Caongitants
i A = e Lind Company Registration No. 1958071988

S1UBLAVE [, $02-25 PAVA UHIINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 4083033 TEL : (065) A256354] FAX : (w5} 62564015

Remarks:

COR @ 58,075.00 as per AXA mandate

Mandate:

Liability(TP) 100%

Proposed repair cost 5 8,075.00

Loss of use s 360.00 (6days x S60.00)
Loss of rental NIL

Loss of income NIL

LTA/GIA search fees 5 7.45

Others NIL

Proposed Total 5 8,442.45




Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2019 8:55 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: New message for service request 56863, vehicle number GBFB4TT

n (18/3/19 1:37 PM CHAN Kian Chuan — PLS PROCEED DS COR @ $8,075.00 BEFORE LSp 18/3/2019 |
oo Pk L . 7:29:21 PM
Messaqe Liability: 100%. Insured driver rear-ended third party. Inform Ol aboutthird party |

= clair_n. Agreedto seftle at best and aware NCD issue. We seek vour mandate at $8.442 .45 CHT 12/6/2019

all-in). TP-Man in Smartclaims. Kindly let v 8:14:20 AN

___|2pprovaliinstruction. Hsiao Tong — 12 June 2019 e Pk

Dlﬁnzﬁg 10:29 AM CHAN Kla_n Chuan-—-PLS PROCEED FOR SETTLEMENT NOT LSP 113/6/12018 '
[EXCEEDING 8,442 45(all-in) 1842:42 AM

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

-----0riginal Message-----

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2019 10:33 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: New message far service request 56863, vehicle number GBF847T

Best Regards,

summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

---=-0riginal Message-----

From: kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg [mailto:kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 12 June, 2019 10:30 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 56863, vehicle number GBFE47T

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S8MOONZW.

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided forina
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com=

Sent: Saturday, 3 August 2019 3:28 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBFB4TT180709 *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18012692/Upb3 [ACCIDENT

INVOLVING PA 2287Y(AXA) AND GBF 847T ON 09/07/2018]

We hereby confirm acceptance of your offer.

Kindly let us have your discharge for our client's execution and your cheque made in our favour as soon as possible.

Thank.

Best Regards,

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746

On Saturday, 20 July 2018, 10:39:57 am SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) =chewht@|kkauto.com= wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email

We have our principal instruction to offer as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair 5 8,075.00
2. Loss of Use (Bdays x $60.00) 5 360.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee 5 7.45

TOTAL | 5 8,442.45

Flease confirm acceptance.



“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms
of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor
should it be binding in any other related claims."

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408533)

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com=

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 10:22 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto com=

Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBF847T180709 *Our Ref: CC4/ASM18012692/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA
2281Y(AXA) AND GBF 847T ON 09/07/2018]

We regret we are unable to accept yours offer

We counter propose of your offer as follow settlement:-

Global Sum 5%8,800/- (All-In)
Thank.

Best Regards,

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Warkshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746



On Saturday, 15 June 2019, 12:19:05 pm SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: GBF847T180709 Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/ASM18012692/Upb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 2281Y({AXA) AND GEF 847T ON 09/07/2018

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $8,400.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms
of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor
should it be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3187 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax; 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Our Ref: GBFS47T180709 Date:  19/08/2018 '(
Your Ref:

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
8 Shenton Way #27-01

AXA Tower

Singapore 06BR11

Attn: Motor Claims Department
Dear Sir / Madam

TRAFFICACCIDENT ALONG TPE/ CHANGI
INVOLVING GBF847T AND PA2281Y ON 09/07/2018

We/l, Messers Goldbell Leasing Pte Ltd (Nric / ROC No: 199001196N, the registered owners of m/vehicle — GBFB4TT at
all material times of the above accident. Our/my vehicle was surveyed by “AXA” authorized appraiser and we/l based
our/my claims on his recommendation for $$8,500-00 being the repair for 04 Days (Strictly on a Without Prejudice Basis).

We/| have ascertained that you were the insurers of the driver of m/vehicle PA2281Y when the same was involved in the
aforesaid accident with our/my m/vehicle - GBFRATT.

We/l whereby you are the insurers of m/vehicle PA2281Y and the driver / owner was caused solely by the negligence of
your insured and as a result there of our / my m/vehicle -~ GBFB4TT has suffered loss and damage as follows:

{a) Costof repairs 55 8,500-00
{B) LOU for pre-repair notice 02 days @ S560-00 120-00
(c) LOU Fee for 04 days @5560-00 240-00
(d) GIA fLTA search fee 7-45

Total Amount 55 H,BE?#Q

We/l enclose herewith copies of the supporting documents for vehicle no. GFBA7T as follows:-
(i) Motor Accident Report;
{ii) Repair Invoices;

Kindly look inta the matter and let us/me hear from you on the settlement of our / my claims as soon as passible.

Please remit us/me your settlement sum in favor of M/s Liu’s Brother Auto Engineering Workshop. Forward the cheque
to Mo. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue & #01-01 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883,

Thank you.

Yours faithfully,

The owner of m/vehicle GFB47T
Messers Goldbell Leasing Pte Ltd
cc. Liu's Bro Auto Engrg Ws



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reqg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9807198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Ref :  CC4/ASM18012692/Upb3s2
ROATONERSINGARORE 6ce owe: sooszoe [N
ATTN: KIAN CHUAN Code : ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PA 2281 Veh. Inspected GBF 8477
Policy No. POS02358 Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. SBMOONZW Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From  KIAN CHUAN Assign Date 12/07/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model FIAT DOBLO CARGD (A) c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. ZFAZB300006C23135 Colour WHITE
Odometer 54196 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/60 R16 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/60 R16 PIRELLI B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/60 R16 PIRELLI B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/60 R16 PIRELLI & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSATINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  09/07/2018 ]Inspectinn Date 11/07/2018
Survey held at  LIU'S BROTHER AUTO ENGINEERING WORKSHOP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-01 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE
417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 195607198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBF 847T

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

Page Mo.:1 of 3

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | "eiie @) [si}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR RH TAILGATE {CONSISTENT] DENTED / BENT 1,895.90 1,895 90
1|REAR RH TAILGATE LOCK TOP (CONSISTENT) MOT NECESSARY 189.30 -
1|REAR RH TAILGATE LOCK LOWER {CONSISTENT) TWISTED 182 90 182.90
1|REAR RH TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP (CONSISTENT) TORN 267.00 297.00
1|REAR RH TAILGATE OUTER GARNISH (CONSISTENT)  |GRAZED 321.80 321,80
1|REAR RH TAILGATE "FIAT LOGO" EMBLEM NOT NECESSARY 87.80 -
(CONSISTENT)
1{REAR RH TAILGATE "PROFESSIONAL" EMBLEM WECESSARY 163.50 163.50
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR RH TAILGATE GLASS (CONSISTENT) SHATTERED 540 00 540.00
1|REAR LH TAILGATE (CONSISTENT) DENTED / BENT 2,385.00 2,305 00
1|REAR LH TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP (CONSISTENT) MOT NECESSARY 344 50 -
1|REAR LH TAILGATE LOCK (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 331.00 :
1|REAR LH TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD (SN) NOT NECESSARY 384,60 i
(CONSISTENT)
T1|REAR LH TAILGATE HANDLE QUTER GARMNISH GRAZED 369.80 3659.80
(CONSISTENT) }
1|REAR LH TAILGATE OUTER HANDLE (CONSISTENT) } 556 40 ;
1|REAR LH TAILGATE "MAXI" EMBLEM (CONSISTENT) MNECESSARY 86.00 86.00
1|REAR LH TAILGATE "DOBLO" EMBLEM (COMSISTENT) MNECESSARY 118.00 118.00
1|REAR LH TAILGATE WIPER MOTOR {CONSISTENT) CRACKED 428.00 428.00
1|REAR LH TAILGATE WIPER LINK (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 165.30 i
1|REAR LH TAILGATE WIPER RUBBER (CONSISTENT) MOT NECESSARY g8.00 -
1{REAR LH TAILGATE GLASS (CONSISTENT) SHATTERED 841 50 841 50
1{REAR LH NUMBER PLATE OUTER GARNISH NO SUCH PARTS 387.00 ;
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR BUMPER [CGNEISTEN'I—:I DENTED { 745.00 B89.02
DEFORMED
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (CONSISTENT) BENT 47530 47530
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LH (CONSISTENT) CRACEKED 117.60 117.60
1|REAR END PANEL (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 430.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 347.70 -

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18012692/Upb3s2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al B B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 196607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 3
Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our Adjusted
& P Workshop )| (5)
1|REAR TAIL LAMP LH (COMSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 462.70 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -B93.13
12,771.80 B,038.19
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR RH TAILGATE "90" EMBLEM (SN) (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY a7.50 &0.00
1|REAR RH TAILGATE "MULTIJET" EMBLEM (SN) NECESSARY 119.60 60.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR RH TAILGATE "6 PAX" EMBLEM (SN} MNECESSARY 12.00 10.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR RH TAILGATE GLASS SEALANT (SN) HMECESSARY 80.00 40.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR LH TAILGATE "70 KM/H" STICKER (SN) MECESSARY 12.00 10.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR LH TAILGATE GLASS SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 80.00 40.00
{CONSISTENT)
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SN) (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 65.00 6500
1|SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN} SHORTED 220.00 200.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|SET REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS (SN} NOT NECESSARY 58.00 -
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 50.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE & BASE (SN} (CONSISTENT) BENT 48.00 40.00
1|REAR "CORPORATE" ADVERTISEMENT & ART WORK NECESSARY 400.00 300.00
[SN) [CONSISTENT)
1,242 10 825.00
LABOUR
REMOVE & INSTALL REAR RH & LH WINDSCREEN 240.00 200.00
GLASS TO FACILITATE REPAIRS.
REMOWVE AND REFIX REAR RH & LH TAILGATE 180.00 120.00
COMPONENTS & WIPER MECHANISM
LABOR FOR PANEL BEATING, CUT, WELD, 1,200.00 550.00
STRAIGHTENING & REPLACING PARTS ETCS.
INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR END PANEL.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING & INCLUDING TQUCH UP 1,200.00 800.00
PAINT OM ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS
TO CHECK ALL WIRING & ELECTRICAL COMPONENT 80.00 20.00

FOR PROPER FUNCTION,

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18012682/Upb3s2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

"-J -4 ;; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R Page No.:3 of 3
. Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
N B Workshop (5))| ($)
REMOVE AND REFIX REAR REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 50.00
TO APPLY RUST PROOFING, RESEAL TUFF-COATING 120.00 60.00
TREATMENT ON ACCIDENT AREA.
3,120.00 1,800.00
GRAND TOTAL 17,134.00 10,663.19
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 8,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18012692/Upb3s2
CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: This Report is made salely for the wss and benefit of the Glient named on the frem page of this Repart.




