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9/7/2018

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 8651N
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GBD8833R
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 11Sep 2018
Vehicle Make: NISSAN

Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:

CABSTAR 3.0 5M/T ABS 2DR 2WD EURO 5
Gold

Manufacturing Year: 2014

Engine No.: ZD30336400K

Chassis No.: JN1SC2F24Z0855603

Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $25,799.00

Original Registration Date: 10Mar 2014

First Registration Date: 10 Mar 2014

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $1,290.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 09 Mar 2024

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus

COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $50,001.00

COE Rebate Amount; $27,463.00

Total Rebate Amount: $27,463.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Sep 2018
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

e
'Fro[n: Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 11 July 2018 4:10 PM
To: Nivitha (LKK Auto); assignments@Ikkauto.com
Cc: Henry, Irene James; 'SUR'
Subject: RE: CMTD1800134/THE - LKK Ref: CS3/SMO18000481/R1d3e2; ACCIDENT
INVOLVING GBD4877R & GBD8833R ON 05.01.2018
Attachments: 1377_001.pdf; 1378_001.pdf; 1379_001.pdf: 1380_001.pdf
Importance: High
Dear Nivitha,

We refer to your reference CS3/SM018000481/R1d3e2
Please assist to get your surveyor to conduct a paper re-survey on an urgent basis

Let us have the paper re-survey report within the next 10 days.

Best Regards

Thelma Choo

Claims Divisions

D: 6322 4681 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: Www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG

Download now @ App Store or Googe lay

‘For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 09, 2018 9:00 AM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments@Ilkkauto.com

Cc: Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; 'SUR'
<sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE; CMTD1800134/THE - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD4877R & GBD8833R ON 05.01.2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.



G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

"Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 8 January 2018 5:38 PM

To: Kelly Cheng <keliv.cheng@ksteontr.com>; admin-d@Ikkauto.com: assignments@Ikkauto.com

Cc: Choo, Thelma <theIma.choo@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: CMTD1800134/THE - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD4877R & GBD8833R ON 05.01.2018

Our Reference: CMTD1800134/THE
Your Reference: TKS/ P566-ACC-39605.18/kc

Without Prejudice
Date: 8" January 2018

Attention:
M/S TEO KENG SIANG LLC
Dear Kelly,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD4877R & GBD8833R ON 05.01.2018

We refer to your email reply dated 08/01/2018.
We do not agree to your list of surveyors.

As such, we will be appointing our motor surveyor, LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS to conduct the pre-repair survey of
your client’s vehicle.

commencement of repairs.
We would like our motor surveyor to conduct a post repair inspection once your client’s vehicle has been repaired.

The survey is conducted on a without Prejudice basis and without any admission of liability.

Yours faithfully,

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147



Innovation for Wellbeing

. SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or Company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.

From: Kelly Cheng [mailto:kell .cheng@ksteo tr.com]

Sent: Monday, January 08, 2018 5:18 PM

To: Teo, Grace

Subject: Re: CMTD1800134/THE - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD4877R & GBD8833R ON 05.01.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Grace,
We refer to the above matter and to your email dated 8 January 2018.
We have our client's instructions to reject your proposal on your Single Joint Expert.

We enclosed herewith the list of our client's proposal on single joint expert for your necessary action.

the necessary.

Thank you.

On Mon, Jan 8, 2018 at 3:23 PM, Teo, Grace <grace.teo(@sompo.com.sg> wrote:

Our Reference: CMTD1800134/THE

Your Reference: TKS/P566-ACC-39605.18/kc

Without Prejudice

Date: 8" January 2018 EMAIL ONLY



Attention:

M/S TEO'KENG SIANG LLC

Dear Kelly,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD4877R & GBD8833R ON 05.01.2018

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 08/01/2018.

Please be informed that Thelma Choo the handler of this case.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)

3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
leffery Ong

4 | JP Knights Adjusters & Surveyors Jason Lek

5 [ In House surveyor Teo See Ling




Yours faithfully,

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

- Innovation for Wellbeing C f T
@ ==

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: WWw.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Best Regards,



Kelly Cheng
Tel: 6333 4222 ext 72
Fax: 6333 5675

Teo Keng Siang LLC

111 North Bridge Road
Peninsula Plaza, #29-07/08
Singapore 179098



PRO-OPTION SERVICES

Mailing address: Blk 1898 Rivervale Drive, #04-1004, Singapore 542189

Tel: 6315 1239, Fax: 63153298, Mobile: 9061 0543, Email: mirage1195@gmail.com

Report no
Vehicle no

REFERENCE
Date of inspection
Requested by

Type of survey
Repairer

Date of accident

VEHICLE DATA
Make/model
Chassis no

Engine no

Date of registration
Engine capacity
Odometer Reading
Colour

STATIC CONDITION CHEC

ACCIDENT VEHICLE INSPECTION REPORT

Steering

Foot brakes

Hand brakes
Paintwork
General Condition

TIRE CONDITION CHECK

Front tread
Rear tread

: 7 mm/Yokohama
. 6 mm/Cheng shin

: 15MO0118.PH
: GBD8833R

: 9January 2018
. SC Integrated Engineering Pte Ltd

15 Yishun Industrial Street 1
#09-12 Win 5
Singapore 768091

: Independent
- Paul Hoe Batteries & Motor Services

Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #01-109 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883

: 5January 2018

: Nissan CABSTAR 3.0 5M/T ABS 2DR 2WD EURO 5
: IN1SC2F24Z0855603

. ZD30336400K

: 10 March 2014

. 2953 cc

: Golden

: Serviceable
: Serviceable
: Serviceable
: Good
: Good

RH/MAKE LH/MAKE SIZE
7 mm/Yokohama 195/80R15
6 mm/Cheng shin 165R13

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF DAMAGE

Floor board panel crumpled, RH front door squashed/distorted, RH front suspension parts damaged, front
bumper grazed/bent/deformed, RH headlamp broken, front windscreen cracked, front RH door glass
shattered, tailgate dented/bent, etc. Please see para. 8 of this report for more details.

REMARKS

This inspection is carried out on a “WITHOUT PREJUDICE” basis and | have not authorized any repairs.

RECOMMENDATION

Cost of repairs
No. of days taken

$30,700.00 (lump sum)
Twenty-one (21)



>

ASSESSMENT OF DAMAGE AND COSTS

Report no: 15M0118.PH
Vehicle no: GBD8833R
SPARE PARTS

Description
(Nett Items)

Front windscreen glass

Front windscreen inner seal

Front panel

Front panel “CABSTAR” emblem
Front grille

Front grille logo

RH side mirror

RH side mirror arm

RH side mirror arm base cover
Front wiper panel

Front wiper linkage

Front wiper motor

RH front corner panel

RH headlamp assy

LH headlamp assy

RH headlamp lower garnish

Front bumper

Front bumper bracket RH

RH front door

RH front door hinge — upper

RH front door hinge — lower

RH front door check

RH front door weatherstrip

RH front door indicator lamp

RH front door trim board

RH front door trim board clip

RH front door power window motor
RH front door glass regulator

RH front door glass outer moulding
RH front door 1/4 garnish

RH front door inner lock

RH front door hand bezel

RH front door inner handle

RH front door glass rubber channel
RH front door lock channel

RH front door arc weatherstrip

RH front door frame

RH front door frame beading

RH front door frame inner top cover RH
RH front wheelhouse inner panel
RH front wheelhouse top sill garnish
RH front step panel board
Dashboard assy (complete)
Dashboard underside support beam
Meter assy

Instrumental cover

Centre console box
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Assessed

Condition

cracked

necessary
buckled/distorted
necessary
warped/distorted
necessary

missing

missing

missing

to repair

to reuse
serviceable
crumpled

broken

casing bent/tab fractured
bent/distorted
grazed/bent/distorted
bent
squashed/distorted
bent

bent

bent
squashed/deformed
to reuse
bent/deformed
necessary

seized

bent

torn
bent/deformed
distorted

warped

to reuse

deformed

bent

deformed
bent/distorted
squashed/deformed
warped/distorted
bent/distorted
bent/deformed
broken

side bent/cut

bent

Leg & casing bent/deformed

warped/distorted
warped/distorted

Repairer's Revised
Amount Amount
991.00 991,00 << /
205.00 €07 205.00NEL
NEV1,41270  1,412.70
na = X 3530 35.30
578.60./%7 457860 D)
48.10 48.10Me7
171.70 171.70
191.90 191.90}m15¢
111.30 111.30
494.60 0.00 2.
151.50 0.00 Nix
542.10 0.005VCx
389.90 389.9041 /
473.40 473.406¢ /
47340  -473:40 NN X
28.60 28.6057
945.10 945,10 0D/
91.50 91.50 4T
1,396.50  1,396.50 )] v
61.10 61.10BTy
61.10 61.10 BT/
39.50 39.50 BT,/
151.10 151.10 D%/
57.10 0.00 11 X
722.50 7225027,
85.00 85.00 /&0y
A\ HA Y 524.40 524.40
112.00 112.00 &7
136.20 136.20 CuT v
55.30 55.30 BT v
190.60 190.60 &7 _
101.20 101.20 %
57.00 0.00 NHX
185.20 185.20 /< v
48.90 489047 .
85.10,  85.100u],
1,646.40 ' 646,40 57
151.10 151.10 g7
114.70 114.70 47,
485.60 485.60 15/
78.40 78.40F7 v
139.40, . 139.40 (R
. 1,329.00 T LUty
A ¥ 5L 869.60 869.60
A 0N ¥£1,17820 1,178.20
~ <o Y 257.90 257.90
443.40 44340 D (S

130 oD
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Report no:

15M0118.PH
Vehicle no: GBD8833R
ABS brake pipe

Steering column assy
Steering column base cover
Steering column top cover
Steering column lower cover
Steering box

Wiper washer tank ¢/motor
Brake vacuum tank

Tailgate assy

Taillamp assy RH/RH

RH front lower arm

RH front upper arm

RH front suspension ball joint
RH front steering tie rod

RH steering ball joint

(Special nett)
ERP bracket

Front windscreen sealant

Co. registration sticker

RH front door glass

ABS pump assy

ABS wheel speed sensor wire RH
Brake booster c¢/w bracket

Brake /clutch pedal bracket
Aircon evaporator unit

RH front shock absorber

LH front shock absorber

RH front knuckle arm

RH front wheel bearing

Tailgate “70 km/h” sticker
Tailgate “13 pax” sticker
Tailgate aluminum back plate
Rear step bar

Rear step bar aluminum cover
RH front door artwork sticker set
Rear number plate

Brake oil

LABOUR

FRONT PORTION
To check wiring.

PR RRPRNRBRPRRERRRERR
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To refocus headlamp beams to specifications.

bent

bent

torn
buckled/deformed
buckled/deformed
shaft bent/jammed
squashed/distorted
squashed
dented/bent
broken

bent

bent

bent/jammed

bent

bent/jammed
Subtotal of the above
Discount

Subtotal 1:

necessary
necessary
necessary
shattered

seized

shorted

bent

bent

mounting arm bent
bent

Necessary (50%)
bent/distroted
notchy/rattled
necessary
necessary

bent

bent

bent

necessary

bent

necessary
Subtotal 2:

Total cost of parts:

To re-apply rustproofing for the affected portion.

60.20 60.20
1,162.80  1,162.80
115.50 115.50
151.20 151.20 k‘“\
135.60 135.60 |
881.60 881.60
206.40 206.40
22560 225.60/
2D 1,399.70 1,399.70
497.20 497.205¢ v
489.00 489.00°
480.00 480.00 | w1
87.50 87.50 1
34.80 34.80
124.00 124.0
24,150.30  22,848.00
10%/ 10%  2,415.03  2,284.80
21,735.27 20,563.20
26.40 26.40)
80.00 7 86:00 \yer,
3500 % 3—5:6@[
760.00 3\ 2 766:00 ERV
4,500.00  4,500.00)
525.30 525.30
310.60 310.60
208.80 208.80 | 1)
1,310.60  1,310.60 ;
180.40 180.40
180.40 90.20
857.80 857.80
73.20 73.20
15.00 15.00)
15.00 15.00 /"<
200.00 \SM 20066 27
125.00 ¥ 12500 EB]v
50.00 150.00 ETy,
150.00 "> 150.00 (L
35.00 35.00 &£ T
40.00 40.00 | ¥
9678.50  9,588.30 {5r.
31,413.77 30,151.50
29
120.00 60.00
-
80.00 60.00 /
600D
200.00 15000



Report no:
Vehicle no:

15M0118.PH
GBD8833R

Labour charges to remove and replace, to cut and weld, to panel beat
and reshape damaged body parts & panels.

Spray painting charges to putty and spray all affected parts and body
panels.

To remove and replace front windscreen glass.
To remove and replace front dashboard and support beam.

To remove and replace aircon evaporator, vacuum and charge up aircon
gas.

To remove and replace front RHS undercarriage parts.

To remove and replace ABS pump, pipe, sensing wire and test for safe
operating condition.

To remove and replace steering column, steering pump, brake/clutch
bracket, brake booster, etc. To bleed brake system of airlock and test for
safe operating condition.

To realign wheels by computerised wheel alignment.
To supply front door artwork stickers and affix after the repairs.

REAR PORTION
To check wiring.

To re-apply rustproofing for the affected portion.

Labour charges to remove and replace, to cut and weld, to panel beat
and reshape damaged body parts & panels.

Spray painting charges to putty and spray all affected parts and body
panels.

To supply tailgate artwork/information stickers and affix after the repairs.

Total cost of labour:

Total cost of repair:

3,600.00
1,500.00

150.00
450.00

120.00

600.00

800.00

450.00

90.00

150.00

45.00
120.00

900.00
750.00
300.00

10,425.00

\ (O Q)
3,000.00

200-060
1,250.00-

Y 90.00 X

150.00 7/

{00+~0D

8,170.00

41,838.77] 38,321.50|



9 CONCLUSION
Report no: 15M0118.PH
Vehicle no: GBD8833R

The actual damage sustained by the vehicle was carefully inspected and assessed during the inspection and
the assessment is appended in para. 8 of this report. The degree of damage sustained by individual part(s)
is/are carefully assessed before the part(s) is/are recommended to be either replaced or repaired.

The revised or adjusted cost of repairs to restore the vehicle is $38,321.50.

However, after considering the age and condition of the vehicle and the availability of good second hand
parts in the market, the repairs are therefore recommended to be undertaken on a contract lump sum

basis of $30,700.00 and the repairs had taken Twenty-one (21 days to complete.

The above recommendations in my view are fair and reasonable for the restoration of the vehicle to its pre-
accident condition.

Note: By accepting to carry out the repairs on a contract lump sum basis, the repairer has the discretion to
replace the damaged part(s) with used, reconditioned or new part(s), or to repair the part(s) to a roadworthy
condition.

We have not authorised any repairs and would like to revert the recommendations for your consideration
and decision.

Yours faithfully / ’

/

/

" )
i

Liaw Leong San
Licensed Automotive Appraiser

=
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" VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

‘-J; :; : 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref : CS3/SM0O18000481/Bsd3e2-1

50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06 Date: 10-09-2018

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

NN

Code: SMO
1: Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBD 4877R Veh. Inspected GBD 8833R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1800134/THE Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  THELMA CHOO Assign Date 11/07/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN CABSTAR c.c 2953
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. JN1SC2F2420855603 Colour GOLD
Odometer 145171 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/80 R15 YOKOHAMA 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/80 R15 YOKOHAMA 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |155 R15C (D) YOKOHAMA 6/6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 155 R15C (D) YOKOHAMA 6/6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S AND REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  05/01/2018 Inspection Date 09/01/2018
Survey held at PAUL HOE BATTERIES & MOTOR SERVICES
BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-109 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417833
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 16 Working Days




Ll L

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl B B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 4
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBD 8833R
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (g) (Sl)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS CRACKED 991.00 991.00
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL NECESSARY 205.00 80.00
1|FRONT PANEL (BUCKLED / DISTORTED) NOT CONSISTENT 1,412.70 -
WITH THE IMPACT
1|FRONT PANEL "CABSTAR" EMBLEM (NECESSARY) NOT CONSISTENT 35.30 -
WITH THE IMPACT
1|FRONT GRILLE DENTED 578.60 438.40
1|FRONT GRILLE LOGO NECESSARY 48.10 48.10
1|RH SIDE MIRROR MISSING 171.70 171.70
1|RH SIDE MIRROR ARM MISSING 191.90 191.90
1|RH SIDE MIRROR ARM BASE COVER MISSING 111.30 191.30
1|FRONT WIPER PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 494.60 E
LABOUR
1|FRONT WIPER LINKAGE NOT NECESSARY 151.50 -
1|FRONT WIPER MOTOR SERVICEABLE 542.10 -
1|RH FRONT CORNER PANEL CRUSHED 389.90 389.90
1|RH HEADLAMP ASSY BROKEN 473.40 473.40
1|LH HEADLAMP ASSY NOT NECESSARY 473.40 -
1|RH HEADLAMP LOWER GARNISH BENT 28.60 28.60
1|FRONT BUMPER DENTED 945.10 945.10
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET RH BENT 91.50 91.50
1|RH FRONT DOOR DENTED 1,396.50 1,396.50
1|RH FRONT DOOR HINGE - UPPER BENT 61.10 61.10
1|RH FRONT DOOR HINGE - LOWER BENT 61.10 61.10
1|RH FRONT DOOR CHECK BENT 39.50 39.50
1|RH FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP DISTORTED 151.10 151.10
1|RH FRONT DOOR INDICATOR LAMP NOT NECESSARY 57.10 -
1|RH FRONT DOOR TRIM BOARD BENT 722.50 722.50
10|RH FRONT DOOR TRIM BOARD CLIP NECESSARY 85.00 85.00
1|RH FRONT DOOR POWER WINDOW MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 524.40 -
1|RH FRONT DOOR GLASS REGULATOR BENT 112.00 112.00
1|RH FRONT DOOR GLASS OUTER MOULDING cuTt 136.20 136.20
1|RH FRONT DOOR 1/4 GARNISH BENT 55.30 55.30
1|RH FRONT DOOR INNER LOCK BENT 190.60 190.60
1|RH FRONT DOOR HAND BEZEL BENT 101.20 101.20
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1|RH FRONT DOOR INNER HANDLE NOT NECESSARY 57.00 -
1|RH FRONT DOOR GLASS RUBBER CHANNEL DISTORTED 185.20 185.20
1|RH FRONT DOOR LOCK CHANNEL BENT 48.90 48.90
1|RH FRONT DOOR ARC WEATHERSTRIP CuT 85.10 85.10
1|RH FRONT DOOR FRAME BENT 1,646.40 1,000.00
1|RH FRONT DOOR FRAME BEADING BENT 151.10 151.10
1|RH FRONT DOOR FRAME INNER TOP COVER RH BENT 114.70 114.70
1|RH FRONT WHEELHOUSE INNER PANEL DISTORTED 485.60 485.60
1|RH FRONT WHEELHOUSE TOP SILL GARNISH BENT 78.40 78.40
1|RH FRONT STEP PANEL BOARD BROKEN 139.40 139.40
1|DASHBOARD ASSY (COMPLETE) CuT 1,329.00 1,123.00
1|DASHBOARD UNDERSIDE SUPPORT BEAM TO REPAIR SEE 869.60 -
LABOUR
1|METER ASSY NOT NECESSARY 1,178.20 -
1|INSTRUMENTAL COVER SERVICEABLE 257.90 -
1|CENTRE CONSOLE BOX DISTORTED 443.40 180.00
1|ABS BRAKE PIPE NOT NECESSARY 60.20 -
1|STEERING COLUMN ASSY NOT NECESSARY 1,162.80 -
1|STEERING COLUMN BASE COVER NOT NECESSARY 115.50 -
1|STEERING COLUMN TOP COVER NOT NECESSARY 151.20 -
1|STEERING COLUMN LOWER COVER NOT NECESSARY 135.60 -
1|STEERING BOX NOT NECESSARY 881.60 -
1|WIPER WASHER TANK C/MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 206.40 -
1|BRAKE VACUUM TANK NOT NECESSARY 22560 -
1|TAILGATE ASSY DENTED / BENT 1,399.70 1,399.70
2| TAILLAMP ASSY RH / LH BROKEN 497.20 497.20
1|RH FRONT LOWER ARM NOT NECESSARY 489.00 -
1|RH FRONT UPPER ARM NOT NECESSARY 480.00 I
1|RH FRONT SUSPENSION BALL JOINT NOT NECESSARY 87.50 -
1|RH FRONT STEERING TIE ROD NOT NECESSARY 34.80 -
1|RH STEERING BALL JOINT NOT NECESSARY 124.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -2,415.03 -1,256.13
21,735.27 11,305.17
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|ERP BRACKET (SN) NECESSARY 26.40 26.40
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 80.00 50.00
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1|CO . REGISTRATION STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 35.00 25.00
1|RH FRONT DOOR GLASS (SN) BROKEN 760.00 613.00
1|ABS PUMP ASSY (SN) NOT NECESSARY 4,500.00 -
1|ABS WHEEL SPEED SENSOR WIRE RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 525.30 -
1|BRAKE BOOSTER C/W BRACKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 310.60 -
1|BRAKE / CLUTCH PEDAL BRACKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 208.80 -
1|AIRCON EVAPORATOR UNIT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 1,310.60 -
1|RH FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 180.40 -
1|LH FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 180.40 -
1|RH FRONT KNUCKLE ARM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 857.80 B
1|RH FRONT WHEEL BEARING (SN) NOT NECESSARY 73.20 E
1|TAILGATE "70KM/H" STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 15.00 15.00
1|TAILGATE "13 PAX" STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 15.00 15.00
1|TAILGATE ALUMINIUM BACK PLATE (SN) BENT 200.00 150.00
1|REAR STEP BAR (SN) BENT 125.00 100.00
1|REAR STEP BAR ALUMINIUM COVER (SN} BENT 50.00 50.00
1|SET RH FRONT DOOR ARTWORK STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 150.00 120.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) BENT 35.00 35.00
1|BRAKE OIL (SN) NOT NECESSARY 40.00 -
9,678.50 1,199.40
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. } 120.00 30.00
TO REFOCUS HEADLAMP BEAMS TO SPECIFICATIONS. } 80.00 -
TO RE-APPLY RUSTPROOFING FOR THE AFFECTED 200.00 60.00
PORTION.
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE AND REPLACE, TO CUT 3,600.00 1,600.00
AND WELD, TO PANEL BEAT AND RESHAPE DAMAGED
BODY PARTS & PANELS. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
FRONT WIPER PANEL AND DASHBOARD UNDERSIDE
SUPPORT BEAM.
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGES TO PUTTY AND SPRAY ALL 1,500.00 800.00
AFFECTED PARTS AND BODY PANELS.
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE FRONT WINDSCREEN 150.00 120.00
GLASS.
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE FRONT DASHBOARD AND 450.00 200.00
SUPPORT BEAM.
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE AIRCON EVAPORATOR, NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -

VACUUM AND CHARGE UP AIRCON GAS.

Report Ref No. CS3/SMO18000481/Bsd3e2-1




' 74 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:4 of 4
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
D f Condition
Qty escription of Parts Workshop ($) ($)
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE FRONT RHS NOT NECESSARY 600.00 -
UNDERCARRIAGE PARTS.
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE ABS PUMP, PIPE, SENSING |NOT NECESSARY 800.00 -
WIRE AND TEST FOR SAFE OPERATING CONDITION.
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE STEERING COLUMN, NOT NECESSARY 450.00 -
STEERING PUMP, BRAKE / CLUTCH BRACKET, BRAKE
BOOSTER, ETC. TO BLEED BRAKE SYSTEM OF AIRLOCK
AND TEST FOR SAFE OPERATING CONDITION.
TO REALIGN WHEELS BY COMPUTERISED WHEEL NOT NECESSARY 90.00 -
ALIGNMENT.
TO SUPPLY FRONT DOOR ARTWORK STICKERS AND NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
AFFIX AFTER THE REPAIRS.
TO CHECK WIRING. 45.00 30.00
TO RE-APPLY RUSTPROOFING FOR THE AFFECTED 120.00 40.00
PORTION.
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE AND REPLACE, TO CUT 900.00 400.00
AND WELD, TO PANEL BEAT AND RESHAPE DAMAGED
BODY PARTS & PANELS.
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGES TO PUTTY AND SPRAY ALL 750.00 300.00
AFFECTED PARTS AND BODY PANELS.
TO SUPPLY TAILGATE ARTWORK / INFORMATION 300.00 100.00
STICKERS AND AFFIX AFTER THE REPAIRS.
10,425.00 3,680.00

GRAND TOTAL 41,838.77 16,184.57
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 12,950.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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