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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL:

F256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607196R GST Reg. No. 19-9607T198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref . CCB/CTI8012636/AM3
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 Date - 11-07-2018 ” “”l“””"””” ‘"l‘l
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLQ 4579P Veh. Inspected SFZ 1801R
Paolicy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess () 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 11/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c ]
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Meodification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
[ L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre i
4, Description of Damages
5. 1 General Information
Accident Date  0B/07/2018 Inspection Date 08/07/2018
Survey held at NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE & #01-43 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
3a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

BiiN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




‘-f an LtE. I

AR 15 2 R AR R 2 5]
NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE. LTD.

| Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk C #01-43 Autobay@HKaki Bukit, Singapore 417683
Email: admin@nhtmotor.com Website: www.nhtmotor.com
Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276
UEN: 201718370K

~—
T,

09/07/2018
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 TP (htrs
#01-43 7\
Singapore 417883 . i U (

Accident date: 08/07/2018
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: SFZ1801R HYUNDAI ELANTRA 1.6 A '15
CHASSIS: KMHDH41CMGU624596

S/n Qty Items/ List U/price Amount

1 1 RearBootlid "Denicd $1,188.70 '/
2 2 Rear Boot Lid Hinge  n/¢f 1 S84.00 5168.00

3 1 Rear Boot Lid Emblem Logo $38.00 ~
4 1 Rear Boot Lid Elantra Logo | '/ $40.00

5 1 Rear Boot Lid Elite Logo J $32.80 7
6 2 Rear Boot Lid Side Reflector rcu.fud $298.50 $597.00 ¥’
7 1 Rear Boot Lid Number Plate 7~ $50.00 ©
8 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Lock 5 A $125.00 ~
9 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Rubber $115.80
10 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Trim Board pit $285.00 ~
11 8 Rear Boot Lid Inner Trim Board Clip ~ * $6.50 $52.00 7
12 1 Rear Boot Lid Camera (Special Nett) /.7 - $550.00 ~
13 2 RearTaillamp gl $354.80 $709.60 ~
14 4 Rear Tail Lamp Clip a2y $8.00 $16.00
15 1 Rear Bumper v $454.80 ~
16 8 Rear Bumper Clip $6.50 $52.80 7
17 2 Rear Bumper Side Retainer 4+ $38.00 $76.00 <~
18 2 Rear Bumper Side Reflector <! /e $58.00 $116.00 <
19 1 Rear Bumper Lower Betored $282.00 ~
20 1 Rear Bumper Inner Sponge  A/ot e $162.80-"
21 1 Rear Bumper Reinforcement =¢to. $328.00
22 2 Rear Bumper Reinforcement Bracket Ze.f $94.60 $189.20 ~
23 5 Rear Bumper Reinforcement Top & Lower Bracket” °$19.80 $99.00
24 1 Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor (Special Nett) .. $350.00+ "
25 1 Rear End Panel Repoi J $593 80
26 1 Rear End Panel Top Garnish D¢ laed $105.00
27 2 Rear Fender Inner Trim Board >+t pve $267.50 $535.00
28 1 Rear Spare Tyre Panel Top Cover b ) fréi— $255.00 -7




29 1 Rear Spare Tyre Panel & End Panel Sealant Mif ma $450.00
30 Rear Exhaust e, $798.30%
31 1 Rear Centre Exhaust | MM $886.30 .
A0 30
' Subtotal :- $9,701.10
15415 b
Labour charges
To remove & refit cushion $280:00 0o
To remove & refit reverse sensor 51M 50
To remove & refit rear & centre exhaust $380.00 *

To remove & refit rear camera

To check wiring

Tuff kote

Panel beating

Spray painting

To Jtrafﬂopef l’"’dq’ d a%s‘ﬂjﬁ

| LK

513}00/50
56996.L7

$150.00 =

Slm Qoo

$1,400:00 677

1560

Subtotal :- $3,950.00

Total:- $13,651.10

) GlorsL

]
wind



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

==
From: Lucas Lee <lucaslee@sg.cntaiping.com=
Sent: Friday, 13 July 2078 11:10 AM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLQ4579P (Ol : CT1 - SNM18D03375C02)
AND SFZ1801R (TP ; LKK REF - CC6/CTI18012636/Afb3 ) on 0B.07.2018
Attachments: leeSZ_SMM18D03375C01-5LQ4579P-LKKDirectSettlementAccidentLtr CLCRY5.856.pdf:

MSATI18087757-5LQ4579P.pdf

Dear Sirs,
Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Hwang Shiang Yi

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Direct (65) 6389 6181

Fax (B5) 6222 7175/6224 7478

Email: luces lee@sg.cotaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cnlaiping.com

!
=
v

In Sdmpapore pwer 1748

Dhisclaimer

Thix wessare s confidential; s contents do not constitute o commitment by Ching Taiping fnswrance (Singapere) Pre, Lid, exoep
witere pravided for in awritten agreement hetween vou and Ching Taiping Inswrance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. Anv wnauthorized disclosure,
nse or dissemination, either in whele or partial. is prohibited. If vou are not the intended recipient of the message, please notife the
seneder fmmediately,

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto_.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 July, 2018 5:18 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Ce: Sharon Han; Lucas Lee; Poh Kin (LKKAute); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLQ4579P (O : CTI - TBA) AND SFZ1801R (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18012636/AFb3 ) on 08.07.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case,

We had inspected TP vehicle SFZ 1801R at M/s New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID; 6841 2132,
Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phana: 6366-0055 | email; thupei@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi &venue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www symanteccloud.com
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QOur Reference: SNM18D03375/C01/8
Date: 13 JULY 2018 via Ordinary & Registered Mail

RULLY ADRIAN

1 BUKIT BATOK STREET 25
#02-18 PARKVIEW APARTMENTS
SINGAPORE 658882

Dear Sir/ Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ4575P AND SFZ1801R ON 08 JULY 2018
ALONG SLIP ROAD OF BUKIT BATOK ST 25

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SFZ1801R | is filing a third party property
claim against your vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information about the accident.

Kindly render your assistance and co-gperation accordingly.
Yours truly,
Claims Department
(This is a computer generated letter and no signature is required.)
CC | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Aln POH KIN
Ref 1 CCE/CTIB012636/AFB3

Contact No . 68412132
via Email POHKINELKKAUTO.COM

CC : Agent - (ANO571A) - M3 AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

FO1/LKKDS-2013



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Fram: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com=

Sent; Friday, 7 December 2018 2:53 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Chloe

Subject: Re: SFZ18071R CLAIMING SLQ4579P DOA DB.07.18

Without Prejudice
Hi Poh Kin
We accept your offer as $4,807 .45

Please send us the discharge voucher for close case.thanks.

EE

On Fri, Dec 7, 2018 at 2:46 PM Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@|lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CCB/AIG18012636/Afh3
Your Ref: MNPLT1807-0146/SFZ1801R
Dear Sukyi,

We refer to the above matter.

Thank you for your patient waiting on this matter.

Purely towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have
instruction from our principal to offer settlement as below:



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
m

From: Poh Kin (LKKAUto)

Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 2:47 PM

To: ‘Admin nht'

Cc: Chloe

Subject: RE: SFZ1801R CLAIMING SLOQ4579P DOA 08.07.18
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC6/AIG18012636/Afb3
Your Ref: NPLT1807-0146/5FZ1801R
Cear Sukyi,

We refer to the above matter.
lhank you for your patient waiting on this matter.

Purely towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have
instruction from our principal to offer settlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair S5 4,500.00

2. Loss of Rental {$100.00 x 3 days) S5 300.00

3. LTA search fee SS 7.45
SS 4,807.45

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on 2 without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. Mo admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affectfinfluence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement,”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4089:33)
i 74 P

- EE

SeSRER L NET Sve the Eorth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
Lnintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not

1



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
“

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November 2018 4:44 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc 'Catherine Thia'; 'sharon.han@sg.cntaiping.com’; Lucas Lee; Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLQ4579P (Ol ; CT| - TBA) AND SFZ1801R
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18012636/Afb3 ) on 08.07.2018

Attachments: LKK RESURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; Preliminary Advice.pdf; TP

Estimate-Marked. pdf

Importance: High

Our Ref: CCB/CTI18012636/Afb3
Your Ref: SNM18D03375/C01/9

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter and below E-mail.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
— Estimated cost of repair
—  Preliminary advice
Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)
78 7

SEREIR NET Suve the Earth: Print only when mecessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 July 2018 5:18 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Sharon Han <sharon.han@sg.cntaiping.com>: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
<pohkin@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLQ4579P (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SFZ1801R (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18012636/Afb3 ) on 08.07.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e
From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 17 July 2018 5:01 PM
To: ‘Admin nht'
Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: Cur Ref: CCe/CTINB012636/ATb3;  Your Ref; SFZ 1BO1R

Our Ref: CCB/CTI18012636/Afb3
Your Ref: SFZ 1801R
Dear Sirs,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SLQ 4579P AND SFZ 1801R ON 08/07/2018
We refer to above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /

under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above
mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair
to your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email; pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

24 74

" Save the Earth Print Oy ke fecesiary:



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 2:39 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto), Admin A

Cc Catherine Thia; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Chee So Chow; KKLau

Subject: RE: <Urgent><Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLQ 4579P
(Ol: SNM1BD03375C01/9) and SFZ 1B01R (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18012636/Afb3)
on 08/07/2018

Categories: clear

LKIK REF - CC6/CTI18012636/Afb3
CTI REF - SNM18D03375C02/9 (SLQ4579P)

Dear Poh Kin
We refer to your email of even date pertaining to the above matter,
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 54,807.45.

We await your payment advice to enable Catherine to act accordingly.

Hest Regards

Alfred Toh
Sonior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
J Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +656389 6183
FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175
Email: claimsdept@sq.cntaiping.com
alfred toh@sqg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.co

' ANNIVFRSARY
i 5"’1’?’" winey [ O35

Disclaimer :

Ihis message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized
ihisclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Poh Kin ({LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, December 07, 2018 11:44 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Catherine Thia <catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-

1



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e e B e

From: Poh Kin (LEKAuUto)

Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 11:44 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI'

Cc: ‘Catherine Thia’; 'alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com’; Admin A

Cubject: <Urgent> <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLQ 4579P (O1:
CTI - SNM18D03375/C01) and SFZ 1801R (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18012636/Afb3)
on 08/07/2018

Attachments: LKK Adjustment Report.pdf; LKK Inspection Report.pdf; LKIK RESURVEY PHOTO. pdf;

LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LOD_SFZ 1801R.pdf

Importance: High

Your ref : SNM18D03375/C01
Our ref : CC6/CTI18012636/Afb3

Cear Sir/madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LQ 4579P (OI) AND SFZ 1801R (TP) ALONG BUKIT BATOK STREET 25
ON 08/07/2018

We refer to the above matter.
Insured driver collided into the rear of third party vehicle. Liability is down against our insured driver.

We did clarify with Insured driver (Mr Rully) the nature of the accident and he's agree to settle and aware
that NCD [if any) would be affected.

\We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd" at $ 4,807.45(all-in).

[he summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair $13,831.10 5 4,500.00
| 2. Loss of Rental 5 360.00 (3 days x $120.00) % 300.00 (3 days x 5100.00)
| 3. LTA search fee S 7.45 $ 745
Total | $15,166.73 $ 4,807.45

**05 days recommendation for repair.
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
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Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automohile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref : CCB/CTI18012636/Ab3s2
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 076608 DeiE - Sonivl ” ‘"H‘"ulmm l"[l
Code: CTI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLG 4579P Veh. Inspected SFZ 1801R
Policy No. DMPCSMN3055281700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D03375/C02/9 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 09/07/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI ELANTRA c.c 1591
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. KMHDH41CMGUB24585 Colour RED
Odometer 67513 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[205/55R16 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[205/55R16 MICHELIN 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55R16 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 205/55R16 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  0B8/07/2018 Inspection Date 09/07/2018
Survey held at NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTELTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-43 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SFZ 1B01R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Fage Mo.:1 of 2

; Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rkshap?{'l} I$I:l
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT LID DENTED 1.188.70 1,188.70
2|REAR BOOT LID HINGE @ %84 00 NOT NECESSARY 188.00 -
1|REAR BOOT LID EMBLEM LOGO NECESSARY 3B.00 38.00
1|REAR BOOT LID ELANTRA LOGO NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
1|REAR BOOT LID ELITE LOGO NECESSARY 32.80 32 .80
2|REAR BOOT LID SIDE REFLECTOR @ $298.50 CRACKED 589700 597,00
1|REAR BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER LOCK DAMAGED 125.00 125.00
1|REAR BOOT LID INMER RUBBER cuT 115.80 11580
1|REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD NOT NECESSARY 2B5.00 -
8|REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP @ %6.50 NOT NECESSARY 52.00 -
2|REAR TAIL LAMP @ $354.80 CRACKED 709,680 709.60
4|REAR TAIL LAMP CLIP @ $8.00 NECESSARY 16.00 16.00
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 454 BO 454 80
8|REAR BUMPER CLIP @ $6.50 NECESSARY 52.00 30.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @ $38.00 NECESSARY 76.00 76.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE REFLECTOR @ $58.00 NOT NECESSARY 116.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER DEFORMED 282.00 282.00
1|REAR BUMPER INNER SPONGE NOT NECESSARY 162 80 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DEFORMED 328.00 328.00
2|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET @ $94 .60 BENT 189.20 189,20
5|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT TOP & LOWER DAMAGED 99.00 £5.00
BRACKET @ $19.80
1|REAR END PANEL TO REFAIR SEE 593.80 -
LABOUR

1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 105.00 105.00
2|REAR FEMDER INNER TRIM BOARD @ $257.50 NOT NECESSARY 535.00 -
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP COVER NOT NECESSARY 255.00 -
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL & END PANEL SEALANT MNOT NECESSARY 450.00 -
1|REAR EXHAUST MOT NECESSARY 798.30 -
1|REAR CENTRE EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 886 30 -

Report Ref No. CCB/CTIHB012636/Afb3s2
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop lg:'} l$j]
LESS 20% DISCOUNT . -885.38
8,801.10 3,541.52
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BOOT LID CAMERA (SN) NOT NECESSARY §50.00 =
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN} DAMAGED 350.00 200.00
900.00 200.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REFIT CUSHION 280.00 60.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REVERSE SENSOR, 100.00 50.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR & CENTRE EXHAUST MOT NECESSARY 380.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR CAMERA. 180.00 80.00
TO CHECK WIRING. 60.00 30.00
TUFF KOTE NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
PANEL BEATING. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,400.00 800.00
END PANEL.
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 1,400.00 800.00
TO TRANSFER BOOTLID FITTINGS. 180.00 60.00
4,130.00 1,860.00
GRAND TOTAL 13,831.10 5,601.52
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,500.00

(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CCB/CTI18012636/Afb3s2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

He Babity of resgonsibility whatsoever, in contact or to
Eepori in whels or in par, dogs s
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