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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 July 2018 5:26 PM

To: 'Joel Goh'

Cc: Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: SLW2387H - TP CLAIM AGAINST XB6166X(EQ)  DOA: 7/7/18

Dear Joel, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 10 July 2018 4:47 PM 

To: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SLW2387H - TP CLAIM AGAINST XB6166X(EQ) DOA: 7/7/18 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Anikka 

 

We will appoint LKK to take over this direct settlement. 

 

Dear LKK 

 

Please assist on the DS. 

 

Best Regards,  

 

Joel Goh  

Executive | Claims 

  

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190 

www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete al
 

 

 

From: Anikka Lai [mailto:anikkalai@honda.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, July 9, 2018 9:30 PM 
To: EQI PRS 

Subject: SLW2387H - TP CLAIM AGAINST XB6166X DOA: 7/7/18 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Attached pls find the claim documents for your necessary action. Kindly advise the liability of direct settlement. 

 

Thank you 

 

Warmest Regards 

 

Anikka Lai 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd 

255 Alexandra Road 

Singapore 159937 

DID : 6514 5481   HP : 8288 6302 

Email:  anikkalai@honda.com.sg 

 

 

 

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual 

or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from 

disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are 

hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly 

prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete 

the mail. Thank you. 


