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51 UBIAVE 1, 801-25 PAYA URT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563501 FAX : (065 62564115

Your Ref: XE3965K/SLpl Date:17/7/2018
Qur Ref' CS/ECI18012619/K1d3

The Maotor Claims Department
ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO_SJZ 7251R .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above-mentioned vehicle
on 11/7/2018 _ at the premises of M/s __ Wei Lee Motors _and have the following to

report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount 188 10.704.16
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5% 4.478.24
“Check” Items Amount ' 8% 1.474.96
Market Value : 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 8% -
Mett Value ;5% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
At o/s body portion.

Repair days: 3 Days

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Kenneth
Automotive Assessor



Mivitha (LKK Auto)
[

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Catherine,

Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey Report@ergo.com.sg>
Wednesday, 11 July 2018 2:21 PM

‘admin-d@lkkauto.com'

Ol - XE3965K / TP : SIZ7251R/LKK / DOA : 06/07/2018

XE3965K - SAS.pdf; SJZT251R - SAS.pdf; SIZ7251R - ESTIMATE pdf; SIZ7251R - PRS
FORM.pdf

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be

the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS,

ADDRESS

PERSON TO CONTACT

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE

BLK 9 5IN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
#01-32
SINGAPORE 575644

KAREN SEAH @ 6456 9830

STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle and

inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to
claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are estimate, insured and third party SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee Pei LI
Claims Assistant {Mator)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasak Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec
Singapore 038985

DID.: +65 6629 919

Tel. ; +55 6 189

Fax . +65 GB2G 9247

i, rgo. Com. s

Toewer Five



ERGO

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Gemany and Evrope. Warldwide, ERGO is rapresentad in more than 30 countries and concenirates
on Eurape and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carners

WWW.ETGD.C0M 50
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Date: 11.07.2018 Sent via Fax
Our Reference:  XE 3965K/5L/pl
Your Reference: 52 7251R

or

Email
weIleqmntumarks@gmall.cum

To: WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

Pre-Repair Survey (PRS) Ack nowledgement
Vehlele Fer Inspection: SIZ T251R
Insured's Vehicle: XE 3965K

Date OFf Accident: 06.07.2018

We acknowledge receipt of Your request for PRS an: 10.07.2018
— -l

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Am endment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selectian in the box marked *, FL KK, MU &"E‘lh“‘r‘( }

Als Automobile Inspection Servicas Fte Ltd LBS L.B.5 Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

FTa FormTeam Consulra ncy Pte Lid * LKE LEK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

145 Infiniti Appraisal Servica PS Priority Services

IPK IP Enights Pre Ltg VAC Vicom Ltd j

L |Your request for inspection doss nat have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy.
| |Yeurrequest for inspection does not have your elient's GlA re pert, kindly forward 3 co pY.

L |Weatknowledge your interest for direct settlem ent, we will assess & revert SG0N Upon receipt of estimats,
L |Qur insured's driver has not reported the accident to us todane,

LY Jothers:  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LI

Prepared by: a“)__‘r_/ L’ | reu | 6829 9154 claims@ergo.com.sg
Signature: T N l r FAX : 6829 0247

Assessor use only: Wearkshop uge only;
Agsessar attanded warkshop on;
Assignment Date:

Date:
Assignment Time: Time

Inspactor:
Remarks;

D Vehicle nogt available at the appointed date and tima,

Kindly acknowledge our ASSESSOF presence for the abowe job |

=
»
& &y,
Workshop Ackment & Stamp,

Nete: Qur inspection is on a without odmission to Nability basis.



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 July 2018 11:56 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.); assignments
cc SUR

Subject: RE: XE3965K / TP : SJZ7251R/LKK / DOA : 06/07/20718

Attachments: PREL| ADVISED SJZ 7251R.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJZ 7251R

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
amPhone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay{@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 July 2018 2:34 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com=

Cec: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: XE3965K / TP : SJZ7251R/LKK / DOA: 06/07/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G .Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 11 July 2018 2:21 PM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Subject: Ol : XE3965K / TP : SJZ7251R/LKK / DOA : 06/07/2018

Dear Catherine,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions amendment Mo.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS,

ADDRESS : BLK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE

1



& # A& %
WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32
SINGAPORE 575644,

TEL. 6456 9830

Blsiases Hagn Mg

Dated : 10/7/2018

EGRO INSURANCE PTE LTD

FAX' 6458 0128

TELER0

ez A ém’,g_,,

p 2L, © 0ok
Yo, 4 fn /%,

5, Temasak Boulevard dfﬂ/
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five K<
Attn: Motor claim department-3rd party claim %ﬂn‘%ﬁ.ﬁﬁgﬁ%w“‘* _n__?“"n'e notify
Claiming against your insured vehicle no: XE3965K' " o otay pairling
Accident involving vehicle no : SIZ7251R / XE3965K . Pt S
Date of Accident : 9/7/2018 e . L }
PL :Woodlands Avenue 2 e !
5 Subgect
Dear officer incharge, Acknowledged by Repairer
Re: Estimate of repair to 5JZ7251R é::-”ur'f'
To supplied:-
Description Quantity Amount 5
Front Fender Rh af A, 396.40 "
Fender WWT Emblem 1 rie, 4610 |jp—
Front Fender Cowling 1 Ve 101.90 X
Headlamp Rh 1 S 45660 | A
Front Door Rh ;s 1 1,038.40 t—
Doar Hinge @ 56.40 77 2 11280 | x
Front Door Checker | S | 49.40 A
Front Doorboard J 1 1,097.60 A
Door Lock vl 1 291.50 x
Door Outer Handle - Small = 1 37.10 | X
Front Door Power Window Mechanism Rh 1 /0 349.10 f
Rear Door Rh /%y 1 1,072.30 +—
Rear Doorboard 1 A~ 105220 | ¥
Door Outer Handle - Long 2y 1 79.40 —_—
Door Outer Handle - Small Iy 1 37.10 —
Rear Door Lock T | 29150
Rear Door Hinge @ 56.40 1 2 112.80 X
Rear Door Checker . 1 4940 (X
Front Door Weather Strip 1 i 221.20 ?’
Rear Door Weather Strip 1 Ji- 221.20 K’
Rear Door Power Window Mechanism Rh By’ T, 1 349.10 —
Rear Fender Rh P 1 1,543.00 <~
Rear Fender Cawling S 1 59.10 A
Total 5,105.20
Parts Less 20% -1,821.04

7,284.16




Vehicle No: SJZ7251R

Towing fee 80.00
To remove/refit rear windscreen glass A~ 180.00
To transfer front n rear door glass,moulding and all attachment to new door. 200.00

To remove damaged parts and attachments.
Cut n weld damaged fender,panel.
Straighten center n frant pillar.
Repair/reshape all damaged/dented areas,

Replace/align above parts into position. 1,300.00
To spray paint 1,600.00
Alignment. 80.00

Fe Frd

/_Ze..!,

Focy
?ﬂ ﬂ-‘,/‘

10,704.16



'Vl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-"' = 51 Ubd Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
"’—4—. TEL. 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 100607198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref CS/EGI18012619/Kid3n2
MM
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 21-00-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. XE 30965K Veh. Inspected SJZ7251R
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. XEAGESKISLp! Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Y¥EE PE! LI Assign Date 11/07/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI AVANTE (A) c.c 1591
Engine No. HICDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. KMHDU41BEMALD18291 Colour METALLIC BLACK
Odometer 198477 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Meodification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOoOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/60 R15 FALKEN 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |125/60R15 FALKEN 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/60R15 FALKEN 3 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/60 R15 FALKEN 3mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE Q/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/07/2018 Inspection Date 11/07/2018
Survey held at WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS
BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
#01-32
SINGAPORE 575644.
Sa. Remarks
AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BilN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: & Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJZ T251R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 406833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199607T198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Page No. 1 of 2

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | = mmp?g” “l}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT FENDER RH BENT 396 40 396.40
1|FENDER WWT EMELEM NECESSARY 4610 4610
1|FRONT FENDER COWLING SERVICEABLE 101.80
1|HEADLAMP RH SERVICEABLE 456 60
1|FRONT DOOR RH BENT 1.038.40 1,038.40
2|DOOR HINGE @356.40 TO REPAIR SEE 112.80
LABOUR
1|FRONT DOOR CHECKER SERVICEABLE 49 40
1|FRONT DOORBOARD SERVICEABLE 1,097 80 -
1|DOOR LOCK TO REPAIR SEE 291 50 -
LABOUR
1|DOCR OUTER HANDLE-SMALL SERVICEABLE 37.10 -
1|FRONT DOOR POWER WINDOW MECHANISM RH TO REPAIR SEE 34810 -
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR RH BENT 1,072,230 1,072.30
1|REAR DOORBOARD SERVICEABLE 1,052.20 -
1|DO0OR QUTER HANDLE-LONG DISTORTED 79.40 79.40
1|DOOR QOUTER HANDLE-SMALL DENTED ario 3710
1|REAR DOOR LOCK JAMMED 291.50 291.50
2|REAR DOOR HINGE @%56.40 TO REPAIR SEE 112.80 -
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR CHECKER SERVICEABLE 49.40 -
1|FRONT DOOR WEATHER STRIP SERVICEABLE 221.20 -
1|REAR DOOR WEATHER STRIP SERVICEABLE 221.20 -
1|REAR DOOR POWER WINDOW MECHANISM RH BENT / JAMMED 34910 34910
1|REAR FENDER RH TO REPAIR SEE 1,543.00
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER COWLING SERVICEABLE 9910 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,821.04 -6562.06
7,284 16 2648 24
LABOUR
TOWING FEE 80.00 50.00

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18012619/Ktd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industral Park, Singapors 408933
TEL: 6256 31561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607186-R Page Mo 2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
=y 5 Workshop (8))] __(5)

TO REMOVE/REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS. NOT NECESSARY 160.00

TO TRAMSFER FRONT N REAR DOOR GLASS MOULDING 200.00 120.00

AND ALL ATTACHMENT TO NEW DOOR

TO RMEOVE DAMAGED PARTS AND ATTACHMENTS.CUT 1,300.00 700.00

N WELD DAMAGED FENDER PANEL STRAIGHTEN

CENTER M FRONT PILLAR. REPAIR/RESHAPE ALL

DAMAGED/DENTED AREAS REPLACE/ALIGN ABOVE

PARTS INTO POSITION.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF

DOOR HINGE,DOOR LOCK FRONT DOOR POWER

WINDOW MECHANISM RH REAR DOOR HINGE AND

REAR FENDER RH

TO SPRAY PAINT 1,600.00 900.00

ALIGNMENT, 80.00 §0.00

3,420.00 1,830.00

GRAND TOTAL 10,704.16 4,478.24

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMFP SUM REPAIRS 3,500.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION}

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18012619/Ktd3n2

/454

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is rmade solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front pags of this Roport.
s labilibe of resgonsibiiy whatsgever, in contact or lert. is accented to any third garty wio may reoly on the Reper wholly or 0 part, Any third sary 8cling of replving on this
hits @r her own nisk.

Reporl. in whole or in part, does $¢ Al




