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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, January 2, 2020 1:31 PM
To: Ng Wai Yin
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 3067J  & SHC 5169D ON 06/07/2018 -- AAD1807-055

TrackingTracking: Recipient Delivery

Ng Wai Yin

Admin A

shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 1/2/2020 1:31 PM

olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 1/2/2020 1:31 PM

Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 1/2/2020 1:31 PM

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear  Sir/Madam, 
 
The above matter refers. 
 
Damage to the third party vehicle (as per images below) seem to suggest the bumper was pulled away rather 
than a direct impact as such, we opine that third party’s sketch is not consistent to the damages.  
 
 

 
 
 



2

 
 
As such, our principal are unable to consider liability against our Insured under BOLA 27 unless any supporting 
evidence (for e.g. scene photo/video footage) is provided. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
  

From: Ng Wai Yin 
Sent: Thursday, 29 August 2019 11:21:02 AM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Admin A; 'claims' 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 3067J & SHC 5169D ON 06/07/2018 -- AAD1807-055 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Khanchna 
  
We regret to inform that we do not have PIR for this case due to no traffic police in the scenes.  
  
Our driver was in stationary position and your insured vehicle who hit onto our taxi rear portion.  
  
Hope you can review this matter let us have your revised offer. 
  
Thank You 
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Best Regards, 
Ng Wai Yin 
Finance Department 
TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 
  
*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 
  

 
  
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you 
have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or 
disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for 
response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 
  
  

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 27 August, 2019 4:31 PM 
To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 3067J & SHC 5169D ON 06/07/2018 
  
YOUR REF: AAD1807-055/SHC5169D 
OUR REF: CC3/LCR18012613/Kkb3 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
The above matter refers. 
  
Kindly let us have a copy of the Police Investigation Result. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
 


