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5 Consultants
- S P Lid Campany Registration Mo, 199607 198H

!’ ;"['j Auto

51 UBEAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 308031 TEL : (0651 62561361 FAX 65 6256015

Your Ref: D18005260MESH Date: 13 July 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18012592/T1sd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SKD 4315P .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 11/07/2018 at the premises of M/s 3A Automobile Pie Ltd and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 8% 647440 .
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 1,828.80 ;
“Check”™ Items Amount 1 5%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value . 5% ;
Nett Value 85 T
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s portion.

raar
from

Comments/ Present Status;
Damages Consistent,
Repair days: 4 Days

Yours faithfully,
Mohamad Taufikh
Automotive Assessor



Ms‘ FI rs tCa pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited tcReg Mo 1950001060 GST Beg ho, M2-0O016769

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare 048580
Tel |B5) 6222 2311 Fax [B5) 6222 1547

Clalms & Motor Undenwaiting Dept: 36 Robinson Soad #16-01 Cliy House Singapore 068877
Tek (65] 6507 3848 Fax: [B5) 6507 3845
waww.msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

06-07-2018 Our Ref No. D18005260MFSH
02-07-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHDE918Y Third Party Vehicle. SKD4315P

120 LOWER DELTA ROAD #02-15 CENDEX CENTRE
WINNIE FAN
62231122/ 0 Fax No. 67386666

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSLULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

3A AUTOMOBILE PTE

LTD Attention. NIL
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




TH12018

Claim Workfiow Systam

Job Sheet (/ClaimWs/Surveyor/JobSheet/242151) = PRI Documents (@ | Close X
PRI Header Details
Claimant
Claim No D18005260MFSH Policy No D-18088936MFSH S.No & 1 & 3A AUTORM
Name
PTELTD | SUrvey 120 LOWER DELTA ROAD #02-15 CENDEX CENTRE
Workshop S O = Location ERD
N (Contact Person : WINNIE B Conbant Mobile: 0 , Phone: 62231122 , Fax: 67386666
s FAN) ! Emailld: WINNIE.FAN@BKW.SG
Details
Our LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS Instructions
WITHOUT P ;
Surveyor PTE LTD To Surveyor RETEIEE
Insured COMPORT Insured AR
TRANSPORTATION PTE SHD6&I18Y Vehicle SkKD4315P
Name Vehicle No
LTD No
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 06-07-2018 09:08:54 PM Appointed 11-07-2018 09:58:09 AM | Accept 11-07-2018 1
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
Surveyar Surveyor gﬂ:ﬂ:: =
Inspection o Rt Laks 11-07-2018 Bt | Choose File
Date *: B, e
Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make ¥ Model Please Select Model ¥ | Year Select Year
Chasis No [ Engine No 1 Mileage |
Cubic
Golar I Capacity r
Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Multiple Documents
File Name Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks

Save

https:/fficlaims. com:S001/ClaimWS/SurveyorDetails/24 2151

172



5hirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@Ikkauto.com=
Sent: Thursday, 26 July 2018 9:37 AM

To: "Winnie Fan'

Cc: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auta)'

Subject: RE: After repair photos for SKD 4315 P

Hi Winnie,

COR lumpsum 51400 , 4 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Winnie Fan [mailto:winnie.fan@bkw.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 24 July 2018 5:23 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: After repair photos for SKD 4315 P

Hi Taufikh,
Attached is the after repair photos for SKD 4315 P you surveyed on 11/07/2018.

Please let us have the finalise amount ASAP.
Thank you and have a wonderful day! ©

Winnie Fan

34, Automobile Pte Ltd
120 Lower Delta Road
#02-15 Cendex Centre
Cingapore 169208
ﬂDFFiCE : 223 1122

@'FEIX : 738 bBb6

Email : winnie.fan@bkw.sg



Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 13 July 2018 1:24 PM

To: EILEEMLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG; 'Claim Warkflow System’
Cc 'SUR'; 'Mivitha (LKK Auta); ASSIGMMENTS@LEKAUTO.COM
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005260MFSH/1

Attachments: SKD 4315P - Preli Advise pdf

Dear Eileen,

Enclosed preliminary revised for SKD 4315P.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Nivitha [LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 July 2018 10:21 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ <cwsmoto rclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKALUTO.COM
Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005260MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@[kkauto.com | fax: 6250-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{q08y33)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailtn:cwsr‘nntnrciaims@msﬁrstcapital.mm.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 July 2018 9:59 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005260MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team
. Claim Workflow System

. 1



Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




3A Automobile Pte Ltd

No 120 Lower Delta Road #02-15 Cendex Centre Singapore

160208 Tel: 6223 1122 Fax: 6738 6666

Estimate Report

Date: 9-Tul-2018

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

36 Robinson Road

#16-01

Singapore 068877

Email: MotorClaims@msfirstcapital com.sg
Attn: Claims Officer

Vehicles Number; SKD 4315 P
Make and Model: Citroen Grand C4 Picasso 1.6
Date Of Accident. 2-Jul-20N8

Tel: 65073848

Dept: Motor Claim Department Fax: 65073849
Unit List ltems Units Price Prices
1 lpc |Front Left Door $  1,54500|% Ry 1,545.00
1 |pe |Front Left Door Protector 5 148005 oA — 14800
1 |pc |Front Left Fender $ 482.00 | $ Ky  482.00
8 |pes |Front Inner Shield Clips 5 200]% X aM 16.00
1 |pc |Rear Left Fender $ 152800|8% £y 1528.00
1 |pc |Rear Left Door $ 1,345.00 | § £y 1,345.00
1 |pc |Rear Left Door Protector $ 13800 | 3 et 138.00
8 |pcs |Rear Inner Shield Clips $ 2008 Xpa 16.00 281
SiTotal 3 5,218.00 |y ey
Less 20% lnzfa ($1,043 60) g 2574
E 4,174.40 |
Labour Charges = A (R
To Provide Skill Labour & Material to do Surface Treatment / 7> o)+ k] o
Epoxy Treatment and to Respray with 2K Paint On All Affected .ggf.." A i )
Areas with Oven Spray Booth Facilities. g 1.100.00 J
To Remove & Replace the Damaged Parts as Listed Above,
including Reinstatemnents of necessay Attachments & Fittings to w
Facilitate Repairs: Jack, Panel Beat & Reshape the Affected
Parts & Components, Correct & Realign the Necessary Parts. 3 1.200.00
Total 3 6,4?&.4#)
Yours faithfully. _ 6a0b20
3A Automobile Pte Ltd T TF '[} 1 '*Q‘{’\
Person to contact: Johnny / Winnie
Mobilephone : 9786 8677 / 6223 1122 ula [ (% Q (ou?
W B N
LKK Auto Consultants hence notify ‘T@‘""" s \\x\\
the Repairer of the following:

«To dinpl ay damaged

- I
Mo illegal modification(s) is alloweag

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Dt

= To resurvey belora/aher spray painting
parts) during resurvay Sur @ IM»LCV’J: ATV

. :hr': prices are aubject 1o confirmation
L]
hird party survey is on a “Withau Prejudice” basis

® Supplementary itemy
5) muist be
is subjeci o I resuTveyed and

inal approval om Insurancs Company




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapare 408833
TEL: 6256 1561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

'Y V4 74

a-’ff--'_-

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref - CS/FCIMB012592/T1sd3n2
#16.01 GITo HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 B SEeec NIH“M"W"W
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 6918Y Veh. Inspected SKD 4315F
Policy No. D-18088936MFSH Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D18005260MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN Assign Date 11/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model CITROEN GRAND C4 c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. VFTUASFVBBJTE285T Colour BLUE
Odometer 118771 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/50 R17 NEXEMN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/50 R17 NEXEN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/50 R17 NEXEN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/50 R17 NEXEM & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/07/2018 Inspection Date 11/07/2018
Survey held at 3A AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
BLK 120 LOWER DELTA ROAD
#02-15
SINGAPORE 169208
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]EsnmmEn NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




I Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg, No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No..1of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKD 4315P

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {:ﬂ {']}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT LEFT DOOR TO REPAIR SEE 1,545.00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT LEFT DOOR PROTECTOR cuT 148.00 148.00
1|FRONT LEFT FENDER TO REPAIR SEE 482,00
LABOUR
B|FRONT INNER SHIELD CLIPS @$2.00 NOT NECESSARY 16.00 i
1|REAR LEFT FENDER TO REPAIR SEE 1,528.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR LEFT DOOR TO REPAIR SEE 1,345.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR LEFT DOOR PROTECTCOR cuTt 138.00 138.00
8|REAR INNER SHIELD CLIPS @$2.00 NOT NECESSARY 16.00 -
LESS 10%: DISCOUNT -521.80 -28.60
4,696.20 257.40
LABOUR
TO PROVIDE SKILL LABOUR & MATERIAL TO DO 1,100.00 800.00

SURFACE TREATMENT/EPOXY TREATMENT AND TO
RESPRAY WITH 2K PAINT ON ALL AFFECTED AREAS
WITH OVEN SPRAY BOOTH FACILITIES.

TO REMOVE & REPLACE THE DAMAGED PARTS AS 1,200.00 700.00
LISTED ABOVE, INCLUDING REINSTATEMENTS OF
NECESSARY ATTACHMENTS & FITTINGS TO FACILITATE
REPAIRS JACK PANEL BEAT & RESHAPE THE AFFECTED
PARTS & CPMPONENTS.CORRECT & REALIGN THE
NECESSARY PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
FRONT LEFT DOOR FRONT LEFT FENDER,REAR LEFT
FENDER AND REAR LEFT DOOR

2,300.00 1,500.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,996.20 1,757.40
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,400.00
{TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/FCI18012592/T1sd3n2
| ‘g‘
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng, AMSOE,AMIRTE.AMSAE-A M.MATAI|
Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report |8 made solely for the use and banelit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




