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Catherine Chuna (LKK Auto)

From: Admin-D (LkKAute) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 6:32 PM

To: 'CWS Motaor Claims'

Ce: assignments

Subject: RE: REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D18005275MFSH;ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SHB3306T AND SLIS18D ON 05-07-2018

Dear Sir f/ Madam,

Mease be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection after some attempts to inform the workshop to
aresent the vehicle,

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavailability of the owner, therefore we decided to
temporarily close this case.

Cindly advise us if there isany arrangément made and will be glad to re-opeén thie case accordingly.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pie Lad

Thone: b741-8444 | email: issgnmentsflkkoutocom | fux: sa56-4915
lk 51, Paya Ubi todustrial Parck, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{qo8933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

3ent: Monday, 10 December, 2018 2:18 PM

To: "CWS Motar Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Ze: assignments <assignments@lkkauto,.com> _ _

Subject: RE: REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D18005275MFSH;ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB3306T AND
5LI518D ON 05-07-2018

Dear Sir/ Madam,
Thank you for yout email.

Please be informed that according 1o the repairer, owner 5L 5180 did not send in vehicle for repair as liability not
Zlear.

Kindly advise.

Hest Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: psaignments@lkkauto.com | fx: 6250-4315
Blk 51 Pivia Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenuoe 1, #02-25 | S{408037)

Fram: CWS Maotor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)
Sent: Mondawf, 10 Becember, 2018 1:44 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital com.sg>; Lurene Jaw <Lurenelaw@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
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Ms @ FirstCapital

M3 First Capital Insurance Umited o ses bie 1000006 651 Rew b S0 000102
& Rafies Quay #2200 t
Tob (B5F622¢ FI11 Fax [B5) 6222 3547

Pvtar Undriting Beyt: 6 Rstinsan Hoad #1601 Gty House Singagere 063677

i §
Tel (B5) 6507 3848 . Fax {85) 6507 3849
mnmlfmﬂn!.m

Dats

Accldent Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Conlact Persaon.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person
Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
08-07-2018 Our Ref No. D1B005275MFSH
05-07-2018 Cialm Type. Third Party
SHB3306T Third Party Vehicle. SLI518D

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #02-11 AUTOBAY
AH XIAN

65096585/ 92327457 Fax No. 85096684

WITHOUT PRE.JUDICE:
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of clalm for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY BEQUEST

Ce : Warkshap

Ce : TP Salicitor

Officer Incharge

JEC AUTOMOTIVE Attention. MNIL
JUSEQUITY LAW
CORPORATION TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindty submit the survey rapon via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This [s & computer generated latter, no gignature requlred,
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