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51 UBLAVE 1, #001-25 PAYA URL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18005279MFSH Date: 18 July 2018

QOur Ref: CS/FC118012524/Ugb

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _S.JB 9946H .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 17/07/2018 at the premises of M/s TAN LIM MOTOR. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S$  1.250.00
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5% 800.00
“Check” Items Amount : 83 -
Market Value : S§ -
LTA Reimbursement Value : S8 -
Nett Value 1 5% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the o/s rear portion.

Yours faithfully

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser



MSs & FirstCapital

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (B5) 6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coReg be 15500010680 C4F Reg bo. M2 -GOGLGTG-9

Claims & Mater Underwriting Cept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore QSBR77

Tel: (65} 6507 384 Fax (65] H507 3849
whanw msfirstcapital. comusg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
00-07-2018 Our Ref No.
05-07-2018 Claim Type.
SHAD516D Third Party Vehicle.
51 DEFU LANE 10
LAM WEI SHONG WILLIAM
68585121/0 Fax No.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
MA Fax No.

MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D18005279MFSH

Third Party

SJBS846H

68580877

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cec : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

TAN LIM MOTOR PTE

Attention.
LTD
MA TP Solicitor Fax No.
LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

MA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature reguired.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

E

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 July 2018 5:03 FM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’; assignments

Ce: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005279MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI18012524Ugb.pdf

Dear Lurene,
Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SJB 9546H,

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sipwse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #Fo2-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 July 2018 10:13 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: LURENEJAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005279MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:; 6741-B434 | email: agsi s@lkkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 9 July, 2018 6:51 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; LURENEJAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005279M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team
Claim Workflow System



Used Toyota Wish Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page 1 of 3
sGC ARMART.COM Login  Sign up

Mew Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Praducts Insurance Articles Forum Resources

Post an Advertisement ARl A3 T 1A TTIE AMDIIIREORSS VALUE FOR MONEY |
Self i yourself Advertise it &t just N Direct Owne: Low Mieage VALUE FORTIME |
$58 until it's SOLD! P ARG Bk A PEACE OF MIND i
-
L
Browse by Category ] =Back{1234) Sort by Date Posted ~| 20 results/page | v |
75 vehiclas Toyota Wish d Search M Submit
Mgdal Price Depreciakion Req Da Eng Cap Mileage Weh Type
Search Selection Toyots Wis 2008 Ava
Toyota Wish L8A [New 5-yi 537,800 £7,560 fyr 08-Sep- 2008 1,794 cc MPY Available
COE)

Down Payment 28000 Lowest Monthiy $688 Onwards, Low [nterest At 3.68% Per Annum By GV Cars Financing. 100% Laan Appraval, 2 Years
Warranty/Servicing By GV In House Workshop. New Fully Pure Leather Se...

{a¥ Credit Pte Ltd
Toyala Wish 1.88 (New S-yr $37,800 37,560 fyr 31-Jul-2008 1,794 o - MPY Available
COE)
Down Payment $2800! Lowest Monthly $6B8 Onwards. Low Interest At 3.68% Per Annum By GV Cars Financing. 100% Loan Approval, 2 Years
Warranty/Servicng By GV In House Warkshop, New Fully Pure Leather Se, .. )
i [ FRE I D
GV Crecidt Pre Lid
s ot
Toyota Wish 1.8A Aero Tourer 533,800 56,700 fyr 29-Jul- 2008 1,794 cC 143 000 km MPY Availabla
{New S-yr COE)
In Howse Finance And Low Monthly Instalment $563 Available. Cheap Manténance, Relable, Low Fuel Cansurmption, Agent Unit. Call Now, ;
TR
Speado Mokoring
Toyota Wish LBA (New 5-yr $36,B00 47,360 jyr 16-Sep- 2008 1,794 cc MY Available

COE)

50 Dirive Away And 50 Down Payment Avaiable, No Worries About Down Payment, Bank And In House Loan Available, Low Interest Rate, Low Down
Payment Or Mo Down Payment Available, High Trade Tn, Fast And .,

Vish,

Toyota Wish 1.8A (New 5-yr %33,900 56, 780 fyr 20-Aug- 2008 1,794 cc 160,000 km MPY Available
COE)

CEETD
Toyota Wish L.8A (New S-yr £38. 800 $7. 760 fyr -Sep-2008 1,794 cc 107,000 km Py Availalle
CODE)

One Chwrer, 54,800 Down Payment, 5717 Monthly Tnstaliment, New Paintwork, all Dene Up, No Further Begair 15 Meeded, Do Drop By For
Wiewing,'test Drive.

http://'www.sgearmart.com/used_cars/listing. php?RGD=2008&MOD=Toyota Wish&RPG=20&VEH=0&... 17-Jul-18



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Wehicle Owner Particulars
Owener 1D Type:

Chwier 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Wehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year;
Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Walue:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:

o Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date;
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE PeriodiYears):
POF Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Page | of |

Business
5816E

SIB99446H
Mo

06 Jul 2018
TOYOTA

WisH 1.8 A
Sihver

2007
1222991020
ZME100387183
27.0kW (130 bhp)
31495100

29 Jan 2008

2% Jan 2008

2

$15050.00

Forfeited

£0.00

28 Jan 2023

E - Open Category
5

$26,136.00

523 831.00
$23,831.00

Please note that the S-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (it applicable), whichever is earlier.

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 06 Jul 2018

_—

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput ?FUNCTION _1D=F03. .

OK

06/07/2018



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of 2

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Prirary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Business
5816E

SJB9946H

No

17 Jul 2018
TOYOTA

WISH 1.8 A
Silver

2007
1272991020
ZNE100387183
97.0 kW (130 bhp)
$14,951.00

29 Jan 2008

29 Jan 2008

2

$15,050.00

Forfeited

$0.00

28 Jan 2023

E - Open Category
5

$26,136.00
$23,676.00
$23,676.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle
must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if

applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Jul 2018

https://vrl.la.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By Public Before Dereglnput?FUNCTION _ID=F0304... 17-Jul-18

OK



MS FCIL Insured's Vieh No : SHAS16D
Date of Accident : 05 July 2018

Messrs JF Limo Services

TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD

51 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539216
Tel - 68585151 ( 24 Hours )  Fax : 68580877

GST Regn. No. : M2-8922054-2

Date : 09 July 2018

/ Lol -

Estimate To Repair SJB9946H - Toyota Wish 1.8 A | 22 @ o
Chassis No : ZNE100387183 U= k{ I E'J'ﬁ
SiNo | Quantity Description Amaount

LABOUR & MISC. CHARGES
01 Panel beating, knocking and straighten the right rear fender and right| 45000 1L 0D

rear door, adjust and realign the same.
02 Putty and spray painting of the affected portion. 3 800.00 | o %

5 1,250.00
Total $ 1,250.00

4 %n/{
A S

19/7/0F

p/p ® £00
B
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref ©  CS/FCI8012524/Ugbn2
T D1 CEF Mok R IGHFPORE DESETY b, (2 M|‘||IH|”|||‘“H"I
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 516D Veh. Inspected 5.8 9946H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1800527SMFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date 08/07/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAWISH (A) c.C 1754
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. ZNE100387183 Colour SILVER
Odometer 199372 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/45 R17 PIRELLI g mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/45R17 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/45R17 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/45 R17 MICHELIN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  05/07/2018 Inspection Date 17/07/2018
Survey held at TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD
51 DEFU LANE 10
SINGAPORE 539216
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTIOMN WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE"™ BASIS.
C)HIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




N’ ’d LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
.H. : - i 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: G256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607196R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R Page Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJB 9946H

. Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (3)) ($)
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEN THE 450.00 200.00

RIGHT REAR FENDER AND RIGHT REAR DOOR ADJUST
AMND REALIGN THE SAME.

PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED BOO.00 500.00
PORTION.

1,250.00 BOO.0O
GRAND TOTAL 1,250.00 800.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 800.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18012524/Ugbn2
MARKET VALUE: §33,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: 523,831.00=NETT VALUE: $9,169.00

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




