
1

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 5:49 PM
To: 'Julia - Shu Fatt Auto Works'
Subject: RE: Accident involving SJY 3228 R and SKV 5444 Z on 6 July 2018 (Our Ref. 

SF/062/2018)
Attachments: DV_SJY3228R.pdf

Without Prejudice 
  
Hi Julia, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
*Meantime, kindly let us have a clearer copy of rental agreement. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 

From: Julia - Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 1:18 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving SJY 3228 R and SKV 5444 Z on 6 July 2018 (Our Ref. SF/062/2018) 
 
Miss Chew 
Without prejudice 
 
Your revised offer of $2,463.00 is acceptable. 
 
Kindly forward payment soon. 
 
Thank you 
樹發汽車修理廠 
Shu Fatt Auto Works 
Julia Wong 
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Tel: 62730119 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, October 03, 2018 12:57 PM 
To: Julia - Shu Fatt Auto Works 
Subject: RE: Accident involving SJY 3228 R and SKV 5444 Z on 6 July 2018 (Our Ref. SF/062/2018) 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Julia, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
 
We are prepared to revise our offer as follows: - 
 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 2,140.00 
2. Loss of Rental (3days x $100.00)(w/GST) $    321.00 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $        2.00 

TOTAL $ 2,463.00 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
*Meantime, kindly let us have a clearer copy of rental agreement. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 

From: Julia - Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 27 September 2018 11:17 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving SJY 3228 R and SKV 5444 Z on 6 July 2018 (Our Ref. SF/062/2018) 
 
Miss Chew 
Without prejudice 
 
Let’s settle at $2,470. 
 
We look forward to your settlement. 
 
regards 
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樹發汽車修理廠 
Shu Fatt Auto Works 
Julia Wong 
Tel: 62730119 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, September 26, 2018 5:22 PM 
To: Julia - Shu Fatt Auto Works 
Subject: RE: Accident involving SJY 3228 R and SKV 5444 Z on 6 July 2018  
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Julia, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We propose settlement at a global sum of $2,460.00(all-in). 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 

From: Julia - Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 15 August 2018 4:16 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involving SJY 3228 R and SKV 5444 Z on 6 July 2018  
 
Miss Chew Hsiao Tong 
Without prejudice 
 
We now forward LOD with supporting documents for your settlement of $2,527.20. 
 
Please let us have same soonest. 
 
Thank you 
樹發汽車修理廠 
Shu Fatt Auto Works 
Julia Wong 
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Tel: 62730119 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, July 12, 2018 2:35 PM 
To: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: RE: Accident involving SJY 3228 R and SKV 5444 Z on 6 July 2018  
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear 
and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case. 
  
Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of 
repair to your client’s vehicle. 
 
The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the 
accident. 
  
And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor. 
 
Please note that all finalisation subject insurer’s approval. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 

From: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works [mailto:shufatt@singnet.com.sg]  
Sent: Thursday, 12 July 2018 2:33 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: Accident involving SJY 3228 R and SKV 5444 Z on 6 July 2018  
Importance: High 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Rasul surveyed the vehicle. 
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Any news on the direct settlement? 
 
Thanks & regards, 
Pat 
Shu Fatt Auto Work 
 

From: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works [mailto:shufatt@singnet.com.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, 11 July, 2018 10:20 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Cc: 'assignments' 
Subject: Accident involving SJY 3228 R and SKV 5444 Z on 6 July 2018  
Importance: High 
 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Reference to the above. 
 
Attached is our client GIA report. 
 
We have arrange for survey tomorrow (12 July 2018) afternoon.  Kindly advise if you are able to do direct 
settlement. 
 
Thanks & regards, 
Pat 
Shu Fatt Auto Works 
 
 
 


