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Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Bobby Koh <Bobby@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 13 August, 2018 2:40 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto); 'Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'SUR'; 'assignments'; Allan Saw

Subject: RE: Policy No: TBA - Insured: Urban Redevelopment Authority - DOL. 7.7.2018 - 

Faling tree branch@Adam Road Food Centre - damage to car SKU9722A. III Ref: 

LPL2018D0000018 

Hello Catherine, 

Our claim number for this case is: LPL2018D0000018. Please let us have your prelim. report with your fee charge for 

us to settle your fee first. Please mark you prelim. report and fee bill for my attention. 

 

Regards 

BobbyKoh 

Tel: 63476111 

 

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 13 August, 2018 1:27 PM 

To: Bobby Koh; 'Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)' 
Cc: 'SUR'; 'assignments'; Allan Saw 

Subject: RE: Policy No: TBA - Insured: Urban Redevelopment Authority - DOL. 7.7.2018 - Faling tree branch@Adam 
Road Food Centre - damage to car SKU9722A. III Ref: LPL2018DE0000018  

 

Dear Bobby, 

 

Kindly assist provide us the policy number or claim number. 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 31 July, 2018 2:47 PM 

To: Bobby Koh <Bobby@iii.com.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Allan Saw <allan@iii.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Policy No: TBA - Insured: Urban Redevelopment Authority - DOL. 7.7.2018 - Faling tree branch@Adam 

Road Food Centre - damage to car SKU9722A  

 

Dear Bobby, 

 

Please be informed that the repairer didn’t arrange us to conduct resurvey of above vehicle. 

 

We will submit our preliminary report to you asap. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 


