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'Vl Vd LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GS5T Reg. No. 19-0607128-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref : CS/SMO18012365/T15d3

50 RAFFLES PLACE '
#05-01/086 Date: 06-07-2018

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

Code : SMO
i3 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FBM 9796K Veh. Inspected 5GJ 69256
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD180287T2/AGC Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  GRACETEO Assign Date 0B/07/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  04/07/2018 Inspection Date

Survey held at WOON MENG MOTOR PTELTD

50 BUKIT BATOK ST 23
#01-06 MIDVIEW BUILDING
SINGAPORE 859578

5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




Consuwilanis

¥ Aule
=4 5 Fla Ltd Company Registration No. 19360T195R
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bt

S URIAVE L 0225 PAYA UREINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08953 TEL @ (063) HI503501 FAX 1 (065) 62564315

Your Ref: CMTDI1R02Z8TZ/AGC Date; 23 July 2018

Our Rel: CS/SMO18012365/T1sd3

The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice
Tenet Sompo Insurance Pie Lid

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SGJ 6925G

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle
on __18-07-2018 at the premises of M/s Woon Meng Motor Pre Ltd and
have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;8% 2.365.11
Revised Estimate Amount 5% 1,326.43
“Check” Items Amount c 85
Market Value : 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value . 5%
Nett Value 183

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the rear poartion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent,
Repair days: 3 Days

Yours faithiully,
Mohamad Taufikh
Automolive ASSessor



Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Heng Sew Sow <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 10:56 AM

To: '‘Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)'

Cc: Taufikh (LKK Auto); sur@lkkauto.com; "Admin A’
Subject: RE: SGJ6925G ON 04.07.18

Dear Shirley

Accept your offer $1300.00

Best Regards,

Heng Sew Sow (Ms)

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050

—--—-Original Message-—--

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 10:42 AM

To: 'Heng Sew Sow' <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)' <taufikh@Ikkauto.com>; sur@lkkauto.com; "Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: 5GJ6925G ON 04.07.18

Hi Ms Heng,

Please re-confirmed COR I/s 51300, 4 days.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| 5(408933)

————— Original Message-----

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 10:02 AM

To: 'Heng Sew Sow' <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>; sur@lkkauto.com; ‘Admin A'
<admin-a@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auta)' <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 5GJ6925G ON 04.07.18

Hi Ms Heng,
COR |fs 51050, 3 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk AUTO



————— Original Message-----

From: Heng Sew Sow {maiIta:wnunmeng@singnet.cum,sg]
Sent: Saturday, 11 August 2018 1:26 PM

To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)'; sur@lkkauto.com; 'Admin A’
Subject: 5GJ6925G ON 04.07.18

Dear Taufikh
Can we finalise the repair cost
Thank you

Best Regards,

Heng Sew Sow (Ms)

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel: 6316 1131/51

Fax: 6316 7050



Shirlel Hiew (LKK Auto) -

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Maonday, 23 July 2018 1:45 PM

To: ‘Teo, Grace'; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes’; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin’; "SUR"; ‘Nivitha (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: CMTD1802872/AGC - SUV(LKK)/ & FBM9796K & SGJ6925G ACC ON 04/07/18
Along Ang Mo Kio Ave 3 Towards Hougang

Attachments: SGJ 6925G - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Grace,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SGJ 6925G.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 5256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 6 July 2018 6:09 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.tec@sompo.com.sg>; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes' <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; "SUR"
<sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: CMTD1802872/AGC - SUV(LKK)/ & FBM9796K & SGJ6925G ACCON 04/07/18 Along Ang Mo Kio Ave 3
Towards Hougang

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed vehicle not in workshap, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS;

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultanis Ple Lid

Phone; 6841-1972 | email: pssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 6 July 2018 1:39 PM

To: admin-d@Ikkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>; Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; Ye, Yong Kang
Melvin smelvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: CMTD1802872/AGC - SUV(LKK)/ & FBM39796K & 5GJ6925G ACC ON 04/07/18 Along Ang Mo Kio Ave 3
Towards Hougang

Our Reference: CMTD1802872/AGC



“Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Ce:
Subject:

Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Friday, 6 July 2018 1:39 PM

admin-d@Ikkauto.com; assignments@Ikkauto.com

Woon Meng: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin
CMTD1802872/AGC - SUV(LKK)/ & FBMI796K & 5GJ6925G ACC ON 04/07/18
Along Ang Mo Kio Ave 3 Towards Hougang

Our Reference: CMTD1802872/AGC

Dear LKK AUTO/ MOHD TAUFIKH,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for S5GJ6925G.

Please be informed that Agnes Chan the handler of this case.

Aside to Agnes,

Please refer to the liability request from Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 5329 5170 | T. 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

—

A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase® via Sompo 5G

Download now @ pp Store or B Google Play

LFgr Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Persanal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential

and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.

If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes

stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom

disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click hare for

our Privacy Policy



From: Woon Meng [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]

" Sent; Friday, July 06, 2018 12:10 PM

To: Teo, Grace

Cc: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin

Subject: RE: CMTD1802872/AGC - PRI(LIA)/ & FBM9796K & 5GJ6925G ACC ON 04/07/18 Along Ang Mo Kio Ave 3
Towards Hougang

Dear Grace,

We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.

Please kindly refer to the tick in the table below for our selection.

Thanks & Warmest Regards,

WOON MENG

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Address : 50, Bukit Batok Street 23, #01-06 Midview Building, 5{659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax : 63167050

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 6 July 2018 8:57 AM

To: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: CMTD1802872/AGC - PRI(LIA)/ & FBM9796K & SGJ6925G ACC ON 04/07/18 Along Ang Mo Kio Ave 3
Towards Hougang

Our Reference ;: CMTD1802872/AGC
Your Reference: 5GJ6925G

Without Prejudice

Date: 6™ July 2018

Attention:
M/S WOON MENG MOTOR

Dear Ms. Heng,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBM9796K & SGJ6925G ON 04.07.2018

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 05/07/2018.

Please be informed that Agnes Chan the handler of this case.



We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
* client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul {West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area) o
3 | Priority Services Jlimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

Jeffrey Ong
4 | JP Knights Adjusters & Surveyors Jason Lek

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Aside to Agnes,

Please refer to the liability request from Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6328 5170 | T; 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

" i

@') msngul.:ndt;gwng A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte, Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this infarmation may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Palicy



From: Woon Meng [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, July 05, 2018 4:34 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey

Subject: Accident Involving SGJ6925G & FBMS796K On 04/07/18 Along Ang Mo Kio Ave 3 Towards Hougang

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above accident for your kind attention.

Kindly be advised that we will be assisting our client, owner of vehicle no:

$GJ6925G, to submit a third party claim against your insured vehicle, FBM9796K. We
would like to proceed with direct settlement.

Please arrange for your surveyor to liaise with us for an inspection of our
client's vehicle at your earliest convenience.

Location : 50, Bukit Batok St 23 Midview Building (S ) 659578 ( Vehicle in )

VWarmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

Address - 50, Bukit Batok Street 23, #01-08 Midview Building, 5(859578)
Tel: +65 6316 1131 /+656316 1151 | Fax: 6316 7050

WOON MENG
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ENTRY DATE & TIME: [SM7T72118 1355

SUBMITTED BY Hang Sew Sow
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1 Pleasa raport

comecty the details of the accident ta speed up the claims procass

2 Thiz Form must be completed by the Policyholder andfor the Autharised Driver

1. Infarmation provided must be as ruthful and accurate as possibbe. Any

repudiate palicy abiity

4 The iszue and accoptance of ihis Fomm by insurance compant

#5 &5 N0t an admissign of policy Rability on the part of the insurance companies.

5 Any false raporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

. Thils report will be tonwvarded by the insurers of the GIA Racords Managament Cantre establishad by the General insurance Assoclation of Smgapore (GIA) for

archiving and that copias of this repart wil, for 3
7. By the lodgement of this report (o the insUrars, you
afprasaid

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

Yehicle Registration Mumber
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
NRIC MNa

Email Address

Mohile Phone Mo

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufaciurer

Model

fee, be made availakie upon appication by
heredy consent ta the archiving of thia repeart at

interestad parties
the camvre and 10 Copeas of the report being mads availabla

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
05/07/2018 13:53
04/07/2018 11:20
ANG MD KIO AVE 3 TOWARDS HOUGANG
SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
SGJE925G

KOMG WEI SING
573824970

NOEMAIL

(LOCAL) +65-92712518
OFFICE-92712518

TOYOTA
COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 AUTO

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken
Wehicle Category

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Mumber

Cover Note Number

Driver

Mame of Driver

MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Numbser

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

ECICS LIMITED
COMPREHENSIVE
MO
MPC17A00292601

KONG WEI SING
573824970

02/03/1973

OUTDOOR

291122001

16 YEARS AND 6 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-92712519

OFFICE-327125159
NOEMAIL

Page t

el

willul misrepresentation or witholding of materal facts may allow insurance companias 1o

o I



Address

Postcode

Was driver an employee of the |msured's Company

if Mo Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

\ehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Yehicle

insurance Company of Daver's Dwn vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Waather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

\Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?
Number of vehicles invalved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed Lo hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assislance

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

\Was the accident reported to the police?
if Yes Please state which Police Station

Polica Station Mame
Police Station Address

Police Station Contact
Was natice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident
REFER TO SKETCH PLAN.
r: nt(s)
Are accident photos available for attachment?

Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

BLK 450C, BUKIT BATOK WEST AVENUE 6 #09-625
£53450

NO

OWMER

GOLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
CLEAR
DRY

NO

NO

NO
YES

18]

YES

BUKIT BATOK NEIGHBOURHOOD POLICE CENTRE

ROAD: 21 BUKIT BATOK EAST AVE 4 . POSTCODE: 659840 . COUNTRY
SINGAPORE

TEL NO: 1200-5659990 - FAX NO: 66855793
NO

YES
NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Wehicle Registration Mumber
vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Wehicle Category

Mame of Driver
NRIC/Passport Mumber
Contact Number

Address

Postoode

Insurance Company Name

mMature Of Damage

FBMITIEK

MOTORCYCLE
GOH TECK ANN
521456450

Page2 af 20



SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to spead up the claims process.

3. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as pussible. Any wilful misreprezantation or withholding of material
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA facords Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested parties.

7. By the ladgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the report being made available aforesaid.

2 Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

fa) My insurer, my waorkshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore (“GIA") may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal infarmation set out in this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer {collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident {all insurer(s) who have insured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s)
ﬂf &
(i} processing, handling and,/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary

investigations relating to the claims;

{ii} investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(iii} carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

{iv} administering my claims [including the mailing of carrespondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
sxternal cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

(v} complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.(collectively the
“Purposes”)

{b) allinsurer{s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Persanal Information for one or more of the abave Purposes; and

{c) my Personal Information may/can be d isclosed by any of the [nsurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapeore, for one or more of the above Purposas.

(d} my Personal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detaction,
investigation and management in present and all future clalms.

() theinformation so collected under {d) above may be shared / disclosed:

{ij to all insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government age ncies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

(i} For complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

v 2

I-Eiwhulr.ter'ti Signature Driver's Signature Reporting Cantre nel’s Signature
Date & Time {If driver is not the policyholder) Mame:
Datz & Time: MRIC/FIN No.

Please note that you might be able to submit an Own Damage Claim under own policy within 14 days.
{ 3 Claim Own Damage (/% Claim TE i ) Reporting Only i 1 Claim OD/TP at other workshop

Wonek chaom ™Sames :



SKETCH PLAN
o i -I.
s

o Mg P15l e 3

AR eI
B FBMG Tk

e e g e

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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| 7[18 at
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T ie Cmerceniy predce omd the pretorcyclel
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DECLARATION
|/We declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respact.

e :_'_T_'__::_‘_'.'d'a. -
[\:F'_ ._‘___,.-"? ‘;/:_‘_‘F‘?l- "II

AN

Driver's Signature
[If drivar iz not the policyholder)

Date & Time:

7
Palloyholdar’s Signature
Date & Time

Reporting Cantriks
Name
NRIC/FIN MO

nel's Signature



Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

Office 50 Bukit Batok St 23, #01-06 Midview Building, Singapore 859578
Workshop: 50 Bukit Batok St 23, #01-06 Midview Building. Singapore 659578
Tel 6316 1131 HP: 9730 2017 Fax: 6316 7050
42 Sungei Kadut Ave, Singapore 729666 Tel : 63268523
{ Email Adress | woonmeng @singnet.com.sg )

Co Reg No. 200603678M GST Reg No. 20-0603678M
Estimate
TP Claim
To - Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
Motor Claims Dept Date : 18 Jul 2018
Dear Sirs : Fax : 62213302
62213147

RE : ESTIMATE COST FOR TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 - . 5GJ6925G
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGJ6925G & FBM9796K ON 04/07/2018

ITEMS DESCRIPTION Qrty PRICE
1 Rear bumper. 1pc S 484.90 A~
2  Rear bumper retainer @$88.5ea 2pes § 177.00 Mt~
3 Rear end panel 1pc % 587.50 .f{ W
4  Rear bootlid lock. ipc § 197.41 ¥ ™
$ 144681 b [-20
Less 25% 5 (361.70) ) _
$ 1,085.11 HA6HS
_2\:- & Aw_-
5 Rear sensor. ipc 5 220.00
Labour Charge & Misc
To remove, replace, repair & install } 5 500.00 /
damaged parts.
To R & R wiring and lighting. $ 60.00 40
To putty & spray painting. $ 500.00 ) OV
9%
Total $ 2,365.11 i /\
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Al = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 189607108R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE FL Ref . CS/SMO18012365/T1sd3n2
il L
#05-01/06 Date: 01-09-2018
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  FBM 9796K Veh. Inspected SGJ 6925G
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1802872/AGC Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEOQ Assign Date 0B/OT/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA ALTIS c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2006
Chassis No. MRO53ZEC107127315 Colour SILVER
Odometer 196367 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN QRDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre [205/55R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 EBRIDGESTONE & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  04/07/2018 |inspection Date 18/07/2018
Survey held at WOON MENG MOTOR PTELTD
50 BUKIT BATOK 5T 23
#01-06 MIDVIEW BUILDING
SINGAPORE 659578
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGJ 6925G

e Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($) )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 484,90 484 .90
2|REAR BUMPER RETAINER @$68.50 NECESSARY 177.00 177.00
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE E87.50 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BOOTLID LOCK NOT NECESSARY 197 .41 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -361.70 -165.48
1,085.11 496 .42
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR SENSOR (SN} NOT WORKING 220.00 200.00
220.00 200.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE,REPLACE REPAIR & INSTALL DAMAGED 500.00 500.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR END
PAMNEL.
TO R&R WIRING AND LIGHTING. 60.00 30.00
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 500.00 400.00
1,060.00 830.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,365.11 1,626.42
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,300.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS/SMO18012365/T1sd3n2
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser




