Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Jeslyn - VAG Singapore <jeslyn@vag.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September, 2019 11:37 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: SKR8555M - LKK REF CC6/AIG18012350/T1hb3
Attachments: 17092019111848-0001.pdf; 17092019111903-0001.pdf
Hi Vic,

Please find attached signed DV and rental agreement as per your request.

Kindly process payment at your soonest.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jeslyn Chua

AVANTAGE VAG
AUTOMOTIVE SPECIALISTS

6515 9515 Sales & Service | 6795 5005 24hr Towing | www.avantage.sg

WEST Service, Tuning & Accident Reporting Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-123 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586

NORTH Service & Accident Reporting Centre
160 Sin Ming Drive, #04-17 Sin Ming AutoCity, Singapore 575722

EAST Service & Accident Reporting Centre
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #06-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875

CARCRAFTERS Spray Paint, Grooming & Accident Repair Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-155 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586

On Mon, Sep 16, 2019 at 11:34 AM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jeslyn,

We refer further to the below email.



On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we offer a global sum of $6,530.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward a copy back to us a copy together with the Rental
Agreement for our principal to process payment.

The above amount is to be made payable to CARCRAFTERS SINGAPORE PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

w5 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Jeslyn - VAG Singapore [mailto:jeslyn@vag.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 18 July, 2019 9:26 AM



To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: SKR8555M

Hi Vic,

Still no news on the above mentioned claim?

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jeslyn Chua

AVANTAGE VAG
Audi | BMW | Mercedes | Volkswagen

6515 9515 Sales & Service | 6795 5005 24hr Towing | www.avantage.sg

AVANTAGE VAG WEST Service & Tuning Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-123 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586

AVANTAGE VAG NORTH Service Centre
160 Sin Ming Drive, #04-17 Sin Ming AutoCity, Singapore 575722

AVANTAGE VAG EAST Service Centre
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4. #06-48 Premier @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875

Accident Reporting & Repair Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-155 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586




