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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 3:21 PM

To: Kevin Leong Wai Kit; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: PRE-SIGNED DV - SLP48L & SKV8720G ON 30.06.2018

Follow Up Flag: Flag for follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Dear Asher 

 

Please proceed with the payment. 

 

Our CSA has confirmed with our client and agreed with the proposed settlement. 

 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 

 

From: PBSP 

Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 1:11 PM 

To: Kevin Leong Wai Kit 

Cc: Asher Sng (LKK Auto) 

Subject: Re: PRE-SIGNED DV - SLP48L & SKV8720G ON 30.06.2018  

  

Dear Kevin  

 

Please advise ASAP. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 

Caroline 

From: PBSP 

Sent: Monday, 18 February 2019 3:19:56 PM 

To: Kevin Leong Wai Kit 

Subject: Re: PRE-SIGNED DV - SLP48L & SKV8720G ON 30.06.2018  

  

Dear Kevin 

 

Please let us have your decision asap. 
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Thanks 

Caroline 

From: PBSP 

Sent: Monday, 7 January 2019 6:40:18 PM 

To: Kevin Leong Wai Kit 

Subject: Re: PRE-SIGNED DV - SLP48L & SKV8720G ON 30.06.2018  

  

Dear Kevin 

 

Surveyor recommended 9 days repair. However, your customer is claiming for 17 days loss of use.  

 

Please confirm with your customer if we may proceed to settle as per offer below - $100 x 13 days = $1300. 

 

 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 

 

From: PBSP 

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2018 5:04 PM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) 

Cc: 甯珺 © 

Subject: Re: PRE-SIGNED DV - SLP48L & SKV8720G ON 30.06.2018  

  

Dear Kevin 

 

Surveyor recommended 9 days repair. However, your customer is claiming for 17 days loss of use. Please see 

attached invoice. 

 

Please confirm with your customer if we may proceed to settle as per offer below - $100 x 13 days = $1300. 

 

 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2018 4:09:00 PM 

To: PBSP 

Cc: 甯珺 © 

Subject: RE: PRE-SIGNED DV - SLP48L & SKV8720G ON 30.06.2018  

  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
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  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
  
Dear Sir/Madam,  

   

Accident involving Vehicle SLP 48L & SKV 8720G on 30/06/2018 
 

  We refer to the above matter 
  
On a without prejudice basis, our principal propose settlement as follow:  

 

COST OF REPAIR                                 $ 19,693.09 
Loss of RENTAL ($ 100.00 x 13day)    $   1,300.00 
GIA SEARCH                                        $      2.00 
  
                                                               $ 20,995.09 
  
Kindly confirm acceptance 
  
  
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 
   
  
  

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

  
  

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November, 2018 5:24 PM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: PRE-SIGNED DV - SLP48L & SKV8720G ON 30.06.2018 

  

  

From: PBSP 

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November 2018 4:50:13 PM 

To: Vivian Lau; CS A Team 

Subject: PRE-SIGNED DV - SLP48L & SKV8720G ON 30.06.2018  
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Dear Sirs 

  

Payment reminder (pre-signed dv enclosed). 

  

  

  
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 


