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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B25E 4315

Reg. Mo: 198607198R G3T Req. No 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

300 BEACH ROAD

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Ref : CC4/LPC18012331/T1wb3

Date 06-07-2018

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 189555

[HMIAMOI

Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLL BETEE Veh. Inspected SHD 2889
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 06/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer 3 Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  05/07/2018 Inspection Date 08/07/2018
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTELTD
& BENOI PLACE
SINGAPORE 629927
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANGE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




B 74 "4~

Consultants
M, M. B W Pte Lt

S| UBIAYE 1, #02-25 PAYA URL INIM STRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 4084933 TEL !

Your ref; To Be Advised

Our ref: CC4/LPCI8012331/TIwb3

The Motor Claims Departmen
M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sirdadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.

We refer to the above matter.

Company Registration No 198607 138R

(S} BIEA3SA1 FAX {10651 62564315

Date:

SHD268Y.]

11.07.2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 06.07.2018
at the premises of M/s _Prime Auto Claims Services Ple Lid and have the following to report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amoun!
Revizsed Estimate Amount
"Check” Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Rear Portion

Comments/Present Status;
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs:

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser

t 35

6,305.15

: 5%

4.253.05

: 5%

1 5%

o

‘8%

days

‘J

:

T
¥
I}
e



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@I|onpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, 5 July 2018 4:06 PM
To: admin-d@lkkauto.com —E?
Cce: MT_Claim_SG B\
Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 05.07.2018 INVOLVING SHD2683) & SLL6676E
Attachments: img-180705175314.pdf

. 411 pm @ 5(7| 20\
Importance: High

whide \n
?oﬂur" @ t}ﬂnaiﬂ

Our Ref : 18/18/18/VP05/020739 m\h’““‘”f- on b H h‘!

Dear Catherine,

Kindly note the request from the third party and proceed
with the pre-repair survey.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Chrissy [mailto:chrissy@primeautoclaims.com]
Sent: Thursday, 5 July, 2018 4:01 PM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com; pelyee@primeautoclaims.com

Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 05.07.2018 INVOLVING SHD2689] & SLLBEBT6E
Importance: High

Dear Gerald,

We select Mr. Mohamad Taufikh (refer to enclosed attachment).

Thank you.

Important Note: Our workshop is now locoted at No. & Benoi Place, Singapore 629927

Best regards,

Chrissy Teo

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte. Ltd.

Office : 5 Benoi Place Singapore 629926
Workshop : 6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended
solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us

1



immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose
its contents to any person.

Erom: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com])

Sent: Thursday, 5 July 2018 3:25 PM

To: Chrissy <chrissy@primeautoclaims.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt _claim@|onpac.com>

Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 05.07.2018 INVOLVING SHD2685] & SLL6676E

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Qur Ref : 18/18/18/VvP05/020739

Dear Chrissy,

We are not agreeable to your proposal of the Single Joint Expert and
attached our list of surveyors from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Chrissy [mailto:chrissy@primeautoclaims.com]

Sent: Thursday, 5 July, 2018 3:02 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: alicelegng@primeautoclaims.com; peiyee@primeautoclaims.com

Subject: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 05.07.2018 INVOLVING SHDZ2689] & SLLE6G7EE
Importance: High

Hi
The above referred
Our client’s GIA report enclosed for your retention. Please arrange PRI on urgent basis.

Please inform surveyor to avoid 1145-1245pm lunch hour.

#=We select RT Appraisal Pte. Litd.

**Please arrange PRI soonest possible due to loss of income and loss of rental per day count.

Thank you.

Impartant Note: Our workshop is now located at No. 6 Benoi Place, Singapore 629327

Best regards,

Chrissy Teo
Prime Auto Claims Service Pte, Lid.
Office : 5 Benoi Place Singapore 629926



Workshop : 6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended
solely for the identified recipient(s] to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us
immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose
its contents to any person.

Virus-free. www avast com




Z
o

Name of Surveyor

Please tick

Kalvin Ang

Xing Guo Qiang

Mohamad Taufikh

Mohammed Rasul

Bryan Ang

Adrian Ling

Marcus Chua

Kenneth Kong

*OCD“HJO\‘(J“I-I‘AQJI\J—'

Muhammad Nazril
Bin Abdullah

L)

Sathya Sai
Kathirrasen




Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

# —— s ﬂ
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.coms=
Sent: Friday, 13 July 2018 9:06 AM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Cc MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 05.07.2018 INVOLVING SHD2689) &
SLLEATHE***LKK REF:CC4/LPCI1B012331,/T1wb3
Attachments: INSD'S REPORT pdf
Qur Ref : 18/18/18/VP05/0207359

Attached copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei {LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 July, 2018 5:34 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 05.07.2018 INVOLVING SHD2689] & SLL6676E***LKK
REF.CC4/LPC18012331/T1wb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.,

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHD 2689] at M/s Prime Auto Claims Service Pte
Ltd.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Enclosed for your perusal is:

Estimated cost of repair

TP GIA report

Preliminary advice
Our case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 B625.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei] Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: chupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #032-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuUte]

sent: Thursday, 5 July 2018 4:15 PM

To: ‘GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.coms; assignments <assipnments@lkkauto.cam>
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt claim@ionpac.com>,; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PRIREQUESTTO ACCIDENT ON 05.07.2018 INVOLVING SHD2685) & SLLEGT6E

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment,

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: B841-1972 | email: assignments@kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [m_ai1to:gﬁraldpuh@lonuac.mm]

Sent: Thursday, 5 July 2018 4:06 PM

To: admin-d@ikkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 05.07.2018 INVOLVING SHD2689) & SLLE6T6E
Importance: High

Our Ref : 18/18/18/VP05/020739
Dear Catherine,

Kindly note the request from the third party and proceed
with the pre-repair survey.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Chrissy [I‘ﬂai|tDLEI‘IFISSV@Drlf‘nﬂautﬂrﬂalmﬁ,(jl:]{\_‘l]

Sent: Thursday, 5 July, 2018 4:01 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com; peiyes@primeautodaims.com

Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 05.07.2018 INVOLVING SHD2689] & SLL6676E
Importance: High

Dear Gerald,



We select Mr, Mohamad Taufikh (refer to enclosed attachment).

Thank you.

Important Note: Qur workshop is now located ot No. 6 Benol Place, Singapore 629927

Best regards,

Chrissy Teo
Prime Auto Claims Service Pte, Ltd.

Office - 5 Benoi Place Singapore 629926

Workshop : 6 Benoi Place Singapore 629917
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended
solely for the identified recipient(s) to whomt it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply Lo us
immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its
contents to any person.

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lon pac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 5 July 2018 3:25 PM

To: Chrissy <chrissy@primeautaclaims carm=

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 05.07.2018 INVOLVING SHD2689) & 5LL&6T6E

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our Ref : 181’18!18NF’D5}(}2D?39
Dear Chrissy,

We are not agreeable to your proposal of the Single Joint Expert and
attached our list of surveyors from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel* (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Chrissy [ﬂﬁ_‘Lﬂ_:_c;hri553@;@mean.:'tgg]a:ms._c_qn;]

Sent: Thursday, 5 July, 2018 3:02 PM

To; GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: aliceleong@primeautoclaims. com; peiyes@primeautodaims.com

Subject: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 05.07.2018 INVOLVING SHD2689) & SLL6676E
Importance: High

Hi



The above referred
Our client’s GIA report enclosed for your retention. Please arrange PRI on urgent basis.
Please inform surveyor to avoid 1145-1245pm lunch hour.

##We select RT Appraisal Pte. Litd.

##Pleasc arrange PRI soonest possible due to loss of income and loss of rental per day count.

Thank you.

important Note; Qur workshop is now located ot No. & Benai Ploce, Singapore 629327
Best regards,

Chrissy Teo
Prime Auto Claims Service Pre. Lid.
Office : 5 Benoi Place Singapore 629926

Workshop : 6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended
solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us
immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or atherwise disclose its
contents to any person.

Virus-free. www.avast.com




05.07-18:17:48 From

Transfer Fec Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire Transfer Fee
Wehicle Details
vehicle Mou:

Wehicle Type

Vehiels Attachment 1:
Wehicle Scheme

Yehicle Make :

Yahicle Mocel;

Chiassis Ng. .

Fropellant:

Engine Mo,

Matar Me.

Engire Cagacity |

Power Rating

Waximum Fower Qutput:
Maxirmum Laden Waight :
Unladen Weight :

Year Of Manufacture:
Original Regrstration Date:
Lifespan Expiry Date
COE Catepory:

Quota Premium:

COE Expiry Date :

Road Tax Expiry Date
PARF Eligibility Explry Date:
Imspectsan Due Date :
Intended T-onsfer Date:
Z02 Emission:

CO Erission ;

HC Emission :

MOx Emissian :

P Emission

To: 62659841

SHD2EET)

H10- Public Transpert Taxi (Matar Car)
Ar-Can (Taul}

Tax) {Crrrpaty)
TOYOTA
PRIUSHYBRID 132X A
NHW 203575784
Petrol-Electric

1M 25845084
ACMEA54484

1484 er

80,0 xW

S56.0 kw (75 bhpl
1535 kg

1250 kg

2010

29 Mar 2011

26 Mar 2017

A= Car | 1600cs & bolow|
$24,001.00

28 Mar 2017

28 Sep 2018

28 Mar 2019

28 5ep 2018

05 Jul2028

# B/ 8
Page | of |

The current road tox expiry is 28 Sep 2018, You may renew the read tax from 27 Jun 2018 with all pre-requisitels) fulfilled. If the road tax is renawed
after 28 Sep 2018, late renewal teels) will be impased. Please use Enquire Road Tax Payable tocheck on the late fee(s) payable.

Rioad tax. including Over Paymert (if anyl, of a vehicle will follow the vehicle to the new registeroe owner when its gwnership is being transterred.
Amount Payable [From 29 Sep 2018 to 28 Mar 2019)

Trangfer Fee;

Sub Total:

Mett Road Tax Amount (After
Cityetting Over Payment)
Total Amount Payable -
Massage

Amount Before GST
(5§]
2500

510,00

GST Amount Arnount After GST
[55) (5%

. 25.00

25.00

310,00

535.00

Please note that the 8-year COE for thie vehicle sannot be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registerec upan COE expiry or when the vehicle
reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

You may print this page for reference.

0K Print

https://vil.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquire TransferFeeDetailsProxy WWUNCTION _ID=F0501015ET

5/7/2018



08 -07-18;17:49

From

Date: 05.07.2018

PRIME GROUP

To: 62659541

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

GST Reg. No : 201606560M
5 Benoi Place Singapore 629926
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

Lonpac Insurance Bhd

100 Beach Road #19-00
Shaw Tower
Singapore 185702

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEHICLE SHD2689) TOYOTA PRIUS HYBRID 1.55 (2010)

To supply

1)
2 )
3
4}
5)
6)
7)
4)
o
10 )
11)
12 )
13)

lpc
1set
1pc
lpc
1pc
lpcg
lset
lpc
1pc
lpc
1pc
1pc
1pc

Rear bumper

Rear bumper clip

Rear bumper right bracket
Rear bumnper right side retainer
Rear end panel

Rear end panel top garnish
Rear end panel top garnish clip
Rear end panel

Tailgate

Tailgate "Toyota" emblemn
Tailgate "Prius” emblem
Tailgate "Hybrid Synergy Drive" emblem
Tallgate weathersirip

To supply S.Nett parts

1)
2)
3)
4)

1pc
1pc
lset
1set

Prime taxi' sticker

“Dial A Cab" sticker

Tailgate lower glass moulding (2 pcs)
Tailgate glass moulding (3 pcs)

Sub total parts

Less: 25% discount

14 B

p—

4,633.53

(1,158.38)

5
9
5
s

3,475.15

A 5800
w48 00

o 50.00
w < 240.00

Sub total 5.Nett Parts 5

400.00



05-07-18:17:49 From: To; 626859941 3 # 2/ 8

L/charges
‘?;. [P,
1) Totuff-kote S 50.00
2 ) Toremove & refit tailgate glass 4 120.00 «
3 ) Toremove & refit tailgate lower glass S 60004 ¢
4 ) Totransfer rear boot lid trim board, wiper motor, wiring & etc. S 100.00
5 ) Tocut/welding end panel, knock floor panel & etc. Remove & $ 1,000.00 éﬂ“
replace tailgate, rear bumper & the above parts. Align & adjust
tailgate & rear bumper.
6 ) To putty, respray painting tailgate inlet & outer, rear bumper, rear S 1,100.00 %U =
end panel & rear floor panel. To polish.
Sub total L/charges 5 2,430.00
Estimated Grand Total § 6,305.15

Tukin 1H1SHY

o

plse 5

WBW L
P, fiv??

qur (@ ([

LKK Auto Consuftants hence notfy 1
the Repairer of the following:
* To resurvey before/atter Spray painting
= To display damaged pari(s) during resurvey
» Parls prices are Subject to confirmation
® Third party survey ts on a "Without Prajudice” hasi
* No illagal modification(s) is allowed
- ;upp;emlarg ey s} must be resurvayed
i subject o final approval from Ingurance E?i:“

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:




¥ ML LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

tan B 2B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL- 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607156-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref : CC4/LPC18012331/T1wb3n2
0407 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 1ggs55 Defe: 1810:2018 ” mmm‘m‘“w
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLL BB7BE Veh. Inspected SHD 2689
Policy No. Z18VP05017754 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 18/18/18/VP05/020739 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  GERALD Assign Date 05/07/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAFPRIUS c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. MHW203575784 Colour ORANGE
Odometer Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/65R15 GOODRIDE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/65R15 GOODRIDE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre 185/65 R15 GOODRIDE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/85 R15 GOODRIDE & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  05/07/2018 Inspection Date 06/07/2018
Survey held at FRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTELTD
& BENOI PLACE
SINGAPORE 629927
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
Sb. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199807198R GST Reg, No. 19-9807198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 2689J

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

Page Mo.:1 of 2

Qty Description of Parts Condition vf:m;; E{l;} } our ﬁi?]ustnd
LACE F PART
1|REAR BUMPER DEFCRMED 580.00 580.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER RIGHT BRACKET NECESSARY 132.10 132.10
1|REAR BUMPER RIGHT SIDE RETAINER MECESSARY 122.25 122.25
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 781.40 -
LABOUR

1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 561.40 561.40
1|SET REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIP NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
1|REAR END PANEL NOT NECESSARY TB1.40 -
1| TAILGATE BENT 1,008.84 1,008.84
1|TAILGATE 'TOYOTA' EMBELEM MNECESSARY 61.10 81.10
1|TAILGATE 'PRIUS' EMBLEM MECESSARY 71.25 71.25
1|TAILGATE 'HYBRID SYNERGY DRIVE' EMELEM MECESSARY 51.10 51.10
1|TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP CuT 322.69 32269
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,158.38 -TB7.68
347515 2,303.05

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|PRIME TAXI STICKER (SN) MECESSARY 55.00 55.00
1|'DIAL A CAB' STICKER (SN) MECESSARY 45.00 45.00
1|SET TAILGATE LOWER GLASS MOULDING (2 PCS)(SN) |NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1|SET TAILGATE GLASS MOULDING (3 PCS) (SN) MNECESSARY 240.00 240.00
400.00 400.00

LABOUR

TO TUFF-KOTE. 50.00 30.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT TAILGATE GLASS. 120.00 120,00
TO REMOVE & REFIT TAILGATE LOWER GLASS. 60.00 40.00
TO TRANSFER REAR BOOT LID TRIM BOARD WIPER 100.00 60.00

MOTOR WIRING & ETC.

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18012331/T1wb3n2




¥ M AL LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Ne. 18-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) (s)
TO CUT/WELDING END PANEL KNOCK FLOOR PANEL & 1,000.00 600.00
ETC REMOVE & REPLACE TAILGATE ,REAR BUMPER &
THE ABOVE PARTS ALIGN & ADJUST TAILGATE & REAR
BUMPER.INCLUSIVE OF THE REFAIR OF REAR END
PANEL
TOPUTTY ,RESPRAY PAINTING TAILGATE INLET & 1,100.00 700.00
CUTER ,REAR BUMPER REAR END PANEL & REAR
FLOOR PANEL .TO POLISH.
2,430.00 1,550.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,305.15 4,253.05
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,400.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18012331/T1wb3n2
foufirs !
A
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

Automotive Assessor




