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T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 19 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector A
#01-19 Singapore 575677
Tel: 64593319 Fax: 64593019

1 ‘ /2/‘7 Al arg et ESTIMATE -
STARS RENTAL & LEASING , DATE . 04/07/2018
50 SERANGOON NORTH AVE 4 é/.[‘ry R ‘(j;m“ VEHICLENO  : SIP 4860 E
#02-19 FIRST CENTRE y» MAKE/MODEL  : Nissan Latio
SINGAPORE 555856 rey -"f'#zt.,_ /s, ACCDATE : 04/07/2018
PARTICULAR ﬁ/"ﬁ AMOUNT 5%
NETT ITEMS: P
| | BOOTLID 764.60 “—
2 | BOOTLID TOP LOCK Piv 3590 —
3 I BOOTLID LOWER LOCK T 8690 X
4 | BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP P e 12510 Sofin
] | BOOTLID LOGO e 4280 —
6 | BOOTLID EMBLEM - LATIO Mo 5620
7 | BOOTLID GARNISH (CHROME W/SENSOR) 292 50 «
§ | REARBUMPER Py % 53140 —
9 2 REAR BUMPER BRACKET aains 9570 193.40 =7~
0 2 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER 35.20 Pry 7040 —
Il | REAR BUMPER SPONGE S~ 7850 ,?'
12 2 REAR TAIL LAMP 281.90 €/ 56380 &
13 2 REARTAIL LAMP PANEL 168.50 @/ %% 33700
14 1 REAREND PANEL 462,60 —
IS | REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH Beo 13510 —
16 | REARFLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD Cra 49520 —
17 2 REAR FENDER AR 7l B 88730 1.774.60 &+
I8 2 REAR FENDER INNER TRIM I B dym, 24220 48440 &
6.680.40
Less Discount: 10% He8.04
6,012.36
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS:
|1 REARNUMBER PLATE ft so00 ¥ T
2 8 REAR BUMPERCLIP 5.00 Ar. 4000 —
3 2 REAR TAIL LAMP CLIP 5,00 e 1000 —
4 2 REAREND PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIP [ LKk At Consulonis herce nog, (e 10,00 —
5 8 REAR FENDER INNER TRIM CLIP-RH | the Repairer of the foliowin: bo 40.00 —
6 | REAR REVERSE SENSOR ¢ spray painting < 350.00 Zopyg,
8] darg resuvey 50000
ilateiam® ity
LABOUR CHARGES: ik
| TO CHECK WIRING ) st b vess s0.00 22¢
3 TO TUEF KOTE is subjsct 1o tnal approval Bom jnsg sy 250,00 Fﬁ!’
3 TO TOWING CHARGES (KING DOLLY) | Acknowiedged by Zecara: 12000 /et
4 TO REMOVE/REFIX UPHOLSTERY. CUSHIOMSEAT & ROOF LINING 150.00 /22 ¢
S TO REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR | Dl 100.00 Soy
f TO PANEL BEATING, REMOVING & REPLACING OF NEW PARTS 40000 2 ﬁr{
T TO SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREA | 400,00 ffﬁ,p{
3.470.040
GRAND TOTAL: OB 36



Poh Kin (LKKAuto) - =

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 July 2018 1:52 PM

To: T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd'

Cc Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident involving SGV5101K / SIP4860E on 04,/07/2078
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC4/AIG18012257/Kfa3
Your Ref: 0718/1374

Dear Vincent,
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGV 5101K AND SJP 4860E ON 04.07.2018
We refer to the above matter and your letter of demand dated 13" July 2018.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have instruction
to offer settlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S5 5,457.00
2. Loss of Use ($60.00 x 8days) S5 480.00
3. LTA search fee 5 7.45

55 5 .45

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciate.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discoverad or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the Issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Repards;

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4086133)



This -mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intenided recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this g-mail in error, please do not read
this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies theraof. Thank you.

From: T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd [mailto:tntautoservices@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 13 July 2018 10:08 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving SGV5101K / SJP4860E on 04/07/2018
Dear Poh Kin,

We refer to the above matter.

Attached herewith the respective documents of vehicle no: SJP4860E for your perusal.
Please revert as soon as possible,

Thank you.

Best Regards.

Vincent Tan

T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd

Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 6861
Hp: 9145 9776
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made diffamnt
Certificate of Insurance

r BACTON VEHICLES {THIRD PAITY RISKS ANG COMPENSATION) ACT [CHAPTER 149}
MOTOR VERICLES (THIRD PARTY AUSKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1360
AOAD TRANSPORT ACT, 1957 [MALAYEIA|

MOTOR VEHICLES [THIRD PARTY RiSKS) RULES, 1959 [MALAYSIA

Certificate Number: S0RSS42280-01 Cover : Third Party
1 Index mark and Registrition Number of Vehicle : SJPARGOE
Chagiis Murmber ¢ IN1BAACT 120001080
2 Mame of Policyholder : STARS RENTAL & LERS™HG
A Efactive Date of Insurance 1 07 Jun 1018
4, Explry Data of Insrance : D6 Jun 2019
& Persors or Classes of Persons entitled (o drived
{#] Tha PaBicyhoider.

&) ﬁn-,rm'he.rHmnmuﬂﬂmwﬂlqhm‘urdwnrmhwhmnhm
Provided that the perion driving 1 permitted In accordance with the llceniing e other faws of rejulations to drive
the Motar Vehicle or has bedn so permittad and Iy net disquaiified by arder of » Court of L or by reason of any
aractmant or mguliton in that behalf from driving the Mator Vehicle,
6. Limitaticns a8 1o Used
{a} Lisa for socil domestic and pleature purcales and In coanaction with the Polisyhoider's or Hirer's business.
Thiz Policy doas Aot cover
{a) Use for raing, pace-making, reliabiity trinl o spasd-tasting.
{b] Lise for the cartiage of goods [other than samples) In connection wikh gry trase or business.
(e} Use for sy purpose in connection with the Motor Trade.
luﬁmmmmumnmwmufmmwmmmnmwwmm
Act [Chapter 125) end Secdon 95 of tha fload Transport Ast, 1887 (Malaysls), ire a2t 10 be Incluged uncer these

headings.

EXCESS (SECTIDN 1) 5 WA
EXCESS (SECTION 2| 1 551,500
ADDITIONMAL EXCESS 1 N
UNNAMED DRINVER EXCESS © MfR
REPAIR AT OWHER'S PAEFERRED WORESHOP | NOD
INSURE WITH COE 1 K
WCD PROTECTION ' WO
FRIMARY DANER L NJA
WAMED DRIVER (1) : NJA
MAMED DRIVER (2} . Nfa
HIRE PURCHASE COMPANY + Mk
SUM INSURED + M

|/Wa heraby Certify that the Falicy to which this Cartificatn rolates i ssued in accordance with the provisions of the Mator
Vanicies [Third Party Risks and Compensation] Act {Chaptar 185) and Fart 1 of the Rasd Transport Act, 1687 (Malrysis]

Agancy : DICKSON AUTD AGENCY (0000DET&645)
Date of tsfun i 06 Moy 2017 09:03 hry

For NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LIMITED

Zﬁ‘? el

Authorised Officer Chief Exscutive

Countersigned By




T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive
#08-14 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722
Tel; 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 6861
ST Registration No: 200910712

Emall: ntautoservices@gmail.com
"-.”
Date: 13* June 2018
Our Rel: 0718-1374
Your Ref:

Attn: The Motor Claims Department

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

AlG Building

76 Shenton Way

#08-16

Singapore 079120

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGV5101K / SJP4860E ON 04072018
Please refer to the above-mentioned accident.

We are writing on behalf of Stars Rental & Leasing, the registered owner of motor vehicle no:
SJP4860E which was invoived in the above accident.

We are instructed that the above accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence
of your insured's vehicle no: SGVS101K. As a result of which, our client have suffered loss

and expenscs.

We are instructed by our client to claim for:-

1. Cost of Repair (inclusive of 7% GST} 1585,457.00
2. Loss of Use (8 days @ $120.00/day) 85 960.00
3. LTA Search 88 743

TOTAL  1596.424.45

We enclosed hereby the following documents for your consideration:
(a) Original Tax Invoice

(b) GIA Report lodged by our driver

(c) Owner & Driver I/C/Driving Licence

(d) Certificate of Insurance

() LTA Search

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above said documents and your favourable reply is greatly
appreciated.

Yours faithfully,

Vincent Tan
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S1UBLAVE 1, #1-25 PAYA LB INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (63) H2563501 FAN (063 67414108

Our Ref: CC4/AIG18012257/Kfad

18" July 2018

NG SO0 LENG

Block 415 Bedok North Avenue 2,
#17-99,

Singapore 460415,

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGV 5101K AND SJP 4860E ALONG
GUILLEMARD ROAD ON 04.07.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Lid to
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken
up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us, We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable sertlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

i

X
f‘l. I
Pol'Kin, Chong
Uase Handler
DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: pohkin@ lkkauto.com

F- AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd
Mator Claims Dept)
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VOUCHER
ia Pacific - Express Third P laim

“We/l, T& T Auto Services Pte Ltd (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd LKK AUTO

AN E LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for $55.457.00
(Repair Cost), S$ 480,00 (Loss of Use/Remed), $§7.45 (Disbursement) for vehicle no. SJP 4860E
that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 04/07/2018 (date) along Guillemard
Road (location) involving vehicle no/s SGV 5101K, This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on
05/07/2018 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am suthorized by the owner STARS RENTAL & LEASING (“the third
party claimant) of vehicle no. SJP 4860E make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”,

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific [nsurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges & further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage 1o SIP
4860E (vehicleno.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final seitlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

31 JuL Eiﬂlﬂ

Dated this (day) of month) 20____ (year)

Signed by appointed surveyor




T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive
#08-14 Sin Ming AotoClty
Singapore 575711
Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 6861
GST Registration No: 20091071 IE

TAX INVOICE
AIG Asin Pucific Insurance Pte Ltd DATE ¢ 13072018
AIG Building VEHICLE MO : SIP 4RGSO E
76 Shenton Way MAKEMODEL  : Nissan Latio
#OB-16 ACC DATE : 04/07/2018
Singapore 079120 CLAIM NO : O718-1374
POLICY NO :
AMOUNT 55
Lump sum repair nclusive of supplying paris, labour,
panel beating and spray painting
Repair Amount 5,100.00
Add 7% GST 357.00
Totl 5,457.00

Singapore Dallars: Five Thousand Four Hundred And Fifty Seven Only.




Trarzuie Receipt

> Back to OneMeotoring

gl Tz |}%‘m: Wy

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701
(55T Registration Na, : M&-0008528-2
Print Date/Tima : 04 Jul 2018 [ 15:58:42
Receipt Date/Time : 04 Jul 2018/ 15:58:42
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Raceipt Mo, : [TNET-D0000-180704-001647
Provious Receip! No. .
S/N Hem Description Amount GST  Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (55) (&68) (5%)
Resuit of Insurance Enquiry - SGVS101K
As at 04 Jul 2018/07:45:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 Insuranca Enquiry - SGVE10TK
Enquiry Fes T.00 049 749
20180704155T50807 148
Sub-Total T.00 048 T.A48
Total Bafore Rounding 7.00 048 T.43
Rounding Ditference 0.04
Total Amount Payabla 745
Paid By
Darect &MNETS Debil
20180704155808845 - m“';fﬂw} 745
Total TAS
Cash Changa 0.00
Tandared Amaunt T45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ansure that all payments to the Autharity are good and promptly sattled by the paymant service
provider | financlal Institution. Otherwiss, the transaction and roceipt |s considered vold and late fas
may apply.

mm;rmn.lu.m.!wlwmmmmmmwuwg 1N _IL=r AT L

1



Merimen e-Claims

rage 1 o1 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastlana
(CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING _ |
 Case | Motified Est Submitted _ |Ad) Assigned | Ad) Rpt |Adj Submitted | Ins Authed SLatuE '
|04 2012018 ol W $§5,100.00  |5$5,100.00 W""‘“" for Survay
| Edit Reg ] | | HthRpt_l . Edit Estimates Wigw Rpt _ Cancel Case l

Reforence Claim Details

(CLATM

SUBFOLDER DETAILS

s

" |[Created by adjuster]

NG SO0 LENG, [0: SP0128638

STARS RENTAL & LEASING, Co, Reg. No. 533123171

Mot

Ciaimant —
Wehicle Reg, | _ |bajo?/2018 00:00 - 159
SIP4BGOE ﬂ!_ll! of Losst [111 Moniths and B Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r]]
| Cmim Type: | TP / 644542270256 ﬂ""“‘m’ﬂ*’? VET | 2100334936 {Comprehensive)
Vehicle Reg. ] ' 1
; SGVS101K ?gﬂ:;}. S085947280-01
{Insured) :
Excess: ~ |

TET AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (HQ) BLK 15 SIN MING IND EST SECTOR A lﬂ"l.~19, 575677 Sin Ming - Tef: 64593319

| Yusoff@alg.com

TAIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express) - T=l: £5-6419-3000 ... [Handied by Syed-Yusoff, Saliha] Saliha. Syed:

NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Lid (HQ) - Tel!

| LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6256-3561 . [Handled by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 16/07/2018]

'ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case Mail |

. AIG.5G (06/07/2018): Request To Upload TP GIA Report

-

Due Date
| No results,
L

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View Al | Search Tosks | _Create New Task | _Complete |

Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handlar Assigned By Complated On Created On Done?

https://singapore. merimen.c nma’cIaimsfindex.cﬁn?ﬁ:seboFMTRadjustﬂr&ﬁlscactinn#sp_. .. 15/8/2018



Merimen e-Claims

upload Documents | _L umm| Cnmpuummml uptoad video | Upload Auio |

Claim Documents

+5IP4B60E (64454227025G)
[SGV5101K]

STARS RENTAL & LEASING
Jul 4 2018 12:00AM
[NG SO0 LENG]
T&T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

Page | 01 £

Wiew | View in Browser| |
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i |(Drat) | Third Perty Express Settiement = payment Breakdown [1] Edit
[PhotoafImages e )
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Ll——- 31/07/18 09:03 | General View . © | wooirs | B
{2 |31/07/18 09:03 General View © | loadrs | A
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Preview

Fage 1 01 1

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
[Venicle No: SGV5101K (Insd veh) Model: ISSAN LATIO 1.5 L (A)
SJP4BGOE (TP veh)
[Date of Accident: | 04/07/2018
Global Sum Settiement | 1| [ ] Yes | X1 No
Repair Estimate '8 10,681.13
Final Repair Cost - 5,457.00
Loss of Use % 480.00 8.00 days at $60.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 0.00 days
LTA / GiA Search Fee g T.45
Others - 0.00
9§
Final Settlement Sum a1 5,544 45

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered?
below)

[

] YES [X ] NO (Kindly indicate

Agreed Liability ___100 (%)

BOLA Liability: (%)

« Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nof apply.

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No  BOLA Scenarno No.

Assessed Liability (*): (%)

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown
1) |T&T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD : 9 5,044 45
2) $
3) 5
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN oty
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents 1o the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report! Bill (if any)

https://singapore. merimen.co m/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdocé& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 15/8/2018



Adjuster Report

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email suri@ikkauto.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreqno 1asso7188R)

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

rage 1 01 4

com:assignments@lkkauto.com

Our File No:  CC4/AIG1801 2257IKFA3Q2
Date: 15/08/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurar.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd.  Policy No 2100334836
Cmant Vehicle 5 p4860E insured Vehicle No: SGVS101K
Date of Loss: 041072018 Nature of Claim. TP Claim No: 644542270256
DESC 9] D FICATIO F I
Reg No! SJP4BE0E
Make & Model: NISSAN LATIO, 1.5 L (A) Engine No. HR15081365B
Reg. Date: 26/03/2008 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No: JN1BAAC11Z0021060
Colour: Metallic Gold Odometer: 116338 km
Engine Capacity: 1498 cc
Market Value/New Car Price. N/A
Sum Insured [S8): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): vYes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification; Mo Pre-accident Condition:
C T E
From Tyre Size: 205/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55 R16
Front Lefl Side: Michelin 9 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 9 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin @ mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 8 mm
The sbove values rapresant tha remaining fyre treads depth
GoSTOFGIANS — Rearwa  Adusters  Difenc DI A
Paris 8,512.36 4,903.23 1600813 2471
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,.470.00 2,660.00 810.00 23.34
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total ($5) 9,982.36 7.563.22 241913 24.23
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 5,100.00
{5%) 9,982.36 5,100.00 4,862.36 48.91
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) £98.77 357.00 3177 48,91
Matt Amount (S5) 10,681.13 5,457.00 522413 4891
+ Loss of Usa (8.0 x $$60.00/day) (S%) 480.00
+ DoclSearch Fee (S§) 7.45
Mett Liability (5%) 5,944 .45
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 04/07/2018

Dale Inspected:

https:e’fsingapure.meﬁmcn,cnnﬂcIaimsx‘index.cfm?ﬁxscb

05/07/2018 Inspected At:

T&T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (HQ)
BLK 19 SIN MING IND EST SECTOR A

ox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_...

15/8/2018



Adjuster Report Fage £ 014

#01-19
Singapore 575677
Estimated Period of Repair: 8.0 days
Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Chong Poh Kin

NOTE: This repor represents our findings af the time and place of inspecton stfed harein, Such inspaction hag been camied out fo the best of gur
knowladoe and abily but any other llability undar any other circumatances 18 herehy expressly axclided

https://sin gapore. merimen.com/claims/ index_cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 1 5/8/2018



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *BOOTLID Bent 764 60FN “TB4.60FN
2 1 *BOOTLID TOP LOCK Distorted 135.90FN "13580FN
3 1 *BOOTLID LOWER LOCK Repair B5.90FN *FN
4 1 *BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP (50%) Distorted / Dented 112.59FS "B2.55FS
] 1 *BOOTLID LOGO MNecessary 42 BOFN  "42.B0FN
B8 1 *BOOTLID EMBLEM -LATIO Wecessary 58.20FN *58.20FN
7 1 *BOOTLID GARNISH (CHROME W/SENSOR) Warped 292 50FN *282.50FN
B 1 *REAR BUMPER Bent 581.40FN *581 40FN
g 1 *REAR BUMPER BRACKET G/S Dented 193 40FN  "BG.TOFN
10 2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER Distorted 7O40FN *TD40FN
11 1 *REAR BUMPER SPONGE Serviceable TB.50FN FN
12 2 "REAR TAIL LAMP Cracked 563 B0FN *563.80FN
13 1 "REAR TAIL LAMP PANEL /S Bent J3T.00FN *188.50FN
14 1 *REAR END PANEL Bent 462 B0FN "462 BOFN
i5 1 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH Buckled 135 10FN *135.10FN
1B 1 *REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD Cracked 495 20FN *495.20FN
17 1 *REAR FENDER N/S Repair / OfS Buckled 1,774 60FN *BBT.30FN
18 1 *REAR FENDER INNER TRIM O/S Deformed 484 40FN "242.20FN
19 1 *REAR NUMBER PLATE Dented 50.00FS "45.00FS
20 8 *REAR BUMPER CLIP Mecessary 40.00FS *40.00FS
21 2 *REAR TAIL LAMP CLIP Necessary 10.00FS *10.00FS
22 2 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIP Necessary 10.00FS *10.00FS
23 B8 "REAR FENDER INER TRIM CLIP -RH Necessary 40.00FS "40.00F5S
24 1 *REAR REVERSE SENSOR Cracked 35000FS *200.00FS

F=Franchizse part. S=SpcNell N=NetiliemDiss

Sub Total (S§) 7,167.89  5402.75

- Nett Item Discount on N ltems 10.00/10.00% (53%) 655.53 489,52

Total Parts (S5) 6,512.36  4,903.23
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 15/8/2018



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous tems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
1 TO CHECK WIRING Mew 50.00 20.00
2 TO TUFF KOTE New 250.00 90.00
3 TO TOWING CHARGES (KING DOLLY) New 120.00 100.00
4  TO REMOVE /REFIX UPHOLSTERY ,CUSHION ,SEAT & ROOF New 150.00 100.00
LINING
5 TOREMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR New 100.00 50.00
6  TOPANEL BEATING ,REMOVING & REPLACING OF NEW New 1.400.00 1,200.00
PARTS
7 TO SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREA New 1,400.00 1,100.00
Gross Labour Cost {85) 3.,470.00 2,660.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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