Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 5:51 PM

To: Lee, Ming-Yao; SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM : GBC766J // 4797124927SG // DOA : 23/06/2018

Dear George,

The MV of GBC 766J is $22K-$23K(est) as at Jun’18.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lee, Ming-Yao [mailto:MingYao.Lee@aig.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 11:48 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: OD CLAIM : GBC766)J // 4797124927SG // DOA : 23/06/2018

Hi LKK,
For your expertise on determining the market value of above mentioned accident please.

Regards,

George Lee

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1769 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Ming-Yao.Lee@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg
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