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mNiFOR.IDELGRO CulmiurEDHIGru Engineering Pte Ltd

ENCINEERING i s
* memisr of COMFORIDELGRD, ) Date/Time* 02-07+2018°11:02  Page : 1
Team: ARC Eepa.u{i’(ciﬂ:lil JOB CARD :=sles Order. JCNO: 305182185
STOMER - REGN NO MILEAGE
- SHC1170A
o~ COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD V@AEFS —— =
& 7010045 © TOYOTA AT F
STOMEANOS83 SIN MING DRIVE ey :
gingapore SINGAFORE 575717 FRIUS H&"EEID{G&}GZ%G? 09:50
65508755 BT D
h g o : YROFWEY- 10. 2017
@ CHASSIS COMPLETION DATETIME:
T . C ¥%maruz03s6a974
JOB DESCRIPTION
Accident Date: 28.060.2018
NATURE: 3F 28.06.2018
& /NO ABOR CODE DESCRIPTION
o : H :
¢ Q ~ Qgw Side Mo
1 L L/
w
[ECKED & PASSED OUT By
SERVICE ADVISOR CUSTOMER'S SIGNATURE
T
owlsdgement Skp Eslt Paas
v
Vishacis o,
one:  SHOI170A LARRY SHC1170A
y gty e
& of Sarnce Acasor SigratureTane WName of Service Adusar Date
i retumed o Sservice Reception upon collection . To be kepl by Security Guard
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- COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE
VEHICLE NO : SHC1170A

¥y

2. Jul. 2018

MAKE : TOYOTA 2
MODEL . PRIUS J DOA: 28.06.2018
|PARTS DESCRIPTION QTY |UNITPRICE|  AMOUNT
1IMIRROR ASSY. OUTER REAR VIEW, RH $1.374.00
1|ICOVER, OUTER MIRROR, RH $141.90
SUB TOTAL $1,515.90
LESS 25%]| $303.18
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 51!212.’!2
| nance nolify
ftan} .
ar of the I« '-':f:'--l .
Tt
o To fiapley demaged AP
« Parts prices 2w $-
» Thied porty aurvey 5. €
LABOUR CHARGE o
1|Panel Beating u subpect ¥ $100.00
1|Spray Painting Charge Acknowsecged by a0l $100.00|
1|Wiring Charge L’_, $50.00
TOTAL LABOUR $250.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL 81 i4ﬁ!.?2
!
h
IThis is an inifial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle.|The final ru:Jir guantum will
be prepared jfter the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor apgointed by the insurancd company.




Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 2:50 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 28/06/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GU 4888K AND SHC 1170A
Dear Ms Thin

Please process settlement in sum $ 1720.00 for resolving our property damage claim amicably.
Thank you.
Best Regards

Jim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto} <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 2:14 PM

To: lim Wong See Pah

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 28/06/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GU 4888K AND SHC 1170A

Your Ref: T0618/SHC1170A/IW/(st) "Without Prejudice"
Our Ref: CC3/EQI18012169/Nua3

Dear Mr Jim,

ACCIDENT ON 28/06/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GU 4888K AND SHC 1170A
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at Global Sum $51,720.00 (all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

Plagge nofe thot our above settlement is mode on o without prejudice bosis, and should not be construed os on admisgion of liability on
our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in ony other related matter(s) in
respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is mode solely to resolve this matter anfy. No reference shall
be mode to this offer or ony settlement arnsing from this offer in any other related motters.

settlemment and payment are subject to production of onginal documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher
{far settiement sum abowe $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retoined by us after we have

maoade payment on the settlement sum.

Best Regards,
Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler



Lkﬁﬁhuta'tunsultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5(408933)

From: Jim Wong 5See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 2:49 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 28/06/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GU 4888K AND SHC 1170A

Dear Ms Thin

Please find the attached video footage.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Jim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 1:53 PM

To: Jim Wong See Pah

Cc: Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT ON 28/06/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GU 4888K AND SHC 1170A

Your Ref: SHC 1170A "Without Prejudice"
Our Ref: CC3/EQI18012169/Nua3

Dear Sir / Madam,
ACCIDENT ON 28/06/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES GU 4888K AND SHC 1170A
We refer to the above matter.

As per our principal instruction, we would like to request a copy of video footage to justify your client’s claim
smoothly and promptly.

Thanks.

Megse note thot our above settlement is mode on o without prejudice basis, and shouw'd not be construed os on admission of lability on
pur part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terme af such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other refoted matter(s) in
respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter (s mode solely to resolve this marter only. No reference shall
be made to this offer or ony settlement arising from this offer in any other reloted matters.



settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents an demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher
(for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Eurther all original docurments shall be retained by us after we hove

made poyment on the settlement sum.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

This message and sny stachments mey contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information, |f you are nat the intended recipien. kindly natify us
and dalete this messags and its attachments immediately, and pleass be advised that using copying. distributing or disclosing any contents therain |s
nat dliowed Statementy petaining to &ty matter autside our business are nol to be taken as endorsed by ComforiDeiGro Corporation Lemited o its
relniag companes The comments/proposals provaded ane for discussion purpases only and are subject to approvals. Nothing heren shall constitte a
Linding agreamant between the parties. Neithes party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except &s agreed in 8 written agresmaent
signed by the duly authorised representatives of bath parties

CamtonDeiGo - a Grean Office cenified by the Singapore Environment Councll - s committed to preserving the anvironmant. We encourage you to
print s only if necessany

ComforiDaiGro Engineenng Phe L1g [Registration No. 199506048W]

This messaga and any attechments may contamn confidential, privileged or propristary information. If you are not the intended recipient. kindly notity us
ang delats (his message and s sttachments immediately, and pleass be advised that using. copying. distributing or disclosing any contents thenein is
ol mllowed Stilements pertaining to any matter outside our business are nol 10 be taken as endorsed by ComforiDetGro Corporation Limited or s
reimled compames The commenis/proposals prowded are for discussion purposes only and are subedt to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute &
it agreemant between the parties. Nelther party sfrall be bound in any way 10 any term ar condition excapl a¢ agreed in 3 writien agreement
sgned by the duly authorised representalives of both parties

ComfornDalGro - » Green Office certified by the Smgapore Envirenment Council - i committed to presanving the anvironment. We encourage you to
prnt 1his only f necessany

ComfordDeiGro Enginesnng Ple Lid [Registration No 1885080480




COMFORIDELGRO

Our Ref T0618/ SHC1170A /JW(st) ENGINEERING
Your ref :
Date : 17-Jul-18 COGE Tasl Claims Dept
50 Loyang Drive 4th Fir
EQ Insurance Company Limited Singapors 508659

5 Maxwell Road, MND Complex
#17-00 Tower Block

Singapore 069110

Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHC1170A YOUR INSURED GU 4888K
AND OTHER ON 28.06.18

We are the authorised repair workshop far Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Vehicle No - SHC1170A which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving GU 4888K
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER’S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 145190

2 2  days Loss of Rental @ $ 12540 perday $ 25080

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by Mis LKK) 5 -

4 LTA Search Fees 5 7.49

5 GIA/ Police Report Fees s -

6 Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees -
SubTotal: $ 1,710.19

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 2 dayslossoflncome@ $ 8000 perday $ 160.00

Total Claims: $ 1,870.19

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a) Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs - [+ pes.
b) LTA search slip/s of GU 4888K
c¢) GIA/ Police report/s of : SHC1170A

d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Wilness statement/s ( ) Towing/Medical billireceipts ( ) Cerificate of Insurance
{ X ) Photograph/s of Accident Scen ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

Jim Wong

Deputy Manager

CDGE Claims Depantment

Tel : 6214 B374 Fax: 6214 1843 Email : imwong(@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter, No signature Is required

COMFORIDELCRO G P



B UL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA U INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62503561 FAN 11063 6256403

Our Ref: CC3/EQI1B012169/Nual
24 OCTOBER 2018

HOYA UPHOLESTERY
27A JURONG PORT ROAD
#01-22

SINGAPORE 619101

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GU 4888K AND SHC 1170A ON 28/06/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 5 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

THIN THIN HLAING

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

Fax: 6741 4108

Email: thinthin@lkkauto.com

c.c. EQINSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)



CDGVARS. V. LettofAuthorisation Page | of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
(NAF |/ PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING TOYOTA PRIUS SHC1170A | GU 4B8BK ON 28-Jun-18 17:30
ALONG TPE TWDS PIE UPP CHANGI AD EAST B4 CHANGI NORTH EXIT.
1/ We LOH CHENG HUAT [Hirer] NRIC No.: S51582923]1
and/of (Rehef) NRIC No..
Tax) Numibser SHC1170A

hereby authnorise ComfortDelGro Engneering Ptz L[ CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and sapanss, ncluding loss of iIncome, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs

4. Ta have ppsoluté discration 1o agree (o-any settlement or compensation-amount ih respect al my/our elaim
against third party (except personal Injuries and medical claims)

1. Ta sign Discharge Vaucher on my/our behalf,
4. Ta accept any paymeant (claim procesds) n respact of the claim against third party and paymefit by chegue

=hall be forward directly to CDGE In accordance with CDGE's instruction and mada in favour of
"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 29-Jun-2018

Hame of Hirer LOH CHENG HUAT

Hirar NRIC 51582923] Sigrature

Address 101 SIME]I STREET 1 205-882
520101

Contact No 98155052

http://edgek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/ View/CDG.VARS.V LettofAut...  29/06/2018



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

WAFORIDELGROD

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
A et of COMPORYON LCRG

Head Office
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 79701

Kindly nole that no recept shall be issued unless requested

CUSTOMER'S COPY

TAX INVOICE

ACCOUNT No

CaomfortDelGro Engineering Ple Ltd

INVOICE No

AMODUNT

BANK/CHO No




COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

COMFORDELCRD

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

ComforilDeltvro Engineering Pre Lid
& rrsmbse o COMPORIN LCE

Head Office
205 Broddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly note fhat no recoipt shall ba issued unléss requesied
CUSTOMER'S COPY

TAX INVOICE

ACCOUNT No

ComiortDelGro Engineering Pie Lid

INVOICE No.

AMOUNT

BANK/CHQ No




Our Ref:  CT18060899 n

Date: 13 July 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT ON 28/06/2018 @ 17:30 hrs

ALONG TPE = PIE UPP CHANG| RD EAST B4 CHANG| NORTH
EXIT

INVOLVING GU4888K

We refer to lhe above-menlioned accident and wish lo inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHC1170A (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to LOH CHENG HUAT IC NO
$1582923J a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd al the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $125.40 per day
{(inclusive of GST), i

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at lhe material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signalure is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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Insurance Particulars Enquiry By Agems Dewl hips: vrl s gov.sg/lmovrl actionims Pan Detm By AATFUNCTION .

Enguire Vehicle Insurer
Vehicle No. Incident Date/Time SearchStatus  Insurance Company Code Insurance Company Mame
GUARBAK 28 Jun 2018 7 17:30-D0 Successtul ED4 EQ) INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Previous oK

lofl 2062018, 4:08 PM



Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

e e e —

From: Justin Wong <justin.wong@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 2:58 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Mei Kwan (LKKAutD)

Cc Vivian Lau (LKKAuta): Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GU4888K (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SHC1170A (TP

: LKK REF - CC3/EQI18012169/Nua3) on 28/06/2018

Dear Thin Thin,

Liahility is clear against our insured based on third-party accident video.
Kindly proceed with direct settlement.

Thank you.

Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

g

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110 =
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 656223 4190 EI
WwWw.eqi rance.com.

]

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the :

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@Ilkkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, October 24, 2018 2:04 PM

To: Justin Wong <justin.wong@eqginsurance.com.sg>; Mel Kwan [LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Ce: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) svivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GUA4888K (01 : CTI - TBA) AND SHC1170A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQU180121659/Nua3) on 28/06/2018

Dear Justin,

Enclosed herewith CCTV footage from TP for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | emall: thinthin@ kkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paye Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Justin Wong <justin.wong@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 August 2018 3:07 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuta) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GU4888K (Ol : CT1 - TBA) AND SHC1170A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQI18012169/Nual3) on 28/06/2018

Dear Mei Kwan,

Please find our insured’s GIA report for this matter.

Kindly obtain third-party accident video footage to confirm liability before concluding direct settlement.
Thank you.

Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 64969115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW.eqinsurance.com.sg

I |

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the :

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) [mallto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com)]

Sent: Wednesday, July 4, 2018 6:42 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>; Joel Goh <joel. goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Thin Thin [LKKAuto) <thinthin@|kkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GU4888K (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SHC1170A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQI18012169/Nua3) on 28/06/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,



We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case.
We had inspected TP vehicle SHC 1170A at Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang).

Enclosed for your perusal is:
. TP GIA report
TP estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 68412360.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 o055 | email: MeiKwani@kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Tatal Control Panel

To: joelgobideginsuranee. com.sg Remove this sender from my allow list
From: meikwan alkkauto.com

You received this message because the sender ix on your ollow list
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] UBEAVE |, PUZ-28 PAYA U INDUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J00933 TEL : (063) 62361561 FAX :(065) 62554115

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 09/11/2018

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Vehicie No GU 4888K (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DMCPHQ17-008035
' SHC 1170A (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CC3/EQI18012169/Nua3q2
Date of Accident 28/6/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost '8 1,451 80
Loss of In::um_e 1 75.00 1.5 days
Rental (If any) 9 188.10 1.5 days
Others: - 7.49
' 5
1,722.49

Final Settlement Sum |: § 1,720.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks

ayment In ion: P 's Breakd

1) [COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD - 1,720.00

' $

JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1201-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL G256 3581 FAX: G256 4315
Fieg No: 199807188R GST Reg. No. 19.-9807188-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCIEQI18012168/Nua3g2

5 MAXWELL ROAD

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK

MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 089110

Coda: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  GU 4888K Veh. Inspected SHC 1170A
Policy No, DMCPHQ17-D08035 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 03/07/2018
Z. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS c.c 1788
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. JTDKB3IFU203568074 Colour BLUE
Odometer 68217 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Madification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Slize Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |19585R15 WEST LAKE 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |19585R15 WEST LAKE 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre [185/85R15 WEST LAKE 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/85R15 WEST LAKE 5 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE /S SIDE MIRROR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/068/2018 |Inspection Date 03/07/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
50 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508968
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REFPAIR: 1 Warking Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusinal Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. No: 198607T188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607168-R Page No.:1 ol 9
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 11704
Qty Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By | -ﬂur-lgwhd-
REELACEMENT OF PARTS
1|MIRROR ASSY DUTER REAR VIEW RH CRACKED 1,374.00 1,374.00
1|COVER ,OUTER MIRROR, RH BENT 141 80 141.890
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -378.98 -378.98
1.136.82 1.136.92
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING 100.00 100.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 100.00 10000
WIRING CHARGE 50.00 20.00
250.00 220.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,386.92 1,356.92
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | ]| ' 135892
Report Ref No. CC3/EQI18012168/Nua3q2
.lr 1=
[
MUHAMMAD NAZRIL BIN ABDULLAH HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor Automotive Assessor

CMECLARBAER OF LLARILITY T0 THIRD PARTIES - This Rapart s made sabsby for the ase srd benef® of fhe Gl named on e tront peges of his Regan.




