Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 September, 2019 4:59 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Alfred Toh; 'Chong Boon Sen'

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGQ 6502G (OI : CTI -

TBA) and SJU 12927 (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18012166/Aha3) on 03/07/2018

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to our below email.

Please be informed that TP is chasing for settlement.
For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LSES

" Save the Larth Print only whernr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, 8 June, 2019 2:08 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cec: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh @sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>;
Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong @sg.cntaiping.com>; elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com; Admin A <admin-
a@]kkauto.com>

Subject: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGQ 6502G (OI : CTI - TBA) and SJU
12927 (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18012166/Afa3) on 03/07/2018

Our Ref: CC6/CT118012166/Afa3
Your Ref:  TBA

Dear Sir/Madam,
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGQ 6502G(0Ol) AND SJU 12927 (TP) ALONG CTE ON 03/07/2018

We refer to the above matter.



Liability: The accident occurred when our insured collided into the rear of third party vehicle. Liability is
down against our insured.

We did clarify with Ol (Ms Charmaine Sia) the nature of the accident and She agree to settle and aware
that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop" at $
5,427.49(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair $18,380.80 S 5,000.00
2. Loss of Rental S 540.00 ($180.00 x 3 days) S 420.00($140.00 x 3 days)
3. LTA search fee S 7.49 S 7.49
Total | $18,928.29 $ 5,427.49

**06 days recommendation for repair.
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
For your approval please.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciate.

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥F LIRS 2
memmE = ww o Save the Larthe Print only whenr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 4:49 PM

To: claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com

Cec: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Ong Chin Kiat

<chinkiat.ong @sg.cntaiping.com>; elaine.cheong @sg.cntaiping.com; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGQ6502G (OI : CAI - TBA) and SGU1292Z (TP :
LKK REF - CC6/CTI18012166/Afa3) on 03/07/2018

Importance: High

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’




SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC6/CTI118012166/Afa3
Your Ref:  TBA

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SGU 12927
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EIES

i, -

" Save the Larth Print only whern necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 July 2018 5:56 PM

To: claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com

Cec: Sharon Han <sharon.han @sg.cntaiping.com>; Angie Foo <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>; Poh Kin
(LKKAuto) <pohkin @lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGQ6502G (OI : CAI - TBA) and SGU1292Z (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI18012166/Afa3) on 03/07/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/ Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle SGU 12927 at M /s Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed for your perusal is:



- TP GIA report
Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841
2132.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



