
Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

GERALD POH WEE BIN < geraldpoh@lonpac.com >

Thursday, 20 December 2018 9:29 AM
Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

MT_Claim_SG

RE: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TMFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NoS. SJQ
5551G(OD AND SKK s320E (TP) ON 01-07-2018; LKK ref: CC4/LpC1BO1Z165/Kfa3;
Lonpac ref: 18/ 1 8/ 1 8N P05/0207 27

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Dear Poh Kin

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive I Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/O7 The Concourse, Singapore
I_eli (0s) 6250 7388 Ext.255 I Fax: (65) 6296 2706

199555

From3 Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto: pohkin@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 18 December, 2OLB li46 pM

TO: GEMLD POH WEE BIN
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A
subject: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SJQ 5561G(OD AND SKK 5320E
(TP) ON 01-07-2018; LKK ref: CC4l1pC18012165/Kfa3; Lonpac ref: 18/18/18/VpOSld2O7Z7 '
Importance: High

OurRef: CC4lLPCt8Ot2t65/Kfa3
YourRef: t8lt8lL8lVpOSl02O727

Dear Gerald,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOTVING SJQ 5561G (OI) AND SKK 5320E (TP) ALONG TENGKOK BAHRU ON
otloTlzots

We refer to the above matter.

Liability: The accident occurred when our insured collided into third party vehicle while reversing along the
said road as per TP video footage. Liability is down against our lnsured.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Hui yanq Motor pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 4,650.69 (54,346.44 + 7o/ol S 1,819.00 (Sl.7oo.oo + 7o/"
2. Loss of Use S 32o.oo (S8o.oo x 4 davs) 240.00 (560.00 x 4



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent Tuesday, 18 December 2018 7:46 PM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A
SUbJECI SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS, SJQ

5561G(Ol) AND SKK 5320E (TP) ON 01-07-2018; LKK ref: CC4ILPC1 8012165/Kfa3;
Lonpac ref: 1 8/ 1 I /1 8N P05 /0207 27

Attachments: LKK Adjustment report.pdf; LKK lnspection report.pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO.pdf;
LKK RESURVEY PHOTO-AFTER REPA|R.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; TP LOD_SKK

5320E.pdf

lmportance: High

Our Ref: CC4ltPC18012155/Kfa3
YourRef: tSltghAlvPOSlO2OT2T

Dear Gerald,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOTVTNG SJQ 5561G (Or) AND SKK 5320E (Tpl ATONG TENGKOK BAHRU ON
otloTl2ots

We refer to the above matter,

Liability: The accident occurred when our insured collided into third party vehicle while reversing along the
said road as perTP video footage. Liability is down against our Insured.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Hui Yans Motor Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 4,6s0.69 i.54,346.44 + 7o/ol S 1,819.00 (5r,700.oo + 7%
2. Loss of Use S 320.00 (580.00 x 4 davs) 2a0.00 (560.00 x 4
3. GIA search fee S 2.oo

Total S 4,972.69 3 2-06r.

**04 days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.



Best Regards,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LI(K Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: Dohkin@lkkauto.com I laxt 6741-4to9

Blk 5r, Paya Lrbi Industrial Park, Lrbi Avenue 1, #o2-2S I S(+o8g:g)

Sayc tlc Eartl. Pnht a/r/y t//1cn ner.ssdrr.

This e-mail contain conrldential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. lf you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 July 2018 12:15 PM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@ lkka uto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim SG <mt_claim @lonpac.com>; Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao TonB (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subiect: RE: TP Claim forSKK5320E against SJQ5561G / DOA:01./07 /20L8 {'** LKK REF: CC4l1PC18012765/Kfa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

LPC ref: t8 / l8 / 18 lVP OS / O2O7 27
LKK REF: CC4 / LP C18O12I6S /Kfa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed revert ofvehicle: SKK 5320E

We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
o TP estimated cost of repair
o Preliminary advice
r Photographs ofTP vehicle in its damaged condition

ofyour insured'i GIA report for our necessary actiort.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841
2t32.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan I Admin

LKKAuto Consr tants Pte Ltd
Phone:6366 oo55 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com I fax:67414108
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HUI YA]VG MOTOR PTE. LTD.
Contact Add : SIN MING AUTOCARE Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02 Singapore 575721

Tel: 64515752 (2 Line). Fax:64514658
Reg No. 2016294j8M

Date:10/08/2018

Lonpac Insurance Bhd
Moto r C la ims D ep artment
100 Beach Road

#19-00 Shaw Tower

Singapore 189702

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLWNG SKK5320E & SJQ5561G ON 01-07-2018

ALONG JANCTION OF LENGKOK BAHRU

SETTLEMENT OF OUR CLAIM FOR SKK532OE

Lump sum repair cost as recommended by surveyor (TP0422 ) $ 1,819.00

4 days Loss ofuse @ $80.00 per day $ 320.00

TP Insurance Enquiry $ 2.00

$ 2,141.00

*The above claim applies only to vehicle damage and expressly exclude all personal injuies
and other consequential loss.

Please let us have your reply soonest possible, thank you.

Best Regards,

Marco Neo
HUI YANG MOTOR PTE LTD
DID:64515752
Fax: 64514658
email : hui )dng _motor@hotmail. com



AUTHOzuZATION LETTER

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

tNte, 4Kt,( c,r< )CqS/^G p/( /-7, hereby declare and agree to use the

address of Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd, that is at Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive, #04-02 Sin Ming

Autocare Singapore 575721 in all mylour correspondences with any party in connection with

mylour claim arising from an accident involving my/our motor vehicle registration number

$kR 57*€ and other vehicles registration number 574' 5-Z iG(

o" o/tr//r7

LTVe, further grant authority to Messrs Hui Yang Motor pte Ltd or any of their

representatives to open all my/our letters and to negotiate myiour claim on my/our behalf.

I/We wish to inform you that you could issue the cheque pal,rnent in favour of my/our repairer

Messrs Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd.

owner and/or Company's stamp

along



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 18118118NP051020727DArE , ),ol,vltt

L&Ve, MKM CAR LEASING PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD andlor the owner of SJQ 5561G the sum of Singapore Dollars
Two Thousand Sixty-One Only ($2,061.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation
and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by me/us whether now or
hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident to
my vehicle, SKK 5320E on 1"t July 2018 along/at Leng Kok Bahru.

I AVe hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnifu (KHO ZHENG HONG
/LONPAC INSURANCE BIID) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made
by any person/persons on our behalfin respect ofthe said accident.

L/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/s HUI
YANG MOTOR PTE LTD.

L\Ve hereby acknowledge that this pa),ment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured's recovery action.

.\

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

itl,l,1

!1f( (: /.::::.s r7,- /ta/
Name of vehicle owner/Date tililrq



HU] YAJVG MTOTCR PT'E LTD
Bill To:

Lonpac Insurance Bhd
Motor Claims Department
100 Beach Road

#19-00 Shaw Tower

Singapore 189702

Reg No.:201629438M

GST No:201629438M

HUI YANG MOTOR PTE LTD

Authorised Signature

Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd
Sin Ming Autocare Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive

#04-02 Singapore 5 7 57 2 I
Email : huijanglnotot@hotmail.com
H/P:98625891 Ofire: 64515752 Fax : 64514658

l'AX INVOICE
TP Claim Invoice No: TP0422

Bill Dute: 10/08/2018

Description Amount

Date of Accident : 0I/07/2018
Owner : MKM CAR LEASING PTE LTD
Vehicle No : SKK5320E
Make &Model : TOYOTA ALTIS

Lump sum repair cost as recommended bv survevor

Sub-Total
Add 7% GST

Total Amount SGD

$ 1.700.00

.,

,s

1,700.00

119.00

$ 1,819.00



7t2t2014 lnvoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

GEl{ERAL
IilSURAXCE
ASEOCIATIOX Operating Hours: Monday to Friday gam to 5pm

RECoRDS MANAGEMENT cENTRE 
GST R"gistration No: M400017735

Third Party lnsurer Enquiry

our Ref No: GR-18-'100122

Date of Request: 0210712018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #O4-O2
Sin l\iling Autocare
Singapore 575721

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 0210712018

Enquiry By Loh Siang Chuan Marcus

TP Vehicle No. SJQ5561G

Accident Date 0110712018

Result
TP Vehicle No. lnsurer Period of lnsurance lnsurer Tel. No.

sJo5561G Lonpac lnsurance Bhd 24tO1 I 201 8-23 I 01 t20 1 I +65 62507388

Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General lnsurance Association of
Singapoie and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage aris ng out of
or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generaled document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp-!eninvtp&refid= 1847717&CFID=36535565&CFTOKEN= 1e4.. 112



7t212C18 lnvoice

GENERAL INSUR,ANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Rames Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

GEilERAT
IilSURAHCE
AltsOCnflOI Operating Hours: Monday to Friday gam to spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE 
GsT R"sistration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our RefNo: GR-18-100122
Date of Request: 0210712018 Your Ref No: Online purchase

Hui Yang Motor Pte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #04-02
Sin Ming Autooare
Singapore 575721

Dear Sir/l\,ladam,

Enquiry Date 0210712018

Enquiry By Loh Siang Chuan Marcus
TP Vehicle No. SJO5561G
Accident Date 0110712018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$)

TP lnsurer Enquiry 't.87

GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST lnclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:

lxl GIRO [] Cash I I Cheque

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvtp&refid='18477'17&CFtD=36535565&CFTOKEN=1e4...2!2


