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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 16 July, 2018 10:26 AM

To: Liew Thye Wui

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SLE3983A AGAINST SLU6026J  ACCIDENT 

DATE: 1/7/18 ***LKK REF:CC4/ASM18012158/hb3 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Liew, 

 

We refer further to our below email. 

 

Please be informed that we confirmed in receipt of the video footage. 

 

In view of the above, since both parties were changing towards the same lane, we are prepared to settle your client’s 

claim on a 50/50 basis. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present 

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer 

in any other related matters.  

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 4 July, 2018 4:06 PM 

To: Liew Thye Wui 

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SLE3983A AGAINST SLU6026J ACCIDENT DATE: 1/7/18 ***LKK 

REF:CC4/ASM18012158/hb3  

 

Without Prejudice 
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Dear Liew, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Please be informed that we are pending for DS instruction from our principal. 

 

We will check and will get back for an update. 

 

Meanwhile, our Insured reported (as below) that both vehicles moved towards the same lane when the accident 

happened. Kindly furnish us any evidence to support your client’s version. 

 

Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

 

 

From: Liew Thye Wui [mailto:twliew@honda.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 4 July, 2018 3:14 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) 

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SLE3983A AGAINST SLU6026J ACCIDENT DATE: 1/7/18 ***LKK 

REF:CC4/ASM18012158/hb3  

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Can we have a Direct Settlement for this case? Hope to receive your reply soon. 

 

Thank you and have a Nice Day. 

 

Best Regards 

 

 

TW LIEW 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

15 Ubi Road 4 

Singapore 408610 

DID: 6514 5687 

Fax: 6748 0770 

 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 4 July, 2018 3:08 PM 

To: Liew Thye Wui <twliew@honda.com.sg> 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SLE3983A AGAINST SLU6026J ACCIDENT DATE: 1/7/18 ***LKK 

REF:CC4/ASM18012158/hb3  

 

Dear Mr Liew, 
 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096. 

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

 

Thank you 
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To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Liew Thye Wui [mailto:twliew@honda.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July 2018 1:26 PM 

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg> 

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT OF VEHICLE NO. SLE3983A AGAINST SLU6026J ACCIDENT DATE: 1/7/18 

 

Dear Officer-in-charge,  

Kindly refer to the attachments for third party direct settlement.  

Vehicle is not in our workshop. Please call for the arrangement.  

Meanwhile, kindly get back to me once liability has establish. 

Thank you very much. 

Best Regards 

 

 

TW LIEW 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

15 Ubi Road 4 

Singapore 408610 

DID: 6514 5687 

Fax: 6748 0770 

 

 

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the 

individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and 

exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended 

recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this 

communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately 

notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you. 
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Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the 

individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and 

exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended 

recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this 

communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately 

notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you. 


