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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 July 2018 2:03 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: FW: SUPPLEMENTARY FOR VEHICLE NO SHB219G  (TAX06/18/2145)

NS/INC18012121/Vvb 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 

#02-25 | S(408933) 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Phua Zhi Yang (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC/AR) [mailto:ZhiYang.Phua@smrt.com.sg] 

Sent: Saturday, 7 July, 2018 9:41 AM 

To: Sathya Sai (LKK Auto) <SathyaSai@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Lay Hoon <kuahlayhoon@gmail.com>; layhwee_kuah@leeshengauto.com.sg; Jurviel 

<jurviel.leesheng@gmail.com>; Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) 

<BThaiyalN@smrt.com.sg>; Alex Kam <alex_kam@leeshengauto.com.sg>; Kok Tuck Foo (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR 

& SC/ARC) <TuckFoo@smrt.com.sg>; Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC) 

<YeoPohsuan@smrt.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: SUPPLEMENTARY FOR VEHICLE NO SHB219G (TAX06/18/2145) 

 

Hi LKK, 

 

Kindly please approve the supplementary, so we can proceed for the repair. 

 

FYI, the vehicle has been overdue, based on the surveyor first estimate marking 

 

Thanks, 

zhiyang 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Alex Kam [mailto:alex_kam@leeshengauto.com.sg] 

Sent: Thursday, 5 July, 2018 2:03 PM 

To: Sathya sai; Phua Zhi Yang (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC/AR); Kok Tuck Foo (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & 

SC/ARC); Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/AR & SC/ARC) 

Cc: Lay Hoon; layhwee_kuah@leeshengauto.com.sg; Jurviel; Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims 

& IA/Taxis/Claims) 

Subject: FW: SUPPLEMENTARY FOR VEHICLE NO SHB219G (TAX06/18/2145) 

 

Hi Sathya , 

 

 

 

The above awaiting for your approval, please let us have your decision . 

 

 

Thanks 
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Regards 

ALEX 

 

 

Mr Alex Kam 

Lee Sheng Auto Pte Ltd 

1, Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-60 , Autobay@KB . S(417883) Tel : 67477397 Fax : 67457138 Email : 

alex_kam@leeshengauto.com.sg 

 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Alex Kam [mailto:alex_kam@leeshengauto.com.sg] 

Sent: Thursday, 5 July, 2018 1:32 PM 

To: Yeo Poh Suan(Auto Svcs/Maint & Engg/ARC); Jurviel; Janet Neo Mei Yen(Auto Svcs/ARC); Zhi Yang Phua (Auto 

Svcs/ARC); Kok Tuck Foo(Auto Svcs/ARC); Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi(Auto Svcs/ARC) 

Subject: RE:SUPPLEMENTARY FOR VEHICLE NO SHB219G (TAX06/18/2145) 

 

 HI  All, 

 

This  vehicle  is  survey by  SATHYA  (LKK) 

 

Thanks 

 

Ms  Lee 

 


