Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Foo, Chityan <Chityan.Foo@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 April 2019 10:03 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 7996283227SG, ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBM 7054G AND SLV 2098Y ON
27/06/2018

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Hi Asher,

We refer to your email dated 19.02.19.

Please forward your adjuster fees for service rendered and close the file in merimen.
We will proceed to repudiate due to insured accident non-reporting.

Kind regards,

Jimmy Foo

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1945 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Chityan.foo@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, February 19, 2019 2:12 PM
To: Foo, Chityan <Chityan.Foo@aig.com>

Subject: Your Ref: 7996283227SG, ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBM 7054G AND SLV 2098Y ON 27/06/2018

Hi Jimmy,

We refer to the above matter.

We have send out final non-reporting letter however insured yet to report till date.

Kindly advice / instruction if any as third party is chasing for settlement.

Thank You.

Best Regards,



Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



