Vic (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Without Prejudice
Dear Vivian,

We refer to your below email.

Vic (LKKAuto)

Friday, 30 August, 2019 5:35 PM

Vivian Tan

Admin A; Rasul (LKKAuto); josephyeh@vendaengrg.com.sg;
lionelchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg; lawrencesim@pegasusengrg.com.sg;
ngsoontat@vendaengrg.com.sg; Vic (LKKAuto)

RE: Finalise For SLL7112J (DOA 26/06/2018)

FINALIZATION - Your Ref SLL 7112) DOA 26/06/2018 LKK REF
CC6/AIG18011998/R1ja3

Please refer to the attached email.

Kindly forward LOD t o us.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

I 3 74 74

P

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the

unintended recipient is prohibited, and
read this e-mail or any attached items.

" Save the Larth Print only when necessary-

sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vivian Tan [mailto:vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 26 June, 2019 6:59 PM

To: CS A Team

Cc: Admin A; Rasul (LKKAuto); josephyeh@vendaengrg.com.sg; lionelchua@pegasusengrg.com.sg;
lawrencesim@pegasusengrg.com.sg; ngsoontat@vendaengrg.com.sg
Subject: RE: Finalise For SLL7112J (DOA 26/06/2018)

Dear Rasul,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Finalise amount @ Part by Part $4,831.60 @ 6 working days.

Parts - $2,941.60
Labour - $1,890.00

Total - $4,831.60

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Vivian Tan

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road $628800

Office: 65137748

Fax: 62513161



