Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 29 June, 2018 9:52 AM

To: 'Joel Goh'; assignments

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: SLF6224H CLAIMING AGAINST GBC1678C(EQ) DOA25062018 CHECK LIABILITY
& ARRANGE SURVEY

Categories: HMK

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 9:53 AM

To: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Operation <braddell operation@sparkcarcare.com>

Cc: braddell cr@sparkcarcare.com; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLF6224H CLAIMING AGAINST GBC1678C(EQ) DOA25062018 CHECK LIABILITY & ARRANGE SURVEY

Without Prejudice

Dear William

We will appoint LKK to survey your client’s vehicle.
Dear LKK

Kindly assist on this PRS.
Our insured has not reported the accident.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel fax



Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .

From: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Operation [mailto:braddell operation@sparkcarcare.com]
Sent: Tuesday, June 26, 2018 5:06 PM

To: EQI PRS

Cc: braddell cr@sparkcarcare.com; braddell operation@sparkcarcare.com

Subject: SLF6224H CLAIMING AGAINST GBC1678C DOA25062018 CHECK LIABILITY & ARRANGE SURVEY

Dear Sir/Madam,

Kindly assist to check liability for this case and arrange survey at CDGE braddell.
Your insured vehicle number is GBC1678C
Please see attached and reply as soon as possible.

Thanks.

Best Regards

William Wang

External Business | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6383 8115 | Fax: 6281 5767
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