Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Alice Tng <kangcarl76@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 4:18 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd; Admin A

Subject: Fw: LOD:ACCDT INVLG SKH5343E & SKP4970J(AIG) ON 27.06.18
Attachments: LOD.SKH5343E.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE/REMINDER

Dear Vic,

We refer to our email below and our LOD dated 26 Oct 2018.

We have yet to receive any offer from you.

Kindly expedite the matter and let us have your offer to settle our client's claim asap.
Thank you & Regards,

Sharon

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd

Tel: 6747 7636
Fax: 6748 5071

On Friday, 26 October 2018, 12:00, Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd <kangcar@singnet.com.sg> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

To: The Claims Officer-in-charge

We refer to the above accident and attach herewith our LOD for your
reference.

Please let us have your offer to settle our client's claim asap.

Thank you & Regards,
Sharon

Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd
Tel: 6747 7636

Fax: 6748 5071



