GaE.Shi

From: Gary Shi

Sent: Thursday, 13 December, 2018 10:02 AM

To: ‘Joy Irene (LKKAUto)'

Cc: AccReport; Admin A

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHD1480A & SLUB13T on 27.08.18 (China Taiping casea)
Attachments: SHD1480A - DV pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Joy,

On a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability whatsoever on our client's part and driver of
SHD1480A, our client agreed to direct settle the above claims at $858.00

We enclosed hereby Discharge voucher & ATA for your kind attention, original copies will pass to Mr Kalvin.

Kindly let us have your settlement sum of 55858.00 in our favour = Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd within 14days
from the date hereof.

Please be informed that this settlement excludes any bodily injuries arising out of the above said accident and pertains
to property damage only.

Regards

Gary Shi
Senior Executive, Claims
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 069 | DID: 6544 6671 | Fax: 6214 1511
Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.sg

Confidentiality Notkce | This e-mail message, including any attachments, Is for the sole use of the intended recipientis) and may contain confidential or
proprietary information, Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. if you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

@ Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION

#h

From: loy Irene [LKKAuto) [mailto:loylrene @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December, 2018 7:33 PM

To: Gary Shi

Cc: AccReport; Admin A

Subject: RE: LOD / Accident involving SHD1480A & SLU813T on 27.06.18 (China Taiping case)

WITHOUT PRIEUDICE

Dear Gary,
DV and ATA for your necessary action.

Thank you.



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511

CO. REG:200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Ref: SHD1480A/GS
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

24% July 2018
(By Email Only)
Attn: The Motor Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00
Springleaf Tower
Singapore 079909

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHDI480A & SLUSI3T ALONG QUEENSWAY
SHOPPING CENTRE INTO QUEENSWAY ON 27.06.18

We have been authorized by Premier Taxis Pte Ltd. the owner of Taxi vehicle number:
SHD1480A, to claim against the party/parties responsible for the damages arising from
the above-mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number: SLUB13T at the material
time of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, Mr Arthur Lim

As a result of the accident caused by vour Insured Driver’s negligent driving and/or
management of your insured’s Vehicle Number: SLUSI3T, our client’s vehicle was
damaged and we have been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair % 406.60 (Incl. GST)
(2) Loss of Rental - 4Days @$109.94per day S 439.76
(3) Loss of Income — 4Days @$100.00perday S 400.00
(4) GIA Search Fee $ 2.00
b 1248.36

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
(1) Final Repair Bill, GIA report & sketch plan of SHDI1480A

(2) Driver’s I/C and Driving Licence

(3) Vehicle Registration card. Certificate of Insurance

(4) Check In/Out Voucher, GIA search & Scene video



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG:200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Ref: SHDI480A/GS

We would appreciate if you could look into the subject matter and let us have your
favorable offer within 14 days. If you are agreeable to the settlement of the above said
claims, please forward us your discharge voucher as for our client’s signature and
payment made to “Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd”.

Please note that if we do not hear from yvou within the stipulated 14 days, we will have no
alternative but to appoint our solicitor to act on our behalfto commence proceedings
against you without further notice to you.

Yours faithfully,

= 2

- -= -

Claims_:D.ﬁ;ﬁﬁﬁilfneﬁt — Gary Shi

Email: varv shir@premiertaxi.com

NB: We encourage all parties to liaise with us via email to expedite all matters

P5: Please quote our reference no when replyving

c¢.c. Client = Premier Taxis Pte Ltd



Joz Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 29 November 2018 4:00 PM

To: ‘habahaba@gmail.com’

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 813T AND SHD 14804 ON 27/06/2018

Our ref: CC3/CT118011892/Uja3

NG WEIWEN
Policy Holder

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 813T AND SHD 1480A ON 27/06/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with
them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed
to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

loy Irene | Case Handler

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@Ilkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or
privileged information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please
notify the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution
of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

[/We, PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD (“the third party claimant”™) of 23 CHANGISOUTH
AVENUE 2 #03-02 GINGAPURE 486443 (address), owner of SHD 1480A (vehicle no.)
herch} authorize PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™)
to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use
(“claim™) for my vehicle no. SHD 1480A that was damaged pursuant to the accident which
occurred on 27/06/2018 (date) along QUEENSWAY SHOPPING CENTRE INTO
QUEENSWAY (location) involving vehicle no/s SLU 813T (“the accident™).

I/We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to

settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of “the workshop”.
I/'We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on
a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the

driverfowner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this *  (day)of L (month) 2018 (year)

—
e
Signed by “the third party claimant Signed by “the workshop

{with chop if applicable) (with chop)



MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE WVOUCHER

Policy Mo DMPCSHE081431700 Claim No : SHM1SD0O3Z23/C01/3
Claimant t PREMIER TAXIS FTE LTD
Amount :  S55BS5B.00

SINGAPORE DOLLARS EIGHT HUNDRED FIFTY EIGHT ONLY.

I/We agres to accept the above mentioned amount to bes paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by mefus through an accident involving

Claimant Vehicle Neo. : SHD 1480a

Insured YWehicle No. 1 SLO B13T

Date of Loss : 27.06.2018

Place of Accident 1 QUEEMEWAY SHOPPIMG CEMTRE IHNTCO QUEENSWAY

IN COMSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIFING INSURRNCE (SINGAFORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absoclutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSUBANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/for

Inaured MName : NG WEIWEN
Driver Name : NG WEIWEN

from all claims, present or future in respect of all less, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising cut of the saild accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) FTE. LTD.

Global Sum S5 B58.00

Y T

TOTRL + + + &« « + + » = # = 3.+ = .- 53 B58.00

' o PO P e
Claimant Name ; NRIC No = A~ (."‘J ¢ ‘?ff—f’}!{/

Signature : [ Date




<)PREMIER

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
OFFICE: 23 Changi South Avenue 2 #01-02 S(486443)

TEL: G2435676 ( 65436688 FAX: 62141511

AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES CO. REG NO.: 2007077430 GST. REG. NO.: 2007077430
TAX INVOICE
PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD DATE 24-Jul-2018
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #03-02 PAGE 10F1
SINGAPORE 486443
ITEM Description aTty U.PRICE AMOUNT
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR HYUNDAI 130 380.00
REGN NO: SHD 1480 A
TOTAL REPAIR COSTS AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR 380.00
GST@7%| % 26.60
GRAND TOTAL 406.60
E il

for Premier Automotive

(ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST)




PREMIER

TAXIS

06 July 2018

To Whom It May Concern

Dear Sir/Madam

CERTIFICATION LETTER

This letter serves to inform that Arthur Lim of NRIC Number 57905034B is a registered
driver of SHD1480A. Arthur Lim is paying daily rental rate of $109.94 (Inclusive of
GST).

Should you require further information, please contact us at 6214 §880,

Thank you.

Yours sincerely

[\..

Kellie Poh

Administration Manager

Prepared Dy: Hasnah

PFREMIER TAX]S PTELTD

13 Changi South Avenoe 2

i03-02

Singapore 456413

Teleplione: 465 6214 BER0 Fax: +065 6214 0330
W, premigriaxh esnt

Co, Reg. Mo, 200304975H



V. C pe
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REPLACEMENT VEH GIVEN YES /MO

CHECK IN / OUT VOUCHER

VEH NO.

JOB NG,

DRIVER'S MAME Rr_}h'ﬂ‘ M

NRIG EZLq 55&3;’{.5

worone OAE AT 50 b

TAXIREGNNO. g

: MAKE | MODEL I 20 Uﬂ

DATE IN TIME QUT
.gqaétraf o) smem% 18‘ 15120

I':ILCI#L_FHES l.‘\!

- [efwlvelwal e ]}

TAXI METER DOWNLOADED

YES NO

| ACHKNOWELDRE AND CONFIRM THAT | HAVE EU.MIMED THEA.BD"IE SAID VEHICLE AND
THAT THE BAME 15 IN GOOD COMDITION AND TO MY SATISFACTION IN EVERY RESPECT
TOGETHER WITH THE ACCESSORIES f ITEMS LIST ABOVE. THIS VOUCHER IS USED IN

D'DMMYY

INDICATE AREA OF DAMAGE HERE:

CONJUNCTION WITH THE TERAM AENTAL AGREEMENT.
CHECK IN CHECK OUT
Oethyr Ui Pty Vien
DRIVERB NAME DRIVER'S NAME
| a/oyy n2leH1¥
DRIVER'S SIGNATURE / DATE / TEME DRIVER'S SIGMATURE / DATE I WE
% BODY MARKMNGS
1 - Light Dant 5 - Dameged
P ,Iﬁ""' 2 - Serlous Dent 8- Chip
EMERNS AUTHOMIBED WORKSHOP) #T (PREMIER" 2 Mg Somcl 7—Crack
P {PAEMIER’S AUTHORISED WORKSHOF) 4 Boricio Becanh B— Posling
| SERVICE | REPAIRS DONE DRNVEA'S AEMARKS
O SERVICING O OTHERS:
O T/BELT
0O AIRCON SYSTEM 0O ACCIDEN
O TURBD

O BRAKE SYSTEM

O CLUTCH SYSTEM
0 BuULB

0 UNDER CARRIAGE
0 CPF
. O BATTERY




Invoice Page 1 of 2

s GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
" GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

4k 8 Raffles Cluay #18-00, Singapore 048580
’fp\% @? [HSURANCE Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
S ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Maonday to Friday Sam to Spm
i Ne: M4D0D17735
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GO redistration No: M40

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Mo: GR-18-087318
Diate of Request: 271062018 Your Ref Mo: Online Purchase

Premier Automaotive Senvices Pte Ltd
23 Changi South Ave 2

#01-02

Singapore 486443

Dear Sil'Madam,

Enquiry Date 2THGR01E

Enquiry By GARY SHI GUO RONG

TP Vehicle Mo, SLUB13T

Accident Date 2710872018

Enquirny Rasult

TP Vehicle Mo,  [Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. Na.
SLUB13T China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. 1TAMZ0TT-29M10/2018 6389 6111
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the eriginal reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the Genaral Insurance
Associalion of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contenis and shall ba undar no liability whalsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connaction with the repors or their images.

This iz a computer generated document and requires no signature,

https://www.giarme.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_genin... 27/6/2018



Invoice Page 2 0f 2

P f : GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
A7 H b RA’ RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
s GENE 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
2 7 INSURANCE #rone <65 6224 0010 Fax: 165 6224 0030
557 ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Manday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE C°) registration No: MA00017735

TAX INVOICE
Cur Ref Na: GR-18-087318
Date of Request: 27062018 Your Ref Mo; Online Purchase
Fremier Automotive Services Pte Lid
23 Changi South Ave 2
#01-02
Singapore 486443
Dear Sir/Madam,
Enquiry Date 27/06/2018
Enquiry By GARY 3HI GUO RONG
TP Vehicle Ma, SLUB13T
Accident Dale 271062018
CESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 013
Total Amount Due {G3T Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[¥] GIRO[] Cash[] Cheque

https:/fwww, giarme.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_genin... 27/6/2018



