
Asher Sns (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
lo:
Cc:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Dear Asher,

GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Monday, 7 January 2019 8:55 AM
Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

MT_Claim_SG

RE: [MANDATE REQUESII RE: Direct Settlement - Accident lnvolving YM6973M (Ol : LPC

- TBA) and YP7676Z (TP: LKK REF - CC6I1PC18011843/Aea3) on 20/06/?018

Follow up
Completed

Kindly proposed as proposed.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive I Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #t7-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 73BB Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:Ashersng@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 2 January. 2019 3:52 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG
Cc! GEMLD POH WEE BIN; ericwoo; ONG LI LI
Subject: [MANDATE REQUESr] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YM5973M (OI : LPC - TBA) and YP7676Z
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/1PC18011843/Aea3) on 20/06/2018

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above mafter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 03/07/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our Principal,
Lonpac lnsurance Bhd.

The accident occurred when our insured reversed and collided third party vehicle.

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at '100% liability.

Summary to offer to repairer HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair $ 6,156.50 $ 3,000.00
2. Loss of Use (6days x $300) $ 1,800.00 $ 1,200.00 (6days x $120)



LTA,/GIA Search Fee

**5 days recommendation for repair.

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for vour approval please.

Thank You-

Besl Regqrds,

Asher Sng I Cose Hondler

LKK Auto consullonls Ple ttd

phone: 6841-6051 | emqil: oshersno@lkkoulo.com I fqx: 6741-4108

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 July 2018 10:02 AM
To:'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Cc: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'<geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com>; ONG Ll Ll

<llong@lonpac.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Joy lrene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@ lkka uto.com>;
Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@ lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a @ lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident lnvolving YM6973M (Ol : LPC - TBA) andYP7676ZllP: LKK REF -

cc6/1Pc18011843/Aea3) on 20/06 /2078

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly assist to verify validity of our insured's policy, and let us have a copy ofinsured's accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan I Admin

LI{K Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 oo55 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com fax:6744108

Blk 5r, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Lrbi Avenue r., #o2-2S I S(+o8ggS)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday,3 July,2018 5:37 PM

l#,*f,,,-.,



To:'MT-Claim-SG' <mt claim@lonpac.com>
Cc: 'GERALD POH wEE BIN' <seraldpoh(a lonpac.com>; 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonoac.com>; ONG Ll Ll

<llons(alonpac.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSnq@lkkauto.com>; Joy lrene (LKKAuto) <Jovlrene@lkkauto.com>;

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a @lkkauto.com>

subject: Direct settlement - Accident lnvolving YM5973M (Ol : LPC - TBA) and YP7676ZFP: LKK REF -

cc6/1PC18011843/Aea3) on 20/06 /20t8

WITHOUT PREIUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case

we have inspected TP vehicle YP 7 67 62 at[/s Hua Meng Spray Painting workshop - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

o TP's GIA report

PIease be informed that the estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Kindly assist to veriff validity ofour insured's policy, and let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
' necessary action.

our case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051'

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thankyou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan I Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 oo55 ] email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com I fax:. 67414rc8

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 ] S(4o89$)



HU

+
A t'lENG SPRAY PAINTING WO

AUTOBAY@KAKIBUKIT
1 , Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C #01 -34l#01-61 , Singapore 417883
Tel:6747 8064,6746 5519 Fax: 6743 4896 tUP: 9666 9680

Reg. No.: 254678/00M
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Attn: Motor Claims Dept

ACCTDENT ON 20.06.2018 INVOwING VEHICLE YP 7676 Z & YM 6973 M ATONG

CARPARK OF JALAN KAYU

With rega rds to the above, we are writing on beha lf of the registered owner of vehicle YP 7676 Z

which was involved in the above mentioned accident.

We are informed that the above accident was caused solely by the negligence of your insured

vehicle YM 6973 M. As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle was damaged and our client

had instructed us to submit his claims for loss and expenses, particulars of which are follows:

1) Repair cost

2) Loss of use-S300 X 06days

3) LTA search

s
5

s
Total

We hereby enclosed herewith the following documents for your consideration of the above claim.

c) LTA SEARCH

d) Owner / Driver NRIC & Driving License
a) Final Repair Btl Of YP 76762
b) GIA report

r(/^fl\r\1 "'i :,l;,,"rr.suoP
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HUA MFNG,SBRAYA:PETffiIiIBOUbNTSTIOP



tlWe, L sLa^j 9t-YU t
third party claimant,,) of

V- /Vta ' lr- (address),
owner of {vehicle no.) hereby authorise llUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING
woRKsHoP ("the workhop")to act for me with lespect to-my claim for repair costs and/or
rental and,/or loss of use ("claim") formyvehicle no. YP YbYbY thatwasflamaged pursuant
to the aqcident which occurred on 1'0 - 0 b.\01* (date) along _ a-"b A4, 0 f &-V,'.

L ^Yt (location) involvinevehirl"no/rw.

I furiher authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem
fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim
with payment cheque/s being made in favour ofthe workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a whhout
preludice end without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other
vehiclels !s isii.erned.

oated this TYlayi of (monttr) zo,(-L (year)

+EA,a::+ffi
HUA INENG SPRAY PAII]TING WORKSHO

AUTOBAY@ KAK] BUKiT
1 (AKr BUK,T AVE 6 al] I. jd S,\GAPoHE 4 ] /88
TEL: 67{7 806a. 67d6 5519 FAX: 6743 489

R"t wv^r1

b

Signed by "the workshop"
(with company stamp)

Signed by"tlie ihlrd pafty claimant',

{with company stamp if applicable}



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

: 1 8/1 8/1 8rVC00 1020693
: t7 .IAN 2019

CLAIM NO
DATE

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

L/We, ISLAND RECOVERY SERVICES confirmed acceptance from NUs LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner YM 6973M the sum of Singapore Dollars

FOUR THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED SEVEN AND CENTS FORTY NINE
ONLY. ($4,207.49) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all
propefty losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to
become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident involving, YP

76762on2010612018 along/at CARPARK OF JALAN KAYU.

I AVe hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (INTERCONTINENTAL
LOGISTICS PTE LTD /LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any

claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said

accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to N{/s HUA
ME,NG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP.

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our

insured's recovery action.

tlL\
Signature of vehicle owner/Date

t 1|3.:.1 *v:.Y:).. S*n:.-s'
Name of vehicle owner/Date
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AMENG SPRAY PAINTING TITO

R.
RKSHO

AUTOBAY@KAKIBUKIT
1 , Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C #01-34/#01-61 , Singapore 417883
Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 Fax: 6743 4896 tUP: 9666 9680

Reg. No.: 254678/00N4

Date:

:YP 7676 Z

:ISUZU NPR

:lSLAND RECOVERY SE RVICES

:3026 UBI ROAD 1

#04-1,46
s 408719

30lto/2018
Your Rer , Yrt'r b{trgw\

ourRer , 
Yf ?ttrA t

VEHICLE NO

MAKE / MODEL

NAM E

ADDRESS

FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR VEHICLE NO:YP 7676 Z

TO SUPPLY AND REPLACE PARTs, LABOUR CHARGES FOR

REPAIRING, KNOCKING, WELDING AND TO RESPRAY PAINTING

(LU IV]P SUM REPAIR)

S a,ooo.oo

SINGAPORE DOLLARS:THREE THOUSAND ONtY
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ilij'J3ili;.,.,,,*f tr+#ffi fffi ;Ctilll,ffii;.,!,'lfl i?"##6333
Reg. No.: 254678/00M

OwnerlDType Company

200708593N

INIERCONTIN€NTAL LOGISTI'5 PTE. LTD.

Date:

rffi
YourHBf'rP'

OwnerName:

OU, ffiPt".f Addr*sTvDer Private Residential (Condo Apt or Hou!.) / ShoppinE / O Fflce Complexes

Reglgtered BlocUHoure No;192

Regirtered Slreet Namc; PANDAN LOOP

ReElste.ed Unit No.r S05 - !3

. Regislered gulldlng Namei PANTECH BUSINESS HUB

RegktlredPostalcoder rzfiA7
Current Vehicle D6tails

Vehicle No.l YM6'73M

MakeDercrlptlory'Modet MIISUBISHt,/ FE04BE65RDEA

lnstrance Company Namer LONPAC INSUMNCE BHD

htpr://vrl.l(rgov.ig/lLdvrl/octiul/lnwFinnDqrnil?FUNCTION_tD=F IEO l07l ET

ffi,.,ffi stzJihotet
PAINTING WORKSHOP

m001/001

-,,1_r- ., pogc I of I

25/6n0tB


