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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

- | T
REPAIR ESTIMATE P_{X _\)-U 1 r

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS)
CUSTOMER: 7010070
ADDRESS : CITYCABPTELTD

383 5IN MING DRIVE

SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717

65551188

JOB ' PARTS DESCRIPTION
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MAKE
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Date: 27.06.2018
Time: 14:29:33
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305180575
SHB3232Y
DODOOOHN00
HYUNDAL

140

15122017
27.06.2018 11:30
26.06.2018

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC® AMOUNT

PART REQUISITION

0001 04-01-0103-0600-G  WING MIRROR LH 1
front j.,.,u.. S Kap A
front LH Fosdar > s

JOB NATURE

0000 L PANEL BEATING

0001 23-502 Spraypaint-Frt Bumper/LHF Fender

brtaa: dabesindo b
o002 17-01 CHECEK ALL LIGHTING
0003 20-00 TUFF COAT ON AFFECTED PARTS.

U“-Ln

980.50 20.00 784.40

-~

SUB-TOTAL
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COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING
Our Job Ref Mo 305180575
== ComboriDelGro Enginaerng Fie Lid
Data 28/068/18 5§ Loyang Drive Singapore SOA0A0
— e e——t Fax 6546 8156
FINALIZATION FORM
To LKK Fax |
Altn KALVIN ANG
Vehicle Reg Mo SHB3232Y Date of Accident 26-Jun-18

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentionad vehicle are as follows:-

1 The repair job shall bill to: EQ INS — YPB770C

2 The finalized amaount shall be:

(a) Spars Pars after List discount $784.40
it} Labour Charges $650.00
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost 5143440

(e} Lumpsum Repair (If applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cosl after Less 20%

Final Lumpsum Repaircost

3 Estimated normal period for repairs 2 wuorking days
4 Wa shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed If there s no reply from you
within 7 working days
5 Thank you for your assistance We confirm the estmates and
finalized amount
LS
Signature ! Signature
Name LMTS Nama KALVIN
Tal 52148388 Date ?f / 4 /'f
Fax 65468156
For Dfficial Uss Only
Document
Hem Amount Aftached [c"’si;:::lg{ Remarks
Yes ar No
1. Rental Rate P/IDay YES
2. Loss of Incomea Paid
3. Survay Fees mneasesisessans
. LTA Search Fee
15

Medical Fees (on betall
of driver, if applicabls|

B Owverrun

Remarks:
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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD Date: 28.06.2018
Time: 14:58:43
REPAIR ESTIMATE Page: 1
COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) JORB NO ¢ 305180573
CUSTOMER: 7010070 REGN NO + SHB3231Y
ADDRESS - CITYCAB PTE LTD MILEAGE s UD000D000NO
383 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE - HYUNDAI
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL S i ]
65551188 DATE OF REGN = 15.12.2017
DATETIME IN 27062018 11:30
ACCIDENT DATE < 26062018
JOB ' PARTS DESCRIPTION QOTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC"% AMOUNT
BART REQUISITION
0001 04-01-0103-0600-G  WING MIRROR LH 1 980,50 20,00 7TR4.40

SUB-TOTAL - 78440

JOB NATURE
0000 L PANEL BEATING 200.00
0001 23-502 Spraypaini-Fri Bumpes/LHF Fender 450.00
SUB-TOTAL 650,00
| TOTAL 143440
M ‘
B LiwuA AUTHORISED : YES ' NO
MVA NAME & SIGRATURE SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE

DATE : DATE :



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD Date: 27.06.2018
— Time: 14:29:33
REPAIR ESTIMATE J:@ Lﬁ o V | 9 Page: | l:g
COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) 0B NO . 305180575
CUSTOMER: 7010070 REGN NO SHRB1232Y
ADDRESS : CITYCAB PTE LTD MILEAGE 0000000000
383 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE . HYUNDAI
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL 1-40
65551188 DATE OF REGN © 15122017
DATETIME IN ¢ 27.06.2018 11:30
ACCIDENT DATE - 26.06.2018
JOB / PARTS DESCRIPTION QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT
PART REQUISITION
e |
0001 04-01-0103-0600-G ' WING MIRROR LH I 98050 2000 78440 7
ot Foge % Kyt SUB- 784.40
Fread LH frs o > pap® B-TOTAL 84.4
JOB NATURE
0000 L PANEL BEATING 39»:@" 2o
0001 23-502 Spraypaint-Frt Bumper/LHF Fender 19315 ¥se
i
0002 17-01 CHECK ALL LIGHTING et Xk~
0003 20-00 TUFF COAT ON AFFECTED PARTS. 49,9:( >
SUB-TOTAL 880,00
TOTAL 1,664 40
U“Ur\ AUTHORISED : YES / NO
MVA NAME & SIGNATURE SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE
DATE DATE
b,{.,u. f(,'f(é’ LKH Auttn Cone
fhe Kepa |
/ 24'/ (ft 1res ‘. iy
2 4 s i
i n
fabes Pt phFe Pleieteek




Hsiao Tuﬂ IU(KA.utn!

From: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 19 August 2019 3:35 PM

To: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: <Request for Video Footage> Your ref: CC18060827/ SHB3232Y/ JW(st) Our ref:
CC3/EQI18011810/K1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP B770C(EQ) & SHB 3232Y ON
26/06/2018]

Attachments: SHB3232Y VC (T5)(2).avi

Final stage.

Best Regards

Jim Wong

Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

From: lim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 19 August 2019 3:33 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: <Request for Video Footage> Your ref: CC18060827/ SHB3232Y/ JW(st) Our ref:
CC3/EQI18011810/K1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 8770C(EQ) & SHB 3232Y ON 26/06/2018]

Dear Ms Chew

Please find the attached video footage.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Jim Wang
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, 17 August 2019 10:39 AM

To: lim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: <Request for Video Footage> Your ref: CC18060827/ SHB3232Y/ JW(st) Our ref: CC3/EQI18011810/K1pa3
[ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP B770C(EQ) & SHB 3232Y ON 26/06/2018]

Your ref: CC18040827/ SHB3232Y/ JW(st) Without Prejudice
Our ref: CC3/EQI18011810/K1pa3

Dear Sirs/Madam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP B770C(EQ) & SHB 3232Y ON 26/06/2018

We refer to the cbove matter,



Please be informed that our insured driver disputed liability as he reported that he had indicated his right
signal but your client still overtook his lorry and resulted the accident. Attached is a copy of our insured
accident report tor your easy reference.

As per EQ instruction, we would like 1o request a copy ol your client's video footage as stated in his
accident report for our necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liabllity, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settiement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liabllity/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phaone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, wo2-25 | S(408933)

This message and any aftachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the Intended recipient. kindly notity
us and delate this message and its aftachments immediately, and plaase be advisad that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents
therein is not allowed Statements paraining to any malter outside our business are nol 1o ba taken as endorsed by ComforDelGro Corporation
Limited or its related companies The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and ane subject 1o approvals. Nothing herein
shall conslitute a binding agreeman! batween the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way 1o any term or condition excep! as agreed In &
written agresmant signed by the duly suthorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Grean Office cadified by the Singapore Environment Council - 15 committed to presenang the environment, YWe ancourage you
to print ths only if necessary

ComfonDelGro Engineanng Fie Lid [Registrabion No. 1899506048W]




Hsiao anla (LKKAuto)

From: lim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.comsg>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 September 2019 9:46 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: <OFFER> Your ref: CC18060827/ SHB3232Y/ JW(st) Our ref:
CC3/EQI18011810/K1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 8770C(EQ) & SHB 3232Y ON
26/06/2018]

Dear Ms Chew

Please process settlement in sum $ 1850.00 to resolve our property damage claim amicably.

Additionally, it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal
injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Thank you
Best Regards

Jim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

From: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2015 5:19 PM

To: lim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: RE: <OFFER> Your ref: CC18060827/ SHB3232Y/ JW(st) Our ref: CC3/EQI18011810/K1pa3 |[ACCIDENT
INVOLVING YP 8770C({EQ) & SHB 3232Y ON 26/06/2018]

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to our below emall.

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties an this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.,

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liabllity/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsian Tong. Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhti@lkkayto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Pays Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 August 2019 9:46 AM

To: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: <OFFER> Your ref: CC18060827/ SHB3232Y/ JW(st) Our ref: CC3/EQUI18011810/K1pa3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING YP 8770C(EQ) & SHB 3232Y ON 26/06/2018)

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your video.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $1,850.00{all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of llability on
our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should alsa not be disclosed in any other related matter{s) in
respect of the accldent. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only, No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintitf/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made
payment on the settlement sum."

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-3108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jim Wong See Pah <|imwong@cdge.com.5g>

Sent: Monday, 19 August 2019 3:35 PM

To: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) <chewht@®|kk m>

Subject: Re: <Request for Video Footage> Your ref: CC18060827/ SHB3232Y/ JW(st) Our ref:
CC3/EQI18011810/K1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 8770C(EQ) & SHB 3232Y ON 26/06/2018]



' Final stage.

Best Regards
Jim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

From: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 19 August 2019 3:33 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <ch kkauto.com>

Subject: Re: <Request for Video Footage> Your ref: CC18060827/ SHB3232Y/ JW(st) Our ref:
CC3/EQI18011810/K1pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 8770C(EQ) & SHB 3232Y ON 26/06/2018]

Dear Ms Chew

Please find the attached video footage.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Jim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

From: Hsiao Tong |LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikk .com=
Sent: Saturday, 17 August 2019 10:39 AM

To: lim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>
Subject: <Request for Video Footage> Your ref: CC18060827/ SHB3232Y/ IW(st) Our ref: CC3/EQI18011810/K1pa3

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 8770C(EQ) & SHB 3232Y ON 26/06/2018)

Your ref: CC18060827/ SHB3232Y/ JW(st) Without Prejudice
Cur rel: CC3/EQIIBO1 1810/K1pa3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 8770C(EQ) & SHB 3232Y ON 24/06/2018
we refer to the above malter.

Please be informed that our insured driver disputed liability as he reported that he had indicated his right
signal but your client still overtook his lorry and resulted the accident, Attached is o copy of our insured
accident report for your easy reference.

As per EQ instruction, we would like to request a copy of your client's video footage as stated in his
accident report for our necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties an this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negaotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materlally affect/influence on the lssues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

3



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

thm message and ary attachments may sontaln confidential, privileged or propristary ilormation. I you are not the intanded reciplant. kindly nolity
us and dalets this message and lls attnchmants immedialely, and please be advised thal Uking. copying. distnbuling or aisciosing any contants
thaneln is not dliowed. Statements pertaining 16 any mafter outside our busmass ate not 1o be taken as andorsed by ComfortDeiGro Carparation
Limited of its related companies The commentsiproposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject 1o approvals Nothing hersin
shall consttute 4 binding agresment batwesn the parties Nulther pary shall be bound |nany way to any term of conditibn axcept as agread in a
writien agreament signed by the duly authorisad represantatives of both parties

ComfortDeltino - 4 Grean Office certifed by the Singapore Environmani Councl - & commitied lo presenving the snvironment. We sncourage you
1 el thes only If necesaary

ComfonDelGro Engineenng e Lid [Regsirauon No. 105506048W]

This massage and any sttachmants may contain confidantial. prvileged or propriatary information If you are not the intanded recipant, kmdly noldy
us And delote This message and s sftechments mmedalily, and please be advioed that using; copying, distnbutmg of discioamg amy cankahis
therain s not allowed Staternants pertaining to any matler sutsde oul business ae not 16 be taken as endorsed by ComfonDelGro Camparation
Limiited or it relgted companies The commentifproposals provided are for discussion purposes anly and ane subject 1o approvals. Nothing hersin
shill constitiste & Binding pgreermen betwean the parfies Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or candibon excep! &s agreed in &
wriniEn agreamant sgnad by the duly authonsed represantalives of both pamses

ComiornDelGeo - 8 Green Office canified by the Singapom Envilonmant Council - is commitled 16 pressiving the enviranmanl. W encourage you
1 prinl this only il RecesBary,

ComfornDelGro Enginesaning Ple Lid [Registration No. 190536048W]




COMFORIDELGRO

OurRef : CC18060827/ SHB3232Y /JW(st) ENGl NEERINE
Your Ref COGE Taxi Claims Dept
Date : 03-Jul-18 58 Loyang Drive 4in Fi

Singapore SOEEES

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road, MND Complex
#17-00 Tower Block

Singapore 069110

Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHB3232Y YOUR INSURED YP 8770C
AND OTHER ON 26.06.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Citycab Pte Ltd, the owner of motor Vehicle No :
SHB3232Y which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured vehcile.

The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to assist

them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all aplicable matters

arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving : YP 8770C
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 1,534.81

2 2 dayslossofRental@ § 117.00 perday $ 23400

3 ‘Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by Mis LKK) $ -

4 LTA / GlASearch Fees ] 7.49

5  GIA/Police Report Fees E T

6 Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees L -
SubTotal: $§ 177630

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 2 days Lossofilncome @ $§ 80.00 perdays 5 160.00

Total Claims: § 193630
We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a)  Original repair bill and photocopies of phatographs 6 pcs.
b)  LTA search slip/s of : YP 8770C
¢)  GIA/ Police report/s of SHB3232Y

d)  Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
[ ) Wilness statement/s ( ) Towing/Medical bilireceipts [ ) Certificata of Insurance
{ ¥ ) Photograph/s of Accident Scen: { x ) Downtime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver

Yours faithfully

Jetm Wong

Deputy Manager

CDGE Claims Department

Tel : 6214 8374 Fax: 6214 1843 Email : imwong@cdge.com sg

This is a computer generated letler. No signature is required.

COMFORIDELGRO ., Be=



S1UIRDAVE L #0025 PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (0G5) 2563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Ouwr Ref: CCI/EQIIS01 1810/K 1 pa3
11 JULY 2019

PHOENIX ENGINEERING PTE LTD
25 FERNVALE LANE

#18-34 THE TOPIARY

SINGAPORE 797502

Dear Sir'Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 8770C & SHB 3232Y ALONG/AT JALAN BUKIT MERAH
TWDS KAMPONG BAHRU ON 26/06/2018

We refer to the Inhmrn: subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed
by your motor insurer, EQ Insurance Company Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your

palicy.
We have received a claim from SHB 3232Y against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your driver's favour as your
vehicle changed lane and collided with third party. Under Motor Accident Guide, vehicles should
keep in the proper lane and change lane only when it is safe. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Pt!mﬁl: noic that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to
this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries,

Yours faithfully,

N

CHEW HSIAO TONG
Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: chewhi@lkkauto.com

ce. EQ Insurance Company Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)
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LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

| NAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING i 40 SHB3232Y ., YPB770C OMN 26-Jun-18 18:10
ALONG JLN BUKIT MERAH TWDS KAMPONG BAHRU
1/ We TAY LYE CHONG {Hirer) NRIC o, 51236943C
and/ar [Raliel) NRIC No.

Taxl Number SHB3232Y
herely authorise ComfortDelGro Engmeenng Pte LId{CDGE);

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fes and legal costs

2. Tn have absolute discretian to agree 1o any settlemeant or compensation amount n respect of my/our claim
agamst third party (except personal injunas and medical claimsj

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our behalf,
4. To accept any payment (Claim proceeds) in respect of the claym against third party and payment by cheque

shall be forward directiy to CDGE wn accordance with CDGE's instruchon and made in favour of
“ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 27-Jun-2018
Hame of Hirar TAY LYE CHONG
Hirer NRIC 51236943C Signature .kl/\f
Addrecs 116 SIMEI STREET 1 #11-598
520116
Contact No S7584256

hup://edgek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/ View/CDG.VARS. V. LettofAut...  27/06/2018



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

IMFORIDELCRD

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

ComforiDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
A memtar of CoOMPOmDN Cag

Head Office:
205 Braddell Road
Singapore ST9T01

Kindly note that no receipt shall be Esued unless requested
CUSTOMER'S COPY

TAX INVOICE

ACCOUNT No

ComiortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

INVOICE No.

AMOUNT

BANK/CHQ No.




COMFORIDELGRO
"ENGINEERING

P LOWMARDN f}ill‘.—qﬂ@

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
A member of COMPOMCLLCAD

Head Office.
205 Braddell Rood
Singapare ST9701

Kindty nota that no receipl shall be issued unless mguestad
CUSTOMER'S COPY

TAX INVOICE

ACCOUNT No.

ComlortDelGro Enginearing Pie Lid

'

INVOICE No.

IXMETKR |

AMOUNT

BANK/CHQ Mo.




Our Ref: CC18060827
NeGycab

Date: 29 June 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 26/06/2018 @ 18:10 hrs

ALONG JLN BUKIT MERAH TWDS KAMPONG BAHRU
INVOLVING YPBYTOC

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that CityCab Pte Ltd is
the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration number SHB3232Y (the
"Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to TAY LYE CHONG IC NO $1236943C a registered hirer-
operator of CityCab Pte Ltd al the time of occurrence of the aforementioned accident
at a rental rate $117.00 per day (inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxl arising from the said accident with a motor
waorkshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company In respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated |etter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapare 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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RIFFRIA Insirmnes Pariicrdare Fooine P st Matail

" Enquire Vehicle Insurer.

Vehicle Mo, Incldent Data/Thmes SearchStatus  Insuranca Company Code Inzuranee Comparny Name
YPETTOC 26 Jun 2018/ 18:10:00 Successful E04 EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
Previous OK
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Consultants
Rim ma®m™ Peld Company Registration No. 199607198R

51 LIEAVE 1, #12-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563361 FAX 1 1065) h2564315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 15/10/2019
ECTS NT
Vehicle N YP 8770C (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. . DM18HO02576/JT
i .

s SHB 3232Y (TP Veh) [Our Ref. No.: CC3I/EQI18011810/K1pa3q2
Date of Accident 26/6/2018
Liability 100% | -
Final Repair Cost 9 1,534.81 -
Loss of Income ' $ 100.00 2days -
Rental (If any) -] 23400 2 days
Others: ] 7.48 -

- -
1,876.30

Final Settlement Sum |: § 1,850.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks _ =
Pa n ion: a's Breakdo

1 |COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD - _‘IBEGUD

o ' 9

JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6258 3561 FAX; 6256 4315
Reg No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Dos Experts En Automoblle

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref - CCIEQI18011810/K1pa3q2
STy T
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date 15-10-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YP 8770C Veh. Inspected SHB 3232Y
Policy No. DMCPHQ18-003824 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HO02578/JT Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 27/06/2018
b ‘ Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chasslis No. KMHLB41UMHUO029997 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 42501 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. i Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/80 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/80R18 HANKOOK 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/80 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R18 HANKOOK 7 mm
4. | Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. : i General Information
Accident Date  26/06/2018 Inspection Date 27/06/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508869
5a. : Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. | Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




¥y L~ LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl B = 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
= TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No 199607198R GST Reg No. 19-9807198-R Page No /1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHB 3232Y

aty ~ Description of Parts Condition | =Simate B |
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|WING MIRROR LH CRACKED 880.50 980.50
1|FRONT BUMPER (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
1|FRONT LH FENDER (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -196.10 -196.10
T84 40 TB4.40
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING .INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT 300.00 200.00
BUMPER AND FRONT LH FENDER
SPRAYPAINT -FRT BUMPER /LHF FENDER 500.00 450.00
CHECK ALL LIGHTING. NOT NECESSARY 40,00
TUFF COAT ON AFFECTED PARTS. NOT NECESSARY 40.00
880.00 650.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,664.40 1,434.40
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS ) [T v T (B P YV 1

Report Ref No. CC3/EQI18011810/K1pa3q2

HALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessor

CISCLAMER OF LLABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: This Repar is made sclely tor the use and benefit of the Cllent named on ths front pags =l this Report




Joanne Lee !LKI{ Autaz

From: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 October 2019 3:49 PM

To: ‘eqiprs@eginsurance.com.sg’

Cc '‘chewht@Ikkauto.com’

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Invelving YP 8770C (OI) and SHB 3232Y (TP) on
26/06/2018

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf; TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT.pdf

Dear SitMadam,
Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled

Enclose herewith final report & relevani documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd,

Phone: 5256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report @|kkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933
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