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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 June 2018 9:16 AM

To: 'Jenny Toh'; assignments

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS6865P & SDS3138U ON 06.06.2018 

INS/IC/LAW/0242/2018 DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Dear Jenny, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jenny Toh [mailto:jenny.toh@qbe.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June, 2018 2:16 PM 

To: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Cc: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com> 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS6865P & SDS3138U ON 06.06.2018 INS/IC/LAW/0242/2018 DIRECT SETTLEMENT 

 

Our ref: VC011562 

 

Hi all 

 

Kindly survey the third party vehicle:- 

 

Insured : SDS3138U 

TP Vehicle: SLS6865P 

Date of accident: 06/06/2018 

Contact : as below 

 

Kindly acknowledge receipt. 

 

regards 

 

 

___________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Jenny Toh 
Senior Assistant, Claims 
QBE Emerging Markets – Singapore 
 
QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 
Phone: +65 6477 1225    
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Email: jenny.toh@qbe.com  
Visit us on the web at www.qbe.com.sg 
 

 

From: Lawrence Teo [mailto:lawrenceteo@tanchong.com]  

Sent: Monday, 18 June, 2018 9:30 AM 

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@qbe.com> 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS6865P & SDS3138U ON 06.06.2018 INS/IC/LAW/0242/2018 DIRECT SETTLEMENT 

 

Dear Office In Charge, 
 

Our customer, LI SHUPENG  the owner of SLS6865P is insured with AIG Insurance at the material time of the accident. 
The 3rd party SDS6865P is insured with you at the material time of the accident. 

 

Our customer holds your insured driver liable for the accident and would like to claim against your insured driver. On 
behalf of our customer, we hereby enquire whether you would like to have a Direct Settlement with our customer. 

 

Our customer's claiming for Cost Of Repair and Loss Of Rental @$100/Day.GIA Report / Estimate attached for your 
action. 

 

Best Regards, 

  

Lawrence Teo 

  

Tan Chong Motor Sales Pte Ltd 

913 Bukit Timah Road 

Singapore 589622 

Tel: +65-64694091 :: DID: +65-67038914 :: Fax: +65-64697472 

Email: lawrenceteo@tanchong.com 

Website: www.tanchong.com :: www.nissan.com.sg 

 

 

----------------- 

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are 

not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this 

email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us 

by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced. 


