RE: OD /1293345972SG / SLV6048R -DOA 19/06/2018

From: Azlan, Syazairdina

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto), Accounts (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR, Sukimin, Nurasikin

Sent:  4/1/2019 9:42:06 AM

Attachments: %] Adjuster Invoice.pdfT%] SLV 6048 R Addendum 29062018.pdf

Hi Veron,

Please be informed that Tinesh is no longer working in AIG. Will escalate this case to the relevant department.

Thanks and regards,

Syaza Irdina Azlan

AIG

Express Claims Adjuster Il, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations — Auto
SG Claims Operations | AIG Shared Services

Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, January 04, 2019 9:32 AM

To: Accounts (LKKAuto); Tr, Tinesh

Cc: SUR; Azlan, Syazairdina

Subject: FW: OD / 1293345972SG / SLV6048R -DOA 19/06/2018

Dear Tinesh,

Please be informed that insured not claiming under his own insurance policy (OD CLAIM) for repair
his car.

Enclosed herewith our invoice.

Kindly assist to close this case in merimen as our account department is chasing.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 16 November 2018 12:40 PM
To: 'Tinesh.Tr@aig.com' <Tinesh.Tr@aig.com>; Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>



Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>
Subject: FW: OD / 1293345972SG / SLV6048R -DOA 19/06/2018

Dear Tinesh,

Please be informed that insured not claiming under his own insurance policy (OD CLAIM) for repair
his car.

Enclosed herewith our invoice ,kindly assist to close this case in merimen.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 5:58 PM

To: 'Tr, Tinesh' <Tinesh.Tr@aig.com>

Cc: Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Accounts (LKKAuto)
<account@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: OD / 1293345972S5G / SLV6048R -DOA 19/06/2018

Dear Tinesh,

Kindly assist to close this case at your end.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 July 2018 4:39 PM

To: 'Tr, Tinesh' <Tinesh.Tr@aig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>

Subject: RE: OD / 1293345972SG / SLV6048R -DOA 19/06/2018

Dear Tinesh,

Please be informed that insured not claiming under his own insurance policy (OD CLAIM) for repair
his car.



Enclosed herewith our invoice ,kindly close this case at your end.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tr, Tinesh [mailto:Tinesh.Tr@aig.com]

Sent: Monday, 9 July 2018 4:25 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>
Subject: OD / 1293345972SG / SLV6048R -DOA 19/06/2018

Hi all,
Good Evening,

Based on GIA REPORT, it stated that insured not claiming under his own insurance policy (OD CLAIM) for
repair his car.

Kindly confirmed this issue so that we can close this case from our end.

Thanks,
Regards,

Tinesh Rajantran

AlG

Express Claims Adjuster Il

SG Claims Operations | AIG Shared Services

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or
disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and
permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to
be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



