Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August 2019 12:19 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: <REMINDER> <5eek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GY
B682P (Ol: CTI - TBA) and SLP 8400A (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18011775/Afa3) on
26/06/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Poh Kin,

We refer to the above matter.

Please proceed to settle the property damage claim at $30,703.50.
Thank vou.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Assistant Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6193 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information, Any
unaufhorized disclosure, tse or dissamination of this message, either in whole or partial, is profibited. If yvou are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Flease delete the e-mail and any coples of if thereafter,

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@]lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 25 July, 2019 3:27 PM

To: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong. Tan{@sg.cntaiping.com=>; Claims Dept of CTI
<claimsdept(@sg.cntaiping.com=

Ce: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh(@sg.cntaiping.com>; Asher Sng (LKK Auto) <AsherSng(@lkkauto.com>; Admin
A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=

Subject: <REMINDER> <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GY 8682P (O] : CTI -
TBA) and SLP 8400A (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18011775/Afa3) on 26/06/2018

Importance: High

<REMINDER>
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CCe/CTI18011775/Afa3
Your Ref: ~ SNM18D03196C02

Dear Sir/Madam,



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
ﬁ

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 March 2019 1:01 PM

To: ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’

Ce: ‘Alfred Toh'; Admin A

Subject: <5Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GY 8682P (Ol : CTI - TBA)
and SLP 84004 (TP : LKK REF - CCR/CTI1801 1775/Afa3) on 26/06/2018

Attachments: 2018-06-27-VIDEO-00002666.mp4; LKK Adjustment report.pdf; LKK Inspection

report.pdf; LKK resurvey Photo 01.pdf; LKK resurvey Photo 02 pdf; LKK resurvey
Photo 03.pdf; LKK resurvey Photo-after repair.pdf; LKK Survey Photo.pdf: TP LOD_
SLP 8400A.pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18011775/Afa3
Your Ref: TBA

Dear Sir/madam,
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING NOS. GY 8682P (O1) AND SLP 8400A I:TP,'l ALONG PIE ON 26/06/2018
We refer to the above matter.

Liability: Insured Driver Lost control and causing chain collision, collided into third party vehicle as per TP
video footage. Liability is down against our insured.

We did clarify with Insured(PIC) the nature of the accident and They agree to settle and aware that NCD (if
any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "Modern Automotive Pte Ltd" at $30,703.50 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair S 40,269.44 S 28,301.50 ($26,450.00 x 7% gst)
2. Loss of Rental S 4,800.00 (5200.00 x 24 days) S 2,400.00 (5100.00 x 24 days)
3. GIA search S 2.00 S 2.00
Total | § 45,071.44 $ 30,703.50

**24 days recommendation for repair
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.



MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1 #01 - 61

SINGAPORE 408717

GST REG. NO : 200501102H

TEL : 6748 4422 /| 6745 4422 FAX : 6747 6720

Email: chin@modernautomotive.com.sqg

YOUR REF : GY8682P
OUR REF : SLP8400A

Date : 05.10.2018

The Claims Manager

China Taiping Insurance Co (s) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00

Spring Leaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Tel : 6222 2366

Fax : 6222 1033

RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP8400A & GY8682P ON 26.06.2018
AT PIE TOWARDS TUAS BEEFORE CLEMENTI EXIT

We refer to the above matter,

We have been authorized by our client Ms Lai Meei Yuh to make claim
against your insured vehicle No.GYEBE82P in respect of the above accident

for the following :

Repair Cost
Loss of rental (24 days x $200)
Search fee

Total :

28,301.50 (Incl GST)
4 800.00
2.00

$
$
3
$

33,103.50

Enclosed herewith a copy each of the supporting documents for your perusal.
Kindly process the above and remit the payment to us asap.

Yours faithfully

i —

L=
=

Modern Automotive Pte Lid

I
A K



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 March 2019 11:56 AM

To: ‘charlie@flexcom sg’

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GY 8682P, SLP 8400A AND

OTHERS ALONG PIE ON 26.06.2018.
Importance: High

Our Ref: CC6/CTI1801175/Awa3
Your Veh: GV B682P

FLEXCOM ENGINEERING PTE LTD
Policy Holder

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GY 8682P, SLP 8400A AND OTHERS ALONG PIE ON
26.06.2018.

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with
them.

Based on the Third Party video footage, accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us.
We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

B 74 7N

ELRRER WE Shve the Earthe Print oy when mecessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a viclation of law, If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

= ' i' ,
Date: l’

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE

ON.onrn OB NE e GALONG.. LI s Mas BGore

This letter is to authorize MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD at Block 30234, Ubi Road 1,
#01-61, Singapore 408717 to resolve the above matter.

In respect of this authorization, MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD has my/our authority to
decide on my/our behalf whether to accept any offer of settlement from the third party
insurers. |/we also agreed that all payments include Loss of Use to make in favour of
MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD.

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD is also authorized to sign all the required documents
include Discharge Voucher from the third party insurers on my/our behalf.

Yours Faithfully

R R ERS SR B R EEEE B

Signature of Owner

Il"-i MWy | s La

H

Name /NRIC = 15% S551



MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Folicy No & DMCVSEN3012901801 Claim Ne ; SHM18DO3196C02
Claimant =3 1AT MEETI ¥UH {(LAI MEIYU)
Amount 3 BE30,TD3.50
DOLLARS THIRTY THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED THREE AND CENTS FIFTY
GMLY .

I/We agree Lo &ccept the above mentibned amount to be pzid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, cests & disbursements for injurles / damages
sustained by mefus through an accident invelwving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SLP B400R

Insured Vehlcle No. : CY BeBZF

Date of Loss : 26/06/2018

Place of Accident i PIE TUAS B4 CLEMENTI EXIT

IN CONSIDERRTION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TARTIPING INSURRNCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to
disc¢harge CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE}) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name 3 FLEXCOM ENGINEERING PTE LTD
Oriver Name : IRUDAYASAMY JEYASEELAN

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the said acecident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of Iiability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) PTE. LTD.

{1) General Damages 55
(2} Cost of Repalr/Exeess 55 28;:301:.50
(3} Loss of dse/Rental/Bareing 55 2,:400.00
(4) GIA/Police Reports/

Investigation Hesults/Search Fees - 55 Z..00
(%) Medical Reports/Expenses 85
(&) Survey Fees/Towing Fee/Disbursement 53
{7) Cost ineluding Disbursement S5

i) T ——
TOIAE = w5 o @ s 8 8 & & @ 3 8 5 58 30,703.50

Claimant Name : LAT MEEI YUH (LAI MEIYU) HRIC No : 515858312

'-'&] aits
Signature ¥ Date ¥ 1 & I"




MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1#01-58/61 SINGAPORE 408717
TEL 67474422, 67454422 FAX 67476720
GST REG. NO : 200501102H

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO (S) PTE LTD Tax Invoice : TP001256
3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRING LEAF TOWER SINGAPORE 079309 Date ; 051072018

Vehicle Num. : SLP 8400A
MakeModel - HONDA HR\VL2017

Attention : Motor Claim Department Chassi

Contact : 62222366/63896111 Fax No. - 62221033 Accident Date : 26/06/2018
Claim Nao. :
Reference

Policy No. : 17-MU007104-R00

SN Quantity Particular Unit Price Amount S$
LABOUR :

ACCIDENT REPAIR (LUMPSUM) 26,450.00

Labour Total S% - 26,450.00

Total S% : 26,450.00

GST@ 7% S§% 1,851.50

,I- b Amount Due S§ : 28,301.50

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD



‘E‘ DAWN ENTERPRISES _
A o 21 SELETAR WEST FARMWAY 1

SINGAPORE 798125
TELI: 6383 2661 FAX: 6484 2836
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DAWN ENTERPRISES

legj;ww??gsus : N 35544

Tel' 63832661 Fax: 64842836
Reg No.430058/00D

>¢[6(eg

RENTAL AGREEMENT DATE

HIRER'S Phnncuuns \\l\ DRIVER'S PARTICULARS
MName \ m Name
o U)- Tt Sevy TN - o

N L S R
I'C ar Passport No. \\{0{& % éf‘:\ Country IFS ar Pasaport Na. Country
Oeeupation Occupatian
Date of Birth Age - Date of Birth Age
Driving Licance No, m_ DatePassed DrivingLicence Mo, DatePassed
Tal: (HP) (\. (Residence) Tel: (Office) {Residenca) =

IMPORTANT NOTES: CHARGES

{1 Ma inaurance Coverage il e drivar i bilow 2€y7s old or less than 2 years driving licence,

Z  This vehicie = koanced 0 passanges only ] é W U , T
Hlmrlnllulnup-yl'nﬂwFmaumimmmmtnlmbﬁ _} LDEF a 5;»\ ﬁ FE’I'I:IB}'B &WU UU

=3

of aaming while damaged vehicle &= undar repar. Day at & par wesk
For .mmmumnnwmudlmmssmmmm-mmm
Please nolify gur office shousd thars be any accidant invelving this hired vahich within 24 brs Day at § per month

Ho rofund will be given for vehicle ralums eary

tp rafund will be ghean for petrol lef in vehicle
Hirar is lindile 1o pay i parking fee and frafic summanses

we 0 DB ~ O N B

Wahicles 1 be natum dunng offics hor only, U-
10 Mo Sarvice on Public Helidoy and Sunday TOTAL AMOUNT & m U

SCHEDULE RN T womeL AMOUNT PAID @DQHD UU

Sj v "‘; e 5= f”‘r \\l\h L\rﬁ BALANCE DUE

"
Date Time Mileage Days Extension From To

26l (& | 6ovp—

N \"?Y \\‘f Amaunt Deposit (refundable) §

FROM %\ . \\\r T0 4 .q’\\ .

|iwa have read and understood the terms and conditions
above and horaby agreed o abide

Hirer's Signature DriveriGuranior's Signature DAWN ENTERPRISES



Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
GENERAL & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

‘NSUMNCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Cperating Hours: Monday to Friday S9am to 5pm
T Registration Mo: M400017735
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE T Registration 2

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-087772
Date of Request: 27/06/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Modern Automotive Ple Lid
Blk 30234 Ubi Road 1
#01-61 & #01-58
Singapore 408717

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 27/06/2018

Enquiry By Chin Soi Shong

TF Vehicle No. GY8682P

Accident Date 26/06/2018

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
GY&6E82F China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. 07/03/2018-06/03/2019 5389 6111
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatscever for any
loss or damage arising oul of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and reguires no signature.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.efm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_g... 27/6/2018
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE FPhone: +65 6224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030
ASS0CIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref Mo: GR-18-097772
Date of Request: 2T106/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchass
Modern Automative Pte Ltd
Bk 3023A Ubi Road 1
#01-61 & #01-58
Singapore 408717
Dear SirfMadam,
Enguiry Date 27/06/2018
Enguiry By Chin Soi Shang
TP Vehicle Mo. GYBBE2P
Accident Date 26/06/2018
DESCRIPTION i AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date;
[%] GIRO [] Cash [] Cheque

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp g... 27/6/2018



